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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

N
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto}
Sent: Thursday, 2 May 2019 9:13 AM
To: Motorsurvey; SUR
Subject: RE: Market & Salvage Value of SJT 5258 S Our ref: NSV1900114/5G
Dear Sir/Madam,

The market value of SJT 52588 is $11K-$12K (Estimated) as at Feb 2019

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 30 April 2019 3:42 PM
Subject: Market & Salvage Value of SJT 5258 S Our ref: NSV1900114/SG

OUR REFERENCE | ~ :NSV1900114
MARKET VALUE VEHICLE NO. :SJT 5258 S
Hi

We refer to the captioned matter and would appreciate your advice by return email on the market & salvage
value as per attached vehicle enquiry on PARF/ COE Rebate.

Date of Accident | Valuatioti Advice by Surveyors
Market Value as at 28.02.2019 $
Salvage Value as at 28.02.2019 . $

Please let us have your reply by 11 am of 02 /05/2019

Many thanks.

Regards ’
Claims Division
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Enqunre PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

_ Vehicle Owner Particulars
. OwnerID Type:
Owner ID:
- Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:

.' Intended Dereglstratlon Date -
Vehlcle Model o e

Vehtcle Make

Primary Colour
Manufacturing Year:
~ Engine No.:
Chassis No.:

"""} Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Reg:stratuon Date

_ First Registration Date:
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Actual ARF Pa|d

 Singapore NR'C )

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry
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2009

”..'G4FC9U747341 -
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 $11,440.00

$11,44000

Intended PARF RebateDetails

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibilty Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount;

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE Category -
WCOE Penod(Years)

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Yes
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The information contained herein is correct as at 06 Mar 2019
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