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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 2:31 PM

To: FONG MOTORS; MT_Claim_5G; assignments@Ilkkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Our Ref 18/19/19/VC05/021726 Document from Goh Siew Cheng [External

Genearal] || |
Attachments: SAS2591196 pdf; img-190429135849.pdf 243024141
el
w C

Lonpac External - General fiew )

Without Prejudice
Save as to Costs

Dear Sir/Mdm

Please see below for the list of surveyors and liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for
survey.

______

1 Kalvin Ang

Xing Guo Qiang

Mohamad Taufikh

Bryan Ang

Mohammed Rasul

Marcus Chua

2
3
4
5 Adrian Ling
6
7
8

Kenneth Kong

Muhammad Nazril Bin
Abdullah

10 Ong Hwee jie/Steve Chen

Dear Nivitha
Please follow up and arrange survey.

Regards,

Ong Li LI

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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r Y. The all {#&% 3 lonpac.com.sg
-

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: FONG MOTORS [mailto:fongmotors@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 2:15 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Fwd: Document from Goh Siew Cheng

Dear SirrfMdm,

Kindly arrange PRI for vehicle no. GBD959P
Antach GIA report for your reference.

Please let us have your list of survey.
Thank you.

Regards
Siew Cheng
Fong Motors
81820548

Sent froim my Samsung Galaxy smartphane



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

_———E—_—— —

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpaccom>

Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 3:34 PM

To: Shu Pai (LEKAUtD)

Cc; MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: Our Rel 18/19/19/VC05/021726 Document from Goh Siew Cheng [External
Confidental]

Attachments: 03052019153105 pdf

viernal - Conlidential

Dear Shu Pej,

Attached accident report of insured for your attention,

Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
: =

The all %83 |onpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential dafa is for use by authorised external parties only

From: Shu Pei [LKKAuUto) [mailto:shupei@lkkaito.com]

Sent: Friday, 3 May, 2019 2:20 PM

To: ONG L] LI

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auta)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VC05/021726 Document from Goh Siew Cheng [External General]
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above maltter,

We have inspected TP vehicle GBD 959P at M/s Fong Motors on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct
settlement

Please he informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your Insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Cecilia and she can be contacted at DID: 6740 4274,

hank you,



Bast Regardi

Shiu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Conzultants Pte Ltd

Phone! EI66-0055 | emall: el il lkksito com | fae 6741-4108

Bl 51, Paya Ui rgustrial Park, Uts Avenue 1, #02-35 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAu)

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 3:33 PM

To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.com=; assignments <assignments@lkkauto,com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref 18/19/19/VC05/021726 Document from Goh Siew Cheng [External General)

Dwear SirfMdm,
Imank you far the assignment

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the warkshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Ce.Nivitha| Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

PFvems =072 | omail; guogumeptes kkEyioonm | e 62gh-4315
Bk 51, Pava Ui Indistrial Park, IThi Avenoe 1, #0225 | S{goB8a31)

From: ONG LI U [mailte:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Manday, 29 April 2019 2:31 PM

To:; FONG MOTORS <langmotos@igmail.coms; MT_Claim_56 <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments@lkkauto.com;
Admin-D (LKKAuUtD) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com=

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VC0%/021726 Document from Gah Siew Cheng [External General]

Lonpac External - General

Without Prejudice
Save as to Costs

Dear Sir/Mdm

Please see below for the list of surveyors and liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for
survey.




1 Kalvin Ang

P Xing Guo Qiang

3 Mohamad Taufikh

4 Bryan Ang

5 Adrian Ling

7] Mohammed Rasul

7 Marcus Chua

B Kenneth Kong

q Muhammad Nazril Bin

Abdullah

10 Ong Hwee jie/Steve Chen
Dear Nivitha

Please follow up and arrange survey.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65)

6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

B

The all @88 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General dala is for internal / external use

From: FONG MOTORS [mallte:fongmotorsfgmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 2:15 PM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: Fwd: Document from Gah Slew Cheng

Dear SirfMdm,

Kindly arrange PRI for vehicle no. GBD95YP
Attach GIA repont for vour reference

Please let us have your list ol survey

[hank you,

Regards



Siew Cheng
IFong Motors
RIK20548

i iy my Samsung Calaxy smsrphsone

This el hus been checked tor viruses by AVG antivirus software.
www ave Eﬂ!"



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: GOH SIEW CHENG <goh_siew_cheng@hotmailcom>
Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2019 5:33 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: LOD FOR GBD959P

Dear Khanchna,

All in 53007 .45.
Thank you.

Regards
Siew Cheng
Fang Motors

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, September 16, 2019 7:46 AM

To: GOH SIEW CHENG <goh_siew_cheng@hotmall.com>
Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD FOR GBD959P

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 959P & GBB 9630M (OI- LONPAC) ON 26/04/2019
We refer to the above matter.,
wWe propose settlement at global sum of 52.207.00{all in) on this matter,
Please confim acceptance.
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed f inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360 emall: Khanchna@Ilkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 July 2019 8:16 PM

To: GOH SIEW CHENG <goh_siew_cheng@hotmail.com=

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com=
Subject: FW: LOD FOR GBD959P

Dear Sir / Madam,



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 23 September 2019 529 PM
Ta: GOH SIEW CHENG

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: LOD FOR GBD959P

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm.

ACCIDE BD 959 BB $430M (Ol- LONPA 9
We refer to the above matter.

We maintain our offer for loss of use as it Is within the benchmaork ond propose to setlle al global sum of

52.907.00{all In} on this matter,

Please confimm acceptance,

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement,

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, wither party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@I|kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GOH SIEW CHENG <goh_siew_cheng@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2019 5:33 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <kbanchna@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: LOD FOR GBD959P

Dear Khanchna,

All in 53007.45.
Thank you,

Regards
Siew Cheng
Fong Motors




Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LEK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 30 September 2019 10:57 AM
To: GOH SIEW CHENG
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE-LOD FORd
Attachments: LONPAC DV .pdf
Tracking: Recipient Delivery
GOH SIEW CHENG
Adrmm &
olvialauil kkaute. com Dallversad: 10,/9/2015 1057 AM
Melkwan@® kkaulo com Delivered: 30/9/2019 10:57 AM
shupei@ikkauto com Dealiverad: 30/9/2019 10:57 AM
Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)
Dear SirsfMdm,

we refer to the above matter.

Thank you for the acceptance.

we attoch herewith a copy of the BV for your further action.

Kindly also send us [LKK) all Ihe doecuments below lor our necessary action: -
= Hardcopy of the DV

Thank you.

Hest Regards,

Khanchna) Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

DID: 6841 2360| ecmail: Khanchna@ |kkauto.com!Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GOH SIEW CHENG <goh_siew_chengf@hotmail com>
Sent: Thursday, 26 September 2019 7:42 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com=
Subject: Re: LOD FOR d

We accept your offer.
Thank you.

Regards
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl Induatnal Park, Singapore 408933
TEL B258 3581 FAX: B258 4315
Reg. No: 19380T198R GST Reg. No. 18-B60T106-R

Affillated to Federation Interationale Des Exparts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Rel CCALPC18007E20/AKBIN2
#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE fg9sss D010 03122018 I ”IIII'III"”I'I
Code : LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBB 8630M Veh. Inspected GBD 958P
Policy No. 218VCOS000883 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 1818M19VC0E021726 Excess (5) Q.00
Assign From  ONGLILI Assign Date 26/04/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model  NISSAN NV350 c.c 2488
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. JNIMC2E26200027110 Colour SILVER
Odometer 148528 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185 R15C BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15C BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185R15C BRIDGESTOME & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185 R156C BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE Q/S BODY,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5 General Information
Accident Date  26/04/2019 [Inspection Date 0210572018
Survey held at FONG MOTORS
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
#01-27/01-45
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A™WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Eslimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




7

avsa nsa

| 74 74

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBD 959P

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Ubi Ave 1 #0125 Payn Ubil Indusing! Park, Singapors 408933
TEL 6256 1561 FAX 6256 4315
Reg Mo 1BSB07108R GST Reg No. 15-9607188-R

aty Description of Parts Condition | LT B4
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RH SLIDING DOOR (N} DENTED 1,458.70 1458.70
1|RH REAR FENDER (N) TO REPAIR SEE 1,783.40 -
LABOUR
1|RH DOOR WEATHERSTRIP (N) NOT NECESSARY 158.40 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -145.97
3.412.50 1.313.73
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|RH DOOR GLASS MOULDING (S5N) NECESSARY 108,00 108.00
1|RH DOOR GLASS SEALANT (SN} NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1|HUF CAP (SN} cut 181.20 60,00
1|STICKER (SN} MECESSARY 450.00 450.00
809.20 678.00
LABOUR
TO KNOCK AND CHANGE PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE 800.00 500.00
REPAIR OF RH REAR FENDER
TO SPRAY PAINT 800.00 500.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIX WINDOW GLASS. 120.00 80.00
TUFF KOTE NOT NECESSARY 100.00 .
TO TRANSFER SLIDING DOOR FITTINGS. 150.00 80,00
1.970.00 1,160.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,191.70 3,151.73
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,500,00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC4/LPG18007620/Akb3n2

KR

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE.AMIRTE.AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DESCLASMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD FARTIES - Ths Baport is made soleky for the wee snd benefid of tha Cliar nemed on ihe framl pags of ithis Hapart




