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Type

 Question

Message

There is no development from TP since april 2019. We sent request for LOD since July 2020 and no reply till

date. We will proceed to close file and submit survey report.

Reply

RE: Re:<TP - MANDATE IA> - S9M01ILB [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SJP 3098X(OI) & SJP 4734L(TP) ON
30/03/2019]

Menu LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) 
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 17 November 2020 2:59 PM
To: ppmsgp@gmail.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SJP4734L and SJP3098X on 30/03/2019 *** LKK REF : 

CC4/ASM19007614/Kba3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
Kindly send us the LOD for our necessary action.  
 
Please be informed that we will proceed to close off the case if there is no reply from you after 27/11/2020. 
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 11 November 2020 9:02 AM 
To: 'ppmsgp@gmail.com' <ppmsgp@gmail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SJP4734L and SJP3098X on 30/03/2019 *** LKK REF : CC4/ASM19007614/Kba3 
 
REMINDER  
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
Kindly send us the LOD for our necessary action. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Thursday, 23 July 2020 3:24 PM 
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To: ppmsgp@gmail.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SJP4734L and SJP3098X on 30/03/2019 *** LKK REF : CC4/ASM19007614/Kba3 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to the 
BOLA guideline settlement. Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an 
authorisation of repair to your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair 
cost is subjected to the 
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on 
thenumber of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal. 
 
Kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available to proceed with the settlement. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
From: Henry Khoo <ppmsgp@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 30 April, 2019 8:22 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving SJP4734L and SJP3098X on 04/04/2019 *** LKK REF : CC4/ASM19007614/Kpa3 
 
Dear Mei Kwan 
 
Kindly refer to in car cam as attach. 
 
Cant really understands why did your insured need to find excuses on her statement trying to escape from a full 
claim when she bid the red light.  
 
Have cc to traffic police as well. 
 
Thanks 
 
Best Regards 
Henry  
96356798 
Poon Poong Motors Pte Ltd  
 

On Tue, 30 Apr 2019, 16:28 Mei Kwan (LKKAuto), <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
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‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that we are currently pending verification for direct settlement. 

  

Fyi, OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 

  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.
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Please provide us the following. 

 evidence i.e. video and scene photo. 
 PIR result (if any) 

  

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742 3197. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Henry Khoo <ppmsgp@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 4:15 PM 
To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>; SG AXA Insurance SM Claims 
Service Team <cst@axa.com.sg> 
Subject: Accident Involving SJP4734L and SJP3098X on 04/04/2019 

  

Dear Officer in Charge, 

  

Kindly Arrange for survey asap. 

  

Attach within are the GIA and Repair Estimate 
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Best Regards, 

  

Henry 

Poon Poong Motors Pte Ltd 

176 Sin Ming Drive  

#05-15 Sin Ming Autocare 

Singapore: 575721 

Contact: 96356799 


