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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 15 September 2020 11:49 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto); Admin A
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Jenny Lew; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau; Cecilia 

Low; Irene Tay; Tan Kah Leong; Ben Tang; Lionel Chua; Adeline Chng; Pauline Tham
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB4565B (OI : CTI -SNM19D201812C02/5) 

AND SJP3412Y (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19007601/Uha3) on 23/04/2019
Attachments: SNM19D201812C02 DV RETURNED  BY ASIA MOTORSPORTS.pdf

LKK REF - CC6/CTI19007601/Uha3 
CTI  REF – SNM19D201812C02/5(lewlc) 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
Please assist to notify third party workshops that Discharge Voucher should be returned through M/s LKK Consultants 
Pte Ltd for cases handled  by your good office. 
 
Additional and/or unnecessary time wasted for this claim. 
 
Attach herewith the Discharge Voucher returned  by M/s Asia Motorsports Solutions Pte Ltd for your records. 
 
Please forward your bill for services rendered before we close the file. 
 
Aside to Jenny, please assist to keep track on the matter. 
 
 

NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as 
delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made via email 
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175.  . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Alfred Toh 
Senior Executive 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: 65 6389 6183 
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com 
              alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com 
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 TaipingSG  
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may 
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in 
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please 
delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, September 15, 2020 9:58 AM 
To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB4565B (OI : CTI -SNM19D201812C02/5) AND SJP3412Y (TP : 
LKK REF - CC6/CTI19007601/Uha3) on 23/04/2019 
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Dear Boon Sen, 
 
We refer to the matter above. 
 
We just contacted TP workshop ( ASIA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTE LTD ), just got to 
acknowledge that the claim has been settled and they received the cheque in the amount of 
$7,350.00  (OCBC chq number: 284107) 
 
Since the claim settled , can we get a copy of the signed DV that the workshop send to you for our file 
closing ?  
 
Thanks  
 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


