Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 23 August, 2019 2:25 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJP 3412 Y & GBB 4565 B ON 23 APRIL 2019 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT LKK REF CC6/CTI19007601/Uha3

Attachments: SJP3412Y_estimate_finalization.pdf; SJIP3412Y_invoice.pdf; SIP3412Y_report.pdf;

SJP3412Y_rental_invoice.pdf; GBB4565B_ins_search.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the below email.

Please be informed that we are currently preparing our report for our principal’s mandate approval.
We will expedite and will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LIRS

" Save the Larth Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd [mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 28 May, 2019 10:34 AM

To: SUR; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJP 3412 Y & GBB 4565 B ON 23 APRIL 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Your Ref:

Our Ref : SJP 3412 Y

28 May 2019

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. PROPERTY CLAIM
3 Anson Road (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#16-00 TO: Any Personal Injury
Springleaf Tower Claims)

Singapore 079909



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25

Singapore 408933

Attn: Claims Department

Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJP 3412 Y & GBB 4565 B ON 23 APRIL 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Kindly find attached the finalized report for SIP 3412 Y . We are pleased to inform that we are agreeable to the
amount proposed.

As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving SJP 3412
Y & GBB 4565 B on 23 April 2019. We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the amount as
stated below:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE) : $6,000.00
Cost of Rental :$ 1,800.00

LTA Search 1 $ 745
Total: : $7,807.45

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next
7 days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if
required, so that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.

We have also attached a copy of our company’s invoice for SIP 3412 Y, the Singapore Accident Statement of SJP
3412 Y, rental invoice and LTA Search, for your easy reference.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
568 Geylang Road

Singapore 389514

6745 3811
6746 5110 (fax)
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com




