Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 4:54 PM
To: Tay Boon Chai Jeffrey

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Market Value of SLK6367C
Dear Jeffrey,

The MV of SLK 6367C is S75K-$76K(est) as at Apr’19.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tay Boon Chai Jeffrey <jeffreytay@tokiomarine.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 26 April 2019 3:51 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Market Value of SLK6367C

Hi Shiau Chan

Please assist to advise the market value of this vehicle. Thanks



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars ——
Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner 1D: 8901J
Vehicle Details
VehicleNo.: SLK6367C
Vehicle to be Exported; Yes . '
Intended Deregistration Date: 17 Apr 2019
Vehicle Make: HONDA
Vehicle Model: HRV 1,5 DXCVT
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2016
Engine No. L15B4531804
Chassis No.; JHMRU1810GX 201807
Maximum Power Output: 96,0 kW (128 hhpfl .
Open Market Value: $20.29500
Original Registration Date: 23Jan2017
First Registration Date: 23 Jan 2017
Transfer Count: (¥}
Actual ARF Paid: $15413.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 22 Jan 2027
PARF Rebate Ameount: $11,555.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 22 Jan 2027
COE Category: A~ Car up to 1600cc & 97kW
: (130bhp)
" COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $49.751.00
COE Rebate Amount; $38,623.00
Total Rebate Ameunt; $50,182.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Apr 2019

Warmest regards

Jeffrey Tay

Deputy Manager, Motor Claim Department

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd.

20 McCallum Street #09-01 Tokio Marine Centre Singapore 069046
T (65) 6592 6413 | F (65) 6221 2101 | www.tokiomarine.com

A member of the
Tokio Marine Group

Please note that all personal information provided to Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd. is subject to the Personal Data Protection Policy Statement posted at

www. tokiomarine.com

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 24 December, 2018 4:45 PM



To: Fiona Gan
Cc: SUR; Tay Boon Chai Jeffrey; Alvin Tan; Telma Gomez; Dillen Selvarajoo; Zheng Hanyang
Subject: RE: Our ref: M1604108/FG, TP: SHC5466X DOA 07.09.2016

Dear Agnes,

Please be informed that the book value of SHC 5466X are as below:

Book Value (est) :$77,013.19
LTA rebate : $49,391.00
Nett Book Value :$27,622.19
Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 14 December 2018 10:33 AM

To: Fiona Gan <fionagan@tokiomarine.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Tay Boon Chai Jeffrey <jeffreytay@tokiomarine.com.sg>; Alvin Tan
<alvintan@tokiomarine.com.sg>; Telma Gomez <telma@tokiomarine.com.sg>; Dillen Selvarajoo
<DillenSelvarajoo@tokiomarine.com.sg>; Zheng Hanyang <Hanyang@tokiomarine.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Our ref: M1604108/FG, TP: SHC5466X DOA 07.09.2016

Dear Fiona,

Please be informed that we are still pending for some information from repairer. Once receive, we will update you.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Fiona Gan <fionagan@tokiomarine.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 13 December 2018 3:49 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Tay Boon Chai Jeffrey <jeffreytay@tokiomarine.com.sg>; Alvin Tan
<alvintan@tokiomarine.com.sg>; Telma Gomez <telma@tokiomarine.com.sg>; Dillen Selvarajoo
<DillenSelvarajoo@tokiomarine.com.sg>; Zheng Hanyang <Hanyang@tokiomarine.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Our ref: M1604108/FG, TP: SHC5466X DOA 07.09.2016

Dear Shiau Chan
Please update.

Thank you.

Regards

Fiona Gan
Motor Claims

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd.
20 McCallum Street #09-01 Tokio Marine Centre Singapore 069046
T (65) 6592 6378 | F (65) 6221 2101 | www.tokiomarine.com




A member of the
Tokio Marine Group

Please note that all personal information provided to Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd. is subject to the Personal Data Protection Policy Statement posted at
www.tokiomarine.com

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, October 05, 2018 9:02 AM

To: Fiona Gan

Cc: SUR; Tay Boon Chai Jeffrey; Alvin Tan; Telma Gomez; Dillen Selvarajoo; Zheng Hanyang
Subject: RE: Our ref: M1604108/FG, TP: SHC5466X DOA 07.09.2016

Dear Fiona,

Content noted with thanks.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Pay Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Fiona Gan <fionagan@tokiomarine.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 4 October 2018 5:28 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Tay Boon Chai Jeffrey <jeffreytay@tokiomarine.com.sg>; Alvin Tan
<alvintan@tokiomarine.com.sg>; Telma Gomez <telma@tokiomarine.com.sg>; Dillen Selvarajoo
<DillenSelvarajoo@tokiomarine.com.sg>; Zheng Hanyang <Hanyang@tokiomarine.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Our ref: M1604108/FG, TP: SHC5466X DOA 07.09.2016

Dear Sur

We will request from Trans-cab for the book value and let you know.
In future, please insist Taxi Company to provide book value otherwise don’t finalize the cost of repair as it may not be
justifiable.

Thank you.

Regards

Fiona Gan
Assistant Manager, Motor Claims

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd.
20 McCallum Street #09-01 Tokio Marine Centre Singapore 069046
T (65) 6592 6378 | F (65) 6221 2101 | www.tokiomarine.com

A member of the
Tokio Marine Group

Please note that all personal information provided to Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd. is subject to the Personal Data Protection Policy Statement posted at
www. tokiomarine.com

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, October 04, 2018 5:19 PM

To: Fiona Gan

Cc: SUR; Tay Boon Chai Jeffrey

Subject: RE: Our ref: M1604108/FG, TP: SHC5466X DOA 07.09.2016




Dear Fiona,
Sorry for the late reply.

According to our surveyor, the repair cost advised at $15K-S20K was based on our surveyor’s estimate earlier
marking before repair without supplementary. The final report we submitted at repair cost $28,998.80 included
supplementary items $11,950.70 and some parts found damaged after dismantling and consistent to the accident.

We are unable to advise the book value due to the repairer did not provide although we had requested it several
times and at the time of inspection.

The taxi is likely to be still within economical repair as this is about 1 year 9 months old taxi at the time of accident.

Hope the above clarified.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Fiona Gan <fionagan@tokiomarine.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 5:07 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Tay Boon Chai Jeffrey <jeffreytay@tokiomarine.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Our ref: M1604108/FG, TP: SHC5466X DOA 07.09.2016

Importance: High

REMINDER

Thank you.

Regards
Fiona Gan

Assistant Manager, Motor Claims

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd.
20 McCallum Street #09-01 Tokio Marine Centre Singapore 069046
T (65) 6592 6378 | F (65) 6221 2101 | www.tokiomarine.com

A member of the
Tokio Marine Group

Please note that all personal information provided to Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd. is subject to the Personal Data Protection Policy Statement posted at
www.tokiomarine.com

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, September 27, 2018 3:50 PM

To: Fiona Gan

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Our ref: M1604108/FG, TP: SHC5466X DOA 07.09.2016

Dear Fiona,
Thank you for the email.

We will check and revert to you.



Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Fiona Gan <fionagan@tokiomarine.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 27 September 2018 3:47 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@l|kkauto.com>

Subject: Our ref: M1604108/FG, TP: SHC5466X DOA 07.09.2016
Importance: High

Dear Shiau Chan

We refer to your email dated 06.10.2016, please see attached.
Repair cost likely to be $15k to $20k, however your final report repair cost at $28,998.80.
Please advice the book value of the taxi and whether vehicle was economical to repair.

Thank you.

Regards
Fiona Gan

Assistant Manager, Motor Claims

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd.
20 McCallum Street #09-01 Tokio Marine Centre Singapore 069046
T (65) 6592 6378 | F (65) 6221 2101 | www.tokiomarine.com

A member of the
Tokio Marine Group

Please note that all personal information provided to Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd. is subject to the Personal Data Protection Policy Statement posted at
www.tokiomarine.com
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