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Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carmage

Industries Pte Limited
Aupreraes Desle
Company ko, IRa40036TW

EST"‘ATE FOR SBHGEU GST Reg M. MR-B500111-X
& : Vahicis & Document Information
Wong Foaot Hin \1 WIP No 32483
80 ai Reg No/Reg Date SBHBEU 1211212018
0 Jalan Girang Date InfMileage - ™ 108
=B J ™ i i
Singapore 355245 chassato  WDDZ130422A8693163
Engine No 27492031686447
Mobile: 86381955 MakeMaodel MB/MB E 200 SEDAN AVANTGARDE/AVANTGARDE
. —-’) ColourTnm 027 775 Iridium 511/ 042 201 Leather Bla
Account No Terms DaleTime Printed CSE Operator
CSI00001 Cash 16/07/2019/ 10:03 Vs 356 / Vincent Seah
Description of Goods / Services Qity Unit Price  Disc% Amount
M _BENSUN

Crouict wapcd ot <hasatsvad sl IE ETCUIAL T A Y NG "l 1}
ORIV w‘ﬁicm i 1&341.3 1";; w ius&s!#hn AL ﬂrf‘\' | AA 1INV (-1 1
DATE IN/DATE SURVEY: 16.07.19 //

DIRECT SETTLEMENT:VIC ALPEH-LKE // 15.05.19

A BPILAB ,—(f’,‘l':' 0.10 380.00
“USE XENTRY TO CHECK CONTROL UNITS & RESET MEMORY TO A\~
STANDARD SETTINGS.NETT" f;f: i 6
A BPILAB ~ . \\ :/{,'J‘ Qbo 12pet0
REMOVE & REPLACE ON REAR BUMPER ~ % X\
A BPIRES Gl DNV Cov 19e0
RESPRAY ON REA§ BUMPER N \ e , : o
R REAR BUMPER AN VRN IV L 1.00 2011.82 00.0 2011.
M AEAR BUMPER CHROME MOULDING ot <~ l-;:_’?"' W\ N\ J v 1.00 112.57 00.00 312.57-
M REAR LOMER BUMPER da ~ — \ O\ 1.00 269.37 00.00 269.37
M =t AR, P 1.00 789.61 00.00 789.61

REAR CROSS MEMBER g M,l

o~

s

ey el

¥ - 1
s Henalear af the k

et | s M

Confirmed & accepted by
MNatt 6,163.37
7% GST on B163.37 431.44
Total Payable 6,594.81

Authorized skgnatory and company stamp
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Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Cammiage
Industries Pte Limited

Authorieed Dealer
Company Ma. 1 G4LD03ETW

ESTIMATE FOR SBH66U GST Reg No. MR-85001 11X

Yehicis & Documegnt Information
WIF No 32483

RegNoRegDate  SBHEBU  /21/12/2018

Enging No 27492031686447

Py Make/Model MB/MB E 200 SEDAN AVANTGARDE/AVANTGARDE
Coleur(Trim 027 775 Iridium $11/ 042 201 Leather 81a

Wang Foot Hin
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THISHS ﬂ'ﬁfiﬁ:ﬂ‘:@E EICIAL TAX IN

DATE IN/DATE sunvzr 15 07.1% // 16.07.19 RASUL-LKK 11:00AM
DIRECT SETTLEMENT:VIC ALPEW-LKX // 15.05.19
R SIDE STARILITY
X RH Ne /

80.80 00.00 80.80

Confirmed & accepled by
Nott 80.80
7% GSTon  80.80 5.66
Authorized signatory and company slamp Total Payable 86.46
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Cycle & Carrlage
Industries Pte Limited
Authorsed Dodler
Company No. | 94400357W
ESTIMATE FOR SBHE6U GST Reg Ne. MR-8500111-%
Veh I
WIP Ne 32483

Wong Foot Hin

Reg No/Reg Dite aaunau' [ 2112/2018

80 Jalan Girang Dats In/Milsage .

Enqdnl Nr.'l 27492031686447
MakaModel ME/ME E 200 SEDAN .I;'MHTGAHDE{'M'HTGMHE
—-"J ColourTim 027 775 Irf Il*1diml 51” 042 201 Leather Bla

lms Nﬂf /OICE

BRTE IN/DATE SURVEY: 16.07.19 H 16.07. I! H.I.SLIL-LI{K II ODAM
OIRECT SETTLEMENT:VIC ALPEH-LKK // 15.05.19
A BPILAB 0.10 380,007
"USE XENTRY TO CHECK CONTROL UNITS & RESET MEMORY TO
STANDARD SETTINGS.NETT"
A BPILAB 960.00 ~
REMOVE L REPLACE OM REAR BUMPER
A BPIRES 1 600,00
RESPRAY ON REAR BUMPER
X REAR BUMPER 1.00 2011.82 00.00 2011.82 ~
X REAR BUMPER CHROME MOULDING 1.00 312.57 00.00 312,57 -
X REAR LOWER BUMPER . 1.00 269.37 00.00 269,37 -
X RHR SIDE STABILITY r=1 1.00 80.80 00.00 B80.80 .-
2 o
a0
~ e
e
Confirmed & noccapied by
Natt 4,614.56
7% GST on  4614.56 323.02
e Total Payable 4,937.58
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2 |
Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 30 April 2019 9:42 AM
To: assignments
Subject: FW: SDHBEU/SLUGDSS5A - direct settlement y , :
102 tum@ 3074111
Importance: High .
P Vineant
Hi team Vihicle not In.

Lindly Mlp o roverd-on
il o4 VRN 84

TP smart. Kindly assist.

Thank you. Wiuj Im ordln o reaps
Best Regards, ! ;
Mei Kwan | Admin i'or bbl |f}:j

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | 5(408933)

——0riginal Message—

From: Vincent Seah <vincent.seah@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 4:04 PM

To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SDHE6U/SLUBDSSA - direct settlement

Importance: High

Hi
Kindly revert liability

Tks

Vincent Seah

Cycle & Carriage Ind. Pte Limited

Body Care & Repair - Pandan Loop Service Center
188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378

Tel ; 83320062 ( H/P ) DID: 6771 4401

Fax.: 6872 1272

—0riginal Message—

From: Vincent Seah

Sent: Thursday, 25 April 2019 3:47 PM

To: 'motor.survey@axa.com.sg’ <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Subject: FW: SDHE6U/SLUG0S5A - direct settlement
Impartance: High

Afternoon Officer -in -charge

It's has been 3 weeks ,yet no response on this



. Kindly revert, URGENTI!!I

Vincent Seah

Cycle & Carriage Ind. Pte Limited

Body Care & Repair - Pandan Loop Service Center
188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378

Tel : 83320062 ( H/P) DID: 6771 4401

Fax.: 6872 1272

-----Original Message-——-

From: Vincent Seah

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 2:22 PM

To: 'motor.survey@axa.com.sg’ <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Subject: FW: SDHB6U/SLUBDS5A - direct settlement
Importance: High

HI
Kindly respond on this case
Urgent

Tks

Vincent Seah

Cycle & Carriage Ind. Pte Limited

Body Care & Repair - Pandan Loop Service Center
188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378

Tel : 83320062 ( H/P ) DID: 6771 4401

Fax.: 6872 1272

---—Original Message—-

From: Vincent Seah

Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 11:37 AM

To: 'motor.survey@axa.com.sg' <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Subject: FW: SDHB6U/SLUB0OSSA - direct settlement
Importance: High

HI
KINDLY REVERT

TKS

Vincent Seah

Cycle & Carriage Ind. Pte Limited

Body Care & Repair - Pandan Loop Service Center
188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378

Tel : 83320062 (H/P ) DID: 6771 4401



. Fax,; 68721272

——-Original Message—

From: Vincent Seah

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 10:03 AM

To: motor.survey@axa.com.sg

Subject: FW: SDHB6U/S5LUGOS5A - direct settlement
Importance: High

Morning
Kinldy acknowledge and revert liability

Tks

Vincent Seah

Cycle & Carriage Ind. Pte Limited

Body Care & Repair - Pandan Loop Service Center
188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378

Tel : 83320062 ( H/P ) DID: 6771 4401

Fax.: 6872 1272

~—-0riginal Message—

From: Vincent Seah

Sent: Friday, 12 April 2019 4:09 PM

To: motor.survey(@axa.com.sg

Subject: FW: SDHGEEU/SLUBDSS5A - direct settlement
Importance: High

Afternoon
Kindly acknowledge and revert liability

Tks

Vincent Seah

Cycle & Carriage Ind. Pte Limited

Body Care & Repair - Pandan Loop Service Center
188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378

Tel: 83320062 (H/P ) DID: 6771 4401

Fax.: 6872 1272

—--Original Message———

From: Vincent Seah

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April 2019 6:09 PM

To: motor.survey@axa.com.sg

Subject: SDH66U/SLUB0OSS5A - direct settlement



TO : AXA INS

Accident Claim Dept.

RE: Accident involving mator vehicle nos. SBH 66 U & SLU 6055 A along OUTSIDE CONCORDE HOTEL ( ORCHARD RD
), Accident date:06.04.19

Dear Officer In-Charge,

This email is with regards to the above accident which has been reported by our customer, We have since been
instructed by him/her (motor vehicle number SBH66U ), to submit a claim on his/her behalf as we are the
authorised repair workshop for his/her car.

We note that you are the insurer (3rd party) of the (motor vehicle number SLUGBDS5A ) involved. As such we are
proposing for a Direct Settlement with regards to the repair costs and other consequential losses.

We appreciate your assistance in this matter and look forward to your agreement on this direct settlement.

| can be reached at vincent.seah@cyclecarriage.com.sg

Regards

Vincent Seah

Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Limited

Body Care & Repair - Pandan Loop Service Center
188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378

Tel: 8332 0062 | H/P )

Fax: 6872 1272

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this emall or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this emall in error, please notify us immediately by return emaill and destroy the original message, Any
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
and/or any of its related corporations.



Brar2019 Claim Partal

LEK AUT ONSULTANTS PTELTD(TP) = Meanu

<TP - Mandate IA> - S9MOLJEH [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
@ I8 s A B AGULP) ON 06/04)2019

Type
© Question

Message

Liability: 100%. Insured driver rear-ended third party. Inform Ol about third party claim. Agreed to settle at best
and aware NCD issue. We seek vour mandate at $5.345.03(if claim LOU) -$5,585.03(if claim LOR). TP-Mandate
|A had been uploaded in Smartclaims. Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. Hslao Tong - 03 Aug 2019

hitps:/ivp. smartclams.axa,.com.sg/clam-portalfhtmbindex-vendor-service-requests himi#service-requesis/iview-message/TserviceRequasiNumber=11... 11
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S IS = [ Campany Regiatration b 198807 tRER
S0 UREANT 1, MOEEE EAYA T I IV S TRIAL PARR, SISGAPTRE SS908 THEL @ obhS) AZRARERT FAN - kS RIS 1S
Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 3/8/2019
Survey Details:
Date of loss 6-Apr-19
Date of appointment 30-Apr-19
Date of survey 16-Jul-19
Location of survey CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PL
Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Vehicle number SBHEEU
Make and Model MERCEDES BENZ E200 AVG (R1B LED) - 1991cc
Date of registration 21-Dec-18
Parf Rebate
Market Value 5 219,000.00
Parl Rebate s 78,651.00
Mett Loss 5 140,349.00
Repair details:
[initial Estimate B 6,163.37 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:
Parts 5 2,593.76
Check items (estimate) NIL
Labour s 1,940.00
Supplementary 5 80.80
Total 5 4,614.56
Lump Sumlif applicable) 5 -
[Number of days for repair | 3.0 |




Ainmam fuim Company Asgiutralion Ho 1986071148
AN B, AL A Ay A L S ST R AL AR, SENCA PN A TEL | (eE) AZRASER] AN © (6E) 62ERIILE
Remarks:
Mandate:
Liability(TP) 100%
Proposed repair cost (w/GST) 5 493758 | 5 4,937.58
Loss of use (4days x 5100) 5 400.00 NIL
Loss of rental (4days x $160.00) NIL| 5 640,00
Loss of income NIL NIL
LTA search fees 5 745 |58 7.45
Others MNIL NIL
Proposed Total 5 534503 |5 5,585.03




Hsiao Tuﬁ !LI(I(Autu}

From:; Mei Kwan (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 5 August 2019 10:18 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: New message for service request 113276, vehicle number 5BH66U
5/8/19 10:09 AM *** Pls proceed DS with below revised quantum®*** Message LOR: $140/day. No

change to other costs. Total mandate is up to: $5510. - WANG Peter

—Qriginal Message—

From: peter.wang@axa.com.sg [maillo:peter.wang@axa.com.sg)

Sent: Monday, 5 August, 2019 10:11 AM

To: admin-d@kkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 113276, vehicle number SBHé66U

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number 5M01JEH.

Please click here hitps://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message In Vendor Portal.
This message is confidenfial; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided
for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender
immediately.



CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

MERCEDES-BENZ MOTOR INSURANCE PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder @ WONG FOOT HIN Vehicle No. 1 SBHBEU

Period of Insurance : 21 Dec 2018 To 20 Dec 2018 Policy No. : 1800151938
Engine No. » 27482031686447 Endorsement No. : 000000000257482
Chassis No. : WDD2130422A5608318 Issued Date : 12 Feb 2018

ABOUT THE COVER

MakeMode! MERCEDES Benz E200 Sadan Avanigarde

Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 1,921.00 CC Sum Insured @ Market Value Firsl Year of Registration = 2018

Driver Restriction MA Off Peak Car : No Insuring with COE/PARF ' Yes

Person or Classas of Persons Entilled to Drive®
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Losa of Lse 2000cc
“ Lirnitatiom rencweet inoperaites by Secsar B ol the Molod Vehicies (Thir-Pany Fiska snd Compemaiion | Azt (Cen A5 and Sector B8 of the Mosd Tamegone S V00T Abisysia), gee mol o De
ifClsOed unidei Fess racdnge

Section 1
Frm - 80 Own Dwrmge - $600 Thatt - 83 Flood Cover - §0

Section 1

Propety Dirtsse - 40

Windesrean : $100

Named Driver and EXCESS iwiere soploatis|

'WONG FOOT HiN - $800 [Dwn Damage)

REIL

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (FOR CLAIMS

| Cycie & Camiage Buros Berwoe Cenier |For scoden reparting only) Ade 330 Uts Bosd 3 Segepoes 40850 G2081018
4 Cyee & Catiage Farcian Loog Serese Carter - Bocy Cars & Papser Ads 18d Panden Loop Sngapors 1 I55TF £2081618

For ofrmr Approves Regomng Centrmeald Authonses Meperers. plsans contact our 248-hour acoiderd erargency halling st +05 8338 4200 ASerhitealy, wou iy s 10 A0 wabuits weaw iig com &g
w AMJ BO Mobile App. Birsply search sz Soawnines "AIG ST fram Tunes o Godagim Pray

IMPORTANT NOTES

| Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: DBS BANK LTD

Ve rarstry camiify that the paiicy t whecnh Sus Confcsie of muurence relstes 18 S5680 10 GOCCIENCD W The srovimors of th Motor Venicles{Thind Party Fisks snd Compersahon] A (Cap VBE), Part IV of
s Rosd Trenaport Act 1587 (Malmysia) an2 Motor Varacies [Third Pery Risks| Aules, 1350 (Mainysia) ' )

| EE e R

0504512268
-ﬁ‘\‘
CYCLE & CARRIAGE - ANGIEN
238 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPCR
PORE 159830 AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.
Underwrlttan by AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre, Lid. AUTHCRISED REPRESENTATIVE
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CONFIDENTIAL
Annex E

NOTICE OF COMPLIANCE

bsnn‘-l Shou Jian ﬂf:a”

This is to confirm that

NRIC/FIN_S9S1N&HIF has reported to the Police a nuﬂ-injnr:;'.tmfﬁc accident

which occurred at Outyide concorde Hrf'c.f

on_bltl'4  23eohes involving the following vehicles:
SBHECU
SLVUbosSA
2 If this accident was reported to the Police within 24 hours of its occurrence.

Then he/she has complied with Sec 84(2) of the Road Traffic Act, Cap 276.

Rank/Name of Issuing Officer: ‘Sﬂ’['i-‘) Darcen Nato

Date: ML__ ' Time: 325

SDRef: 33

Original — 10 be issued 1o informam
Duplicate - 1o be submitted 1o Traffic Police

CONFIDENTIAL

Version us of 15 Jan 2002



Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 6 September 2019 11:47 AM

To: Amanda Ang; Vincent Seah

Subject: Your Ref: SBHE6U *Our Ref: CC4/ASM12007594/R1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU

B0S5A[AXA) AND SBH 66U ON 06/04/2019]

Your Ref: SBHG6U

Our Ref: CC4/ASM19007594/R1pa3 Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 6055A(AXA) AND SBH 66U ON 06/04/2019

We refer to the above matter,

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $4,937.58
2. Loss of Rental (2days x $140.00) S 280.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee 5 2.00
Total $5,219.58

Please confirm acceptance.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of termsfsettlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the lssues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)



Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: Amanda Ang <amanda.ang@cyclecarriage.comsg>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2019 2:33 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SBH66U *Our Ref: CC4/ASM19007594/R1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SLU BO5S5A(AXA) AND SBH 66U ON 06,/04/2019]

Dear Hsiao Tong,
We refer to your email of 6 Sept 2019.
Regret that we do not consider your LOR offer of 5280 acceptable.

Our client is driving a MB E200 with engine capacity of 1991cc. According to our agreement with AXA, private car
above 1800cc are entitled to rental at 5160 per day.

Please check and settle our claim in full.

Thank you.

Best regards,
Amanda Ang

L. 12G-

Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd « 188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378
T +65 6206 1818 = DID: +65 6771 4304 « Fax: +65 6779 5383

'4“-”!&_‘-!”“:-_“-

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) «chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, & September, 2019 11:47 AM

To: Amanda Ang <amanda.ang@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Vincent Seah <vincent. seah@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Subject: Your Ref: SBHE6U *Our Ref: CC4/ASM15007594/R1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 6055A(AXA) AND SBH
66U ON 06/04/2019]

This emall was sent from outside of your organisation

Your Ref: SBHBBU
Our Ref: CCA/ASM19007594/R1pa3 Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 6055A(AXA) AND SBH 66U ON 06/04/2019

We refer to the above matter.,



QZy0ta Claim Portal

<« RE: Pls proceed DS with below revised quantum

Type
© Question

Message
Hi, Far LOR, third party rejected our offer at $140.00/day and proposed $160.00/day x 2days = $320.00.

Third party vehicle is a Mercedes Benz E200 with engine capacity 1991cc. According to third party repairer,

they have agreement with AXA that the rental is entitled to claim $160/ day. ). The breakdown of third party

propose is as follows: - 11Cost of Repair (w/G5T):$ 4.937.58 + 2.]Loss of Rental (2days x $160.00): $320.00 .
+ 3). LTA/GIA Search Fee: $ 2.00 = TOTAL: $5,259.58. Kindly let us have your further mandate / instruction

please. Hsiao Tong - 23 Sept 2019

hiipsivp smarclaims.axa.com.sgiclaim-portalhimlfindex-vendor-service-requests himi#lservice-reguestsfview-message/TserviceReguestiNumbe... 11



Hsiao TunE (LKKAuto)

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAULD)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2019 9:53 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: New message for service request 113276, vehicle number SBHB6U

12/11/19 3:38 PM **2 pis proceed with C&C's proposal ***Messageln view that they only claim for 2-
day LOR, we will allow at $160/day, subject to rental receipt. - WANG Peter

—-0riginal Message—-—

From: peter.wang@axa.com.sg <peter.wang@axa.com.sg>

S5ent: Tuesday, 12 November, 2019 3:40 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 113276, vehicle number SBHB6U

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S8MOLIEH.

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided forin a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately,
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Ourret  SLU fos A {_M/grw;w ;-_rn/,;f
Your ref: SBH 44 &

- Direct Settlement
Date: ~ 2 AUG 2018
To: AxA WL
Singapore
At Motor Claims Department

Re: Accident Iﬂ"ﬂlri.ng Motor Vehicle NES.S-M(( </ &II{J' ¢ '-"-;T.q

At/ Ong O 11 . C:JALL& ﬂf:?"&'ﬂnk{/;-f/;f@-’f 4.9
Orcdord” ﬂ-ﬂ"y
I am the owner of vehicle no” S B¥ £€2 that was involved in an accident with vour
insured vehicle no, S£& {05 A of the above accident.
As the accident was caused by your insured negligent/inconsiderats driving, thus | am claiming

from you for the following: -

1. Costof % #; ﬁ;? _S-ﬁ
2. Lossof me:.a.I{__;;da}fs@s M= per day) $ 235 2O
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 2.5 5
4. GIA Report Fes S
5. Others s
Toa: § S. 255 <&

[ bereby give you fourteen (14) days to comply with the above, failing which. 1 shall instruct my
solicitor 1o commence legal action against you. If you have any queries, please contact the
representative of CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD ar Telephone No:
67714401 (Mr Vincent Seah) / 67714304 (Ms Amanda Ang).

I hereby give full authority to CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD and their
representative to negotiate/comprise settlement of the above claim on my behalf.

Your co-operation and immediate attention to the above is greatly appreciated. | hereby look
forward to hearing from you soon,

Yours faithfully

Address: C/o. 188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378
Ce: Mr Vincent Seah/ Ms Amanda Ang

E-mail: vincent seah@cyelecarriage com.sg / amanda.ang@cvclecarriage. com.sg

Fax No. 67795383

Updated..22/01/15



@ Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carriage
Industries Pte Limited

Buthistised Dealer
Company Mo, 198800386TW

TAX INVOICE GST Reg No, MA-850011 1%
Invoice Name & Address Owner NMame & Vehicla Info
Cust No/Nama WCV38137 /Mong Foot Hin
C/0 AXA RANCE PTE
19.058 2 L Reg NofReg Date  SBH66U / 21/12/2018
MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT Daie InMileage 16/07/2019/ 8192
B SHENTON WAY #24-01
S INGAPORE (068811 Chassis No WOD2130422A5693183
Engine No 27492031686447
Contact No Make/Model MB/MB E 200 SEDAN AVANTGARDE/AVANTGARDE
Accouni No Terms  Date/Time Printed Operator WIPNo  Invoica/Credil Note No
Csinopol Cash 20/08/2019/ 10:34 1.‘5 356 / Vincent Seah 32483 28157055
Description of Goods [ Services Cty Unit Price 5% Amount 58
M BPNSUN F.0.C.
POLICY NO/ACC DATE : 1B00151933 // 06.04.19
DRIVE IN/EXCESS : 10.04.19 // TP CAR SLUGOSSA=AXA INS
DATE IN/DATE SURVEY: 16.07.19 // 16.07.1% RASUL-LKK 11:00AM
DIRECT SETTLEMENT:¥IC ALPEH-LKK // 15.05.19
A BPILAB 0.10 380.00
“USE XENTRY TO CHECK CONTROL UNITS & RESET MEMORY TO
STANDARD SETTINGS.MNETT™
A BPILAB 960.00
REMOVE & REPLACE ON REAR BUMPER
A BPIRES &00.00
RESPRAY ON REAR BUMPER
X REAR BUMPER 1.00 2011.82 2011.82
X REAR BUMPER CHROME MOULDING 1.00 312.57 312.57
X REAR LOWER PBUMPER 1.00 269,37 260.37
X RHR SIDE STABILITY 1.00 80.80 B0 .80
Cycle & Carrioge celebrotes 120 yeors.
Vistt www.cyclecorrioge.com/120 for more info!
Parts 2,674.56 Nett 4,614.56
Labour 1.,940.00 7% G5T en 4614.56 323.02
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Jab 0.00 Total Payable 4,937.58
Diagnostics Job 0.00 Paid 0.00
Sundry/Others 0.00 Total Due 4,937.58
Tatal(w/o G5T) 4,614.56
_Paymenit shouid be made strictly by cash. NETS of crogit cards. Thank yoo.
Any dispute 1e the invoice mest be mads within 3 cays. This (8 & compulr Gensiales cocument NGO WGREtre I8 FEguired
Pandan Loap Servce Canter
184 Fandan Loop
Singapore 1 2827
Tul: §777 6388
Fac 4779 5383
m Marzates B - are reglstered vademarks of Dimier, Stittgart. Garmany W IR S Page 1801



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Uibi Ave 1 #D1-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833

TEL: 6255 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Rag Me: 19950718BR GST Reg. No. 18-9507188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

Rel CC4/ASM19007584/R1paldge

i:f: %gﬁigﬁ;ﬁdcﬁe 068811 g ISREEONG Ml“‘""l“ll""l"l
ATTN:PETER Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLU 80554 Veh. Inspected SBH 66U
Policy No. VPA/P2040024 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SOMO1JEH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 30/04/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ E200 AVG |c.c 1891
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WODD2130422A569318 Colour GREY
Odomaeter g182 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/45 R18 PIRELLI 3 mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/45R18 PIRELLI Imm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/45R18 PIRELLI 3 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/45R18 PIRELLI 3mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 06/04/2019 Inspection Date 16/07/2019
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES (1986) PL
168 PANDAN LOOPR
SINGAPORE 128378
(MERCEDES-BENZ)
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




¥

SJs ma B

L7

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL G258 35681 FAX: 6256 4315

1

MOHAMMED RASLUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

s

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor

MECLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIHD PARTIES:- This Report ls made solely lor the use snd benslil of the Clisnt nemed on the front page of this Repart.

Reg MNo: 188607198R GST Rep. No. 18-9607188-R Page No.:1 ol 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SBH 66U
o Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition sapldd o A Lo
S P Workshop (§)| _ (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (SN) (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 201182 2.011.82
1|REAR BUMPER CHROME MOULDING (SN) cuT a12.57 31257
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR LOWER BUMPER (SN) (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 269.37 260.37
1|REAR CROSS MEMBER (SN) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 7 789 61
1|RHR SIDE STABILITY (SN) (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) |NECESSARY B0D.BO BO.BD
©3,464.17 2 674.56
LABOUR
USE XENTRY TO CHECK CONTROL UNITS & RESET 380,00 380.00
MEMORY TO STANDARD SETTINGS.
REMOVE & REPLACE ON REAR BUMPER. _1.200.00 860.00
RESPRAY ON REAR BUMPER. 1,200.00 600.00
2,780.00 1,840.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,244,17 4,614.56|
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | ] 4,614.56]|
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19007594/R1padq2
/
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