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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: weron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 14 August 2019 5:16 PM

To: Shashitharan PTCBC; SUR; Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SMJ394 FINAL BILL

Dear Shashi,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed $3669.20 before GST @ 3 working days

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to CHINA TAIPING

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>

sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 1:14 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto)
<Rasul@lkkauto.comz>

Subject: RE: SMJ394 FINAL BILL

No discount for china taiping

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veron en@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, August 8, 2019 12:10 PM

To: Shashitharan PTCBC; SUR; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SM1394 FINAL BILL

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Shashi,

Any discount for the spare parts?

Best Regards,

veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



---—-Original Message----—-

. Erom: Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg=
Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 10:50 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: FW: 5SMJ394 FINAL BILL

-—=-Original Message--—-—

From: Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg [maiIm:Shashitharan@burneumntcrs.cum.sgl
Sent: Thursday, August 8, 2019 10:25 AM

To: Shashitharan PTCBC

Subject: SMJ394 FINAL BILL

Sent by: [Shashitharan @borneomotors.com.sg]
Number of Images: 1
Attachment File Type: PDF

Device Name: ApeosPort-VI C3371
Device Location:

This e-mail (and any attachment) is intended for the addressee(s) only and contains information that is legally
privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please be advised that you have received this e-
mail in error and that any use, dissemination, distribution, printing or copying of this communication is unauthorized
and strictly prohibited. Kindly notify us by replying to the sender’s e-mail address and delete this e-mail
immediately. E-mail transmissions cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, delayed or incomplete, or could contain viruses. We therefore do not accept
liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this e-mail which arise as a result of e-mail transmission, and
you are advised to carry out your own virus checks and confirm the accuracy of the contents of this e-mail before
relying on it for any purpose.

This e-mail (and any attachment] is intended for the addressee(s) only and contains information that is legally
privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please be advised that you have received this e-
mail in error and that any use, dissemination, distribution, printing or copying of this communication is unauthorized
and strictly prohibited. Kindly notify us by replying to the sender’s e-mail address and delete this e-mail

immediately. E-mail transmissions cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, delayed or incomplete, or could contain viruses. We therefore do not accept
liability for any errors or amissions in the contents of this e-mail which arise as a result of e-mail transmission, and
you are advised to carry out your own virus checks and confirm the accuracy of the contents of this e-mail before

relying on it for any purpose.

This e-mall (and any attachment] is intended for the addressea(s) only and contains information that is legally privileged and confidential. If you are not the
intended recipient, please be advised that you have received this a-mail in error and that any use, dissemination, distribution, printing of copying of this
communication is unauthorized and strictly prehibited. Kindly notify us by replying to the sender’s e-mail address and delete this e-mail immediately. E-mail
transmissions cannot be guaranteed to be secure or arror-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, last, destroyed, delayed or incomplete, or could
cantain viruses. We therefore do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this e-mail which arise asa result of e-mail transmission, and
you are advised to carry oul your own virus checks and confirm the accuracy of the contents of this e-mail before relying on it for any purpase.



‘Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 437 PM

To: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC

Ce: assignments

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201879 -SKE5631P - Direct Settlement (ST) - Accident

Involving SMJ394G & SKES5631P DOA 25.04.2019 (PRS)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir,

We will be assigning M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey your client’s vehicle.
Aside to LKK,

Please proceed to survey the third party vehicle on WP basis.

Thank you.

Chong Boon Sen

Claims Executive
Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 0759209
DID: (65) 63898171 | M: (63) WHHH XXXX | F:(65)6222 1033

W: www sg.cntaipingcom | FB: www_facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: S TFE W Taiping SG 3 Anson

Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (85) 638171 | M: (B5) KHKK XXXX | F: (65) 6222 1033

From: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC '[rna'lIto:SuraidahB.Saidi@inchcape.mm.sg]

sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 4:31 PM

To: Chong Boon 5en <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201879 _SKES631P - Direct Settlement (ST) - Accident Invelving SMJ394G & SKES631P
DOA 25.04.2019 (PRS)

Hi Boon Sen,
We would like to choose XING QUO QIANG to conduct the assessment.
Thank yau.

Warmest Regards,

SURAIDAH

TPR TEAM, CLAIMS DEPT

D: 6631 1887 | F: 6872 7260 | E: surnidahb, saidi@inchcape. com. sq
Inchcape Centre

Level 4, Bodycare Centre

2 Pandan Crescent

Singapore 128462

www.borneomotors.com.sg | www lexus.com.sg | www.toyotasingapore.com.sg | www.hing.com.sg | www.suzukicar.com.sg

1




From: Chong Boon Sen <hoonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=
ant: Monday, 29 April 2019 3:12 PM
To: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC <SuraidahB.Saidi@inchcape.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM190201879 -SKES631P - Direct settlement (ST) - Accident Involving SMJ394G & SKES631P
DOA 25.04.2019 (PRS)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

WWe intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your maotar
workshop. We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors 1o conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single
joint expert.

ADRIAN LING
Kelvin Ang
SEE CHEW SENG
MOHD FADHILAH BIN
OSMAN

XING QUO QIANG
KENNETH KONG
SIMON HO

CHUA WEWJIE
MARCUS CHUA
HENRY NG

Please let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors
as a single joint expert.

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the
single joint expert.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #168-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 83896171 | M: (65) XXXX XXXX | F (65) 6222 1033

W: www sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook.comichinataipingsal | WeChat: + 7 #ifi Taiping SG 3 Anson
Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (65) XXXX XXXX | F: (65) 6222 1033

From: Angie Foo

sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 3:09 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So
Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.coms>, suraidahb.saidi@inchcape.com.sg

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D201879 _SKES5631P - Direct Settlement (ST) - Accident Involving SMJ394G & SKE5631P
DOA 25.04.2019 (PRS)

Dear Boon Sen,



Please conduct PR5-SMJ394G soonest possible [ SNM19D201879 SKE5631P - INSURED NON REPORTING —FILE
WITH BOON SEN)

Officer In Charge —Chong Boon Sen- 6389 6171.

Regards.

Angie Foo
Execufive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID; (65) 63896186 - F: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sq.cntaipingcom | FB: U_u_WW.fEIﬂEbUDh.GOI“I"I."CI‘IiI‘IEIT.&IEIiHﬂSQ_.Lr | WeChat: KT {fdiE Taiping SG

Disclaimer This e-mail and any files transmitied wilh it iz intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information Any
unauthorized disclosura, use or disseminalion of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intanded recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Piease delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereaftar.

From: Claims Dept of CTI

sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 1:05 PM

To: Angie Foo

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement (ST) - Accident Involving SMJ394G & SKES631P DOA 25.04.2019 (PRS)

From: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC I'ma'!|tG:SuraidahB.Saidi@inthcaﬂe.cnm.SE]

sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 11:37 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=

Subject: Direct Settlement (ST) - Accident Involving SMJ394G & SKE5631P DOA 25.04.2019

Hi,
Reference to the above-mentioned.

Please find attached herein a copy of our client's Accident Report, Damaged Photos, Accident Video Footage &
Estimate Invoice for your kind perusal.

As our client is claiming against your insured SKES5631P thus would appreciate if you could revert to us on the liability
urgently or we could settle the case under Direct Settlement with Car Rental of @ $100 per day x no. of days as
recommended by your appointed surveyor.

Kindly have your surveyor to contact our Motor Claim Assessor, Shashi @ 9336 6875 / 6631 1864 located at 2
Pandan Crescent — Level 4 for an appointment to inspect our client’s vehicle soonest.

Your kind attention into the above is greatly appreciated.

Thank you!

Warmest Regards,

SURAIDAH

TPR TEAM, CLAIMS DEPT

D: 6631 1887 | F: 6872 7260 | E: suraidahb. saidi@inchcape. com.sq
Inchcape Centre

Level 4, Bodycare Centre



2 Pandan Crescent
Singapore 128462

- Www.oorneomotors.com.sg | www lexus.com.sg | www.toyotasingapore.com.sg | www.hino.com.sg | www.suzukicar.com.sg

This e-mail (and any attachment) is intended for the addressee(s) only and contains information that is legally privileged and confidential. I you are not the
intended recipient, please be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any use, dissemination, distribution, printing or copying of this
communication is unauthorized and strictly prohibited. Kindly notify us by replying to the sender’s e-mail address and delete this e-mail immediately. E-mail
(ransmissions cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepled, corrupted, lost, destroved, delayed or incomplete, o could
contain viruses. We therefore do not accept liability for any efrors or ammissions in the contents of this e-mail which arise as a result of e-mail transmission, and
you are advised to carry out your awn virus checks and confirm the accuracy of the contents of this e-mail before relying on it for any purpose.

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hilp://www.s} manteccloud.com

This e-mail (and any atachment) is intended for the addresseeis) only and contains information that is legally privileged and con fidential, If you are not the
intended recipicnt, please be advised that you have received thie e-mail in error and that any use, dissemination, distribution, printing of copying of this
communication is unauthorized and strictly prohibited. Kindly notify us by replying to the sender’s e-mail address and delete this e=-mail immediately. E-mail
transmissions cannet be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted. lost, destroyed, delayed or incomplete, or could
contain viruses, We therefore do not accept liability for any errors or om iegians in the contents of this c-mail which arisc as a result of e-mail transmission, and
you are advised 10 carry 0ul your own vins checks and confirm the aceuracy of the contents of this e-mail before relying on it for any purpose.

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp:/fwww.symanteccloud.com




SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORT AN
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Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation
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ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Repart 25/04/2019 15:07

Date Of Accident SEIN4/2018 11:45

Exacl Location Of Accigenl HILLION MALL C/P BASE MENT 1
Sountry/State of Loss SINGAPORI

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
ehicle Registration Number SMJE945

Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Cwnet WED Jis HULJOEL

NRIC No 50313849Z
Emall Address NOEMAIL

Maobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-81696021
Alternative Phone Mo OFEFICE-81606021
Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturar =L ZLKI

Mode

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used al
fime of accidant

Ara you claiming nder your own insurance policy

far repair 1o your vehicla?
if Wo. Pleass state action o be take THIRD PARTY

ahicle Categary

AR
Insurance Company

Mamea of Insurance Company

Typa Of Coverage

Flest Policy
[,

Policy Mumbber

W SSIC)
Cover Mote Mumber
Driver
ma of Drive . |
: 55 407
ta Of | 3
I A | |
| I A
i c arl _ -
e | =
I it : .
mhe
TS FICE
I =



Address BLE 506 HOUGANG AVE B #1 1-[80
Poslcoda

Was driver an employee o7 the Insured's Company MNO

If No. Ralationship of the Drivar with the Insur ed OWHER

yehicle Registratlon Number of Driver's Dwn
Vehicla

Insurance Company of Oriver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions INDOOR

Road Surfaca INDOOR

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Mumber of vehicles (including own vehicla)
involvad in the accident

Was any body injurad in the Accident? WO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
amhbulance?

Was any other material or property damagad? YES

| have heen approached by unknown pers on(&}
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Mumber of Passengers {Including Driver) 3

Passanger 1 NAME:
GENDER: MALE

Paszenger £ MAME v e

GEMDER: : MALE
Details of Police Action
Was the accident reported to the police? NC
if Yes Plesse state which Police Station
Was notice of intended Prozgecufion given? MW
If Yas,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident
BLS REFER ATTACHED ACCIDENT REPORT FROM THE DRIVER
Attachment(s)

Are accident photos avallable for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Ramarks’ Reasons: WILL PASSED TO W/SHOP FOR TP Cl Al
Was there any audio recorded? WO

Details of Witness 1

Mame KENNY GAN LIANG CHAMNG S8932904C
Phona Number 0483993

Emall Address

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Ragistration Numbser SKESB31P
Vehicle Make/Model'Colour

Datails OF arfies

Vahicle Catagory ERIVATE CAR



Mame of Driver

WRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

Mo. Of Passenger {Including Driver)

GUI LIANG
GEEITH24X
86836295

Fage 2ol 11




Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

MPORTANT NOTICE

1. Plesse report gorrectly the detail of the sccident to speed up The claims process,

3. This Form must be completed by the Poilcyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.
3, Informstion provided must beas truthiul and accuraie 25 possible. Any wilful misrepresentation of withnolding of material

facts may allow insurance companiss to repudiate polley liability.

4. The lssue and acceptance of this Form Dy insurance companies is not an admission of poticy hability on the part of the insurance
COMpanies,

5. Any false rgporti be refered ice for Investization.

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Managerment Centre established by the Genoral Insurance
association of Singapore [GIA) for archiving and that copies af this report will for a foe be made availabile upon application by
imterostod parties.

7. By thelndgment of this report to the instrers, you hereby consant to the archiving of this report &t the centre and 1o copies of
the report being made avallable aforesaid.

8, Cansent under the Personal Data Protection Act [POPA)
| uniderstand, acknowledge, agree and consent that,

{al My insurer, my warkshiop and the Seneral insurance Association of Singapore {"GIA"] may/are permitted to collect, uze,
disclose andfor process my persenal data/personal infarmation set out in this [form] and any other personzl mfarmation
provided by me or possessed by my insurer [callactively the "Personal Information”) and discloss and transier such
pergonal Information ta all insurer(s] whao have insurcd yehicle(s) involved In this accldent [all insu rer|s) who have insured
vehiclets] involved in this sccident shall be collectively referred to as the "Insurers”]. the surers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Autharity of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority {such a5 the police), for the purpase(s)
of.

Ui} processing. handling and/or dealing with my claims intiuding the settlement of tha claims and any necRssary
investigations relating to the claims;

{if] investigating the accident andfar my claims,
{iii) carrying out and/cr deafing with my instructions o responding 1o any enquiries by me,;

(v} administerng my claims (including the mailing of carrespondence, statements, INVoicos, reports oF NOLCEs 1o ma,
which could invelve disdosure of certain personal data about me to bring about dellvery of the same as wedl as on the
external cover of envelopes/mall packages):a ndfor

(v] complying with applicahle law in sdminigtering, processing, handiing and/far dealirg with my claims.icollectively the
“purposes’|

() all msurers) wheo have int wred vehictes) isvalved in this secident and the fmsurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
ta calloct, use, disclose andfor proces my Personal infarmation for one or maore af the above Purposes; and

[e] ey Personal infarmation mayftan be disctosed by any of the Insursars and/ar GIA ta thelr third party service providess of
agentsfincluding thelr {mwyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapare, for ong or Moo of the above Purposes

Id]  my Personal irformation will also be collected and used 19 compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
imvestigation And managEment in present and =il futere claims.

g} theinfermalionso collectesd wnder {d) aboye may be shared / disclosed:

(i} 1o all insunies and/er any other third parties that assistin pvaluating, ivastigating, contolling of managing fraud;
reguiators, law enforcement and goves nment dgencias as reasonably requircd for the purposes sated, o

[i{) for complylng with requirgmeants under any reguiations, laws or court orders

i
i
:/ voogior TR Al Iy mATORE {\jﬁlu‘]
15 fpe 19 o '
Iﬁ;r“-rhi:'nd?r; Signarire Drwer's Signaturg Reporting Ceqtre Personrels Sygnature
Date & Time. {IF drivesr i not thie polcyhosden Hame

Date-& Timat MEICTIN No

Pagedol 11



Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

TRAFFEC ~ TRAFFRC

Flowd
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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PARKFRE

OTHER
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' VEHECLE
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$ SUZUKI SINGAPORE

TAX INVOICE
GST Registration No.: MR-8500000-9
RCE Registration No.: 195000068E

[ [Aceount No,
Account Detail

Champlon Motors ( 19755 Pre Lud
Mo 2 Pandan Crescent

Singapore | 28462

Tel:r (65} 6631 1118

Website: wwwanzgkicarcom sg

—
Customer Detail

R T _— c0199882 /SERVCASH =
Service Retail Cash Sales Body & Paint | — Mr Neo Jia Hui Joel
Service Retail Cash Sales {TEomE g 506 Hougang Avenue 8
Body & Paint 1] #11-690
_ Singapore 530506
Invioice Data "
Mobile: 93897123
29/04/2019
Year Mgk haodel Rer’ Date Vah, Reg. No Kitomelers WIP Mo. Order No./Remarks
19 ZLMICKF35 SWIFT 20/02/2019 SMJ0394G 0 11731 BETE/SMJI394G/27041%
Chagsig Mo, Engine Mo. TWC Mo, Terms Sh/Counter Vehicla In Collected On
JSAAZC13800256192 K10C1206478 00 Shashitharan m—mfmmfmmme 0,00 ==f==fe=—— 0.00
L | Cd Job/Parts Description ity Linit Price Disc M | Amcidrt
|15 s-BMs SUNDRI ES 2t 100.00 /| 5o 19e700
tp veh NO.:SKES631P ACC DATE:25/04/19 |
[ I | DATE-IN: DATE SURVEY: [
NHO OF REFPAIR DAYS: [
| Brs AUTHORISED ON: | - :
2 s |5-BMS CHECK WIRING AND REFOCU$ HEADLAMP | | 146.50 | 146,50/
3| s j5-us REPL ACC AFF PARTS AND PANEL _ | 1758.00 | &¥; 1756700
| STRAIGHTEN AND REALLIGN ACC AFF ARER |
4 5 |S-BMSs RESRPAY ACC AFF AREA 1452.00 | (Fwy(m
BUMPER AND FENDER i [
5 1 §71711-53R00-799% BUMFER, FR )L'-“'f W 1.00 659.55 | 20.00 | 527.64
‘ € 2 S71734-52R00-000 HOLDER, FR BUMFER FR,L YU - 1.00 8.40  20.00 | 6.72
T 3 :STITBE-EBROG-OOO HOLDER, FR BUMPER SIDE, L MM+ '1{’ 1.00 7.35 | 20.00 5.88
|
[
| ‘ Auelwo .
| 2wy
os] .v{ 4 @ 1offo |
Champion Motors i3 the ondy authorized warkshop to maintain your Stzukl. Senvice your Suzuk ; (/#‘k VHM
I_ at Champion Mators &very 6 mihs ar 10,000 ke (whichever earker) 10 enjoy warranty benefils (&Q‘-n 5 : i SSS‘LJQ |
= For & on behall of [ = e = “;m;;,_,l_. ; 2 .
| Champion Motors (1875) Ple Ltd i S Change Summany | Tota 3,996.74
| Please acknowladge recept of vehicle | Parta 540.24 | GsST 7.00% 279.77
| LatDoxuar G- nD |
Matenals 3[ 456.50 Less 0,00 |
Lubricatiod/Fiuid 0.00 |
Cthers 0.00 - - o5 '
T I Amount Due 4,276.51
it EA] 002463
TO SECURITY GUARD 002463
29/04/2019 DATE
PLEASE ALLOW THE UNDERMENTIONED VEHICLE TED: 43 TIME
LEAVE THE COMPANY PREMISES.
VEHICLEMOR 394G — —= - ‘
SIGNATURE

CUSTOMER

FOR Champion Motors {1975) Pte Lid IneMcis



€ suzuki

TAX INVOICE Champion Motors (19735) Pte Ltd
GST Registration No.: MR-8500000-9 ESTIMATE 2 Pandan Crescent Singapore 128462
RGCB Registration No.: 195000068E Tel:(65) 64631 1118 Website: www.suzukicar com . sg
Acoount Detail RendinNe Customaer Detall |
58000004 /WIC2 | >
China Taiping Insurance (5) Pte Ltd Tvoice No Mr Nec Jia Hul Joel
3 Anson Road ' 506 Hougang Avenue 8
PL6-00 springleaf Tower 0 #11-650
Singapore 079909 _ Singapore 530506
| Invaice Date .
Mobile: 93897123
08/08/2019
Yaar Make Modal Reg. Date Veh. Rog. Mo, . Kilomelers WIP Mo, Ordar Mao./Aemarks
18 .2_1.1{1cx1r3 5_ SWIFT  20/02/2019% SMJ0394G 0 11792 G66TE/SMI394G/ 270418
: Chasgis Mo Engine M. TWG No. Terms : SA/Counter Yehicle In Collected On |
[JSAREC13S00256192 KE10C1206478 a0 June Choo Lay Koon --f—/---- 0,00 --=/-——/———— 0,00 I
et - i
L | cd | Job/Parts Dascription | Gty | UnitPrice | Disc % Amount
|
| — | |
1l & |S-BMS BODY AND PAINTCHECK WIRING AND REFCUCS 146,50 146,50
HEADLAME. [ {
2| 8 |8-BMs REPLACE ACC AFFECTED PARTS AND PAMEL 586.00 586.00
STRAIGHTEN AND REALIGN ACC AFFECTED PAMEL.
3|8 |[5-BMS RESPRAY ACC AFFECTED ARER 484,00 464.00
BUMPER AND FENDER |
4|8 |8-BMs EUNDRIES 50.00 50.00
TP VEH NO.: SKES631FP ACC DATE: 25/04/201%9
DATE-IN: DATE SURVEY: |
HO OF REPAIR DAYS: 3 DAYS i |
. BY: AUTHORISED ON: _
511 BT1711-53R00-799 FRONT BUMPER COVER, l 1.00 659,585 | 659,55
6|2 B71734-52R00-000 L/FRONT BUMPER HOLDER, 1.00| B.40 B.40
| 7|3 T1732-53R00-000 L/FRONT SIDE BUMPER HOLDER, 1.00 T a5 T35
8|4 g35120-52RB0-000  UNIT,HEADLAME,R ¢m ./ [ (1) 1.00| 1727.40 1727.40 ‘
1C'ﬁﬂmmnn Motars is the only authorized workshop 1o maintain your Suzuki, Senice your Suzuki|
| | at Champion Motors esvary 6 mitha or 10,000 km (whichever earlier} to enjoy warranty benafits
For & on behalf of i o
!. Champion Mators (1975} Pte Lid Custamers Signatire L Chiange Surmimary Total 3, 669,20
S e il 2,402.70 | GST 7.00% 256.84 |
Lataour
0.00 s
r::"“‘:wﬂ n 1,266.50 0.00
CE LI
e Q.00 - _ Tt e
P 0.00
Amount e 3,926.04
PLEASE TEAR ALCING PERFCRATED LiMNE E 1 5:&_1?;% =
TO SECURITY GUARD 215328
08/08/2019 DATE
PLEASE ALLOW THE UNDERMENTIONED VEHICLE Hh: 19 TIME

LEAVE THE COMPANY PREMISES.

s SIGNATURE ' e
MATU

CUSTOMER FOR Champion Motors (1975) Ple Ltd
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coresno:19ssarieer)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CS/CTI19007585/R1VD3N2

Date: 15/08/2019
REFERENCE
Handling China Taiping Insurance ; :
kiR (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Policy No: DMPCSN30145019011
Claimant Insured
Vehicle No : SMIIAG Vehicle No : SKES5631P
Date of Loss:  25/04/2019 MMl of” Claim  5NM19D201878C02
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg Neo: SMJ394G
Make & Model: SUZUKI SWIFT, 998ce T GLX (A) Engine No: K10C1206478
Reg. Date: 20/02/2019 (Man. Year: 2019) Chassis No: JSAAZC13500256192
Colour: Red Odometer: 8511 km
Engine Capacity: 998 cc
Market Value/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S%): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/55R16 Rear Tyre Size: 185/55R16
Front Left Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
The sbove values reprasent the remaining fyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 2,502.70 2,452.70 50.00 2.00
Miscellaneous ltlems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,356.50 1,216.50 2,140.00 63.76
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 5,850.20 3,669.20 2,190.00 37.38
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 410.14 256.84 153.30 37.38
Nett Amount (S§) 6,269.34 3,926.04 2,343.30 37.38
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 04/07/2019
Date Inspected: 05/08/2019 Inspected At: Borneo Motors (S) Pie Lid (Pandan)
2 Pandan Crescent
Singapore 128462
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: VERON CHEN

NOTE: This report represents our findings at the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been carried out fo the best of our
knawledge and abilily but any ather fability under any ather circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.

http5:J.fsingapnr::.men'mcn.cumfciaimsfindax.cfm‘?fuseb{:-x=MTRadjustEr&fuseactimFg.., 15/8/2019
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REPAIR DETAILS

'Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG \ersion: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 15 Aug 2019) ‘
Parts: 144 SUZUKI SWIFT 998ce T GLX (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairar's (Price-denominated Standard List)

|Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SMJ394G)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
. numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page ‘

|
|Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk ™.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *BUMPER,FR Deformed 659.55FS *659.55FS

2 1 *HOLDER,FR BUMPER FR,L Mecessary BAOFS ‘8 40FS

3 1 *HOLDER,FR BUMPER SIDE,L Mecessary 7.35F5 *T.35F5

4 1 *SUNDRIES Mecessary 100.00FS *50.00FS

5 1 *UNIT HEADLAMP,R Cracked 1,727 40FS 1,727 40FS

F=Franchise part. S=Spchett -
Total Parts (S%) 2,502.70 2,452.70

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. _]

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/ index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 15/8/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 CHECK WIRING AND REFOCUS HEADLAMP New 146.50 146.50

2 REPL ACC AFF PARTS AND PANEL STRAIGHTEN AND New 1,758.00 586.00

REALLIGN ACC AFF AREA

3 RESPRAY ACC AFF AREA BUMPER AND FENDER Mew 1,452.00 484.00

Gross Labour Cost (5%) 1,216.50

3,356.50

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 15/8/2019



