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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 507 PM

T ‘Chang Boon 5en’; assignments

Co SUR

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM1SD201875-5KP36644A - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT -

SKGTEB3E & SKPI664A ON 16/04/2019

Dresar SirfMdm,

Plzase be informed that we are unable te conduct the inspection for SKG 7883E after some attempts to Inform the
warkshop to present the vehicle,

This case has been pending for & long time due to the unavailability of the owner, therefore we decided to
tempararily close this case.

Kindly advise us if there is-any arrangement made and will be glad to re-open the case accordingly.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phove: 684 t-1972 | email: pssignments@ikhautocom | fox: b2s6-4315
Bl4 51, Payn Uhi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #0z-25 | S{40H933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d @Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 4:28 PM

To: 'Chong Boon Sen’ <bognsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'assignments@lkkauto.com’
<zssignments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201875-SKP3664A - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKG7BBIE & SKP3664A ON
16/04/2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thatik you for the assjgnment,

Pizase be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regands,

G Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Plione: 6B41-1072 | el Mkm | fax: H56-4515
Blk 51, Payn 1ibi tndustrinf Pack, Ubt Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{4080371)
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View Sent Message

Thix mail Is associated with ©

*SKG7BAIE (SNM13D201875C02)
[SKP3G54A)

™
GUAN KU PING
Apr 16 2019 12:008M

Perfofrridnce Motors Lirnited

_Faosend | View Recipients | Print Message | Delete Massage | Forward | B B

From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 13/09/2019 17:06 PM,
Te bognsen.chongifisg. crtalping .com
Subject SKG7BHIE

Ditar Sir/Mdm, B . . .

Plrase be Informed that we are unable to corduct the Inspection for SKG TBEIE after some attempts to Inform the workshap to preésent the vehicl.
This case has been pending far & jang time doe to the unavaiiabiity of the owner, therelere wa decided to termporarily closs this case.

¥indly mivise us if there is any arrangement made and will ba glad to re-open the case pocordingly.
Bist Regards

G NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phione: 6841-1972 | emall: sssignments@ifibauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
IBIK 51, Pays Ubi Industrisl Park, Ukl Avenus 1, #02-25 | 5{908533)
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Nivitha SLKI{ Autaz

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 11:52 AM

Ta: PBSP

Ce: ‘assignments’

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201875-SKP3664A - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT -

SKGTBB3E & SKP3664A ON 16/04/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Crear Sir,

We will be assigning M/s LKK Auto Cansultants Pte Ltd to survey your client’s vehicle.

Lside to LKK
Flease pracesd to survey the third party vehicle on WP basis,

Thank you.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Ciepartment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore (079909
CHD; (65) 63896171 | M: (B5) XXXX XXXX | F:(65)6222 1033

W www sg entaiping.com | FB: www faceboek comichinataipingssy/ | WeChat: 138 Taiping SG 3 Anson
Foad #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DD (65) 63896171 | M. (65) XXXX XXXX | F:(685)8222 1033

From: PBSP [mailto:pmi-phsp@simedarby.com.sg)

Sent: Monday, 29 April, 2012 11:28 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject; Re: OUR REF: SNM19D201875-5KP3664A - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKG7883E & SKP3664A ON
16/04/2019

Ciear Sirs

We are agreeable to use a commeon surveyor from LKK Auto as the SJE,

XING QUO QIANG

Thank you.

Fegards,
Caroline
Clo Performance Metors Limited - Body and Paint



303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

From: Chang Boan Sen <boonsen chong@seg.cntaiping.con
Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 11:04:56 AM
To: PBSP

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201875-SKP3664A - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKG7883E & SKP3664A ON
16/04/2019

Dear Sir,

We intend to condiict a pre-repair survey of the darmage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your motor
workshop. We propose 1o use one of the foliowing motor surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single
jtint expert

ADRIAN LING
Kelvin

SEE CHEW SENG
MOHD FADHILAH BIN
OSMAN

XING QUO QIANG
KENNETH KONG
SIMON HO

CHUA WEUIE
MARCUS CHUA
HENRY NG

Flease let Us Know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these moter surnveyors
as a single joint expert.

You may select one of the listed molor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survay carried out by the
single joint expert,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Departmeant

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Towar Singapore 079908
DID: (65) B3BYB1T1 | M. (B5) XXXX XXXX | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X T %38 Taiping SG 3 Anson
F.oad #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
DHD: (65) 63BB6171 | M: (B5) XXXXK XXXX | F: (85) 6222 1033

From: Angie Foo
Sent: Maonday, 29 April, 2019 10:16 AM

To: Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping corn>; Alfred
Toh <alfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; pmi-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D201875-SKP3664A - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKG7883E & SKP3664A ON
16/04/2019

[ear Boan Sen,

Flease conduct PRS -SKG7RRAE soanest possible (SNM19D201875-SKP3664A —INSURED NON —REPORTING ~FiLED
WITH BODN SEN)



Officer In Charge —Chong Boon Sen -6389 6171
HRegards

Angie Foo
Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
& Ansen Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079508
[ID: (65) 63896186 - F: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sgenlaiping.com | FB: www facebook comichinataipingsa/ | WeChat: i 73 Taiping SG

Liselaimer This e-mail and any flas transmitted with @ o intended anly for the named recimants and may contain confidential infirmatian, Any
uraiifirized Wesiosurs, Uss ordisssminalion of this message. eithar in whide or pariial, i prohibitad. If you are nol the infendad recitient, plaese
rattly the sender immediataly Plsase delete the o-mail and any cogies of it (hersaffer )

From: Claims Dept of CT|

Sent: Friday, 26 April, 2019 8:55 AM

To: Irene Tay; Chee S0 Chow

Subject: FW: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKG7883E & SKP3664A ON 16/04/2019

From: PBSP [mailto.pml-pbsp@simedarby com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 26 April 2019 8:19 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsde tdiping com>

Subject: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKG7883E & SKP3664A ON 16/04/2019

Ciear Sirs,

We refar to the above matter.

We have instructions from our client to seek repair cost and loss of use/car rental from you through Direct
Leltlement.

Afttached is the estimates and supporting documents for your consideration.

Flease let us have your confirmation that you agree that liability Is clear and we may proceed with Direct Settiement
Il Direct Settlement is approved, kindly let us have your offer for LOU / rental.

Thank you,

Fegards,
Caroline

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint

303 Alexandra Road Singapore 158941

C10: 6318 0174 Fax: 6472 4601

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the

named addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or

proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws.

I you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding

and/or printing the Message. Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete
3



all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the
Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions
expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime
Darby's.”
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