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Catherine Chon:_; (LKK Auto)

From: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 11:49 AM

To: Goh Edmund (VGS - 5G/Singapore); sur@Ilkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Ce: Wong Meiy (VGS - SG/Singapore); Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - 5G/Singapore); Kong
Charmaine (VGS - 5G/Singapore)

Subject: RE: SKT3413L- UOI OD

Attachments: 0297_001.zip

Dear Edmund,

We will appoint LKK to conduct the survey.

Dear Catherine,

Please arrange to survey the vehicle at Volkswagen @ Alexandra.
Excess; S§750.00

Warmest Regards
Jenny Lew

Claims Division

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleal Tower, Singapore 078909
Main {65} 6222 7732 | DID - (65) 6490 9329 | Fax « (65) 6327 3860 | Email » ennylew@ius com 54

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment({s) contained, shall treat the infarmation as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disciose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
racipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group

From: Goh Edmund (VGS - 5G/Singapore) [mailto:edmund.goh@vw.com.sg]

sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 11:23 AM

To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Cc: Wong Meiy (VGS - SG/Singapore) <meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - 5G/Singapore)
<Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>; Kong Charmaine (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <charmaine kong@vw.com.sg>
Subject: 5KT3413L- UDIOD

Dear Jenny,

Please find attached for the repair estimate for this vehicle. Kindly forward this mail to your colleagues if you are not
in charge for this case.

Sorry for any inconvenience caused.

Thanks and Best Regards,
Edmund Goh

Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd



247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158834

Direct line: +65 6305 7133
Main Line:  +65 6305 7299
Main Fax: +BE5 5474 3643
edmund.goh@vw.com.sq
http://www.vw.com.sq



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 9 May 2019 1:54 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SKT3413L- UOI OD

Dear Shirley,

M12D10471905

Warmest REegards

Jenny Lew

Claims Division

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road, #28-01 Springieaf Tower, Singapore 079208
Main - (65) 5222 7733 | DID - (35) 6490 9329 | Fax - (65) 6327 2862 | Email * jennylewi@uoi com s

5

LOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality, If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guarantesd,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com)]
Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 1:53 PM

To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: SKT3413L- UOI OD

Hi Jenny,

Kindly provides us claim number.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: LEW JENNY [mailto:jennylew @uoi.com.sg)
Sent: Thursday, 9 May 2019 11:25 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @|kkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKT3413L- UOI OD

Dear Shirley,

Please submit the report to us.



Thanks.

Warmest Regards
Jenny Lew

Claims Division
United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleal Tower, Singapore 075509
Main « (85} 8222 7733 | DID « (65) 5490 9320 | Fax « (65) 6327 3869 | Emall « jennylew@usl.com sg

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained. shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOEB Group.

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 9:49 AM

To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKT3413L- UDI QD

Hi lenny,

Can we submit our report accordingly?

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkayto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com)
Sent: Thursday, 2 May 2019 11:06 AM

To: "LEW JENNY' <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SKT3413L- UOI OD

Dear Jenny,

Enclosed photos.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax; 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 May 2019 10:32 AM
To: 'LEW JENMNY"

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: 5KT3413L- UOI OD
Attachments: EST.pdf; PRELI REVISED.pdf
Dear Jenny,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKT 3413L
Date of survey: 29/4/2019

We have Not authorise repair.
Vehicle recommended Total Loss.

Kindly provides us claim number,

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler on behalf of Shirley

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 1:04 PM

To: 'LEW IENNY' <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SKT3413L- UDI OD

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assipnments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)



From: LEW JENNY [mailto:jennylew@uoi.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 11:49 AM

To: Goh Edmund (VGS - SG/Singapore) <edmund.goh@vw.com.sg>; sur@Ilkkauto.com: assignments@Ikkauto.com
Cc: Wong Meiy (VGS - SG/Singapore) <meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - 5G/Singapore)
<Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>; Kong Charmaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) <charmaine. kong@vw.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SKT3413L- UOI 0D

Dear Edmund,

We will appoint LKK to conduct the survey.

Dear Catherine,

Please arrange to survey the vehicle at Volkswagen @ Alexandra.
Excess: S3750.00

Warmest Regards
Jenny Lew

Claims Division

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Foad, #28-01 Springleaf Tower, Singapore 079500
Main = (85) 6222 7733 | OID « (65) 8490 9328 | Fax + (B5) 6327 3868 | Emall « jannyviewiEuol.com s |

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended recipient,
please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed, neither UOB
nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily represent the
opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: Goh Edmund (VGS - 5G/Singapore) [mailto:edmund.goh@vw.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 11:23 AM

To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.se>

Cc: Wong Meiy (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - SG/Singapore)
<Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>; Kong Charmaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) <charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg>
Subject: SKT2413L- UOI OD

Dear lenny,

Please find attached for the repair estimate for this vehicle. Kindly forward this mail to your colleagues if you are not in
charge for this case.

Sorry for any inconvenience caused.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Edmund Goh
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales



Wolkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934

Direct line: +65 8305 7133
Main Line: +65 6305 7299
Main Fax:  +65 6474 3643
edmund.goh@vw.com.sg
http:/fwenw v Ccom.sa

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
) WWW.avg.com



!' I’_.f F! Auto

o S e Consu/tants
i =B B Pie Lrd Company Registration No. 16060T198R
1 UBLAVE 1 #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE J08933 TEL @ (0651 62563561 FAX : (651 62564315
Your ref’: FLEASE ADVISED
Our ref: CS/UONI900T492/R15d3 Date:2/5/2019

The Motor Claims Department
M/s UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SKT 3413L

We thank you for your instruction on 29/4/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

29/4/2019 at the premises of M/s VOLKSWAGEN GROUFP SINGAPORE PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ¢ 5540,000,00
Revised Estimate Amount : S$TOTAL LOSS
"Check” ltems Amount ]

Total : 5%

Market Value : §%56,000.00
LTA Reimbursement Value : 55347,737.00
MNett Value : 558,263.00

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear n/s portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent
Repair Cost Not Economical

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL
Automotive Assessor
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MEBHH 1905 TES-01 | Ady Mars Pie LAz - Buiol Nergh
ENTRY DATE & TIME 2200452018 1557

ELBMTTED BY Sabita Shange Santhingan

Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 25/04/2019 06:16

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report Cormecl y the delaits of the accidan o Speed up the clams proceds,

2 This Form rmust be complated by the Policyhalder andlor the Autharisad Driver.

A Infarmaticn provided musl e es ruthful and socurale as possible Any wilful misrepresentalion or withalding of material facts may allow insurance companias o

rapudiale palicy Lably

4 The issue end acceptance af this Form by insurance comoarses ts nol an admission of palicy kabilkty on the part of e NSurance comoanias
5. Any false reporting may be refarred to the Police for immestigation.

B This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Cenire establishad by the General Ingurance Association of Sngapore (GIA) for
archwving and 1hat copies of thes repart will, for a lee, be made available upon applicaton by intaresied partas

T

aforesaid.

By me Indgement of this repart o the insurers, you hereby consanl io the archiv nig af 1hit report &t the cantre and o copaes of tha report beng made availablo

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date OF Accident
Exact Localion Of Accident

Country/State af Lass

230472019 19:57
22104/2019 18:45

ALOMG HENDERSON ROAD
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Numbar
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Qwner
NRIC Mo

Email Address

Mobile Phone Mo

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Madel

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being usad at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insuranca palicy
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state aclion to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Poiicy

Policy Number

Cover Nate Number

Driver

Mame of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Dcoupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experlence

Gender

Maobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SKTa413L

CHOY KUM YUEN
512511308
JESNIGEL@GMAIL.COM
(LOCAL) +65-96322432
OFFICE-96322432

VOLKSWAGEMN
JETTA GP 1.4 TSI 80

PRIVATE USE

YES

PRIVATE CAR

UMITED OVERSEAS INSURAMCE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

N

DHOM1 20034671800

M

CHOY KUM YUEN
512511308

06/05/1957

INDOOR

16/1071978

40 YEARS AND 6 MONTHS
MALE

[LOCAL) +65-96322432

QOFFICE-26322432
JESNIGEL@GMAIL. COM
Page 1 of 19




Address MNA
Posicode

Was driver an emplayee of the Insurad's Company NO

If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured  OWNER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
ehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type OF Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Mumber of vehicles (including own vehizle)

invalved in the accident :
Was any body Injurad in the Aceident? N
Was any injured conveyec ta hospital by MO
ambulance?

Was any other matenal or property damaged? YES
| h?ua i:uelen approached by unknown person(s) ND)
soliciting/offering accident elaims assistance

MNumber of Passengers (Including Drivar) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reporled to the palice? NO
If ¥Yes.Please stale which Police Station

Was natice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If Yes,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

| was travelling alang HENDERSOMN ROAD TOWARDS KEFPEL ROAD IT WAS A 2 LANE TRAFFIC AND MY VEHICLE
SKT3413L WAS POSITIONED IN THE LEFT SIDE OF THE LANE SUDDENLY VEHICLE SLNG342H COLLIDED ONTO MY
VEHICLE SKT3413L REAR. NO INJURIES INVOLVED.,

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for atlachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO
Was there any audio recorded? KO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Mumber SLME342H
Wahicle Make/Model/Colour VOLVOA40 T2(A)
Details Of Properies MA,

Vehicle Categary PRIVATE CAR

MWame of Driver

NRIC/Passpor Mumbear

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Mame

Mature Of Damage

No. OF Passenger (Including Driver)

WEE JIN WEI, CHRISTOPHER
S7501292F
6906562

Page 2ol 18
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Common Statement Pg. 1

ACCIDENT STATEMENT (2000 characters)

SKT3413L REAR. NO INJURIES INVOLVED.

| was travelling along HENDERSON ROAD TOWARDS KEPPEL ROAD IT WAS A 2
LANE TRAFFIC AND MY VEHICLE SKT3413L WAS POSITIONED IN THE LEFT SIDE
|[OF THE LANE SUDDENLY VEHICLE SLN6342H COLLIDED ONTO MY VEHICLE

Taxi Voucher Mo

DECLARATION

I’'We declare thal the above particulars & information prowided above are frue in every aspect

VERIFIED BY AJAX MARS REPCRTING OFFICER -
MOHAMED SAIFULLAH S0 SYED MASDOD

MARS Officer

Regstensd Owner or Driver's Signature

Job Compéete Date/Time DataTime:

23 April 2018 at 2:50 PM

23 April 2019 at 2:59 PM

Page 4 of 19




> Back to OneMotoring

1Ertquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Cremner 1D Type:

Creener 1D

Wehicle Details
Wehicle Mo

Vehicle to e Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Vehiche Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine Mo

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date;
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Pald:
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Categary.

COE PeriadiYears):

QP Paid;

COE Rebate Amount

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 23 Apr 2019

OK

R R L T T T

Singapore MRIC
11308

SKT3413L

Mo

30 Apr 2019
VOLKSWAGEN
JETTAGP 1.4 TSI 20 A/T HL 163465
Black

2014

CAXF 18955
WVWEZZZ16ZFMO02221
20.0 kW {120 bhp)
$19,614.00

02 Jun 2015

02 Jun 2015

0

$%.614.00

Yes
01 Jun 2025
$7.210,00

01 Jun 2025

A-Carup to 1600cc & 97kW {130bhp)
10

$66,590.00

$40,527.00

$47,737.00

S’(f,wu
©1,737

g,20%
/7"

EERS 0 wa . v e g seear v o Em i 1 gt 150 B v 1 LA L 2l 0 BT AL T 1 W0 W 4 B AF I P —1 irr i d b

il



EMAIL

Sabitra
“
From: Kum Yuen Choy «jesnigel@gmail com»

Sent: Wednesday, 24 April, 2019 9:26 PM

To: Sabitra

Cc: group@aasmars.com; edmund gohvw.com sg

Subject: Re: GIA Report - SKT3413L

Hi. Under the actson to be taken. 1 had given instruction to vw the repairer that i will be claiming my own
msurance instead of third party. | had also spoke to voi jeany regarding this.

Choy

On Wed, 24 Apr 2019. 05:03 Sabitra. <sabitra@ ajaxmars con> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please find attached file, the GIA Accident Report for your perusal.

Kindly ignore, If you find the statement, "Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting’ found on the
right top corner of the report.

muu-mmmw:aummuﬂdmwmmamuum“m:mm
reported your accident to the insurer which is within 24 hours from the time of accident as required
under the Motor Claims Framework (MCF).

If you require any further clarification on the matter, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6333 2222,

Thank You.

Mobile Accident Response Service (MARS)
Tel: 6333 2222

Page 5 of 18



Accident Photo
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Accident Photo
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Accident Photo
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Accident Photo
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Accident Photo
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Identification Card
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Addendum Sheet

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF $INGAPORE RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Waies sy 018 00 Smgapnes 4R5E0

Tl jihi G220 000 Faw j&%) G224 O0MO

g ity tionary, Miarschary to Priglasy, (900D - } P 000

BECONDR, bl ¥ CTwTey A EASAROIE | AT Ry fen  MASGGENE FT I

IMPORTANT NOTE: Please submit the completed Addendum form to the same Authorised Reporting Centre
with whom you submitted the Original Report.

ADDENDUM
[A) PARTICULARS OF PERSON MAKING THE AMENDMENTS:
Original ReportNo . MBHH13052783 Vehicle Registration No: S 13413L
NEmen o naxc) : CHOY KUM YUEN NRIC/FIN/PassportNo - 512511308
("Vehicle Driver / Vehicle Owner) (*) Please delete as appropriate
Acdress 1 Singapore( )
Contact (Tel) Mobile No. ;96322432
Email Address fesngei@gma com
Date of Accident 22042018 Time of Accident - _18:45

Place of Accident < ALONG HENDERSON ROAD

(B) ADDITIONALINFORMATION / AMENDMENTS:

I have made a report on the above mentioned accident and would like to include additional information or
make the following amendments:

AMEND 3AD PARTY CLAIM TO OD CLAIM

Policyholder | Driver's Signature Reporting Centre Personnel's Signature
Date:
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Repair Estimate
27 April 2019
Attention: Motor Claims Department
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs,

RE: VEHILCE NO.: 5KT3413L

CHASSIS NO.: WYWZZZ16ZFMO02221
MODEL: JETTA

After inspection of the above vehicle, the vehicle sustained badly damaged to rear
portion , chasis misaligned , undercarrige affected, exhaust pipe damage
Cost of repair for the vehicle is approximately above 540,000 before GST.

Please conduct the survey at no; 247 Alexandara Singapore

Please advise us accordingly.

NB. THIS IS ONLY AN ESTIMATE AND SHOULD ADDITIONAL WORK BE FOUND
NECESSARY TO BE CARRIED OUT IN THE COURSE OF REPAIRS,

EXTRA MATERIAL AND LABOUR COST WILL BE CHARGED ACCORDINGLY WHICH

HOWEVER YOU WILL BE INFORMED PRIOR TO ACTION TAKEN. PARTS PRICES ARE
SUBJECT TO CHANGES.

3 ‘LQ\
Yours faithfully, %WL?'EG( on '}‘?AY/'(J,

L Cuick)
Pearlyn Cheong
9236-1336 / 6305-7288

Torac Lov3



Auto
Consultants

Pte Lid Company Registration MNo. 199607188R

51 UBI AVE 1, #01/02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: (065) 6256 3561 FAX: (065) 6256 4315

Your Ref : MI12D10471905 Date: 14™ May 2019

Our Ref : CS/UOI19007492/R1s5d3s2

M/s United Overseas Insurance Ltd
3 Anson Road #28-01

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

(The Motor Claims Department)

Dear Sir/Madam,

AUTOMOBILE INSPECTION REPORT OF ACCIDENT VEHICLE SKT 3413L
ACCIDENT ON 22.04.2019

Instruction was received to inspect the vehicle Reg. No. SKT 3413L. The inspection was
conducted on 29/04/2019 at the premises of M/s Volkswagen Centre Singapore, 247
Alexandra Road Singapore 159934,

The following information was recorded: -

Registration Number : SKT 3413L

Make & Model : Volkswagen Jetta 1.4 TSI
Year of Registration 12015

Engine Capacity : 1390 cc

Body Colour : Black

Chassis Number s WVWZZZ16ZFM002221
Speedometer Reading : 59155 km

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear n/s portion. The estimate repair cost of such
vehicle is $40,000.00 (Sin Dollars: Forty Thousand only) (Details see photographs
enclosed).



Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd Eumpcan}r Registration No. 199607 198R

S1 UBIAVE L, #01702-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408033 TEL: (D65) 6256 3561 FAX: 1565} 6256 4315

In view of this repair work, we are of the opinion that it would be uneconomical to proceed with the repairs
and recommend it’s to be written off as “Total Loss”,

{a) Ilthe vehicle 1o be “Total Loss™
Market Value

8% 56,000.00
Lesy: LTA Reimbursement Value (RV) (8% 47,737.00)
S5 8,263.00
Less: Excess (5% 750007
Mett Liability
5§ 7.513.00
(b} If the vehicle 1o be “Repair™
Repair Cost 5% 40,000.00
Less:Excess (S5 750.00)
Nett Liability
5% 39.250.00
(@) - (b) = (S8 31,737.00)

I L e

The amount of estimated saving of $831,737.00 if the vehicle to be written off as “Total Loss™ instead of to
be repair.

Vehicle Inspected By:

MEp

MOHD. RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS
AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAL-A M MATA!

Autcmotive Assessor

A

KEKLAY |V

MSefEng ML B Eng{Hons), PengiUK)
MASME(USA), B Bus(Aust), MBA(UK),

TEng(UK), MITE{mech), MinstAEA, MFIEA,

MIRTE, MIMI MSAE MCIArd, AM NITAAR{TUSA),
AM CATARNCAN) M MATAUSA), M MAATAUSA),
Licensed Apprairer

DISCLAIMER QF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named
on the front page of this Report. No liability or responsibility whatsoever, in contract or tort, is accepted to any third party
wha may rely on the Report wholly or in part. Any third party acting orf relying on this Report, in whole or in part, does so at
his or her own risk,




