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Premiioam € arnr s

Co Reg Mo:201416720C

1 Bl Bukit Sve 8 801-60 Autobey@ikail Bulit Sngapone 417883

Tel &6538 0100 Fax GG S113
Date ; 26/04/2019

EQ Insurance Compnay Lid

5 Mawwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block, MND Complex
Singapore 069110

TO:

Geue

Attn ;
Fax : 6224 3903

Our Customer :
Vehicle No :
Model :
Manufacture Year :
Date of Accident :

Chung kwang Nam
SKUZ611H

Pasche Panamera
2011

25/4/201%

Total Estimate Repair Days I
Total Pages

WPo 722972¢L 0005 19,

Motor Claims Department

Re: Repair Estimate For Third Party Claim against SMABSE1H

No. Item Descriptions Qty Unit Price
A Spare Parts
I Rear bumper  Toww 1 53,300.00|
F] Rear bumper side refainer RH AL 1 $665.00
i Rear sports rim AH  JF i 1 53,600.00
[} Rear fender IH 7= 1 repair
g Talllamp RH 4., 1 51,900.00
% - Total
§ Less 10%
:'-7?6'2) LSS Sub Total 1
A~
B. Spare Parts {5/Nett)
1 Rear bumper sticker wrap 1 $1.200.00 .
2 Rear fender sticker wrap = »ad =~ 1 51,500.00 51,500,00|
3 Rear tyre RH T~ 1 $750.00 5750.00].+
4 Rear bumper clip K= 10 510.00 S100.08] 50 m '
Sub-Total 2 53,550.00
Total for Parts $12,068.50
C Labour
i o check wiring S50087 5
Panel beating charges to remove and replace. to cut and weld, to g - 26D
‘ knock and reshape damaged parts & areas. SQM )
3 Spray painting all afected parts & areas. T 20U
4 To check wheels with computenzed wheel alignment SIS0.00| ~ |
5 To spray anti-rust undercoat. 530.00] %
5 gi | Totol Labour 51,230.00
1"
Total Repair Cost $13,298.50
Adny. (-
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

ELITE AUTOPLAN PRIVATE VEHICLE

Hame of Pollcyholder : CHUNG KWANG NAM [ZHUANG GUANGNAN) Vahicle No. : SKLU2611H
Period of Insurance : 16 Aug 2018 To 18 Sep 2018 Palicy No. : 1800085581
Engine No. : CO1450 Endorsemant No. @ 000000000283511
Chassis No. : WPOZZZoT2ZCLO0051G lssued Date : 08 Mar 2019
| MakeModel PORSCHE PANAMERA

Engine CapacityTonnage & 3,605.00 CC Sum Insured . Markst Value Firal Year of Registraton  © 2011

| Diriver Restnotion M Off Peak Car - No ineunng with COEPARF  © Yes
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From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 4:58 PM

To: Aunteng

Subject: RE: Your ref: SMAG861H  Our ref: 0379/SKU2611H/TP/PC/0419

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Aun Teng,

We accept global sum $3800.00 (all-in) as proposed,

Kindly note that no DV is required for settlement less than 20K.
We shall proceed to close the case at our end.

Thanks

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of llability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any ather related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer In any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents an demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-] by the Plaintifl/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlemeant sum."

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6746-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(308933)

¥ ESES o
RES RSB mm Sowe bhe Earthe Print only when pecessary:

From: Aunteng [mailto:aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 2:07 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auta) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your ref: SMAG6B61H Qur ref: 0379/5KU2611H/TP/PC/0419

Dear Cecilia
We propose global sum $3800.00 to conclude claim.
Regards

Aun Teng
Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd



Tel: 6636 9100 Fax: 6636 9113
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@|kkauto.com>
Sent: 08 August 2019 13:47:23

To: Aunteng <aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Your ref: SMAG861H Our ref: 0379/5KU2611H/TP/PC/0419

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Aun Teng,

We are pleased to offer global sum of $3680.00 (all-in).
Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thanks

“Please note that our above settlement |s made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) In respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made ta this offer
ar any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters,

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintif/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @ lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

I B 74 7
L

Save the Lorth: Frint only when necessary

From: Aunteng [mailto:aunteng@premiumecarz.com.sg)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July 2019 11:13 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <Cecili lkkauto.com>
Subject: Your ref: SMA6861H Our ref: 0379/SKU2611H/TP/PC/0419
Dear Sir/Madam

Refer to the above reference number.

Attached LOD for your necessary action.

Regards



Aun Teng

Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6636 9100 Fax: 6636 9113
1 Kakl Bukit Avenue B

#01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Joel Goh <josl goh@eqinsurance.com sg >

Sent: Tuecday, 30 April 2019 847 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A, Joy lrene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE Direct Settlement - Accident involving SMAGBETH (O : EQI - TBA) AND SKU2611H
(TP - LEK REF - CCE/EQIT2007427/1b3) on 25.04.2019

Attachments: SMABBETH.PDF

Dear Shu Pei

Attached our insured’s accident repart for your attention
Best Regards,

loel Goh

=Y

EQ Insurance Company Limited

[Cry |

el el Fan

From: Shu Pey (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com |

Sent: Friday, Apnl 26, 2019 5:29 PM

To: EQI PRS; Joel Gah; Janet Tan

Cc: Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAUtD)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMAG861H (OI : EQI - TBA) AND SKU2611H (TP : LKK REF -
CCE/EQILI9007427/1b3) on 25.04.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear joel / Janet,
We refer to the above matter.

We have received a new assignment from M/s Premium Carz Services Pte Lud and TP repairer proposed for a
direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is.
TP's GIA report



Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792

Thank you.

Bt Reg ards,

Shu Pell Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone 3660055 | emall: dhyge sk subo com | o 67412108

BN 51, Pova LIb) Inclustriol Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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[ Premium Cary
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Co Heg Moo Mld|aTHNH
| Wk Bkt Ave &m0 590 Amobey ol Kaki Bukn Smgapore 41 THES
fel polavlif Fax ohIGSI1D

Date : 30072009

Your Ref : SMABE61H
Dur Ref :0379/5KU2611H/TR/PC/0419

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
5 Muxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block, MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Attn : Motor Claims Dept.

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU2611H & SMAG861H ON 25/04/2019 ALONG PAYAR
LEBAR ROAD

We refer 1o the above accident.

The nccident was caused solely by the negligence of vour insured and as a result. we had
Incurred the following Costs and Losses: -

Costs of Repair (Lump Sum) § 3.200.00
Loss of Use (4 days at $180/day) $ 720.00
LTA TP Search Fee 45
Claimed Amount § 3,927.45

Enclosed are the supporting documents for vour perusal:
Invoice 0379

LTA Tax Invoice/Receipt

Centificate of Insurance

Satisfaction Voucher

Letter of Authority and Indemnity

1 =

Please let us hear from you within the next 14 days,

Yours Fa(i:tqﬁlv

PREMIUM CARZ SERVICES PTE LTD




31 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408033 TEL : (065) 62563361 FAX : (065) 62364315

Our Ref: CC4/EQI19007427/Agb3
26 JUNE 2019

BHASKARAN PRAMCHANDRAN
149 CEYLON ROAD
SINGAPORE 429711

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA 6861H AND SKU 2611H ON 25/04/2019

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster
Company by your Motor Insurer (EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED) to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy
taken up with them.

This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SKU 261 I H.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CECILIA CHONG

Case Handler

DID: 6749 4274

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: ceciliachong@lkkauto.com

ce. EQINSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Moror Claims Dept)
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Co Reg, No- 2014167200 _
1 ki Bk A @ #0100 Aulobay @k akl Bukit Singapone 417853
Tol GEM8 0100 Fax 6838 9113

LETTER OF AUTHORITY AND INDEMNITY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO, SKULLULH  axp St 682 IH
AT/ALONG _ PANY Lewve. eoi()

ON

25 pay APEAL  monTH 20\4 YEAR

ajl

b

(1

d)

el

gl

hi

I'We, the owner of vehicle na 5[“'.*1"&'“ H herehy insroct and authorize you 10 commenoe
repair 1o the said vehicles

You sre further authorized 10 appoim solichiors on my/our belll’ and give the solichors ull
instructions as il the appoibtment are given by meius with respect o the conduct of my'our ¢laims
against third party driver and‘or his insurers including if necessary. 1o commence legul proceedings in
Court in my/our name against the third pary.

You have myfour full suthority 1o instruct myiour soliclions to negotiale @ settlement with the thind
party andior his insurers on such terms as you deem (L Upon settlement of my claim, you are
duthorized o sign any Discharge Voucher or any document to confiom my seceptance ol the settlement
as full and final discharge of my claim, on my behalf,

Lipern resolving miyfour elaim, you are suthorized o agree with myiour solicitors on the smount of their
professivnal cost and disbursements for acting for me/us and 1o relleve payment of the balance of the
sciilement sum on my/our behalldirectly into vour sceount,

In the event that. 'we amiare required o attend of my/our solicilors” office or 1o stiend court n
cannection to myour claim, 1we shall render (ull co-operation

In the event that my/our claim again the third party andior his insurers is Not successful or cannot be
procecded with, Fwe authorized you 1 make o clalm against my/our own insurers for the cost of
repairs and any other losses recoveruble under my our polley of insurance. In this respects. liwe
understand and accept that the excess wrmount applicuble under the pulicy of Insurunce shall be borme
by medus. Vwe shall also be personally lisble vo bear all legal cost incarred by you in claiming back for
the repair cost by your Suliciors.

I fior whatever reusons, my/our insurers reject my four elaim for indemnity for the cos ol repairs andor
iy looses recoversble under the policy of insurance or make uny offer o pay less than the amount
claimed by you, Vwe agree 1o undertake 1 pay the full amount of vour repair bill and surves fees and
any wiher expenses reasonubly incurred on myour behall o W pay vou the difference in amount. as the
case may be.

Liwe have read and understand the sbove statement and agreed.

Dated this 'Ls day ﬂ'FRlL- month wlq venr

Signature : M""

Name : Clyns ' kwana Maw Company Stamp

NRIC/ROC No.  : JSE'E'*-ES"jqqg

Address : Bl U4LS Tampes ST Y e
# ok-Yco)

Sthgupo- 511




.
'/I}I cmmium C arzs r INVOICE: 0379 ]

Ser s lces Pre Lo
Co Reg No 201416720C
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-80 Autobay@lKaki Bukit Singapore 417883
Tel 6535 9100 Fax: 6636 9113

Date © 3000772009

Bill To
EQ Insurance Company Ltd
5 Maxwell Road
#]7-00 Tower Block, MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Our Customer

Name : Chung Kwang Nam Vehicle No : SKUZo11H

IC No . SES45540F Date of Accident : 25/04/2019

Address : Blk 4235 Tampines Street 41 Model : Porsche Pannmera
#06-401
Singapore 520425

No. Qty  |Unit Price] Amount
I To supply labour and materials to repair the above-mentioned ! . $3.200.00

vehicle to its pre-accident condition (Lump Sum)

TOTAL| $3,200,00

For Premium Carz Services Pre Lid

* All cheque should be crossed and make payable to "Premium Carz Services Pre Lid"



4282019

» Back to OneMotoring

L Travvspon Authonty
10 S Mingg Do
Singapore STET01
G551 Registration: No, - M4-0008529-2
Print Db Tlerse 28 Ant 2010 1 094514
Qeceipl Diste/Thne © 26 Bpe 2010 1 (94514
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Aecegi No, - ITHET-COD00- 1 504 20- DI
Prirvous Recaipt Mo
SIN Iem Description) Amouint G5ST  Amount
Business Transaction Relerence Before Amount Afer GST
No. GST(5%) {S%) (5%)

Rosull of irsumnce Enguiry - SMABEETH

As ot 25 Apr 2019150900

kmurance Cu. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

' Irsurmnce Erguiry - SMABSE 1H
ﬁmﬂ'r?- bl i fan T.aN
£01 808 ZA0R4 1 5T 2RERY

Subr-Total 7.00 (R0 TAN
Total Bolors Houndiag .00 AN TAu
Rounding Oifference .04
Total Amount Payable 745
Faic By
TS i

TR 0RATTION I[;mm ‘NE: . 7.45
Tl T.45
Cash Changs 0o
Trwchorens Agrmsinil T
Esress Rorunoanin Senoun| 0o

THANK YO AND HAVE A& NICE DAY

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider | financial institution. Otherwise, the iransaction and receipt 1s considered void and iate fos
My MRy

Fifips.. e 0l P TRt e T B b e R B B e d

1|



Ptw Lid Campany Registration No, 19860T198R

S50 AVE L, #02-25 PAYA UKL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (0651 61563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 20/08/2019

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

T S SMA 6861H {Insd Veh) |Your Ref Nf" . DMPPHWQ18-007484
' SKU 2611H (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CCB/EQI18007427/Agb3q2
Date of Accident 25/4/2019
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost s 3,200.00
Loss of Use 5 600.00 4 days
Rental (If any) '8 - - days
Others: g 7.45
s S —

3,807.45
Final Settiement Sum |: § 3,800.00 |[GLOBAL SUM
Remarks - S =
Payment | ion; 's a
1) |PREMIUM CARZ SERVICES FTELTD .1 3,800.00
JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




1 74 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

P 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

e
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Aeg Mo 198607188R GST Reg. No. 19-8807186-R

AHlliatod to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblie

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCB/EQI18007427/Agb3q2
S ot o | ICATRNER
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 20-08-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
13 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SMA 8881H Veh. Inspected SKU 2611H
Policy No. DMPPHWQ 18-007484 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 29/04/2016
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model PORSCHE PANAMERA ce 1805
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 201
Chassis No. WPOZZZ97ZCL000518 Colour RED
Odometer 858583 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOGoD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[285/40R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre [285/40 R19 MICHELIN B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[285/40R18 MICHELIN 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |285/40 R10 MICHELIN B mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE QIS BODY
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  25/04/201% Inspection Date 29/04/2019
Survey held at PREMIUM CARZ SERVICES PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 8
#01-00 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a, Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days




’ V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

S A 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg, No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607158-R Page No. 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKU 2611H
. 1k Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition |8 e o] (&
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMFER TORN 3,300.00 2,850.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH NECESSARY 665.00 121.00
1|REAR SPORTS RIM RH NOT NECESSARY 3.600.00
1|REAR FENDER RH (NPA) NOT NECESSARY -
1|TAIL LAMP RH NOT NECESSARY 1,800.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -846.50 -307.10
B,518.50 2,7683.90
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER STICKER W/RAP (SN) TORN 1,200.00 600.00
1|REAR FENDER STICKER WRAP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 1,500.00
1|REAR TYRE RH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 750.00
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP @310.00 (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 50.00
3,550.00 650.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. 50.00 30.00
PANEL BEATING CHARGES TO REMOVE AND 400.00 250.00
REPLACE ,TO CUT AND WELD ,TO KNOCK AND
RESHAPE DAMAGED PARTS & AREAS
TO CHECK WHEELS WITH COMPUTERIZED WHEEL NOT NECESSARY 150.00
ALIGNMENT
TO SPRAY ANTI-RUST UNDERCOAT NOT NECESSARY 30.00 =
SPRAY PAINTING ALL AFFECTED PARTS & AREAS 600.00 300.00
1,230.00 580.00
GRAND TOTAL 13,298.50 3,993.90
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS J 3,200.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Repaort Ref No. CCB/EQI18007427/Agb3g2

Py é f‘g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is mada solely for ihe use and benaelii of Me Client named on the frenl page of ihke Repe




Joanne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Joanne Lea (LKK Auto) <report@Ikkauto.coms>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 August 2019 405 PM

To: ‘eqiprs@eqinsurance.com.sg’

Ce: 'CecillaChong@lkkauto.cam'’

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMA 6861H (Ol) and SKU 2611H (TP) an
25/04/2019

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf; TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT .pdf

Dear SiMadom,
Mense be informed that the above-mentioned case had been setiled.
Enclose herewith final report & relevant documenis for your necessary action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

IOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email; report@®lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933



