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REF:

Buwwgoe Bae 2y [ B4
| ASSIL
From i 15590 9
EslInE;_LFd Cost
D[_IJ{T_P f.j'ﬁ;;ITF RES / OD RES [ EVA 1INV MV
To Inspect Vehicle No: Q) 2AERT
at Workshap mis ]:-i'l" \|J1-.JL
of hnLL e cdrﬂ_ kL\; R{.\ \1;: Tes 24
Insured:
Policy Mo
Claims No,
Sum Insured; Excess:
(Clianls Record)
Make of Veh,
(Policy Condition)
Remark: The veh had commenced its NS | 08
repair at the time of inspection, e
Bal. or Market Value: 8 20k e
IDAC Accident Rport: Consistent? : Yes or No
GlA | PR Seen; Cansisten!? : Yes or No
Est. Repairs: days  Res. Yes or No
Lum Sum; % 3Val: Yes or No
Iy Ll
CA | REV | REP. | 24 HRS T M :

Vehicle: IN1OUT

Drate: Parson Conlacled:

sNMENT
Val Mo, $\c 4] K[gsT W1 Reqn: 27 Mov 2001
Type: MG [ M.Cycle | Bus | Van | Lorry | Taxi | Prime Mover |

Truck [ Trailer or
Make: T{il('-_d- fil 4, tig ce {59¢
Colour Ceold AIC: Insured | Std | NI [ NA
SpReading 34271 '];_!, Tiadio Insured | Std 1 NI HA
Eng/Mo: s
Gilo: MR 0522E ¢ 107158900

Gen Cond: Gogd | Fair | Poor | Burnt

Steering: Inﬁ%r [ Jammed ! Leaked | Burnt or
Inorder | Jammed | Leaked | Burnt ar
Nil (/RIm | STD ARRim or

e (£S ] 1o Ry

R: .
BS /! DUN / EXNOVA | GY IFS1 LEAIMICIDHTEU&PIRJEUMH

Braske:
Modi

Tyre Size!

—

TOYOIYOKO of  Flvenze
Eront Rear

.| R/Bal. [; m H.flEIrii. f mm
LBl ¢ in L/Bal £ mm
D.OA ‘H(Ii DOl tg,"‘;/{ﬁ‘
Survey held al L'Dr\l g@vql

Des. of Damages : Fri Fﬁ@ {ois | LIIS | UIC | Reoftop of

The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affected due to collision.

Gate / Time | Aclion / Insiruction

- | pv-§o0000 Mv - ¢ 20,00 45199
| Py- ﬁm%nl LTA -—} 14, Eau"" fﬂtﬂ‘ $
— | BV=R5198 RECEIY uellnr
(odinad Lls Y200k of i 2\\5’\11115’\
C4gi1. 20330 Bod — 204D
DataiTime, Fie Pass jo? EI: Prali. Report Days Of Repair: ‘_,5./’
1 Tiia, ; IZ: Final Report Resurvey No. of Trip: 2 Survey Fee! 150
DialerTime, File Return w? { Transpartation Sﬂ
2 Add Fee: - Site Ingp (3 j|__S+RS, 8 Su1t40
E]: Interview (3 i Prioios 52
Report Format ; [ ] rech nvs 8 ) Gilers _
Lump Sum / LB.L (& .'.'J,:,tm?/_ 1_;"‘5_ ) D; Weekend ($ ) |:
- FOTAl 412
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o osa mam m Pte Lid Company Registration No. 199607138R

21 I AV 1, #0225 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAFORE A0%933 TEL: (068) 62563561 FAX {065} 6250405

Your Ref: D19002463MFESH Date:; 17 May 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19007342/Jsd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Lid

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SKQ 3985T .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 15/05/2019 at the premises of M/s Long Sheng Motor Service and have the following
to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 5% 3,580.53
Revised Estimate Amount ;5% 3.818.02
“Check” Items Amount t 8%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value 8%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 5 Days

Yours faithfully,
Ong Hwee lie
Automotive Assessor



MS@FirstCapital

MS First Capital Insurance Limited (o#eg bio 1950000060 CST Reg Mo H2-D001676-0
6 Raflles Quay #21-00 Singapone D4B5E0
Tel: {E5) 6222 2311 Faw |65) 6227 3547

Claims & Mo Underwiliing Dept: 35 Robinson Road FLE-D1 City House Singapare DBBETT
Tek {65] 6507 3848 Fax (65} 6507 3845
www, msfirsteapitaloom.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
11-04-2018 QOur Ref No. D19002463MFSH
01-04-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC1127E Third Party Vehicle. SKQ3585T

BLK 6 NO. 399-G WOODLANDS ROADYEW TEE INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
MISS WOON

67639733/ 0 Fax No. 67639866

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MNA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

LONG SHENG MOTOR

Attention. MIL
SERVICE
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Lung Shena Motor Service

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: 09 May 2019 12:56

To: Ismstyc@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Joanne Yong Lai fong; CWS Motor Claims

Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST : FC REF: SHC1127B. (D19002463MFSH) & TP REF: SKQ3985T.

(SKQ3985T) ACCIDENT ON 01-04-2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

We wish to state that we are agreeable to WITHOUT PREJUDICE — admit liability with quantum to be agreed.
Kindly liaise with our surveyor accordingly.

Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Limited

From: Long Sheng Motor Service [mailto:lsmstyc@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, April 30, 2019 12:23 PM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST : FC REF: SHC1127B. (D19002463MFSH) & TP REF: SKQ3985T. (SKQ3985T) ACCIDENT ON
01-04-2019

Dear Claim Department,

May we know your insured already report this accident to your company or not?

If reported already may we know how many liability for this case?

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Miss Woon



SMTR019

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Crwner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Viehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Na.:

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Flease note that the S-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Business

0700C

SKQ3985T

Mo

17 May 2019

TOYOTA

COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 AUTO
Beige

2007

3ZZaT13137
MRO53ZEC107158900
BLOKW (108 bhp)
$14,795.00

27 Nov 2007

27 Mow 2007

3

$16,275.00

Forfeited

$0.00

26 Mov 2022

A - Car (1600cc & below)
5

$20,997.00

$14.802.00

$14,802.00

vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 May 2019

OK

NS VTLITE. Gov, g/ Iarvivacuon/enguire repaesyHUCICEEToreLeregInpuL/ FUNL BAN_IU=FUduauUd |

1l



Shirlﬂf Hiew iLI{I{ Auto)

# —= == — ————
From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 2:04 PM
Tao: '‘Joanne Yong Lai fong'; "CWS Motor Claims’
Cc: assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuta)
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002463MFSH/1
Attachments: SKQ 3985T - Preli Advise .pdf

Dear loanne,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKQ 3985T.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 17 April 2019 8:23 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'loanne Yong Lai fong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002463MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment,

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailtu:cwsrnntnrcl:aims@msf'trstcapir.al.com.sg}

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 9:35 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong Lai fong
<Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D15002463MFSH/1



Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CW5S within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CW5 for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.aVE.com




Teansfer Of Ownership

Pawe |.0f 2

Transfer Of Vehicle Ownership (Acknowledgement)

Vehicle Details
Nehiclalo:
Vehitcle Type:
wehicke Malke:
Chassis G

Mator Mo

Fropeliant:
Enging Capacitwv:
Unladen Weight:
Primary Colour:
I Label No.:

First Registration
Date:
tManufacturing
Year:

PARF Elisibility:.

Mo, of Transfer:

N15- FPassenzer (Col
Company Car (Single Rate}
TOYTTA

Viahicie Schems

Yehicle Modsl:
MROSZZEC107153900 Engiiia Nai:

Trailer Chassis

Mo

Petrol F‘335er_|ger
Capacity;

1598 ¢ce Power Rating:
Fa=imum Laden

E

tHske Weight:

Beigs Secondary Colouw
WER Power

1124473389 TR
Cutput:

27 Nov 2007 e
Registration Date:

2007 Open Market
Value:

Vs Minirmum PARF
Benefit:

3 Actual ARF Paid:

Owner Particulars

Crwiner Name:
Ohwner 1D Type:

Ormier 101
Registerad
Address Type:
Fegistered
Block/House Moz
Pegisterad Street
Wame:
Registered Unit

[ [

Hezizterad
Euilding Mame:
Fagistared Postal
Code:

COE MolErplry

fizt=:

LIP FONG RENMOWATION SERVICES
Busingss
43370700C

HDE /HUDC

44

BENDEMEER ROAD

#01-1468

COEBIHCatigaryA - Car (14060 & balow)

POF Paid:

PivmEa Mtalimb ol Maoamar sl mliasrtariion olesTe A nptl T mm Py drd 05T TR

[ Y |

£20.357.00

Florinal

GERCLLA ALTIS Lo AUTE

JZIZATIFEET

1500 kg

510 kW (108 bhp)
27 Mov 2007
$14,795.00

$8,137.00

$16,275.00



JEWET G R 55
LONG SHENG MOTOR SERVICE

Blk 6. No. 399-G. Woodlands Road, Yew T!tlte dustrial Estate
Singapore 678007 | . jisaal modfications) s allowsd [
Tel: 67639733 Fax: 67609868 piomenayfent mistveresneredand |

Email: Ismstyc@singnetcomsdg o cosiadlgol 1

Date: 10.05.2019 .
Owner:  LIP FONG RENOVATION SERVICES L —
Attention: MS First Capital Insurance Limited - Motor Claims Department

RE:ACCIDENT FOR VEHICLE NO. SKQ3985T TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 A (2007) DOA: 01.04.2019
estimated cost of repair of the above mentioned vehicle:-

Replacement Parts:- Page 1
1pc Rear Bumper DtE $ 391.60
2 pcs Rear Bumper Side Retainer LH/RH @ $$39.90 s ¥ B 5 79.80
1 pc Rear Bootlid But ~ 5 712.60
1 pc Rear Bootlid "TOYOTA" Emblem  ree ~ $ 39,10
1pc Rear Bootlid "COROLLA" Emblem "t~ § 38.60
1pc Rear Bootlid "ALTIS" Emblem "%~ § 38.30
1 pc Rear Bootlid "VWTI" Emblem -t o $ 37.10
1pc Rear Bootlid Inner Weatherstrip ~ ©“ T 7 $ 89.30
1pc Rear Bootlid Inner Lock ML % § 113.70
1 pc Rear End Panel duL -~ § 421.70
1 pc Rear End Panel Inner Garnish ¢ 26 ~ S 118.90
| feow 10t Lmp RH Mm-Y cep - § 2,080.70 3331 '*°
Less 25% 5 (520.18)
; 1.560.53
To Repair Eaadd s
R
Ipc Rear Spare Tyre Panel Te-Repair
Special Nett:
Reverse Sensor ‘?:'l»v..twfwl - i 280:.00 20o
feov Porel Senlany M_L = Lo 40
Add: Mo Tal Lomp ww Pan) BRet @ §3.00 (8pu) R/ 4 Rpt> | O
Labour Charges 5 F0000 Loo
Spray Painting S 72600 L0
To Remove & Replace Rear Bootlid and Compartment $ 1»ee0 57
To Remove & Replace Rear Reverse Sensor $ 8000 30
Toff Kote 5 6000 4V
Check Wiring 1 £6-:00 30
Total Amount : $§ 3,580.53
q')f\% Hoee 2o -Cek
(s(s(9
(ofa-92700/ Lls Sdup

27—



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-96071%8-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCELTD Ref : CS/FCI19007342/Jsd3n2
$16.01 OIT HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date: 26052019 ” ‘"“l""““””“'ﬂ
Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 11278 Veh. Inspected SKQ 38857
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19002463MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOANNE YONG Assign Date 16/04/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS C.C 1588
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2007
Chassis No. MROS3ZEC 107 158900 Colour GOLD
Odometer 342274 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GoOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/70 R14 FIRENZA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/70 R14 FIRENZA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/70R14 FIRENZA, & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |1B570R14 FIRENZA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5, General Information
Accident Date  01/04/2019 |Inspection Date 15/05/2018
Survey held at LONG SHENG MOTOR SERVICE
BLK 6, NO. 398-G,
WOODLANDS RD YEW TEE IND. ESTATE
SINGAPORE 678007,
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CIIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




o

e

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 199607188R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9807198-R Page Mo..10f2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKQ 3985T
aty Description of Parts Condition wﬁzm?n ““'*'j"{g]i"‘“"
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 391 60 391.60
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH/RH @$39.90 MECESSARY T9.80 79.80
1|REAR BOOTLID BUCKLED 71260 71260
1|REAR BOOTLID “TOYOTA" EMBLEM NECESSARY 39.10 3910
1|REAR BOOTLID "COROLLA" EMBLEM NECESSARY ar 60 38.60
1|REAR BOOTLID "ALTIS" EMBLEM MECESSARY 38.30 38.30
1|REAR BOOTLID "WTI" EMBLEM NECESSARY aT.0 aro
1|REAR BOOTLID INNER WEATHERSTRIP cuT B9.30 89.30
1|REAR BOOTLID INNER LOCK SERVICEABLE 113.70 -
1|REAR END PAMEL BUCKLED 421.70 421.70
1|REAR END PAMEL INNER GARNISH CRACKED 118.90 118.90
1|REAR TAIL LAMP RH CRACKED 201.70 291.70
LESS 25% DISCOLUNT -593.10 -564 68
1,778.30 1.694.02
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL (NPA)(SN) TO REPAIR SEE . L
LABOUR
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 280.00 200.00
1|REAR PAMEL SEALANT (SN} MECESSARY 80.00 40.00
8|REAR TAIL LAMP LOWER PAMNEL RIVET @$3.00 (SN) NECESSARY 24.00 10.00
384 .00 250.00
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF 700.00 600.00
REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL.
SPRAY PAINTING. T20.00 550,00
TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR BOOTLID AND 120.00 50.00
COMPARTMENT.
TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR REVERSE SENSOR. B0.00 30.00
TUFF KOTE. G0.00 40.00
CHECK WIRING £0.00 30.00
1,740.00 1,400.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18007342/Jsd3n2




Vv L7

- e W
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Page No..Z of 2
GRAND TOTAL 3,903.30 a.m.uzl
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,700.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18007342/Jsd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $20,000,00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $14,802.00=NETT VALUE: $5,198.00

OMNG HWEE JIE ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY T0 THERD PARTIES:- This Repart is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.
Mo llabifity of responaibility whatsosver, i contact or tort, ik accegted to any third party who may mely on the Becor wholly or i part. Any third party scting or replying on this
Eaport. in whobe or I part, does 30 at his or her own ek,



