Vic L LK KAlitﬂ}

-_______“

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 15 November, 2019 4:14 PM

To: Vic (LKKAute); Admin A

Cc Ben Tang; Chee So Chow: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Alfred Toh: KKLau

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201849/5SMC8187Y/BEN - Accident Involving SMC8187Y

AND S5HDB1A (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119007312/Khb3) on 23.04.2019

LKK  REF - CC3/CTI119007312/Khb3
CTPIS REF — SNM19D201849C02/ 7(bt)

Dear Vic

We refer to your email pertaining to the above matter,

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $57,117.34,
We await your payment advice to enable Ben to act accordingly.

p.s. Elaine Cheong NO LONGER in service with CTPIS

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd,

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: FEHifit Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mall and an ¥ files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information,
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited, If you are not the infended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Friday, 15 Novemnber, 2019 1:23 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto) =vicalpeh@lkkauto.com=; Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>: Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM 19D201849/SMC8187Y/BEN - Accident Involving SMC8187Y AND SHD81A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI19007312/Khb3) on 23.04.2019

Dear Vic,

Please note that officer in charge — Ben Tang.
Dear Ben,

Fyd

Thank you

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.




3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896116 | F- (65) 62247175

W: www sg.cntaiping.com | FE;m-.n.-.r.far.:ebc:uk.cnmrchinataininqsq; | WeChat: i {ififil Taiping SG

Lhsclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it (s intended only for the nemed recipients and ma ¥ cofain confidential information, Any
unauvthorzed disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, aiher in whole or partial i prohibited. If you are not the intendad recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delate the o-mail and any coples of if thereaftor

From: Vic (LKKAuta) [maiIm;uu:aIueh@lkkauto.mm]

Sent: Friday, November 15, 2019 12:06 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT|

Cc: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMC8187Y (O1: CTI- TBA) AND SHDR14A (TP :
LKK REF - EC3,H'CT!19CIID?312{'th3} on 23.04.201%

CTI REF - TBA
LKK REF - CC3/CTI119007312/Khb3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SMC 8187Y (Ol}) AND SHD 81A (TP) ON 23/04/2019

We refer to the above matter.

It was reported that Insured vehicle was coming out from the minor road when collided to the TP vehicle that was
travelling on the main road. The result of the impact caused TP vehicle to lost control and swerved to the opposite

lane and collided to an oncoming van. A copy of TP video footage was attached for your reference.

In view of the above, we are of the view that liability is not to our Insured’s favour and the damages sustained to TP
vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident,

Summary to offer to repairer TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD is as followe:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) 5119,688.91 5 54,938.24
Loss of Rental ($103.41 x 21 days) S 217161 s 2,171.61
LTA Search Fee 5 7.49 s 7.49
TOTAL $121,868.01 $ 5711734

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days 24 days
TOTAL CLAIMED DAYS 21 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
For your approval and/or further instructions please,

Thank you.




Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(4089373)
FESLr

CSRER T Sov Bhe itk B anly whan pecessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the Intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law, If yvou belisve that ¥ou received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete tha a-malil and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 April, 2019 7:07 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: 'Irene Tay'; Alfred Toh; Joy Irene [LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMC8187Y (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SHD81A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT119007312/Kjb3) on 23.04.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SHD 81A at M/s Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID- 6841 2409,
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6366-0055 | email; shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #0225 | 5(408033)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

Our Ref : AAD1904-224

Your Ref . SMCB8187Y, GBH3080H
Date : 17.May 2019

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHDO081A AND SMC8187Y, GBH3080H ON 23/04/19 09:30 AM
ALONG OLD TOH TUCK ROAD

It appears that the above accident was caused by your insured’s negligence. We, therefore
seeking compensation from you for our financial loss as itemized below :-

1 Cost of Repair (inclusive of 7% GST) ) 54,538.24

2 Loss of Rental for _~|_ days @ §!%2"41 per day 3 217161

3 Loss of Income for _____ days @ 3 perday % 0.00

4. LTA Search Fee 4 7.49

L Survey Fee % 0.00
Total g 57,117.34

We enclose a copy of the following documents for your consideration :-

GIA report lodged by our driver Rental rate and mileage records

Certificate of Insurance Authorization To Act

Original final repair bill LTA Search Fee

Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 14 days, failing which we shall
proceed to hand over the conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further
reference to you.

Yours Faithfully
Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

Jasmine Tan
General Manager

Tel No, : 6603 1250 (DID)
Mote : Please email any further correspondence to claims@transcab.com.sg (6603 1259)

w=-1%
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Our Ref: CC3/CTI19007312/Khb3

23 SEPTEMBER 2019

TAN YONG JIE (CHEN YONGJIE)
BLOCK 275B JURONG WEST STREET 25
#09-107

SINGAPORE 642275

Dear Sir/Madam,

S} b 25043018

BY POST & BY EMAIL

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC 8187Y / SHD 81A / OTHERS ON 23/04/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them,

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner

of SHD B1A against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down
against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the

Third Party,

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and

settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
'

Fy
7

Vic/Alpeh
DID: 6841 2096
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: vicalpeh @ lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
{Matar Claims Depi)
Yitan29@ gmail, com
(Email)




Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vie (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 23 September, 2019 10:03 AM

To: Yjtan29@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: SMC8187Y - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC 8187Y / SHD 81A / OTHERS ON
23/04/2019

Consuitanis
Fle [

!’ F ! " {J' Aufa

SLUBLAVE L #i-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRI AL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TFI SO GISRIS0L FANX D63 62564315

Our Ref: CC3/CTI19007312/Khb3
23 SEPTEMBER 2019

TAN YONG JIE (CHEN YONGIIE) BY POST & BY EMAIL
BLOCK 275B JURONG WEST STREET 25

#09-107

SINGAPORE 642275

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC 8187Y / SHD 81A / OTHERS ON 23/04/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them,

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshap acting on behalf of the owner of SHD 814 against your motor
insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down against us. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Pa rty.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further gueries.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4089373)
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This e-mall contain ¢confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belisve that you received this e-mail in error, please do not

read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all atlachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.




Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878k

Authorization To Act

We, Trans-cab Services Pte Ltd of Company Registration No. 200303878K hereby authorize
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd to act on behalf to claim for all losses incurred for the
accident involving SHDO0O81A and SMC8187Y. GEH3080H along OLD TOH TUCK ROAD on
23/04/19 09:30 AM.

In addition, we also hereby authorize the above payment to be made in favour of Trans-cab
Auto Services Pte Ltd upon settlement.

Dated this 17 (day) of May 2019

Yours Faithfully
Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

l

Jasmine Tan
General Manager
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Policy Mo : DMPCSN1823271iE00 Claim HNo P SNMLIIDZ0IR43C02/7 (o)
Claimant : TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD

Amount £ SEITHLLT 34

SINGAPORE DCLLARS FIFTY SEVEN THOUSAND ONE HUNDEED
SEVENTEEN AND CENTS THIRTY FOUR ONLY

1/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to mefus in full &
final settliement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injurles / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident invalving

laimant Vehicle No: &« SHD BIa
Insured Vehicle No. ¢ SMC BLB7Y
Date of Loss s+ 23/04/2018
Place of Accident : OLD TOH TUCE ROAD

i CONSIDERATICON of the payment mede to me/us of the aforementicned sum by
CHIMA TAIPING IMSURANCE (SINGAFORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely tao
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE {SINGAFORE) FTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name : TAN YONG JIE (CEEN YONGJIE)
Driver Mames : TAN YONG JIE (CEEN YONGJIE)

from all ©laims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/us arlsing gut of the said acclident. L

I ‘acknowledge that thiz payment is made without admission of 1iability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFPORE) PTE. LTD.

{1) Ceneral Damages 55
(2} Cost of Repalr/Excess 55 54,938.24
(3} Loss of UsefRental/Farning 85 1 B
[4) GIA/Police Reports/
investigation Results/Search Fees 858 T.49
15) Medical Reports/Expenses 55
{8) Survey Feas/P.T, Fees &5
(7) Cost including Disbursement 55
TOTHE & & % 8 & CORSNmEYE N % B 9 5 58 57,117 .34

o e v

Claimant Mame ; MBRIC Mo :

A

L0 NOV 2019

Signature : : y O Date




Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

MNe. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel: 5287 6666

Fax: 6287 7764

Co.Reg. No.: 2010196266

GST Reg. No.: 201019626G

Tax Invoice / Debit Note

TO:

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S5) PTELTD
3 ANSON ROAD

#15-02 SPRINGLEAF TOWER

079905 SINGAPORE

INVOICE NO.  :INV1805-058
DATE : 15, May 2019
REFERENCE NO : AAD1904-224
TERMS :

DUE DATE : 15, May 2019
ATTENTION: PAGE sl |
'NO. CODE DESCRIPTION QTY  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
L 6050101  REPAIR-SHDS14; DOA 23.04 19(PART-BY-PART-18) 1 54,938.24 54,938.24
Total SGD Excl. GST - 51,344.15
7% GST : 3,594.09
**** FIFTY FOUR THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED THIRTY EIGHT AND TWENTY
Total SGD Incl, GST : 54,938.24
FOUR SGD ONLY **** otal SGD Incl fie2

1} All cheques should be crossed and made payable ta"Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd"

2] Please guote our Invoice Wumbsar during payment.

3) We reserve the right to charge interest @ 1.5% per month on overdue invoice
4} Any dispute as to the accuracy, charges et of this invoice must
¥ F ¥

deemed to have been unconditicnal ¥ accepted

THIS IS A COMPUTER GENERATED INVOICE WHICH REQUIRES NO SIGNATURE

ue communicated within 10 days from the date heraof failing which it shall be



Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

17 May, 2019

To Whom It May Concern

Dear Sir / Madam,
Accident on 23/04/19 09:30 AM at OLD TOH TUCK ROAD

1. We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd is the
registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration no. SHDOD81A. The taxi was hired to SIM BEE
CHYE a registered hirer-operator of Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd at the time of occurrence of the
aforementioned accident at a rental rate $103 .41 per day (inclusive of GST).

2. Please be advised that the Taxi is insured with AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD on a third party basis at the
material time of the accident,

3. Please liaise with us directly for any settlement of claims in respect of the said accident,

Yours faithfully,

Jasmine Tan

General Manager

This is a computer generated print-out. No signature is required.



Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

23-04-2019

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that the taxi was undergo accident repair in the workshop as follow:

Date In Date Qut Vehicle No.
Accident No. AADIS904-224 Accident Date 23-04-2019
472372019 09:30 5/13/201% 18:00 SHDODELA

Yours Faithfully,
Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

| |
!

Jasmine Tan

General Manager
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Vehicle Insurance Particulars Result

htlps.nrn.ll.a.HL.-v.::H-uu.vu-m_n.u.m. WABL S L @y

Vehicle Mo,
SMCB187Y

GEB1150E
SFF44648E
SME3972U

Incident Date,/Time

23 Apr2019/09:30:00
23 Apr 2019 /05:50:00

23 Apr2019/14:30:00
22 Apr 2019/ 20:20:00

OK

Insurance Company Mame

CHINATAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE
LTD

NTUC INCOME INSCO-QPLTD

MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

AlIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE.LTD.

Save as PDF
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