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Your ref: To Be Advised
Our ref: CCIEQIIDOUT30E/K 1 pb3 Drate: 25.04.2019

The Mator Claims Department
M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear SinMudam.

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SH A
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 24.04.2019

at the premises of M/s_ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 1,.202.64
Revised Estimate Amounl 1 8% 300.00
"Check” Items Amount : 8% -
Markel Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nen Value i~

T
Fhe vehucle sustwined damages at the v 1 [ = e

Deseription of Damage:
|
(/S Front Portion L | — =_—J
i

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normial period for repairs: 2 dayy

Yours farthfully,

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD E Q
'REPAIR ESTIMATE*

VEHICLE NO @ SH 6203A DATE 24/4/2019 15:00 T
MARE
MODEL : HYUNDALI 1ONIQ
| gw Paris Dmrig tion' Labour Type Unit Price Amount
Front Bumper Cover x b e $ 41830
Front Bumper Centre Moulding » $v* b 188.00
Front Bumper Clips 10 pes ® -~ s 22.00
SUB TOTAL $ 61830
LESS 20% 5 125.66
DISCOUNTED TOTAL S 502.64
Labour Charge foo
Panel Beating s )Bﬂﬁ;
Spray Painting Charge § 3wl
,'.
TOTAL LABOUR s T
ESTIMATE TOTAL r S 120264

pr—

\

AN H

2¥/%/19 /507
2 U

7
Mo P 1%

Uhis is an mitil estimate based on a visual mspection of the above velucle. The final repair quantum will

be prepared after the velucle s surveved by 8 motor Survevor appouted by the msurance company

Page 1 of 1



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD E Q
"REPAIR ESTIMATE*

VEHICLE NO @ SH 6203A DATE 24/4/2019 15:00
MAKE
MODEL : HYUNDAILHONIQ
_ 22 | Parts Dﬂtrigﬂuﬂf Lahour Ty L'mit Price Amount
' Front Bumper Cover X1 S 41830
Front Bumper Centre Moulding ¢ $  188.00
Front Bumper Clips 10 pes ¥ $ 22.00
SUB TOTAL S 62830
LESS 20% 5 125.66
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 8 502.64
Labour Charge foo

Panel Beating 5 ).I-l'f'ﬁﬁ

Spray Painting Charge % ljl-l'.ﬁf

F-
TOTAL LABOUR 5 70000
ESTIMATE TOTAL $ 1.202.04

o Ik 1ttty

2 #/5/11 150r%
2 W

44
y¥ P }.Afr- \ =l

This 15 an mitial esnmaie based on 0 visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final reparr quantum will

be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Survevor appointed by the insurance company

Page 1 of 1



COMFORIDELGRO

ENGINEERING

Our Job Rel Na 305220086

pmioriDaiGro Ps Lid
Date 28/04/2019 E‘I Loyang nmw 508063

Fax: 6546 6156
FINALIZATION FORM
Ta LK Fax:
Atth KALVIN
SH 62034 Dale of Accident : 23.04.19

The sunvey and estimates of the repalrs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-

1 Tha repair job shall bill to: EQ — GYB1520
=
2, The finalized amount shall be:
{a) Spame Parts after List discoun 50,00
(8) Labour Charges o £300.00
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost §300.00
(311
(z.] Lumpsum Repair (it sppicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:  20%
Final Lumpsum Repair cost
3 Esfimated normal paried for repairs; 2 working days
4, We shall treal the above amounl as Comrect and Conflrmed If there Is no reply from you
within 7 working days
5  Thenk you for your aseistance, We confirm the estimates and
finalized amourt
I N AR
Neme : JUMANI \ Name Kl
Tel  : 62148315 3 Date 3 g )iy
Fax : B546B158
For Offizial Use Only
Document
tem Amaunt Attsched g;’ﬁn."?uij? Remarks
Yeaa or No

YES

1. Rertal Rate P/Day

2 Lossof Incoma Paid

3. Survey Foes

. LTA Search Fee

§7.49

Medical Fees (on behall
of driver, If applicable)

Oerrun

Remarks:
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Team ARC Repair TP(CLSO)} JOB CARD  sales Order; Mo 305290086
o SH 6203A
COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD oY | A -
1-.-”:_;'. r;.- }DLU{J45 HYUHD.H.I = 3 F
oz 383 SIN MING DRIVE [(monE. = T DATETTIME 1
Singapore SINGAPORE 575717 IONIQ(G2) 24.04,.2019 12:30
65508755 ] PR O AL i TRRGET DATE h
05.07. 2018
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Shu Pei !LKKAutu]

From: lanet Tan <janettan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 10:14 AM

To: Shu Pei (LEKAUtD)

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GY8152C (O1 - EQI - DM19H001482/IT) AND
SHE203A (TP : LKK REF - CC3/EQI19007308/K1pb3) on 23.04.2019

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE- MARKED POF; TP GIA REPORT PDF; Preliminary Advice pdf,
SAS2613794.PDF

Dear Shu Pel

Attach Ol report. Ol would like to private settle if possible.
Please assist.
Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

i 1= ! ..‘ I- f" I-..-.J
...\JI _.J I"'..\..
= £ el

(1 e -

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 656223 4190

wWww eginsurance com.sg

=

I‘.~.-'.-h.--|-f.-:1 » 0l gt @____.-ﬂ

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sen

From: lanet Tan

Sent: Friday, May 24, 2019 2:41 PM

To: ‘Shu Pei (LKKAuto)' <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GYA152C (O : EQ) - DM19HOO01482/IT) AND SHB203A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQI19007308/K1pb3) on 23,04.2019

Dear Shu Pei

Accident not reported as yet.



Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

| | P il . -
- fasl T el

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 062110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 656223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

WWW. BQINSUrance coim.sg

D
‘.‘ A Bhgwmdy ool [ g 10 ik {.w‘—_—"'

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sem

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mallto:shupel@ikkauto cam)

Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2019 9:47 AM

To: lanet Tan <janet tanf@eginsurance com sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) <chewht @ lkkauto coms

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GY8152C (O1 : EQI - TBA) AND 5H6203A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQI19007308/K1pb3) on 23.04.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report lor our necessary action.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-D055 | email: ghupo i kkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 51408933)

Fram: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 April 2019 7:20 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance. com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GY8152C (OI : EQI - TBA) AND SHE6203A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQU19007308/K1pb3) on 23.04,2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

LN



Dear Janet,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SH 6203A at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd - Loyangon a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal |s:
- TP's GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary actlon.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

Thank youw.

Beut Aagards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: B3EE-D055 | emall: shupel@lkkautin com | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
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Company Regisiration Mo 19880T108R

S1 UL AVE 1, #02:28 FAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGATORE 408933 TEL 1 (065) 62563561 FAX 1 (063) A23ad315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 19/11/2019

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

) GY 8152C (Insd Veh) |Your Ref No. : DM18HOD1482/T
At SH 6203A (TP Veh) |Our Ref No.: CC3/EQI19007308/K1hb3a2
Date of Accident 23/4/2019
Liability 100%

Final Repair Cost -] 321.00 -
Loss of Income . 125.00 2.5 days -
Rental (If any) 4 321.00 2.5 days -
Others: - 7.49 -

-] -

774.49

Final Settlement Sum |: § 770.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks B -

1)

COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

770.00

JOANMNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Uki Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199607198R GST Reg Mo. 18-8607188-R

Affillatod to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCI/EQI19007308/K 1hb3g2
o ToWeR By IR
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 18-11-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 089110
Code : EQI
1% Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GY B152C Veh. Inspected SH 6203A
Policy No. DMCHHQ18-00238 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM1SHOD1482/JT Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 24/04/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 1ONIC c.C 1580
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. KMHCE51CV.JU 103405 Colour BLUE
Odometer 24391 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/85R1S NEXEN 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/85R15 MEXEN 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/85R15 NEXEN 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 195/65 R15 NEXEN 7 mm
4 Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 23042018 Inspection Date 24/04/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
58 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
5a. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

B.Jda BE B 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: B255 3561 FAX. 56255 4315
Reg. No: 189807198R GST Reg No. 18-8607198-R Page Mo, 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE ND. SH 6203A
Qty Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By | OurAdjus
: pti . Workshop (§)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER COVER TO REPAIR SEE 418.30 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT BUMFER CENTRE MOULDING SERVICEABLE 188.00
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 2200 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -125 66
502.64
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT 400.00 100.00
BUMPER COVER.
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 300.00 200.00
T00.00 300.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,202.64 300.00
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I | | 300.00]

KALVIN ANG WEI KUN

Automotive Assessor | Investigator

Report Ref No. CCI/EQI19007308/K1hb3q2

™

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor

CISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIND PARTIES: This Bepari s made salely for the use and benalit of the Cllent nemed oo the frond page of this Reporn




