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~HOCK WAH MOTOR WORKSHOP PTE LTD

HLK 00 TAMPINES ST O3 #0120
SINGAPCHEE S28K40 e
ITL GTNS301] AKX ATHKI0T1

AR Mo 20001 1T GST Regt Mo 200004 141-D

TO: 5T14I65A

SYED ALI BIN SYED HUSSIN Az (A Number:  EBKO0000271
BLK 129 PASIR RIS STREET 11 91 Date : 23042019
02-315 f 1/ Case No:  ADKOO0O3 44
SINGAPORE 510129 28 7 L/ ’}'5‘ Vehicle No : SIT8307p
TEL: FAXN: 'y f C hussis:
1"H - 96329200 ! i Year of MIr
NTTN Policy No
—1 = Madel : PROTON EXORA |61
Term: -"J M.L,?é'{ ’%‘ gt
Sn DESCRIPTION 4 oty [/ v prick | pisc | amount
I [FRT BUMPER hj}/ 1.0 S60.00 10 SO4.00 4
T [FRT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RII A = 1.0 15.00| 10 40.50 )
3O|FRTBUMPER CLIPS 5 2 12.0 150 10 48604
i |FRT FENDER RI y |0 aso00l 1o 405.00 [X
List Price - Parts Sub Total J98.10)
Parts Tulu1 008, 10
5 [LABOLR TO REMOVE AND REFIT NECESSARY PARTS 10 s0000| oD 600,00
i [SPRAY PAINT ON THE AFFECTED AREAS | .0 fChd, 000 i ;?“Cﬂ:r"' IR
— e
Labour 1 Sub Total 1,200,00
!
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)
b
> il
VIV
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SENGAPORE DOLLARS | TWO THOUSAND THREE [UNDRED Len: Excess 0,00
FIFTY-ONE AND CENTS NINET Y-SEVEN ONLY SUBTOTAL 3 19810
GST 7,00 I153.87
TOTAL 2.351.97

Duate of accident 23042019 09:45 AM. Place - PASIR RIS DRIVE 6 MSCP BLK 411 A

E. &0 I

HOCK WAH MOTOR WORKSHOP PTE LTD

CUSTOMER SIGNATURE AUTHORISED SIGNATLURE
Page | of |
* N = lrem not subjected (o GST

Issued by & Dehan



. PARF/€OE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page |1 of |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
4365A

SJTB307P
No

25 Apr 2019
PROTON

EXORA 1.6L AT (M-LINE) ABS D/AB 2WD
S5DR

Black

2009

S4PHQBO0021
PL1IFZ6YRRAF017152
93.0 kW (124 bhp)
$14,115.00

31 Oct 2009

31 Oct 2009

1

$14,115.00

Yes
30 0Oct 2019
$7,057.00

31Jan 2029

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$26,047.00

$25,437.00

$32,494.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 25 Apr 2019

https://vrl Ita.gov.sg/la/vrl/action/enquireRebate ByPublicBefore Dereglnput 7FUNCTION _1D=F030. ..

25-Apr-19



Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Hock Wah Motor Pte Ltd <motor@hockwah.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 1:46 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: TP CLAIM SITB307P AGAINST SKW1857L (AIG) // DOA: 23/04/2019 ****LKK
REF:CC6/AIG19007302/Udb3

Attachments: dv_signed PDF

Hi lia le,

Please check attachment for signed DV.

Thank You.

Best Regards

Dehan

Service Advisor

Hock Wah Motor Workshop Pte Ltd

BLK 9006, TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A #01-204 SINGAPORE 528840
Tel: 67853933 | Fax: | Website: www, hockwah.com. sg

Main Office: Blk 3011 Bedok North Avenue 4 | #01-2008/2010/2012 | Singapore 489977 | Tel: 6441 5655 | Fax: 6243
8121 /6441 5355

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:Jiale @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 27 June, 2019 12:28 PM

To: Hock Wah Motor Pte Ltd <motor@hockwah.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIM SJTB307P AGAINST SKW1B57L (AIG) // DOA: 23/04/2019 ****LKK
REF:CCG/AIG19007302/Udb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Dehan,

We confirm the settlement amount at $976.00.
Please sign the DV and return to us.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jigle@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-3108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 11:41 AM

To: Hock Wah Motor Pte Ltd; Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Ce: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)



L Subject: RE: TP CLAIM SITB307P AGAINST SKW1857L (AIG) // DOA: 23/04/2019 ****LKK
REF:CCH/AIG19007302/Udb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Dehan,
We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that this matter is now handled by my colleague, Ms Carlor and she will get back to you for an
update/offer.

Thank you.

Hest Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

LK == Sgve the Farth Frint ooly when pecessary

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent s prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe thal you received this e-mail In arror, pleasa do nol
read this e-mail or any attached tems. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments. including any copies thereof, and inform the
sander that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachmenis and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Hock Wah Motor Pte Ltd [mallto:motor@hockwah.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 11:17 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: TP CLAIM SITB307P AGAINST SKW1857L (AIG) // DOA: 23/04/2019 ****LKK
REF:CC6/AIG19007302/Uhb3

Hi wic,
Any updates on the status of the claim?
Thank You.

Best Regards

Dehan

Service Advisor

Hock Wah Motor Workshop Pte Ltd

BLK 9006, TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A, #01-204 SINGAPORE 528840
Tel: 67853933 | Fax: | Website: www.hockwah.com sg

Main Office: Blk 3011 Bedok North Avenua 4 | #01-2008/2010/2012 | Singapore 489977 | Tel: 6441 5655 | Fax: 6243
8121 /6441 5355

From: Hock Wah Motor Pte Ltd
Sent: Thursday, 16 May, 2019 9:40 AM
To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>



Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto) | .com>
Subject: RE: TP CLAIM SJT8307P AGAINST SKW1857L (AIG) // DOA: 23/04/2019 ****LKK

REF:CC6/AIG19007302/Uhb3

Hi vic,

| had done finalize the cor with surveyor Marcus and attached all the relevants documents for your process.
Thank You,

Best Regards

Dehan

Service Advisor

Hock Wah Motor Workshop Pte Ltd

BLK 9008, TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A, #01-204 SINGAPORE 528840
Tel: 67853833 | Fax: | Website: www.hockwah.com.sg

Main Office. Blk 3011 Bedok North Avenue 4 | #01-2008/2010/2012 | Singapore 489977 | Tel 6441 5655 | Fax: 6243
8121 /6441 5355

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 10 May, 2019 2:48 PM

To: Hock Wah Motor Pte Ltd <motor@hockwah.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto)
<Jiale@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIM SITB307P AGAINST SKW1857L (AIG) // DOA: 23/04/2019 ****LKK
REF:CCh/AIG19007302/Uhb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Dehan,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to
the BOLA guideline settlement.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client's vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal.

Kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available to proceed with the settlement.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@®|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-9108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Sove the Earth Print only when necessary”

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in emmor, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any coples thereof. Thank you.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 May, 2019 9:58 AM

To: Hock Wah Motor Pte Ltd

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TP CLAIM SITB307P AGAINST SKWI1B57L (AIG) // DDA 23/04/2019 ****LKK REF:CC6/AIG19007302/hb3

Dear Dehan,

Please be informed that our insured haven't reporting the said accident.

We had send letter to our insured and informed him to fill the accident report as soonest possible.
Thank you

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email; shupei®|kkautg.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hock Wah Motor Pte Ltd < r ah.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 2 May 2019 9:50 AM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: TP CLAIM SITB307P AGAINST SKW1B57L (AIG) // DOA: 23/04/2019 ****LKK

REF:CC6/AIG19007302/hb3

Dear mdm/sir,

Has your insured report the accident? Please revert on the liability if any.
Thank You.

Best Regards

Dehan

Service Advisor
Hock Wah Motor Workshop Pte Ltd



BLK 9008, TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A, #01-204 SINGAPORE 528840
Tel: 57853933 | Fax | Website: www.hockwah.com.sg

Main Office: Blk 3011 Bedok North Avenue 4 | #01-2008/2010/2012 | Singapore 489977 | Tel: 6441 5655 | Fax: 6243
8121 /6441 5355

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 25 April, 2019 3:49 PM

To: Hock Wah Motor Pte Ltd <motor@hockwah.com sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com?; Vic [LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP CLAIM SIT8307P AGAINST SKW1857L (AIG) // DOA: 23/04/2019 ****LKK REF:CC6/AIG19007302/hb3

Dear Dehan,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for 01 GIA report.

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Thank you

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupsi®|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hock Wah Motor Pte Ltd <motor@hockwah.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 April 2019 10:25 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: TP CLAIM SJITB307P AGAINST SKW1B57L (AIG) // DOA: 23/04/2019

Hi sir/mdm,

Vehicle has been surveyed on the 25/04/2019. Has your insured report the accident? Please revert on the liability if
any. Attached evidence footage for your reference.

Thank You.

Best Regards

Dehan

Service Advisor

Hock Wah Motor Workshop Pte Ltd

BLK 9006, TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A, #01-204 SINGAPORE 528840
Tel 67853933 | Fax: | Website: www hockwah com sg

Main Office: Bik 3011 Bedok North Avenue 4 | #01-2008/2010/2012 | Singapore 489977 | Tel 6441 5655 | Fax: 6243
8121 /6441 5355



Hock Wah Motor Workshop Pte Ltd
Blk 3011 Bedok North Ave 4 #801-2008/2010/2012

Singapore 4BEETT
Tal- +65 6441 5655 Fax +85 0243 B127 / 8441 5355
R.O.C No: 2001041410 Gat Reg No.. 2001041410
QOur Ref. SJTB307P
To Date: 16/05/2019
Motor Claims Dept
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 5
78 Shenton Way , , SG 078120 2
#0716 Tel. +65 G880 4888
Singapore 078120 Fax; +85 6880 4838
C Accident involving vehicle No. SJT8307P AND SKW1857L on 23/04/2019

along / at PASIR RIS DRIVE 6 MSCP BLK 441A

We refer to the above accident.

We were instructed by our client, SYED ALI BIN SYED HUSSIN

the owner of vehicle SJTBI0TP 1o claim damages against your insured SKW1857L
in connection with a road traffic accident as above detaiis.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured's negligent driving
and/ or management of his vehicle. As a result, our client's vehicle was damaged
and our clients have to put to loss and expenses.

Particulars of which are as follows:

Cost of Repair W GST s 856 .00
LOSS OF USE 2 DAYS $ 120 00
_ $

Total 3 976.00

Please revert within the next seven (7) days, so that we can advise our third party claimaint
for the next course of action.

We support our claim with documents enclosed

Yours faithfully, 00K 1

Bk 5000

Motor C}aim



31 UBEAYE 1, 501-25 PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62503561 FAX : (045) 61564315

Our Ref: CC6/AIG19007302/Uhb3
13 MAY 2019

CHIA WING YEE

BLK 558 PASIR RIS STREET 51
#05-297

SINGAPORE 510558

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW I1857L & SJT 8307P ALONG/AT BLK 441A PASIR RIS
DR 6 ON 23/04/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party
claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SJT 8307P against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
favour as you were collided onto the parked vehicle. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an
amicable settlement with the Third Party,

Should you however wish 1o further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please comtact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if vou have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

\

CHAN JIA LE

Case Handler

DID: 6749 5792

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: JinLe@lkkauto.com

C.C. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd
{Motor Claims Dept)



AlG

AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
(AlG Asia Pacific — EXPRESS THIRD PARTY CLAIM)
A
L SY¥%0 AL BN SYE0 HuSN ("the third party claimant’)
of il epar A8 51 11 #oz2-315 St’mllf[) (address),
owner of 597 83079 (vehicle no) hereby authorize

hatt i maTeR  WoRkgHIp  f1E LTp
(“the workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or
rental and/or loss of use (“claim”) for my vehicle no. {12 310?'?' that was
damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 33_! o¥] 19 (date) along
PR RS prvg £ M3ep Bk H41A (location)
involving vehicle no/s Skw 1 #SFL ("the accident”).

| further authorize the workshop to settle the above mentioned claim in a
manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment furtherto settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in
favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my
behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar

as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Datethis 23 dayof O (month)20 '7 (year)

)

Signed by D@I’; third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”




RELEASE VOUCHER

IG Asia Pacific - Ex i rt im

“Well, HOCK WAH MOTOR WORKSHOP PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that

we/l have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Agia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed
for SS856.00 (Repair Cost), $5120.00 (Loss of Use/Rental), S8 - (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
SJT 8307P that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 23/04/2019 (date) along

PASIR RIS DRIVE 6 MSCP BLK 441A (location) involving vehicle no/s SKW I857L. This is

pursuant to the inspection conducted on 25/404/2019 (date) at “the workshop'.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner SYED ALl BIN SYED HUSSIN (“the

third party claimant™) of vehicle no. SJT 8307P make the claim as set oul in the above paragraph
and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his'her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit.
We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”,

Wedl further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further ¢laim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or oss of use pursuant to the
damage 1o SJT 8307P (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of lability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this ""'?. (day) of Qm{—-‘ -[monlh:!ﬂ, (vear)

T [N Figrts '|'l;"_':|IEl
NAH MG WORRCNCE [t
poshid = §3, 001204

s S3AI40
E?f:mm Fox- 6708 I3

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by"‘th: warkshop™ (with chop)



HOCK WAH MOTOR WORKSHOP PTE LTD

BLE 006 TAMPNES ST 23 #01-204

SINGAPORE 528840

TEL 67853933 FAX 4TERI93]

ROC Mo 1001041410 GFT Reg No. 20-0104141-0

TO : 5T114365A TAX INVOICE
AlG Asin Pacific Insurance Pre Lid Number:  KBID00S753
NO 78 SHENTON WAY Dhaite : 16052019
® 07-16 CHARTIS Building Chase No :
SINGAPORE 079120 Vihicle No : SITRI0TP
TEL- 1800 4193000 FAX 68357416 Chiussis:
PH Yearnl Mir
ATIN Policy No
Model : PROTON EXORA | &1,
Term:
Sn DESCRIPTION QTY | U PRICE | DISC | AMOUNT
I |[LUMPSLIM REPAIR 1.0 H00.00 a0 B00_00
Sub Tuu! 500,00
Parts Tola 800,00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS  FIGHT HUNDRED FIFTY-SIX AND CENTS Bits KXesis 0.00
ZERD ONLY :
SUBTOTAL 800,00
G5T 7.00% 56.00
TOTAL B56. 0
Daate of accident : 23/0472019 09:45 AM. Place : PASIR RIS DRIVE 6 MSCP BLK 4414
E &0.E. HOCK WAH MOTOR WORKSHODP PTE LTD

CUSTOMER SIGNATURF

Page | of )
* N = ltem not subjected to GS'l Issued by ; Dehan




Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Festlane

!I':I.l..'lﬂ SUBFOLDER TRACKING

| Case | Motitied Est Submitted | Adj Asmgned | Ad) Rpt Ad] Submitted | Ins Auth’ed Status
|25 Aer 2018 25 fprd01% | ssso00.00 5$800.00 eyt Sy
_tanreg | gam aaj Rt | tan estmates | | _view Rot | CancolCase | |

Aeference Claim Details

[mm SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
| Insured: CHIA WING YEE, [D: 51210334)

SYED ALI BIN SYED HUSSIN, ID: ST114385A

| 23/0472019 09:00 - 59
SIT8307P Date of Loss: | /533 Mantns and 23 Days From LTA Reg Dats (Man ve]]

TP / 419476324656 neLveovRT | 2300433672 (Comprehensive)

Palicy No,
SKWI1B57L {Claimant): 51067566915

- Excess:
Hock Wah Motor Workshop Pte Ltd () BLES006 TAMPINES 5T 93 #01-204, 528840 Tampines - Tal:

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. [Express) - Tel: 65-641%-3000 ... [Handled by Tan, Bennle-WZ - 5419 1716] Bennis-
WZ, TanRaig.com

NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

| LK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] .. [Final Rpt due 07/05/2019]

|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | Compose Case mail |
= AlG_SG (09/05/2018): Re: No O GIA Report
|+ AlG_SG (26/04/2019): No O1 GIA Report

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKSS

view All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | cnmpmﬂ

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assignad By Complated On Craated On nonﬂl
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_c... 8/7/2019



Mernmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SITB30D7P (41947632465G)
[SKW1B57L]
TP
SYED ALI BIN SYED HUSSIN
Apr 23 2019 9:00AM
[CHIA WING YEE]
Hock Wah Motor Workshop Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

Upioad Documants |  Upioad Protos |  Campose tow weter | Upload vides | Upicad A | View [View in Browser| %]
Video 1 per page El
Mo | Finalized On | LMK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (MQ) | Thumbnall | Print
1 |10/05/19 14:45 | Video - Accidunt O | Losdwes
Letters/ Correspondences l:pgn E =l
ho | Finaiizea On LHK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
1 (Draft) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown 0 &
Photos/Images Gperpoge [v] &
|Ne ]W;m LMK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbrail | Print
1 15/04/10 17:04 | Odometer Reading 0| wdws | A
¢ 25/04/1917:04  Chassis Number O i &
1 250419 ) 17:04  General View 0 | Ladiec | A
4 |25/04/19 17:04 | Genersl View Load G | ¥
S 25/04/19 17:04 | General View . O | eaws | B2
& 25/0471917:04  General View 0O | wosws | 4
7 25/04/19 17:0¢ | General Viaw 0 eds |
& 25/04/1917:04  General View O | Lodws | B
% 25/04/1917:04 | Genaral View 0 G | @
10 [15/04/19 17:04 | General View O | eiws | @
11 25/04/16 17:04 | General View 0| saws | &
12 19/04/15 17:04 | General View B | Loaa G
13 3504/1517:04 | General View 0 icors | F
14 |25/04/19 17:04 | General View 0 | loadirs | BA
15 [25/04/19 17:04 | General View O wars | & |
16 25/04/19 17:04 | General View 0 | wors | M|
17 25/04/1917:04 | General View O | teoiws | B |
18 | 25/04/19 17:04 | General View B | lesaws | 4
18 |25/04/19 17:04 | General View © | eows | B
(20 25/D4/19 17:04 | General View O wwows &
21 |25/04/1917:04 | General View O | st | B |
|22 |25/04/19 17:04 | General View 0! tadrs | A
23 25/04/19 17:04 | General View © | s | B
'Documentation Gpepage v BB
o |Relabel/Rearder | LKX Auto Conultants Pte Ltd (HQ) — Thumbnail Print
'\ |25/04/19 15:06 | TP GIA REPORT Losd FOF
EI | |26/04/18 17:53 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED 2 Load POF | |
(3 [29/04/19 11:38 Mon reporting letter D | Load poF
(% | 13705719 12110 LETTER TO O Load POF |
5 08/07/15 0925 | WORKSHOP INVOICE g Load PDF |

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 8/7/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

|Video N tperpage ~] A
[Wa_|Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) == Thumbnail Print
‘& |08/07/1909:25 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM o © [ Loadror |
7 |0W/07/1509:25 | Release Voucher _ © | losdror |
[No_ | Finsfized On AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, (5G) Thumbnail Print
(1 [09/05/19 16:40 |01 GIA REPORT _ © | toadPoF |

Documents Checklist

| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | save | o |
!Trmwmm:ummmm“nﬁum |

- LEK Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
featn” ABMarky &rE DriVETE LOIBEE Y04 khowe T 10 CEhar parTes

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 8/7/2019



Page | of |

Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| vehicie No: SKW1B5TL (Insd veh) Modal: PROTON EXORA 1.6 (M)
SJTB3OTP (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |23/04/2019
Global Sum Settiement | [ [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimale § 2,351.97
Final Repair Cosl $ B58.00
Loss of Use - 120.00 2.00 days at 560,00 per day
Rental (if any) 4] 0.00 days
LTA/ GIA Search Fee 15 0.00
Others 5 0.00
LS
Final Settlement Sum ] 876.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [ X] NO  (Kindly indicate

below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA le: Y
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: OLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenarnio No

BOLA Liabllity: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liabilily to be filled only far chain coliisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Hock Wah Molor Workshop Pie Lid 5 §76.00
2) 3
08 Jul
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report: Medical

Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docltr... 8/7/2019



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregne19seorissm
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCB/AIG12007302/UDB3G2
Date: 0B/O7/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No: 2100433672
s'f,““"‘ Vehicle ¢ raaore insured Vehicle No: SKWI1857L
Dale of Loss 23/04/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 41947632465G
IFTION ICA
Reg No: SJTB3OTP
Make & Model: PROTON EXORA, 1.5 (M) Engine No: S4PHQBDO21
Reg Date: 31102008 (Man, Year: 2009) Chassis No! PLIFZEYRRAF01T152
Colour: Black Odometer 120857 km
Engine Capacily; 1587 cc
Market Value/New Car Price. N/A
Sum Insured (S$). Market Valua/New Car Price
NDITION OF VEHI T THE TI F
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabls): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla). Yes Engine Modification Ne Pre-accident Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/45 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215/45 R17
Front Left Side: Daylon 6 mm Rear Left Side: Daylon 6 mm
Front Right Side: Daylon & mm Rear Righ! Side Daylon & mm
The ahove values repressent the rermaining fyre resds depth
COSTOFCLAMS __ Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference _ Diff %
Parts 998.10 552.60 44550 44 63
Miscallaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,200.00 600,00 600,00 50,00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 2,198.10 1.152.60 1,045.50 47.56
Approved Total (Overridden) (55) 800.00
(S8) 2,198.10 800,00 1,388.10 B3.60
+ GST 7.00/7.00% {S5%) 153.87 56.00 o97.87 63.61
Nett Amount (5§) 2,351.97 856.00 1,495.97 63.60
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x S$560.00/day) (S§) 120.00
Nett Liability (S$) 976.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 25/04/2018
Date Inspected: 25/04/2018 |nspected Al; Hock Wah Molor Workshop Ple Lid
BLKS0D6 TAMPINES ST 93 #01-204
Singapore 528840
Eslimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 8/7/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: MARCLUS CHUA Manager: CHAN JIA LE

NOTE. This report represents our fndings al the Nime and place of inspection stated hoemin. Such inspachion had bean carmed oul lo he best of our
krowladpe and abilly but any other labllity under any cther circumstances is heraby sxprassly sxcluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 8/7/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRT BUMPER Dented / Warpad 580.00FL  *560.00FL
2 1 *FRT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH Not Necessary 45.00FL “FL
3 12 *FRT EUMPER CLIPS Necessary 54.00FL *54.00FL
4 1 *FRT FENDER RH Repair 45000 FL *.FL
Fe=Franchise parl. L=ListiemDesc
Sub Total (S§) 1.109.00 614.00
= List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S$§) 110.60 81.40
Total Parts (S§) 998.10 552.60

Repor was unsubmitted during this print-out

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 8/7/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellansous items selocted.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 LABOUR TO REMOVE AND REFIT NECESSARY PARTS New 600.00 200.00

2 SPRAY PAINT ON THE AFFECTED AREAS New 600.00 400.00
Gross Labour Cost (5§) 1.200.00 500.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 8/7/2019



