Vic (LKKAuto)

From: TeamAuto Pro <teamautoffice@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August, 2019 11:26 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: LOD - Our Ref: SJJ 9152P and Your Ref: SMD 711G (AIG) / DOA: 14-04-2019 LKK

REF: CC4/AIG19007299/Bha3

Dear Vic,
Without Prejudice

Thank you for the prompt offer. However, we noted that Tow fee incurred on our end is $180.00, not
$100.00 as reimbursed your end.

Other than the above, we also seek your kind review on LOR/U. While we are agreeable to your offered of
LOR at $800.00 (8Days), we noted that our 2 days demanded for LOU is totally omitted from your offer.
We believed that our total asking of 10 days LOR/U is fair and reasonable; 2 Days PRS (15/16 Apr) + 7
Repair Days Agreed + 1 Sunday (21 Apr).

We await your favorable revised, for the sake of an amicable and swift settlement:-

COR S 6,050.00
LOR S 800.00
LOU S 160.00
Tow S 180.00
LTA S 7.45
TOTAL S 7,197.45

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,

Adel

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Tue, Aug 27, 2019 at 9:28 AM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice



Dear Adel,

We refer further to the below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, we propose below amount to settle your client’s claim:

Cost of Repair S 6,050.00
Loss of Rental (5100 x 8 days) S 800.00
Towing Fee S 100.00
LTA Search Fee S 7.45

TOTAL S 6,957.45

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV then forward back to us a copy together with the Final Repair
Invoice for our principal to process the payment.

The above amount is to be made payable to TEAM AUTOPRO PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: TeamAuto Pro [mailto:teamautoffice@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 26 August, 2019 8:21 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: LOD - Our Ref: SJJ 9152P and Your Ref: SMD 711G (AIG) / DOA: 14-04-2019

BY EMAIL

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: SJJ 9152P
Your Ref: SMD 711G

Dear Vic,

Accident Involving: SJJ 9152P and SMD 711G

Date of Accident: 14 April 2019

Location of Accident: CTE CitV Before Balestier Exit

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and hereby submit our claim as below, with the relevant documents attached.

Cost of Repair as agreed | $ 6,050.00

Total Days for LOR/U 10 Days ,
2 Days PRS (15/16 Apr) + 07 Repair Days Agreed (17/18/19/20/22/23/24 Apr) + 1

Sunday (21 Apr)
Add Loss of Rental S 960.00 8 Days - Inv#L 192304
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Add Loss of Use S 160.00 2 Days
Total S 7,170.00
Add Towing Fee S 180.00
Add LTA Search Fee S 7.45
GRAND TOTAL S 7,357.45

Please feel free to contact us if you have any query otherwise kindly pay the Grand Total Amount to :
Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-12
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Thank you.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his
personal injuries.*

Cheers,

Adel

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST — SJJ9152P vs
SMD711G (Ol) on D.O.A.: 14/04/2019

Inbox



Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor @aig.com>

to me, Andy-SY, Lee-Ying, Noor, Syazairdina, Yoke, Sheng, Aashweenjeetkaur

Thai

English

Translate message

Turn off for: Thai

This is a secure, encrypted message. To read it, open the
attachment.
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Ini adalah pesan, aman terenkripsi. Untuk membacanya,
membuka attachment.

Click here by 2019-04-22 13:19 +08 to read your message.
After that, open the attachment.

More Info

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl @ gmail.com>

Date: Mon, Apr 15, 2019 at 11:55 AM

Subject: 2 Days Notice: SJJ 9152 P (Our Ref) and SMD 711 G (Your Ref) Dated 14th April 2019

To: Chan, Yoke Shi <yokeshi.chan @aig.com>, Chin, Lee-Ying <Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com>, Fong, Andy-
SY <Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com>, Kaur, Baljit <Baljit.Kaur@aig.com>, Lim, Sheng Yang
<ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>, Md Ishak, Mohd Imran <Imran.Ishak@aig.com>, Noor Mariesa
<NoorMariesa.AbuKassim @aig.com>, Supramaniam, Darshene <Darshene.Supramaniam @aig.com>,
Tan, Lily (AIG) <Lily.Tan@aig.com>

Dear Sir/Madam,
Road Traffic Accident Involving SJJ 9152 P (Our Ref) and SMD 711 G (Your Ref)
Dated 14 April 2019, Time around 11:30

@ CTE City before Balestier Exit

We represent our client; Koh Chee Guan, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving our client’s
vehicle registration number: SJJ 9152 P and your insured’s vehicle registration number:
SMD 711 G.

Enclosed herewith a copy of our 2 Days Notice Letter and the relevant Singapore Accident Statement filed for your
reference.

Please let us know within 2 working days from today, your list of at least ten (10) motor surveyors, via
email to the following personnel:-




Contact Person Alan Koh 9092 7279
Frederick Lim 9674 6635

Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com

Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

With reference to your list of surveyors, we are agreeable with the appointment of Mr Lim -LKK as
the SJE for subject claim.

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his
personal injuries.*

Cheers,

Michelle Lim

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

385 Sin Ming Drive
#01-02 Vicom Inspection Centre
Singapore 575718



