Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 9:37 AM

To: Ng Wai Yin

Subject: RE: Your Ref: AAD1904-143 (SHD 5209S) *Our Ref: CC3/TP19007297/Kb3 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SHD 5209S & SHC 955J ON 13/04/2019]

Dear Wai Yin,
Kindly advise payment status.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 May 2019 9:46 AM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: AAD1904-143 (SHD 5209S) *Our Ref: CC3/TP19007297/Kb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 5209S &
SHC 955J ON 13/04/2019]

Dear Wai Yin,
Please prepare payment.
We will prepare our survey report and send to you soonest.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 9:27 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@l|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: AAD1904-143 (SHD 5209S) *Our Ref: CC3/TP19007297/Kb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 5209S &
SHC 955J ON 13/04/2019]




Hi Mei Kwan/ Shu Pei
Please proceed to send us the survey invoice to prepare the payment.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/"'Cﬁg .

Website: www.iranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you
have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or
disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for
response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 1:34 PM

To: 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Your Ref: AAD1904-143 (SHD 5209S) *Our Ref: CC3/TP19007297/Kb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 5209S &
SHC 955J ON 13/04/2019]

Hi Wai Yin,
SHC 955] is a Premier taxi. If Comfort taxi, vehicle ended number 0-5 is under III.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 1:27 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: AAD1904-143 (SHD 5209S) *Our Ref: CC3/TP19007297/Kb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 5209S &
SHC 955J ON 13/04/2019]

Hi Shu Pei

Can double check on this case, SHC 955J by right should be under India (informed by Jasmine vehicle ended number 0-5
should be under ).



Kindly double check.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/"""Cdg .

Website: www.iranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you
have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or
disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for
response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 6 May, 2019 4:39 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; claims@transcab.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: AAD1904-143 (SHD 5209S) *Our Ref: CC3/TP19007297/Kb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 5209S &
SHC 955J ON 13/04/2019]

Dear Wai Yin,
Please take note that we are appointed to survey the vehicle by your good office.

Kindly refer to the below screenshot for your easy reference.

-143
‘Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1904
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111 /L’fdp' /Z’y?/;ﬂ:ﬁ/
Tel Mo. ; 6287 6666 Fax Mo, : 6257 1330 4
C0./G5T Reg. No. 20101 962606 £ f .
SHD 52095 w7 9 ,;,m,,‘/?
¢57%.53
Vehicle No.: SHD 52095
Chassis No.: JTDKB3FU103076646
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: PRIUS
Date of Accident - 13.4.2019
Third Party Insurer : n JD
Date of Registration . TSy 72018
PART LIST
#F




Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 6 May 2019 3:40 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; claims@transcab.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: AAD1904-143 (SHD 5209S) *Our Ref: CC3/TP19007297/Kb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 5209S &
SHC 955J ON 13/04/2019]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shu Pei
Can we check who appoint your side to survey the vehicle? Any e-mail or proof for it?

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

/ﬂcag Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.franscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you
have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or
disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for
response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 6 May, 2019 10:43 AM

To: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: AAD1904-143 (SHD 5209S) *Our Ref: CC3/TP19007297/Kb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 5209S & SHC
955J ON 13/04/2019]

Your Ref: AAD1904-143 (SHD 5209S)
Our Ref: CC3/TP19007297/Kb3

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 5209S & SHC 955J ON 13/04/2019



We refer to the above matter.
Please be informed that SHC 9554 is insured with FCI instead of lIl.
Kindly confirm if you are agreeable to purchase our independent survey report.

Appreciate an early reply.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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