Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Sebastian Kong <sebastian@smemotor.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July 2019 11:22 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Cc: Jacob Ang; Gary Seah

Subject: Re: GBD 4747H OD / CMTD1901796 Date of Loss: 09/04/2019
Importance: High

Hi Shirley,

Insured had came down to our workshop to settle the additional excess of $2000 (before GST)

Thank you

Regards

Sebastian Kong

SME MOTOR PTE LTD
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6,

Blk D, #02-15/16/17/18
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883.

Tel: 6747 6106 (6 lines)
Fax: 6744 2368

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2019 10:09 AM

To: 'Sebastian Kong'

Subject: RE: GBD 4747H OD / CMTD1901796 Date of Loss: 09/04/2019

Hi Sebastian,
As spoken, additional excess $ 2000/- your side has been settled with insurance.

We shall proceed to submit the report with the excess, total amount $ 2,500.00 before GST.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 5:04 PM

To: 'Sebastian Kong' <sebastian@smemotor.com.sg>

Subject: RE: GBD 4747H OD / CMTD1901796 Date of Loss: 09/04/2019

Dear Sebastian,



Any update?

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 11:34 AM

To: 'Sebastian Kong' <sebastian@smemotor.com.sg>

Subject: GBD 4747H OD / CMTD1901796 Date of Loss: 09/04/2019

Dear Sebastian,

As spoken, there is an additional excess $ 2000/- due to owner driving experience less than 6 months.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



