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ASS-. REC. BY:

A‘/:,”ﬂgf,; ASSIGNMENT / /
From: Date: Veh No: ﬁ/fff fﬁfﬂfwmn: C'%‘ilf /?Z
Estmated Cost 5 Type: M.Car/ M.Cyele / Bus / Van [ Lorry {raxi Prime Mover
0D 5 WS TP RES 10D RES 1 EVA LIV MY - Truck  Traller o > :
!j_ a
To Inspect Vehicle No: Make: @ﬁggﬁ-’ e (,?f',zfﬂ L /s
al Workshop mis ‘Zf.;,,!_, Cod |oou A WAL /R4 NG Insured] St NI NA
of _ ) Sp.Reading ;-{Z‘?// TRadio: Insured | Std | NI [ NA
Insred: Eng/No:
PolcyNo, CNo VITIABL 15 we + TFP5F7
Claims N, - Gen, ma@r Falr/ Poor | Burnt
Sum Insured; Excess: Steering: In&iﬂ Jammed ! Leaked / Bumt or
(Chent's Record) Brake: Ingfder/ Jammed | Leaked. Burnt or
Make of Veh: Modi: MfLJSIRIm I STD ARRIm or
Fi o Tyre Stze; F: Z/f//f,(x{
{Policy Condition) ( -| R: —_— ~
Femark: The veh had commenced lts NS ors ES!EUNIEXNO?#IGYFFS:’UZAIHJCFUHTSU.FNRISUMH
Ir at the time of Inspection, ;
repalr et the Ume of Inspectio TOYO ! YOKO o o 4:;,-
IDAC Accident Rport: Consistent? : Yes or Ho R/Bal, j e REa. f e
Gt / PR Seen Conslstent? ; Yes or No LBal. E mm LfBal ; mm
Est, Repairs: J‘Z days Res.: Yes or Mo 0.0OA, / ? ; 87}'? D.0.. & i'—f : / z
P 2‘{; % 3Val: Yos or No Survey held at % ot
CA | REV | REP. | 24HRS Des. of Damages : Frt | Rear | O/S | NS | UIC | Roallep o
- Vehicle: IN ) OUT ALsL
Date: ______ PersonContacted: The UIC | Chassls frame I Body Structure affected due to cofision.
_Date/Time | Action /Instruction i et
. el 7 - =
| L s 8/#50) Uk § 759 T2, T5HL) R
e e S — N ST e A el et
Ontu/Tine, Fie Pass 137 : Prell. Report ; Days Of Repalr: =
1 :?;7.'{:4 h/‘.u/*?“” D: Final Report Resurvey No. of Trip: L | L ISum;,rFe-a' ez
Ot/ Tene, Fie Raturn 107 ' ier A
2 Add Fee: :Sitalnsp ($ ]f_s -RS__&i
=S, NS— e
[ interview (s ) rws e
Faport Farmat : _:“T I | Tech Invs (§ ) o =
Lump Sum /LB (5 ,f';f"";?-' [ D Weekend (5 by 350 f




51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 406933 TEL : (063) 62363561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19002690MFSH Date: 29 April 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19007263Kqd3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear SirfMadam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SHC 5402E .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 25/04/2019 at the premises of M/s TRANS-CAB. and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S§ 28.364.97

Revised Estimate Amount (8% 1,825.99

“Check” Items Amount ok -

Market Value : S% -

LTA Reimbursement Value :S$ -

Nett Value S8 -

Description of Damage: ki

The vehicle sustained damages - e

at the n/s front portion. i__lj‘_l ] N
= - —— %

oflside

Yours faithfully

FONG SENG CHEONG
licensed Appraiser



MS ‘ First{.‘.apital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited cofeg Mo 1OSOOTI06C CST Reg o ME2-0U0LG15

B Raffles Quay 421-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fac |BS)B222 3547

Claims & Hotor Ustrwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 0eBazry
Tal (65] 6507 3648 Fax (65) 6507 3845
wiww, msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
23-04-2019 Our Ref No. D19002690MFSH
19-04-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHDE718H Third Party Vehicle. SHC5402E

NO. 2 ANG MO KIO STREET 63
CANDY KONG
62876666/ 0 Fax No. 62571330

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc: Workshop

Cc: TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

TRANS-CAB AUTOQ
SERVICES PTE LTD

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

PPPRNRY (i AN T BRI




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 April 2019 1:03 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuta)

Subject: RE: TP VEHICLE SHC 5402E (DOA: 19/04/2019) -- AAD1904-193
Attachments: image001.wmz

Hi Shiau Chan

We confirmed COR amount $ 1,450.00 (before GST).

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

##* please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
MN ﬁ No.2 Ang Mo Kio Street 43, Singapore 369111
— ca IE Main Line: (65) 6287 4666 Fax Line: [65) 6287 7764
Website: www . franscab.com.sg
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected Dy work product immunity or other legal rules If
vou have recelved it by mistake, please let us know by e-mall reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message

ar disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screenad
for response deadlinegs, The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]
sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 5:48 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: TP VEHICLE SHC 5402E (DOA: 19/04/2019)

Dear Wai Yin,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Based on our surveyor's estimate marking, the calculation of repair cost will be at Lump Sum $1,450.00 and 2 repair
days.

Kindly check.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuta)

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 3:38 PM

To: '‘CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc: ‘Eileen Lee’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002690MFSH/M
Attachments: CSFCI19007263Kqd3.pdf

Dear Eileen,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SHC 5402E.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 April 2019 2:22 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLes@msfirstcapital.com . sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002650M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Celine Fonyg

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6841-1572 | email: gssignments@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(308933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 April 2019 11:47 AM

To: ASSIGNIMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <Eileenlee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D15002690M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Crwmer 1D Type:

Owner 1D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model;

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output;
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count;

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period|{Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Page 1 of 1

Company
387K

SHC5402E

Yes

22 Apr 2019

REMAULT

LATITUDE 2.0L DCI AUTO D/AB 4DR
Red

2014
MIRBEIFCO01807
YWFLABL1SAUCZ7S583
127.0kW (170 bhp)
$19.998.00

04 Wow 2014

04 Nov 2014

0

£12.498.00

Yes
03 Now 2022
$9.373.00

03 Nov 2022

&, - Car up to 1600cc & 7KW (130bhp)
g

£51,337.00

L22.4668.00

£32,041.00

Please note that the 8-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan [if applicable), whichever is earlier.

Thie information contained herein is correct as at 22 Apr 2019

hitps://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=F030...

OK

22/4/2019



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

No 2 Ang Mo Kio 5treet 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No.: 6287 6666  Fax No.: 6257 1330

CO./GST Reg. Mo. 2010196266
SHC 5402E

Vehicle No.:
Chassis No.:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Date of Accident :

Third Party Insurer :
Date of Registratian :

PART
1 BUMPER COVER FRT

1 BUMPER SPOILER FRT

1 BUMPER ABSORBER FRT

1 BUMPER RETAINER FRT LH

1 BUMPER SUPPORT FRT

1 BUMPER RETAINER FRT RH

1 BUMPER SUPPORT FRT

1 BUMPER UNDERTRAY FRT

1 BUMPER GRILLE LOWER FRT
1 BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE LH
] BUMPER BEAM FRT

1 HEADLAMP LH

1 HEADLAMP PANEL FRT LH

1 FENDER PANEL FRT LH

1 WHEELARCH FRT LH

1 FENDER BRACKET LOWER LH
1 FENDER INSULATOR LH

1 DOOR PANEL FRT LH

1 RADIATOR GRILLE

1

1

1

1

1

1

1

i

1

1

RADIATOR GRILLE BADGE 'RENAULT

RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME
RADIATOR FAN COWLING
RADIATOR FAN MOTOR LH
RADIATOR FAN MOTOR RH
RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME
FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL
FRAME FULL SUPPORT BRACKET
AIR CLEANER BOX

AIR CLEAMNER HOSE

AAD1904-199

i Fhnig

Z/ﬁj, ®/¢5,)

SHC 5402E
VF1ABL15AUC279583
RENAULT

LATITUDE

19.4.2019

FCIL

4/11/2014

LIST

A 1,259_427
T 18175
e, 39468
P 15141
‘e 12388 P X
I, 15077
123.88
472.83
S 266.80
P 20721
7T 91408
184.43
T 15215
A 78383
278.84
J'l.,i 15.79
Ty 13084
A1 284466
T, 170778
~U 22536
Sy 135375 X
£ 82054
T, 96736
S« 1,479.46
S, 135375
Lo 61590
N 8979
Jo 46420
Jn 17585

B n 6% 4% b WO 0O bR B BT A A O BT B B B B B BT e A A BT en B8 W0 A a
ey
r




Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1904-199

MNo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 565111
Tel No.. 6287 6666  Fax No.:6257 1330

CO./GST Reg. No. 2010196266

SHC 5402E
1 DOOR MIRROR ASSY LH § S 148340 X
TOTAL § 20,374.41
10% $ 2,037.44
$ 18,336.97
Specical Nett
1SET  BUMPER CLIP FRT § LA 6600
1 BUMPER BRACKET CLIP FRT LH $ YA 1200
1 BUMPER SUPPORT CLIP FRT LH 3 aa. 1050
1SET  BUMPER GRILLE LOWER CLIP $ v~ 59.00
1SET  FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL CLIP $ Ve 70.00
2 FRAME FULL SUPPORT PAMEL NUT $ Ao 20.00 X
. FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL STUD % “a. 3000
1SET  WHEELARCH CLIP FRT RH % v A 3050
1 FRONT LEFT TYRE RIM $ s 33000
1 FRONT LEFT TYRE $ /S 300,00
$ 938.00
TOTAL PARTS $ 19,274.97
LABOUR
Panel beating, knocking and straightening the
necessary portion, remove and renewal of parts,
adjust and realign the same 3 3,500.00 ?ﬁﬁ/
Putty and spray painting of the affected portion.  § 3,000.00 7 7 /
To rust-proofing of the affected areas. $ va 17000 A
To remove and refit interior fittings, trimings,
garnish, fittings and other, to enable repair. $ A 38000 X

To check steering geometry and computer wheel
alignment 4 Y 22000 X



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No.: 6287 6666  Fax No.: 6257 1330
CO./GS5T Reg. No. 2010196266

AAD1504-199

SHC 5402E
To transfer of tire, rim and on wheel balancing. g A~ 17000 X
To Check Electrical Lighting Concerned. $ 17000 Z e/
To transfer of Front fender fittings, attachment
and perform water seepage test. 3 A~ 38000 ¥
To transfer of Door fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test. $ 9 38000 ¥
To vacuum, replace, refix and recharge air
condenser $ S 380.00 X
To replace, refix and top up coolant for radiator ~ § ¢ 17000 ¥
To vacuum, replace, refix and recharge Air
Intercooler $ % 17000 > 4
TOTAL $ 9,090.00
Over All Total § 28,364.97
q<

LUMP SUM (REPAIR DAY)

_1e'DAYS

2ok,



' 74 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e Vol e A e 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

pray ar W
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199807198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCIM2007263/Kqdan2
serommeonson waneorcosserr 2 @0 | [N
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHD 6718H Veh. Inspected SHC 5402E
Policy No. Coverage (3$) 0.00
Claim No. D18002690MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From EILEENM LEE Assign Date 24/04/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model REMAULT LATITUDE (A) c.c 1985
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. WF1ABL1SAUC2T9583 Colour METALLIC WHITE / RED
Odometer 467218 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN CRDER Medification MIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60R16 GITI 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 Gm 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  19/04/2018 Inspection Date 25/04/2018
Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
NO.2 ANG MO KID ST 63
SINGAPORE 569111
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b, Estimate Days of Repair

]ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




r

Al Dis

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-89607198-R Page No::1of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 5402E
T Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER COVER FRT TO REPAIR SEE 1,259.42
LABOUR
1|BUMPER SPOILER FRT SERVICEABLE 181.75 -
1|BUMPER ABSORBER FRT SERVICEABLE 354 68 -
1|BUMPER RETAIMER FRT LH SERVICEABLE 151.41
1|BUMPER SUPPCRT FRT SERVICEABLE 12388 -
1|BUMPER RETAINER FRT RH SERVICEABLE 150,77 .
1|BUMPER SUPPORT FRT SERVICEABLE 123.88 =
1|BUMPER UNDERTRAY FRT SERVICEABLE 47283 .
1|BUMPER GRILLE LOWER FRT SERVICEABLE 266.80 2
1|BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE LH SERVICEABLE 207.21 -
1|BUMPER BEAM FRT TO REPAIR SEE 914.08 .
LABOUR
1|HEADLAMP LH MTG CRACKED 1,184 43 1,184.43
1|HEADLAMP PANEL FRT LH TO REPAIR SEE 152,15 -
LABOUR
1|FENDER PAMEL FRT LH TC REPAIR SEE T83.83 -
LABOUR
1|WHEELARCH FRT LH SERVICEABLE 278.84 -
1|FENDER BRACKET LOWER LH SERVICEABLE 16.79 .
1|FENDER INSULATOR LH SERVICEABLE 130.84 -
1|DOOR PANEL FRT LH TO REPAIR SEE 2,B44.66 -
LABOUR
1|RADIATOR GRILLE SERVICEAEBLE 1,707.78 -
1|RADIATOR GRILLE BADGE "RENAULT" NOT NECESSARY 22536 -
1|RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME SERVICEABLE 1,353.75 -
1|RADIATOR FAN COWLING SERVICEABLE B20.54 -
1|RADIATOR FAN MOTOR LH SERVICEABLE 967.36 -
1|RADIATOR FAN MOTOR RH SERVICEABLE 1.479.46 .
1|RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME SERVICEABLE 1,353.75 i
1|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL SERVICEABLE 615.90 -
1|FRAME FULL SUPPORT BRACKET TO REPAIR SEE 89.79 -
LABOUR

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18007263/Kqd3n2




' ’d 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sl B B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 62568 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607 198-R Page No.Z ol 3
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition i
Workshop ($)) ($)
1|{AIR CLEANER BOX SERVICEABLE 464.20 -
1]AIR CLEANER HOSE SERVICEABLE 175.85 -
1|DOOR MIRROR ASSY LH SERVICEABLE 1,483.40 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -2 037.44 -11B.44
18.336.95 1.065.89
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET BUMPER CLIP FRT (SN} NOT NECESSARY 66.00 -
1|BUMPER BRACKET CLIP FRT LH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 12.00 -
1|BUMPER SUPPORT CLIF FRT LH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 10.50 -
1|SET BUMPER GRILLE LOWER CLIP (SN} NOT NECESSARY 65.00 .
1|SET FRAME FULL SUPPORT PAMEL CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 70.00 =
Z2|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PAMEL NUT (SN} NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
2|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL STUD (SN) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
1|SET WHEELARCH CLIP FRT RH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 30.50 :
1|FRONT LEFT TYRE RIM (SN} SERVICEABLE 330.00 -
1|FRONT LEFT TYRE (SN} SERVICEABLE 300.00 -
938.00 -
LABOUR
PAMEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE 3,500.00 300.00
MECESSARY PORTION.REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
FPARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME.INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF BUMPER COVER FRT,BUMPER BEAM
FRT HEADLAMP PANEL FRT LH FENDER PANEL FRT
LH,DDOR PANEL FET LH AND FRAME FULL SUPPORT
BRACKET.
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 3,000.00 440,00
FORTION,
TO RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS. NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR NOT NECESSARY 380.00 >
FITTINGS, TRIMINGS, GARMISH,
FITTINGS AND OTHER, TO ENABLE REPAIR.
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND COMPUTER WOT NECESSARY 220.00 B
WHEEL ALIGNMENT
TO TRANSFER OF TIRE,RIM AND ON WHEEL NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
BALANCING.
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERMNED. 170.00 20.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19007263/Kgd3n2




'Y 74 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

_ T ma 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 4028033
- TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 8256 4315
Req. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607196-R Page Mo.:3 of 3
Estimate By | Qur Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
4 s Workshop (5)| __(5)
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT FENDER NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
TO TRANSFER OF DOOR FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND  |NOT NECESSARY 3B0.00 -
PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TO VACUUM REPLACE REFIX AND RECHARGE AIR NOT NECESSARY 3B0.00
CONDENSER.
TO REPLACE.REFIX AND TOP UP COQLANT FOR MOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
RADIATOR,
TOVACUUM, RERPLACE REFIX AND RECHARGE AIR NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
INTERCQOLER.
8,080.00 760.00
GRAMND TOTAL 28,364.95 1,825.989
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,450.00
{TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19007263/Kgdan2

Y dve

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appralser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is madae solaly for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




