Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 8:37 AM

To: Melody Teoh Man Lin; SUR; Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Liu Chun Cheong; Katherine Chong; Chong Min Seng; Simon Koh Eng Aun
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM: SJC3213Z

Dear Melody,

Please note on lump sum repair cost not exceeding $6600.00 (including any checked or supplementary items)

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 8:35 AM

To: Melody Teoh Man Lin <melody.teoh.manlin@simedarby.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; Steve Chen (LKK
Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Liu Chun Cheong <liu.chun.cheong@simedarby.com.sg>; Katherine Chong
<katherine.chong@simedarby.com.sg>; Chong Min Seng <chong.min.seng@simedarby.com.sg>; Simon Koh Eng Aun
<simon.koh.engaun@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM: SJC3213Z

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SJC 3213Z repair cost not exceeding
$6600.00 (including any checked or supplementary items). Excess $500.00

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Melody Teoh Man Lin <melody.teoh.manlin@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 11:56 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Liu Chun Cheong <liu.chun.cheong@simedarby.com.sg>; Katherine Chong
<katherine.chong@simedarby.com.sg>; Chong Min Seng <chong.min.seng@simedarby.com.sg>; Simon Koh Eng Aun
<simon.koh.engaun@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM: SJC3213Z

Dear Claims Handler,

We propose to do lump sum repair, not exceeding $7,200.00 for this vehicle SJC3213Z.

Best regards,

MELODY TEOH

Customer Service Advisor (Bodyshop)
Vantage Automotive Limited

305 Alexandra Road

Vantage Automotive Centre
Singapore 159942

Regent Motors Limited (FORD)
AutoFrance (PEUGEOT)

DID: +65 6477 7409

HP : +65 9278 2710

Email: melody.teoh.manlin@simedarby.com.sg

-

FELLCGECDT

From: Melody Teoh Man Lin

Sent: Friday, April 26, 2019 8:51 PM

To: sur@lkkauto.com; stevechen@lkkauto.com

Cc: Liu Chun Cheong <liu.chun.cheong@simedarby.com.sg>; Katherine Chong
<katherine.chong@simedarby.com.sg>; Chong Min Seng <chong.min.seng@simedarby.com.sg>; Simon Koh Eng Aun
<simon.koh.engaun@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: OD CLAIM: SJC3213Z

Dear Claims Handler,

For this vehicle, there will be a supplementary labour — To remove front section & all necessary parts to facilitate
jacking of chassis to mount car on celette bench, includes align & adjustment : $1680.00

Hence, We would like to propose to do Global Sum Repair @ $8,000.00 (before GST) for this vehicle SJC3213Z.
Hope to hear from you soon. Thank you.
Best regards,

MELODY TEOH

Customer Service Advisor (Bodyshop)
Vantage Automotive Limited

305 Alexandra Road

Vantage Automotive Centre



Singapore 159942

Regent Motors Limited (FORD)

AutoFrance (PEUGEOT)

DID: +65 6477 7409

HP : +65 9278 2710

Email: melody.teoh.manlin@simedarby.com.sg

-
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