Khanchna (LKK Auto)

e ————

From: ONG LI Ll <llong@®lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 24 October 2019 5:25 PM

To: Khanchna [LKK Auto), MT_Claim_SG

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE Accident  GBE 6369Y (TP) & XD 3281E (O1-LONPAC) on 16/04/2019

Dear Khanchna

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all (&% lonpac.com.sg

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 October 2019 2:29 PM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Cc; Admin A

Subject: Accident GBE 6369Y (TP) & XD 3281E (OI-LONPAC) on 16/04/2019

LPC ref; 18/19/19/VC05/021700

LKK REF: CC4/LPC19007213/Ukb3q2

Deaor Sir/Modam

we refer to the above matier.

Please ignore out e-mail that was sent earlier

we have highlighted to your good office on 24/04/201% of Third-Party's regquest to do Direct Settlement with our
Principadl, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

Our Insured driver collided into parked Third party vehicle. We opine that BOLA 22 is applicable and liability is
down against Insured.

summary 1o offer to third party repairer "KAN FOOK SING MOTOR WORKSHOP" as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount

1, Cesl of Repair [w/GST) $4.511.12 $3.103.00

1



2. Loss of Rental (5 days x $ 100) [w/G5T) $ 53500 $ 535.00 (5daysx $ 100) (w/GST)

3. LTA Search Fee 3 2.00 i 2.00
Tolal | § 5.048.12 3 3.640.00

**04 days recommendation for repair + 1 Sunday = 5 days
e above I

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| emall: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 5741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Dats: 28, Jua. 019

Name & Address Of Claimant Boon Megney Equipmeant Ple ud

c/o: KAN FOOK SING MOTOR WORKSHOP 61 DEFU LANE 12 SINGAPCRE 539147
Name & Address Of Third Party Insured:  Lenpéc |ﬂ§umu[‘ ﬁ-hil

Zop bBeach Read 413 -04/07 The roncouvie Singapore 199556

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident involving vehicles xBE 6364 1) & ¥P3L8iE [™

) an l‘-‘l‘.l“ﬁ along/ a
Bulim Avenae Lampyoof §
| am the owner of vehicle registration no:  GrBE b3bqV) which was Involved in the
above mentioned vehicle registrationno: XD A2 8IE which | understand is insured (s
with you. ;

The accident was clearly caused by your insured's negligence and | am therefore claiming compensation
from you for all financlal losses as ftemized below:-

1 Aepair Costs. 5% 3.\ i

2 Miscellaneous Items 55 —

3 Surveyor Fee 55 —

4 LTA/GIA Search Fee [ 2 e e — Al
5 Lessof Use / Rental for kd days @ 55 lrf 80 perday mﬁ 535.00

6 Excess 55 =

o s F {4000

| enclosed the relevant coples of documents in support of my clalms. Your prompt settiement of my claim
would be much appreciated. If you require any other information, please contact my workshop at KAN
FOOK SING MOTOR WORKSHOP , 61 Defu Lane 12 Singapore (539147), Tel: 6747 9560 Fax: 6748 1006,
Email: ryan@kanfs.net [ patricia@kanfs.net. | have authorized the said workshop to deal with my repairs &
accept payment in relation to the claim for repairs/loss of use & executs documents on my behalf for the
purpose of my convenience,

Please be infomed that this Letter of Demand is SOLELY for the claimant's claim for damage to motor
vehicle/ motor cycle no.. GBE HHﬂ and it does not include the clatmant’s cloim for persanal
injuries and medical expenses.

Please note that the claimant will only execute Dischorge vmdu-f in respect u,fhsf her cloim for the
damage to his/ her motor vehicle/ motor cycle no: HH"}

Thank you,

Your faithfully




WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMS

AUTHORISATION FORM

TO:-

KAN FOOK S5ING MOTOR WORKSHOP
61 DEFU LANE 12

SINGAPORE 535147

FROM:-

name: Proon Menay Equipment Ple Lid
NRICND: |AE 2 0LlZTbE

Dear Sir/Madam
accidenton 10 L 2019 invovingvehicles _GQBE $%69Y) & KD 328IE
slong/at _Bwlim pyeniug LAMppost § y

If'We Bern Meney Eguipment Pte Ltd the owner of
vehicle registration no: __ (BE LE% H hereby do autharize you. Kan Fook Sing Matar
Workshop to commence repairs to my mentionad vehicle.

1f We confirm that Kan Fook 5ing Motor Workshop Is hereby authorized to handle the repairs of my/ our
vehicls and/ or to negotiate and settle any claims relating to the above accident which |/ We may have
against other third party/ parties or insurers and/ or to instruct lawyers on my/ our behalf to facilitate the
third party claim for me/ us.

Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop Is here by authorized to execute and for sign my documents/ discharge
vouchers/ discharge agreements regarding my)/ our claim to facilitate my convenience. ALL PAYMENT
WILL BE MADE TO KAN FOOK SING MOTOR WORKSHOP,

Thank you.

Yours falthfully




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 18/19%19/VC05/021700
DATE : 11 NOVEMBER 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, BOON MENG EQUIPMENT PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of XD3281E the sum of Singapore
Dollar Three Thousand Six Hundred and Forty Only ($3,640.00) in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon
the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all propenty losses
sustained by me/us whether now or hercafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving XD3281E and GBEG369Y on 16
April 2019 along Bulim Avenue.

| /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/WOON FONG TRANSPORT PTE LTD (LUO WENZI)) against all claims
and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of
the said accident,

I/'We further authorize vou to pav the above settlement sum directly to KAN FOOK
SING MOTOR WORKSHOP,

[/We hereby acknowledged that this pavment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice 1o all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action,

Signature’ of vehicle owner/Date

Name of vehicle owner /Date



# % ¢ % 9 x B  TAX INVOICE

KAN FOOK SING MOTOR WORKSHOP No. 46852
Headquarter: 51 Delu Lane 12, Singapore 539147

Tel: (65) 6747 9560, 6743 5344, BAS8 4361 « Fax: (65) 6748 1006, 6281 8428
E-mail: ryan@kants.net / patricia@kanfs.net R

Branch: 1 Kakl Bukil Avenue 6 #01-13, Singapore 417TEE3
Tel: (65) 8481 5150 - Fax: (85) 6481 8683 GST Aeg, No M@-0005333-E

LONPAC INSURAMCE BHD INVOICE NO :46852
iggEEEﬁEH ROAD #17-04/07 THE CONCOURSE SINGAPORE DATE :25-06-2019
VEHICLE NO. : GBEG63IBIY

ACCIDENT DATE : 16-04-2019 12:40

THIRD PARTY REF. : XD3281E

ATTHN: MOTCR CLAIMS DEPT.
INVOICE COST OF REPAIRS TO VEICLE GBES369Y NISSAN CABSTAR

QTY FARTS DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (SG$)
LABOUR CHARGES
LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2500.00
TOTAL [ D) 2,900.00
TOTAL REPAIR COST : 2,9%00.00
GST % : 203.00
INVOICE AMOUNT : 3,103.00

IN PANEL-BEATING & BODY-WORK, DUR WORKSHOP IS WELL-EQUIPPED WITH THE LATEST TECHNOLOGY - CELETTE BENCH PULLER SYSTEM
WHICH ENABLE US TO MEASURE CORRECTLY & EMHMWENTWWMWWTﬂMﬂW



&1 Delu Lane 12, Singapore 5389
Tel: (65) 6747 9560 - Fax: (65) 6748 1

GBE (364 Y
()

KAN CAR RENTAL

147
ooe

Co. Reg. No.: 52008213 - GST RAeg. No.: 52-008213-J

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT Ve
[VEHICLE'S PARTICULARS Date Out , Datein: 311< |0
veh Reg No.: B “64€T  Enginecc., Time Dut: tl:j' ?-ti:;#‘cl ﬂmlné \‘\'—Mi‘ HF
Make/Model: Eja 100 Mileage Cut: -, Mileage in:
Comprehensive/ Third Party Only Coverage Fuel Level: E -\1a /). 12 - 34 - F
HIRER'S PATICULARS 5 oan Bs|pp  seow | & 500
Mame: fhpupn Mens Tel no. [R/O)! WIS ©5 per Wesh
Address: € quig s ¢nt §[ Mobile No- by aqid MONTHS @ § per Month /
ADO, L] per Howr
Nationality: SUB TOTAL| & S0
1] | Gender: V51§ 25
NRIC/ FIN No.: Driving Lic. No.: TOTAL CHARGE(§ S35
Date of Birth: Driving Exp: PAYMENT METHOD
| DRIVER'S PATICULARS
Name: M ntheor Tel no. (R/0)

Address:  Bam ¢4 Bugaar Mabile No.
Hltlumurh
3 | Gender _ AR AT
NRICS FIN No.- '[TGT’” an Drhlinil.lc.ﬂn,;&“;ﬂ‘}u"r
Date of Birth: ¥h Moy 1482 oriving Exp:
A R'S PATI
Name: Tel no. (R/O):
Address: Maobile No.:
Natianality Remarks: /
sl | Gender ** FOR SINGAPORE USE ONLY
MRIC/ FIN No.: Driving Lic. No.: ** TP / OD Excess 58 2,000.00 o
Date of Birth: Driving Enp: ** All damages borne by hirer Third Party Coverage vehicle

1.Tha Hirer and the Authorised Deiver muit be cwer 13 years af age and undes
5 years and be halding valld driving lcenaes and have a minimum of 2 pesrs
egular and gueified driving experience. Fadure 1o observe sppulation may
etwti) afl damages costl to be Dome By the Hirer | the Authovized Drives

2.0l vehicles are supplbed with petrol and should returned with petrol bevel

ewise. A service charge of 55 on top of a petrol surcharge is payable by e

Harer shold he Tadl 1o return the vehide at the appropriate petred level

3. Mo reflend for say retuin of vehicle. The Hirer ahall be liabie for sadinenal

jchrges lor any lace return ot the race shown per howr per day, inchushee of COW

and for PAl wheee applicable, Any returng alter oor operatian hours will be

chinrges 2s @ full day rental.

4. Lse of the wehicle for legal purpose (For smstance; |n conmection with theft,

drug peddiing or trafficking, smugglingl, b atrictly prohibited

5 Vehicie stricthy for Singapoce use only and may net be deiven gut of Singapore

without prics written coment of Kan Car Rental. The Miver iy Rable for 3 penalty

fer of S100 i additionad to the appropriate insserance 109 up o the cese of non-

disclomere of Malaysia usage.

&.The Hirer and/ar driver shall be responsibie for afl damages or losses

howsosver caused, sll traffic wolations, fines snd penalties impoged on the

wehicle for whatsoever reaion | respect ol of in connection with I1's use ¢

operation

7.The Hirer gnd/or Drrver shall b responsbie for ol clams, damages, losses,

ML e E P L n QI Fr i i< k0

ACKNOWLECGEMENT

| hove fead and Bgiee 1o e erml Bnd conditior of B apreement. I | have presented & charge)/credit caid for payment, | agres that ail amounts peyable uraer
|Ihﬁ agreemait and lor parking and traffic infringerments may be billed o the sccount and my sgnstune sbove will be considered to Reve been made on the
charge/credit card vouchey. Al information | have glven to Kan Car Bental in connection with this agreement b trus,

{inchuding tegal costs on & full indemnity basi], whatsoever snd howioever
brought against, sutfered of Incurred by you bn respect of the vehicle of the we or
the operation of the vehicle, Full exceds amount have to be pald immediately in
the event of an sccidem ocourred. Any demage 10 the vehiche will be repalred &
£ar Car Rental suthorized werkihop

BSmoke or permit tmoking and tranaport of pets in the vehicies ee not allowed
Arvy offenaive small g.g. cgarette, durian of pet’s smell, the Hirer and/or diiver
shiall bear the cost of removing the offensive smell or pet’s halr between 5200 -
$a00.

9. The Hirer agrees that & puntured tyre, ampty petral tank, loss of vebicle’s key ot
loched keys inslde of vehiche. by iHael!, dews not comititute o heeakdown and that in|
the evant the owner's 14-Mours Emergency Service ls called upon to respond to
such occurence, the Hirer snall bear the coast of such respoenses at 550,00 per
trip

10y case of sccident. the Hirer shall report to rental office immediately. An
accident repart must be made within 24 hours. Fadlure to comply, the Hirer will
have ta borme al kebility from ail perties claim. Full excess amount have 1o paid
immedintely in the event of sccident.

11.The HiterS Driver slio have the respomibility to emure that the radiator water
bwed m tha car by suificient snd 5o mot drive when the vehicle i3 s1adl and does not
have sulfickent water. Any damage 10 the sngine will be hear by the Hine/Deleer,
12,40 customer's data will be kept strictly confidential snd i solely used lor the
purpose of complenng the sales Tensaction and other relatng matierns.

JdTe]

proths il ] B WAl

Pl

oy s

Additional Driver's Signature

Ranted put by [Stafl name]
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Dmrnﬂnn Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE Co! Regisiration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Mot GR-18-081883

Date of Request: 20/04/2019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop

No. 61 Defu Lane 12

Singapore 530147

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 20/04/2018

Enguiry By Margarel Lee

TP Vehicle No. XD3281E

Accident Date 16/0472019

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No,
XDAzB1E Lonpac Insurance Bhd 11M2/2018-10/12/2019 +85 62507388
XD3A2B1E QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid 11M12/2018-10/12/2019 B2246633
Thank You,

The images provided 1o you are taken from the original reports forwardad 10 the centre by Ihe members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapare and we take no responsibility for thair accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
lpss or damage arising oul of or In connection with tha reports or thalr imageas.

This is a computer generated documenl and requires no signalure,




