Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Sam <samgoh@milanovending.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 10 May, 2019 10:05 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE2101D & SKW7937A ALONG/AT JUNCTION ROAD

OF EDGEFIELD PLAINS & PUNGGOL FIELD ON 15/04/2019

Dear Khanchna
Please proceed with the negotiation on the settlement with the Third Party and keep me posted of the outcome.

Our company registered office is at 5001 Beach Road #07-14 Golden Mile Complex Singapore 199588.
Kindly update your record and forward all correspondence to the registered address.

Thank you.

Best Regards ,
Mg o

Sam Goh,
Milano Vending Pte Ltd

Tel : 6543 9809,
191167492
Fax : 6543 9828
Email : samgoh@milanovending.com.sqg
Website : www.milanovending.com.sg

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 3:29 PM

To: SAMGOH@MILANOVENDING.COM.SG

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE2101D & SKW7937A ALONG/AT JUNCTION ROAD OF EDGEFIELD PLAINS &
PUNGGOL FIELD ON 15/04/2019

MILANO VENDING PTE. LTD
10 JALAN BESAR

#11-10

SIM LIM TOWER
SINGAPORE 208787

Attn: Mr. Goh Siong Choon
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE2101D & SKW7937A ALONG/AT JUNCTION ROAD OF EDGEFIELD PLAINS & PUNGGOL
FIELD ON 15/04/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SKW7937A against your motor insurance policy.



Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




