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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 24 April 2019 8:27 AM
'ANG Yvonne'
HO Vincent; CHAN Sam; KKLaU; LKK Valuation; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

RE: Assistance required: To effect MV for SGA898M

Dear Yvonne,

The market value of SGA 898M is $13K-$14K (Estimated) as at April 2019

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CHAN Sam <sam.chan@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday ,24 Aptil2019 7:36 AM
To: motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; KKLau <kklau @ lkkauto.com>; Jimmy Lee Priority svc <jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg>;
frankie @fta.com.sg; Autoprobe - Mr Tay <bhtay@a utoprobe.com.sg>; AutoProbe Admin -surveyor
<admin@autoprobe.com.sg>; LKK Valuation <va luation @ lkkauto.com>; ricky@rta.com.sg; patrick.soo @a-pac.sg; Olivia
Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkka uto.com>; nick@ lbs-auto.com; elson@rta.com.sg; cynth ia. o ng @ p riorityse rvices.sg;

collin.wong@a-pac.sg; be nso n @ lbs-a uto.com
Cc: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; HO Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Assistance required: To effect MV for SGA898M

Dear Partners,

Please assist to provide Ms Yvonne Ang with the Market Value for this
case,

DoA: L6/04/2079

Thanks in advance for your help.

Thanks & regards
Sam

---Disclaimer---
This message may contain confidentia I information intended solely for the use of the named add ressee. lf you a re not
the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. lf you have

received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this



PARF/COF RahAtA Fnnr rirv

Singapore NRIC

31238

SGA898M
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Vehicle to be Exported:
lntended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

77 Ap. 2Or9

TOYOTA
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:

Original Registration Date:

First Registration Date:

, PARF Eligibility:

LX RX3OO BMR

!i!Y9,
2005

1M21844034

JTJHF31U702011521

1s0.0 kW {201 bhp)

$49,383.00

19 )an2QQ6

19 Jan 2006 '
1

$s4,322.00

Forfeited

owner iD:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount: $o.oo
lntended COE Rebate Details

31Dec 2020

,- COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)

5COE Period(Years):

' . pep paid: $29.999.00
CQE Rebate Amount: $10,191.00
Total Rebate Amount: $10,191.00i Message
Please note that the 5'year coE tor this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon CoE ex1

-. vehiclc reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), wh ichever is ea rlie r . n I
I he information contained herein is correct as at 17 Api io19 t ,l r I 
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