Vic (LKEutn}

= = == #
From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Friday, 4 October, 2019 3:52 PM
To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A
L of .3 Chee So Chow: Elaine Cheong; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201807C02{cml) - <SEEK MAMNDATE=

RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XD8115U AND SKC9381J (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI19007133/ANb3 ) on 22.04.2019

LKK REF - CCB/CT 119007133/Ahb3

CTPIS REF - SNM19D201807C02(cml)

Dear Vic

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to offer as follow:

Cost of repairs $6,527.00
Loss of Use ($50.00 x 7 days) S 350.00
GIA Search fee L 2.00
Total $6,879.00

We await your payment advice to enable Elaine to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 TAT8

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: P-4tk Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mall and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential
information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole ar partial, is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mall and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October, 2019 5:50 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=; Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee 50 Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE=> RE: OUR REF: SNM15D201807C02(cml) - <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement -
Accident Involving XD8115U AND 5KC3381) (TP : LKK REF - CCh/CTI19007133/Ahb3 J on 22.04.201%

Dear Elaine,
We refer to our below email.

Please be informed that TP repairer is now chasing for settlement.



MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UEBI ROAD1 #01-61

SINGAPORE 408717

GST REG. NO : 200501102H

TEL:: G748 4422 | 6745 4422 FAX : 6747 6720

Email: chin@modernautomotive.com.sg

YOUR REF : XD8115U
OUR REF : SKX9381J

Date : 23.05.2019

The Claims Manager

China Taiping Insurance Co (s) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00

Spring Leaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Tel : 6222 2366

Fax: 86222 1033

RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX9381J & XD8115U ON 22.04.2019
ALONG SLE TPE NEAR WOODLANDS SOUTH FLYOVER

We refer to the above matter.

We have been authorized by our client Mr Chng Kai Xiang Joseph to make claim
against your insured vehicle No. XD8115U in respect of the above accident
for the following :

Repair Cost i %  B,527.00 (Incl GST)
Loss of use (7 days x $100) 5 700.00 %on
Search fee $ 2.00

Total: § 7,229.00

Enclosed herewith a copy each of the supporting documents for your perusal.
Kindly process the above and remit the payment to us asap.

Yours faithfully

;
= |

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd



- w Consultants
el . B Pte Lid

! V-L-f Auto

STUBLAYE L, #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (0635 67414108

Our Ref: CC6/CTIT19007133/Ajb3

01/07/2019

RLS TRANSPORT & ENGINEERING PTE. LTD.
24 BENDEMEER ROAD

#11-531

BENDEMEER VILLE

SINGAPORE 330024

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XDS8115U AND SKX9381.J ON 22/04/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third-Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

%./‘

Jimmy

Case Handler
DID: 6841 2928
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: jimmychen@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

. R
pate.22 VY.
TOWHOM IT MAY CONCERNM
Dear Sir,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE

SEXGIST (XD Sew

ON o U ALONG..SLE TIE Neay Woodleds
DO Tlydver .

This letter is to authorize MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD at Block 3023A, Ubi Road 1,
#01-61, Singapore 408717 to resolve the above matter.

In respect of this authorization, MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD has my/our authority to
decide on my/our behalf whether to accept any offer of settlement from the third party
insurers. l/we also agreed that all payments include Loss of Use to make in favour of
MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD.

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD is also authorized to sign all the required documents
include Discharge Voucher from the third party insurers on my/our behalf.

Yours Faithfully

------------------------------------

C L&'L‘u‘-“l |< 61'; -‘KIERLU] Jose ]11*-'1
Name /NRIC < ¢4, ;'s.is'é. |’3



Poliey Hao: DHMoVSHIBE40 651800 Claim Mo = SHMISDZO0IS0TCDZ{cml)

Claimant 4 CHNG KAT XIANG JOSEFH
Amoint SHE, BTS00
SINGAPCRE DOLLARS SIX THOUSAND EIGHT HUHDRED SEVENTY NINE
ONLY
I/We agree to accept the dbove menticoned amount to be paid to meidus in full &
fipal settlement of all claims,; gosts & disbursements forp Injuries / damages

sustained by mefus through an accident invelving

Claimant Vehicle Mo, 3 SEX 93B1J

Insured Vehicle No. + XD BILISU

Bate of Lass Y OE2.04.201%

Place of Accident + SLE TPE MNEAR WOODLANDS SOUTH TLYOVER

IN CONSIDERATION ¢f the payment made to mefuys of the aforementiened sum “by
CHINA TRIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) PIE. LTD., I/We agree absolurely to
discharge CHINA TAIPIMG INSURANCE {(2INGAPORE) PTE. LTD. andfor

Inzured MName » ALS TRANSPORT & ENGINEERING PTE LTID
Driver Name : RAMAIAH SRLASUBRAMANIAM

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by mefus erising ocut of the said accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admis=ion of liabkility on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) FTE. LTD.

{1] Gensral Damages 55
{2} Cost of Repair/Excess 5 &,527.700
{3} Loss of Use/Rental/Earning g% 350.00
{4} GIA/Police Reports/
Investigaticn Sesults/Search Tees 53 2,00
{5) Medical Reports/Expenses 55
{6) survey Fees/P.T. Fess 28
{7) Cost including Disbursement 35
TOERT: ¢ PSR 4 R B O OB 8 N ¥ U 158 6,879.00

Claimant Hame : Ci—'”""fj |28 k'ﬂ.'ruj M ".x*":":'Ld NEIC Mo @ = } &C SULg F

\
,_..#"
Signature H W Date : 1‘{- 1D ‘lQ\

v




MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UB|I ROAD 1#01-58/61 SINGAPORE 408717
TEL 67474422 67454422 FAX 67476720

GST REG. NO : 200501102H

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO {S) PTELTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRING LEAF TOWER SINGAPORE 079909

Aftention : Mator Claim Department
Contact : 62222366/63896111 Fax No. : 62221033

SN Quantity Parficular

Tax Invoice : TP001363

Date : 23/05/2019
Vehicle Num. : SKX 93814
MakeModel : HONDA VEZEL-2016

Chassis/Eng# :

Accident Date : 22/04/2012
Claim No.
Reference -

Policy No. : 5077667312-03

Unit Price Amount 5%

LABOUR :
ACCIDENT REPAIR (LUMPSUM) 6,100.00
Labour Total 55 - 6,100.00
Total 5% - 6,100.00
GST@ 7% S% ¢ 427 00
Amount Due 5% 8,527.00

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD




Page | of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration Na: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Invoice
GENERAL
INSURANCE
ASSODCIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Our Ref No: GR-19-063616

Date of Request:

23/04/2019 Your Ref Na:

Modern Automaotive Pte Ltd
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1

#01-61 & #01-58

Singapore 408717

Dear SirfMadam,

Online Purchase

Enquiry Date 23/04/2019

Enquiry By Chin Soi Shong

TR Vehicle Mo. xDBe1150

Accident Date 22104/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel, No.
xDBe1150 China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid 18M2R2018-17M272018 6389 6111
AD8115U China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 18/12/2018-17/12/2019 6380 6111
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no respansibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever far any

loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... 23-Apr-19



Invoice Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INS URANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday te Friday 9am to Spm
. G3T Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE
Qur Ref No: GR-18-063616
Date of Request: 23M04/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Maodern Automotive Pie Lid
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1
#01-61 & #01-58
Singapore 408717
Dear SirfMadam,
Engquiry Date 23/04/2019
Enguiry By Chin Soi Shong
TP Vehicle No. XDa11sU
Accident Date 22104/2019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)
TF Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use;
Date;
[X] GIROC [] Cash [ ] Cheque

https:x‘.’singaparc.rnt:rimen,com’-.:]aimsu’indcx.cfm'.’ﬁ1sehm=MTRsas&[‘hseaclimFdsp_... 23-Apr-19



