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arzarnia BPARENNE Bakata Fanmiing

" > Back to OneMotoring
-. Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Company
Crwner ID: A59TK

Vehicle Detalls

Yehicle No: SLGI0&1IM
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo

Intended Deregistration Date: 24 Apr 2019
Vehicle Make: HOMNDA,

Vehicle Modal: VEZEL 15X CVT
Primary Colour; YWhite
Manufacturing Year: 2015

Engine No.: L15B4032748
Chassis No. RU11112743
Madmum Power Output: F6.0 kW (128 bhp)
Open Market Value: $20.218.00
Original Reglstration Date: 215ep 2016
First Registration Date: 215ep 2015
Transfer Count: 1

Actunl ARF Paid: $10,304.00
Intended PARF Rebate Detalls

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 20 52p 2024
PARF Rebate Amount: $7.729.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 20 5epn 2026
COE Category: A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW {130b6hp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: §52,503.00
COE Rebate Amount: $38,892.00
Total Rebate Amount: £44,621.00

The infarmation contalned hereln |s correct as at 24 Apr 2019

OK

MIPEIVILR, GOV, SgMaNTYacIan/ enquire NEDae oy ruDNCoOaTONeLarnegInpul rruniu | IUN_IUSTUIEULY | )

LT



WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

47 Jal=n Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3833 Fax No. : 6455 7576

E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg

Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD Estimate : ES190064
64 CECIL ST #04-05 10B BUILDING
049711 Date : 22/04/2018
Vehicle Num. : SLG 1061M (LCR)
Attention : Motor Claim Department cr.“’iﬂ:‘;::; HONDA VEZEL
Contact : 6223 8122 Accident Date : 05/04/2019
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :
S/IN Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 5§
LIST ITEMS :
1 1 REAR TAILGATE N0~ 1,100.00
2. 1 REAR TAILGATE VEZEL EMBLEM MLC .~ 5L 8480
3. 1 REAR BUMPER EE .~ BE5,
4, 1 REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING  woC 7 IS5 185:00-
List TolalS§ : 2,244 60
20.00% Discount 5§ : 448.92
1,7956.68
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS :
1. 1SET REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS - X 30.00
. 1SET REAR BUMPER CLIP N - 30.00
3. 1SET REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT e R Eo up.gﬂ
Special Natt Total S§ : 140.00
LABOUR :
REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS |20 18000
:I"RAHBFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND ACCESSORIES 57 18d.00
WIRINGS CHECK AND RECTIFY WHERE NECESSARY o 18970
.REMCWE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN ORDER TO FACILITATE ﬂf'ﬂo B(Hﬁlﬂ
REPAIRS INCLUDING PANEL BEAT, STRAIGHTEN REAR PANELS
WHERE NECESSARY AND REPLACE ABOVE PARTS
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS 400 sogHo
Labour Total S§ ; 2,140.00
LKK Auto Con
tha Henairer o Ui
» To tesureey BOEng, Sy B2 Total S$ : 4,075.68
o 5 Sl dhporei i ———
Hoce Jo - Clete
o Cupolermeniany (e vad gnd
for WORLD AUTO PTE LTD in subyect 1o fingl Rparoval fsom |naurance Company 3 {4+ {"'f
hodraweiged by Pepast P’ P ‘f‘a{ﬂjg
Sgnatare i
Dt ..@"




Niviti (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 5:18 PM
To: Gan Ping; 'sur@Ikkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Ce: Sundari Nagarajan - |l
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR THIRD PARTY MOTOR CLAIM SURVEY

1-zeanyD 23 /4 hﬁ
Dear Sir / Mdm, Qi P
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLG1061M and let us have your report urgently. i e M

At k"y.u P

This claim will be handled by Ms Sundan. E.'

*Kindiy upioad this survey request email 1o merimen.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee
. INDM
P [nTERNATIONAL
[NsurAnCE
i NG AFODR]]
Serving i region dnce ] RIT
64 Cecil Streat; #05 - 10B Building

Singapare 045711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Gan Ping [mailto:ganping@worldauto.com.sg)

Sent: 22 April, 2019 3:12 PM

To: Motor Claim - Ill €motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Cc: 'Adrian’ <adrian22 @worldauto.com.sg>; geraldine @worldauto.com.sg; daniel@waorldauto.com.sg
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR THIRD PARTY MOTOR CLAIM SURVEY

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We are agreeable with LKK Auto Consultants

Thks & Rgds,

Gan ping

World Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 83621776

Fax: 63631250

From: Motor Claim - Il €motorclaim@iii >
Sent: Monday, April 22, 2019 1:28 PM

To: daniel@worldauto.com.sg
Cc: ‘Ping, Gan' <ganping@worldauto.com.sg>; ‘Adrian’ <adnian22 @worldauto.com,sg>;

1



geraldine@waorldauto.com.sg
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR THIRD PARTY MOTOR CLAIM SURVEY

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your emall.
We proprose using one of the fallowing mator surveyors:

* LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list,

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

o Inpia
P INTERNATIONAL

InsurANCE
SINGAPIDRI
Aarving the ragisn unee [
B4 Cecll Street; 405 - 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: daniel@worldauto.com.sg [mailto:daniel@worldauto.com.sg]
Sent: 22 April, 2019 12:02 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iil.com.sg>

Cc: 'Ping, Gan' <ganping@worldauto.com.sg>; 'Adrian' <adrian22 @worldauto.com.sg>;
geraldine @worldauto.com.sg

Subject: REQUEST FOR THIRD PARTY MOTOR CLAIM SURVEY

Importance: High

Good afternoon,

We would like to request for a third party motor claim survey, details as follow;
Our Vehicle: SLG1061M

Your Insured: SHA3503X

DOA: 05-04-2019

Qur vehicle is currently in the workshop, address as follow;
World Auto Pte Ltd

No.1, Kranji Loop

Singapore 739535

Please response immediately upon receiving this request, send us your list of Loss Adjustor for our choice
within 48 hours.

Kindly note that should you fail to response to us within the above stipulated timeline, we may, at our
discretion, appoint our own Loss Adjustor to perform this PRI.



Thks & Rgds,
Daniel

World Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 63621776

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted. lost, delayed or contain viruses,

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification,

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, vou are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing yvour personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K
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Mariman 8-Claims

Print Received Message

This mall is associatad with

*SLG1061M (MCT18040103)
[SHA3503X]
TP
LCRF PTELTD
Apr 5 2018 12:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
World Auto Pta Lid

From
To
Subject

India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (III_SG), sent on 22/08/2019 17:06 PM.

LKK_HQO
Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$2701.00) - SLG1061M - Ciaim Handler: Sundari Nagarajan

Approved:2701.00: WS to ralse Tax Involce for Cost of repairs in IIl's name

hips:/isingapore. merimen.comiciaims/index.cfm?fusebox=5VCmall&fuseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=58124432ACFTOKEN=ceB81181dceal 710-25,.

1M



WORLD AUTO PTELTD
47 JALAN PEMIMPIN #01-02/03
HALCYON 2

SINGAPORE 577200

10/05/2019

Your Ref:
Our Ref : TP/2561/2019

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
64 CECIL ST

#04/205 10B BLDG

SINGAPORE 049711

Attention: Motor Claims Dept — Third Party

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO. SLG1061M / SHA3503X ON 05/04/2019

Reference 1s made 1o the aforesaid matter (on behalf of our client M/S LCRF)

Enclosed herewith are the following documents for your information and necessary
actions only:-

a) Our Final Repair Bill

Please assist in our claims of:

Final Bill S 2300.00 (already finalised)
GST 7% 5 161.00
Loss of Use (S60 x 4 days) 5 240,00
Amount S 2701.00

Kindly let us have your reply and payment as soon as possible.

Thank you for your kind attention and much appreciated assistance.

Yours faithfully,
ﬁ\\.
7
|.,_1..?__ ,

A\



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

In the matter of the following accident:-

DATE OF ACCIDENT : 05/04/2019
CLIENT'S VEHICLE NO : SLG1061M
PLACE OF ACCIDENT : MARINE TERRACE
THIRD PARTY VEHICLE NO : SHA3503X

|/We, LCRF PTE LTD

ADDRESS: 29 PAYA LEBAR ROAD, PAYA LEBAR OFFICE CENTRE
UEN/NRIC/FIN NO : 201624597K

Tel.(0) (H) (MOBILE }

I/We hereby authonre and appoint World Auto Pte Ltd to act for me/us in respect of the above
matter up toe the final conclusion of the said matter.

I/We hereby autharize and appoint World Auto Pre Ltd to act for me/us far the purpose of
negotiating and enter into settlement with the tortfeasor, their insurers or solicitors appointed
by the tortfeasor/finsurers without the need to commence action

I/We hereby authorize World Auto Pte Lid to receive on my,/our behalf all settlement sums

and disbursements including loss of use/rental to pay to yoursalves all costs you may at any
lime receive in connection with the above mention matter

DATED THIS 05 ™ DAY OF APRIL YEAR 2019

Name: LCRE PTE LTD
UEN No: 201624597K



INDA INTIRNATIONAL INSURANCE PTI LTD

.. INI.’IIA
Ui bleg Ma DUETOTTSRE | GST Meg Mo 80200 TRiMN-X
!HTERHA"IUHM sl | Cawl Shrewd | ®0g | @0% | sonen | R Taiding | Singapane 1497 )
!N!UMHC! itee (A RATRIN  Emal e oo g
LU O Fas  (6A) 62204174 Wisboaile o (Lo sty nl

ey —

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

RISCHARGE VOUCHER
ll-Direct Settlement (PODS)
India Ref: MCT15040103
Claimant Rel - 510 1061M
W, WORLD AUTG PTELTD ("the warkshop”) hereby confirm that wefl have reached an agreemeni
with the appointed Surveyor of India International Insurance Pie Lig LEX AUTO CONSLLTANTS PTE LTD [rurme

of Surveyar) with respect 10 the amount claimed for 5% 2seaco L et ————————
e —— ANl OO SLG UM (hal was damaged pursuant to Ihe accident which oocurred
on _ OS0AT010  (dale) 3t _MAMMNE TERRACE (location] mvolving vehicle no. _SHA 35034 (insured

vehicke). This is pursuant fo the nepechon conducted on | SVoeaoe (date} al “the workshop®

Wel confirm thal we/l arelam authorized by the owner LCREPTELTD {"the third party
clmmant”) of vehicle no. SLG108IM o make the claim as sel oul in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle
hmmmﬁmmhamamhlmmmHﬂﬂmﬂmmmnhmwmmumwmmm
party claimant”.

W/l further confirm that well will iIndemnity India Intermational insurance Pe Lid for all damages, Ings andior expense thal
they will or have already ncumed in Ihe event thal “the third party claimant® sfter the above sald agresment lodges &
ir.nhnrmumnuammrumrurlwlnuundmnluﬂmpaﬂdrﬂmlunmdmmhmﬂmmﬂﬂnrm
of use pursuant lo the damage o _8LG 081N {vehicke no ) as 3 resull of M accident

Well confirm that the agreement raached above Is in full and final settiemeni of all claims of "he third party claimant”

pursuant 1o the acciden| and that further this sattlement is reached on a without prejudice and wilhoul admission of Lability
basis.

This agreement (s subject to the application of Singapore law and ihe Singapare Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any
Sipute anaing oul of the same.

Wil @uatiroriem you o ey o veu e ol O% Lo0e ig o _VWOnLD ALUTD FTE LTD

WITNESS: [ [ %) :|
Signature: '/ o
Signed by appoinied Surveyor
{ g Mame: LMK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTELTD
NRIC '5 fPF?lr{f‘ ,D MRIC: _Agps0T 1R
Addrees S  Kim 1’:1“*-"' J’fd-»\L Addrass: 51 UBHAVE 1. PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
l $37070) #02-24 SINGAPOSE 4oe3)
Mationality 'jrf‘ Af"wl Nationality

p— Ao ﬂﬁmg.u :



WORLD AUTO PTE LTD
47 JALAN PEMIMPIN §01-02/03 HALCYON 2 BLDG
SPGRE 577200
Tel No. ; 64513833 Fax No. : 64557576
E-Mall : worldaut@singnet.com.sg
Webslite : www.worldauto.com.sg
Tax Reg. NO. : 200006765H Buss. Reg. No. - 200006765H

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD .
64 CECIL 5T, 404/05 108 BUILDING Tax Involce : F189323
S'PORE 049711 Date : 10/05/2019
Vehicle Num, : 5LG 1061M
Attention : Motor Claim Department ﬁg"‘:‘;ﬁ;‘ : HONDA VEZEL-1.5(A)
Contact : 63476100 63476139-LALITA Fax No. - 62244174 Accident Date : 05/04/2019
Claim No. : TR/2561/2018
Reference :
Pollcy No. :
S/N Quantity Particular UnitPrice  Amountss
LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,300.00
Total 85 : 2.300,00

Total 85 : 2,300.00
CST 794655 - 161.00
Amount Due 55 : 2,461.00

%

“WORLD Aufq PTELTD




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiement

|CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
| Case Hotified Eat Submitted Ad) Assighed Ad) Rpt Agj Submitted {ns Auth’sd Status

|23 A0r 2019 i $$1,300.00 | $$2,300.00 'm.“m fe Suresy
| _san nag | nest Act Mot | gt esnmates | | view not | Canest Cass |

HMain

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Crested by adjuster]
Ingured. COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, (o Reg. Noo: -
ot |LERFPTELTD, Co. Rep. Mo.: 201624597%
Vehicle feg _ | D%/04/201% 0000 - :59
Mo SLG1061M Datz of LosE: | /35 Manths and 15 Days From LTA Rep Date (Man ¥r)]
Claim Type: TP / MCT19040103 POliEY/COVE | weoMo01S
Vehice Reg.
Ne. SHAI503X Poley e, |19-MKD00194-R00
[Insured): -
Excess:
Rapairer; World Auto Pte Ltd - Halcyan 2 (HQ) 47 JALAN PEMIMPIN #01-03/03 HALCYON 3 BLDG, 577200 Bishan - Tet: 6451 3933
m"r"':" India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 . [Handled by Sundarl Nagarajan - 6347 6071)
mm'w:" g Tekio Marine Insurance Singapore Lid (HQ) - Tel: 6221 8111
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) - Tel- 6256-3561 _ [Handled by ONG WWEE J1E] ... [Final Rpt due 03/05/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All |  Compose Case Mail ||
« [11_5G [22/08/2015)° Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$2701.00) - SLG1061M - Claim Handler: Sundari Nag...
« [5G (22/07/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved {5$0.00) - SLG1061M - Claim Handler: Sundari Nagara...
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View Al | Search Tasks | create wew Tase | compiese |
Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Completed On Created On Dane?
Mo results

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 19/9/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLG1061M (MCT19040103)
[SHA3503X]
T
LCRF PTELTD
Apr 5 2019 12:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
World Auto Pte Ltd - Halcyon 2

Page 1 of 1

upeoad Oucumanis | Upinad hotos | Composs tew Lettar | View [Viem o Srowear v ]
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregne 1sssorisem)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 5256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4MI189007102/)GB30Q2

Date: 18/08/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Lid  Policy No MCOMOOD15
Claimant "
Vehicle No : SLG1081M Insured Vehicle No : SHA3503X
Date of Loss: 05/04/2019 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18040103
R ICAT F I
Reg No: SLG1061M
Make & Model: HOMNDA VEZEL, 1.5 (A) Engine No: L15B4032748
Reg Date: 21/09/2016 (Man, Year: 2015) Chassis No: RUO11112743
Colour White Odometer; 178795 km
Engine Capacity 1466 cc
Markel Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S5): Market Value/New Car Price
10N OF I ATT R
General Condition Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condilion:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Fronl Tyre Size: 215/60 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 215/80 R16
Front Lefi Side: Giti & mm Rear Left Side: Giti 6 mm
Front Right Side: Giti 6 mm Rear Right Side; Giti 6 mm
The above waiues represant the mmasng e reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  DIff %
Parts 1,935.68 1,826.80 108.88 562
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,140.00 1.000.00 1,140.00 5327
Paintwark Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 4,075.68 2,626.80 1,248.88 30.64
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 2,300.00
(5%) 407568 2,300.00 1,775.88 4357
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (55) 285.30 161.00 124.30 4357
Nett Amount (S§) 4,360.98 2,461.00 1,899.98 43.57
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x S$50.00/day) (5$5) 200.00
Nett Liability (S8) 2,661.00
Global Sum Settlement (S%) 2,660.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignmant: 22/04/2019
Date Inspected: 23/04/2019 Inspecied At 1 KRANJI LOOP
Repairer;World Auto Pte Ltd (HQ)
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: ONG HWEE JIE Manager: Chong Pui Lin
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NOTE: This report represants our fingings st the time and piace of inspsction stated herein. Such inspection s Deen carmed oul 1o the bear of our
knawiwdpe and ability but any ofher fabdfty undar sy other circumstances i heraby sxprassly excluded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 14 Aug 2019)

Parts: M1-SUvV HONDA VEZEL 1.5 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0}
|Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLG1061M)

Validity: These astimates are valid only if they contain the print code {above) on all estimale pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: ltemsivalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 A *REAR TAILGATE Denled 1,100.00FL *1,100.00FL
2 1 *REAR TAILGATE VEZEL EMBLEM MNecessary B4BOFL "SBOOFL
E 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed B6E5.00FL “BES.00FL
4 1 *REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING Necessary 185.00FL *150.00FL
5 1 *SET REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS Nol Necessary 30.00Fs *-F§
B 1 *SET REAR BUMPER CLIP Necessary 30.00FS "30.00FS
T 1 *SET REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT MNecessary B80.00FS "BO.00FS

b

=Fmnchise part. S=SpcMetl. L=ListitemDisc.
Sub Total (S§) 2,384.60 2,261.00
- List Itam Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (S5) 445 92 434 20

Total Parts (S§) 1,93568  1,826.80

| Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellansous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltams
1 REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS New 180.00 120.00
2 TRANSFER REAR BOOT LID MECHANISN AND New 180.00 50.00
ACCESSOES
3  WIRING CHECK AND RECTIFY WHERE NECESSARY New 180.00 30,00
4 REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN ORDER TO New B0OO.00 400,00
FACILITATE REPAIRS INCLUDING PANEL
BEAT ,STRAIGHTEN REAR PANELS WHERE NECESSARY
AND REPLACE ABOVE PARTS
5 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS New B00.00 400.00
Gross Labour Cost (SS) 2.140.00 1.000.00

Repont was unsubmitted during this prnint-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 19/9/2019



