Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 May, 2019 9:07 AM

To: Meekey Yap; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Meikwan@Ikkauto.con

Cc: assignments; Admin A; ar_claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: CHECK LIABILITY - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ6366K & YOUR INSURED:

SMD6704M DOA: 06/04/2019 LKK REF CC6/AIG19007082/ha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Meekey,

Please be informed that we are still pending for our Insured’s GIA report. Thus, we are unable to advise liability yet.
We will continue to follow up on the matter.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LIRS

" Save the Larth Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Meekey Yap [mailto:meekey.pegasusengrg@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 3 May, 2019 9:01 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Meikwan@Ikkauto.con

Cc: assignments; Admin A; ar_claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg

Subject: Re: CHECK LIABILITY - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ6366K & YOUR INSURED: SMD6704M DOA: 06/04/2019 LKK
REF CC6/AIG19007082/ha3

Dear Mei Kwan, Vic and Hsiao Tong,

Kindly check and advise liability.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Mee Key

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Email: meekey.pegasusengrg@gmail.com
Office: 6513 7748

Fax: 6251 3161




On Tue, 30 Apr 2019 at 09:59, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Meekey,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are still pending for our Insured’s GIA report.

We will follow up and will get back to you for an update.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

N Save the Larth- Print only wherr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Meekey Yap [mailto:meekey.pegasusengrg@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 23 April, 2019 2:18 PM
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)




Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); assignments; Admin A; CS A Team; ar_claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg
Subject: CHECK LIABILITY - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLI6366K & YOUR INSURED: SMD6704M DOA: 06/04/2019

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Kindly check liability.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Mee Key

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Email: meekey.pegasusengrg@gmail.com

Office: 6513 7748

Fax: 6251 3161

On Tue, 23 Apr 2019 at 12:32, Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We will arrange to survey the car on 29/04/2019.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
3



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 8:31 AM

To: assignments <assignments @lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ6366K & YOUR INSURED: SMD6704M DOA:
06/04/2019 - ARRANGE SURVEY

Hi Admin/ Assign Team,

Kindly assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Meekey Yap <meekey.pegasusengrg @ gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 1:01 PM

To: Jowee <joweesetee @lkkauto.com>

Cc: Pegasus Engineering <ar_claims @pegasusengrg.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ6366K & YOUR INSURED: SMD6704M DOA: 06/04/2019 -
ARRANGE SURVEY

Dear All,

We refer to the above matter.
We enclose the following documents for your attention:-

a. Copy of our client’s SAS report and damaged photos;

Pursuant to paragraph 2.3 of Pre-Action Protocol for NIMA Cases, please let us have a list of 10 motor surveyors for
our selection and please let us know within 2 working days whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of our
client’s vehicle. If we do not hear from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle
without further reference to you.

In the event that you request for post repair inspection pursuant to paragraph 4.1 under the NIMA Protocol, you must
compensate our client for the loss of use of his/her vehicle for the day that the inspection is conducted.

In addition, please confirm in writing whether you are agreeable to direct settle with us at 100% liability for this case.

Vehicle will be grounded on 29/04/2019, please arrange to survey our client's vehicle at 74 Kian Teck Road
$628800.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Mee Key

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Email: meekey.pegasusengrg@gmail.com

Office: 6513 7748

Fax: 6251 3161
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