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Clate:22-04-20188
Te: Metor Claims Departmant

RE Estimate repair cost of SMES28T

Dear SirMtadam,

Venicle Mo, SMES28T

Make Modal: Toyota Senta 1.5
Data of accident 21-04-2018

m“mmnmmnmum“wm

—_

Gy 5 ~Unit TOTAL
1 Rear bumper Tr3-7r¢ - =
2 |Rear bumper retainer —AHIDT 962 195.40| 7~
1 Rear bumper top gamish o 425 80| —
1 Rear bumper side garnish LH 247 388.10| =7
5 Rear bumper clips 3 15.00| —
7 [Bootlid LA 7368 50 —
T [Bootlid upper lock 121.90| ¥
1 Boot lid Toyota logo Aa, AW
2 Rear windscrean mouliging 85.3 180.60
1 Rear end pane| 37 = 558.30 35‘
1 Rear snd panel innar gamish 22580
1 Weather sirips #7 | Jom 22130 A~
1 Reverse sensor LH Per 234 80|
1 SIENTA" ambiam ‘Ae, B8.00| —
1 |Rear end sensor 127 v < w0 R
Sub-total before discount - 5351.00|
Paris percentage discount 20% 7 3 | 1070.20
PARTS TOTAL B -3 4280.80
LABOUR CHARGES & MISC :
1 Labour io dsmantie. panel beat, repiace
mw.mﬁ.wmnﬁiﬁnmm 1m_msif‘f
7 [To remove and refit rear windscrean 150,00 “Z<¢
3 To putly and spray paint 80000 (ﬁf
4 To check wiring 5000| 2¢r
5 To provide undercoaling 5000 3‘4'
LABOUR TOTAL 1250.00
iID.T‘uﬁ"___ R & PARTS TOTAL 530.80
H 3 b ar ]
Terrance Lim s - |




RALLY PITSTOP

178 Sin Ming Drive
#04-17 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721
Tel: 64516985
Email; tar6985@hotmail.com
Date:22-04-20189 Vo7 Ay beots
To: Motor Claims Department ﬁ‘ L, /8,
i 6)"/'/’**7'
RE: Estimate repair cost of SMES28T Your Insured: SMD747D 52,_
Dear SirfMadam, e o
Vehicle No. SMES28T
Make Model, Toyota Sienta 1.5
Date of accident 21-04-2018
We are pleased to quote you the repair cost for the above-meanlionad vehicla:
Qty Description Unit Price TOTAL
1 Rear bumper ~¢ 953.20| “—
2 Rear bumper retainer ALTD7 98.2 196.40| %~
1 Rear bumper top gamish v 42580 e—
1 Rear bumper side garmnish LH 388.10| -~
5 Rear bumper clips i| ~e 1500 —
1 Boot lid B, 135850 «—
1 Boot lid Lpper lock #T 121.30| ¥
1 Boot lid Toyota logo e 3830/~
2 Rear windscreen moulding 85.3| e, 190.50|=—
1 Rear end panel £58.30| -7
1 Rear end panel inner garnish A 22580| X
1 Weather stripe 22130 <
1 Reverse sensor LH s 23480
1 SIENTA' emblem ‘Ax, BO.B0| —
1 Rear end panel key sensor 23280 7
Sub-total before discount = 5351.00
Parts percentage discount 20% 7 3 ) 1070.20
PARTS TOTAL - 4280.80
LABOUR CHARGES & MISC
1 Labour to dismantle, panel beat, repair & replace
rear bumper, boot fid, rear end panel & all the necessary paris 1200.00] 7
2 To remove and refit rear windscreen 150.00 ffi-'(
3 To putty and spray paint 800.00| 4% a4
4 To check wiring 50.00| 2¢
5 To provide undercoating 50.00| 7
LABOUR TOTAL 2250.00
LABOUR & PARTS TOTAL 6530.80
Regards,

Temance Lim



Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Terrence Lim <tarG9B5@hotmail com>
Sent: Wednesday, 26 June 2019 11:22 AM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SME928T after repair photos
Attachments: SMES28T aut letter 001 jpg

Thanks & Regards,

Terrence Lim

91005500

From: Jia Le [LKK Auto) <JiaLle@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 26, 2019 11:15 AM
To: Terrence Lim

Subject: RE: SME928T after repair photos

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Temence.
Flease let us have the Authorization to Act sign by your client.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email; Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-3108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Terrence Lim [mailto:tar6985@hotmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 26 June 2019 11:10 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SME92ET after repair photos

hi
DV attached.

Thanks & Regards,
Terrence Lim
91005500

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2019 5:48 PM



. To: Terrence Lim
Subject: RE: SME928T after repair photos

Without Prejudice
Dear SirfMmdm,
We refer o the above matter.

We propose setflement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair 3 3.845.03
2. Loss of Use [5days x $60) $ 30000
TOTAL | 54149.03

Flease duly sign the DV enclosed and return with Authorization to Act together 1o us.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed |
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially alTect/influence on the
issues of liahility/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Hest Regards,
Carlor Chan | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 2:10 PM

To: Terrence Lim

Subject: RE: SME928T after repair photos

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD 747D & SME 928T ON 28/04/201%

We refer to IThe above matler,

We propose settlemen! at a global sum of $4,100.00{all-in),
Please confim acceplance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting 1o legal proceedings. No admission of lability, whatseever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotintion of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/dnmages. either party is not bound, thereafier, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6740 5702 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Terrence Lim [mailto:tar6985@hotmail com |
Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 9:02 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SME928T after repair photos

Hello

| month pass since we sent you the LOD, if we never heard from your side by today regarding the DV we'll
pass this case to lawyer.

Regards

Terrence Lim

-

Original message
From: "Jia Le (LKK Auto)" <Jiale@lkkauto.com>

Date: 24/06/2019 12:55 (GMT+08:00)

To: Terrence Lim <tar6985@hotmail.com™>, "Asher Sng (LKKAuto)" <Ash ' 20
Subject: RE: SME928T afier repair photos

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD 747D(AIG) AND SME 928T ON 24/06/2019
we refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear
and shall proceed with ditect settiement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail Is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of
repair to your client’s vehicle,

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according fo the nature of the
occident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Please note that all finalisation subject insurer’s approval,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

3



Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6740 5792 | emuail: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Terrence Lim [mailto:tar6985@hotmail.com|
Sent: Monday, 24 June 2019 12:38 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SME928T after repair photos

Hi Jia Le,

Please let us hear from you by today.
Our last email to you was 24/5/19.

Thank you.

Regards,
Angela Tang
090494578

On 21 Jun 2019, at 1:54 PM, Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@ lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS
Hi Angela,

We refer to the email below.

The current case handler for this case is Jia Le.

She will look into the matter and settle with vou soon.

Hi Jia le,

Kindly assist.

Thank You.

Best Regards
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKE Auto Consullants Pe Lid



phone: 4841-4051 | emalt gshersng@ikkguto com | fox: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industicl Park. Upl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Terrence Lim <tar6985 il.com™>

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 11:35 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@/lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SME928T after repair photos

Dear Asher,
We have yet to hear from you since our last email to you dated 24/05/2019.

Please advise if you are doing direct settlement with us or shall we pass to our lawyer to
settle with AIG with the settlement?

Please let us hear from you by today.
Thanks & Regards,

Angela Tang
90494578

From: Terrence Lim <tar6985(@hotmail . com>
Sent: Friday, May 24, 2019 12:15 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: SME928T after repair photos

Dear Asher,

Attached herewith our LOD & Repair Invoice.
Please assist.

Thanks & Regards,
Terrence Lim
91005500

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto com=
Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2019 9:24 AM

To: Terrence Lim
Subject: RE: SME928T alter repair photos

Attach finalised for SME 928T.

From: Terrence Lim -

Sent: Thursday, 2 May, 2019 10:39 AM
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: SME928T after repair photos

Regards
Terrence Lim



RALLY PITSTOP

176 Sin Ming Drive,

#04-17 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapare 575721

Tel: 6451 6985

Email: tar6985 @hotmail.com

Your ref: MT/1038510-002
Qur ref: SME928T

Date: 23 May 2019
AlG

Motor Claims Division
Dear Sir/Madam,

Accident involvi MD747D (AIG) and SME928T on 28-04-

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle: SME928T
which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle:
SMD747D. The vehicle owner has requested and authorized us to assist him in
presenting his claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.
As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are
submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

Cost of Repair $ 384903
LOU 6days @ $60/day $ 360.00
TOTAL $ 420903

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims: -
Repair Invoice
LOD

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our
client's claims as soon as possible.
Thank you.

Yours Sincerely,
Terrence Lim



f

Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June 2019 3:23 PM

To: JIMMYYAP4B@GMAILCOM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD 747D & SME 928T ALONG/AT BISHAN RD NEAR

TRAFFIC LIGHT ANG MO KIO AVE B ON 21/04/2019

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19007079/Kda3
16 JUNE 2019

YAP YIAN HUAT
161 KILLINEY RD
H10-05

SINGAPORE 235569

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD 747D & SME 928T ALONG/AT BISHAN RD NEAR TRAFFIC LIGHT ANG MO KIO AVE 8 ON
21/04/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SME 928T against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liabllity is not in your favour as it is head
to rear collision. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further gueries.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5702 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz2-25 | 5(408933)



Authorization Letter

Fa: RALLY PITSTOR

RE. ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE %-\E‘IJPT Lk Onmp3etD
AT My ke
1

0N

Please et fiar me/us in respect of the stovesnentioned maties. 1/ We herety mshisrire
o -

& To apply for the Accident Report fhrum GLARME and sl oiher relevani
documents oe my beball

B To comsnence pegair ol my vehicle lorhulib,
€ Toclmm s, reeive whstever ummount payable by the imurance compansy

d romlﬂmw; lorees and all hevessary papers in
connection with the above cluim fizr and on iyt behalf

L anmhlﬁm-l‘idi:ihnmmnfwﬁuﬂum ahuill dpemn £l Hor the
purpane of the thind pares isuser’ s clatm .

£ Toinfunn you anidior the Salichior sppotmed by vou on my behalf in the event the
mum'iu—ummmm-ﬂrwﬁwiiqm
| harther underuake not 1o srcept any menies or offer of sciberment from the thind
Py’ ) presrers without first communicating sith you snd ohtaintng yer consent

B Tocooperase fully with you and the Solichior appeimied o see the claim o
ssccemiful conilusion.

Duted this 22doyof O% (9

. T

Company Seanmp



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asls Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

wdwmmﬁmmummw-w
-umwm-mﬂammmﬁ:wnum
Wt—ﬂmlﬂmhﬁﬂlm“
mm;mﬂmWIHMm
MHHMMNMMMMHWIM
ANG MO KI0 AVENUE § (location) involving vehicle no/s SMD 747D This bs pursuant o the
impection conducted an ZAOAZ019 (date} st ~the workabop®,

Weol confirm that 'we'l sre/sm suthorieed by the ownes TAN HEE CHONG (“the thind party
claimant™) of vehicle mo m-&um-muhhmmum
mmmu-ﬁuuﬂ-wuﬂrmmunﬂmmmm
herzin the letier of muthority given by “the thind party claimant™

wmuﬁ-uhmmmm&mﬂmmmmmhmm
hmmﬁmﬂEWMMhhwﬂ‘hﬂmw
ﬂ—'#&ﬂ:ﬂmm-hﬁ-:ﬁh#nmnnud
-_m,nhﬁumﬂmmnﬂ-ﬁﬂhdﬂmu
u---mmm-n—u-rhw erelode HJ-? 14 funs

W/l confirtn that the agreement resched sbove iy in full snd final settlement of my claim of
mmwwnhm-dummw;-mﬂ
without prejudice and withou sdmission of lishiliy basia.

This sgreement is mbject @ the application of Siagapore law sl the Siagapore Courns have
exclusive jurisdiction over wry dispute srising out of the same.

Dﬁﬂ.&._iﬂﬂﬂ_i’é'_lmmﬂw

e G

Signed by sppoinind surveyor Signed by “the warkshop™ (with chop)
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Show Remarks To: [] Handling Insurer
Hole: Sarmaccy are prewsie unees you Whow 8 o other partie
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYDR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|V-hl:h No: SMDT47D (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA SIENTA 1.5 (a4)
SMES28T (TP veh)
|Date of Accident: | 21/04/2019
Global Sum Settlement | | [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate -] 6,530.80
Final Repair Cost - 3.849.03
Loss of Use 5§ 300,00 Sdays at $80.00 per day
Rental (if any) - days
LTA [ GIA Search Fee 5 0.00
Others: 15 0.00
5
Final Settlement Sum 5 4.149.03

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1] YES [ X] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No.

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability. (%) Assessad Liability (") (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Rally Pitstop 5 414803
2) 5
12 Jul
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher, Authorisation to Act, Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 12/7/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregno 1ese071ear)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@/kkauto. com;assignments@Ikkauto. com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

OQur File No: CC4/AIG1800707TKDAI02

Date: 12/072018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. Policy Mo:
ﬁnl",“““' Vehicle o\ ieg081 Insured Vehicle No :  SMD747D
Date of Loss: 21042018 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 625658481256
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SMES28T
Make & Model: TOYOTA SIENTA, 1.5 (A) Engine No: ZNRX 360718
Reg Date: 18/09/2018 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: MHFZ28H3100056483
Calour; Meatallic Silver Odomeler: 4857 km
Engine Capacity: 1496 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
Tl F VEHI T THE TI F
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable) Yes Footbrake (Serviceable), Yes
Handbrake | Serviceable) ¥Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/50 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 185/50 R16
Front Left Side Bridgestone 8 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestons S mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone 9@ mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 9 mm
Tha above values reprasent the remaining fyrs freads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repalrer's Adjuster's Differsnce  Diff %)
Parts 4 28080 2.579.02 1.701.78 39.75
Miscellansous ltems D.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,250.00 1.270.00 980.00 43.56
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount (55) 6.530.80 3.849.02 2,681.78 41.06
+ Loss of Use (5.0 x S560.00/day) [SS) 300.00
Natt Liabllity (S$) 4,149.02

INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 221042019
Date Inspected: 23/04/2019 Inspectad At Rally Pitstop (HQ)

176 SIN MING DRIVE #04-17 SINMING

AUTO CARE

Singapore 787525
Estimated Period of Repair 4.0 days
Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: CHAN JIA LE

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen ... 12/7/2019
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NOTE: This report represents our findings af the ime and plsce of inapection sfatod herein. Such inspection has beaen carriod oul o the beat of aur
Emnwiadge and ability but any other dabiily under any olfer circumatances is horedy exprossly excluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartMo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 ‘REAR BUMPER Buckled 853.20FL “48560FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER RETAINER N/S Distorted 196.40FL “68.20FL
a 1 ‘REAR BUMPER TOP GARNISH Dented 425 BOFL *42580FL
4 1 *REAR BUMPER SIDE GARNISH LH Cracked 388.10FL *269.00FL
5 b5 *REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 15.00 FL *15,00FL
8 1 ‘BOOT LID Benl 1,35850FL *1,1B0.OOFL
7T 01 *BOOT LID UPPER LOCK Repair 121.30FL *FL
8 1 ‘BOOT LID TOYOTA LOOG Necessary 38.20FL *38.30FL
B 2 *REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING Necessary 190,60 FL *180 60 FL
10 1 ‘REAR END PANEL Repair B858.30FL “FL
L . *REAR END PANEL INNER GARNISH Serviceable 225 B0FL *FL
12 1 *‘WEATHER STRIPE Dented 221.30FL *221.30FL
13 1 *REVERSE SENSOR LH Dentad 234 BOFL *234 BOFL
14 *SIENTA EMBLEM Necessary B3.BOFL *B8.BOFL
15 1 *REAR END PANEL KEY SENSOR Dented 232 BOFL *180.00FL
FaFranchise part LeListiemDisc
Sub Total (S§)  5,351.00 3,438.70
- List Item Discount on L ltems 20.00/25.00% (S%) 1,070.20 855.68
Total Parts (S5) 4,280.80 2,579.02
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 12/7/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellancous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Rapairer's Amount
Labour tems
1 LABOUR TO DISMANTLE ,PANEL BEAT REPAIR & REPLACE  New 1,200.00 500.00
REAR BUMPER ,BOOT LID ,REAR END PANEL & ALL THE
NECESSARY PARTS
2 TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN New 150.00 120.00
3 TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT MNew 800.00 600.00
4 TO CHECK WIRING Mew 50,00 20.00
5  TOPROVIDE UNDERCOATING New 50.00 30.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 2,250.00 1,270.00
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. |
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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