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Your ref: To Be Advised
Qur ref: CCe/EQI0UT066/Upb3 Date: 26.04.2019

The Motor Claims Department

M/ EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear SinfMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, GLUIse
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 25.04.2019
at the premises of M/s _Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 5.167.02
Revised Estimate Amount . 58 3,749 26
“Check” llems Amount : 58 2318.73
Marker Value ;5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : §5 -
Nett Value : 55 -
Description of Damage: T
The vehicle sustained dumages at the ol S i R
VS Front Portion b =
P i

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 duys

Yours fuithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 Defu Lane 10 #01-412
Singapore 539195
Tel:52898126 Fax ;62870590
Company Reg No:200704370C GST Reg No :200704370C

&

Your ref :
TP : 25/4/2019
M/S EQ INSURANCE
DEAR SIR / MADAM
ESTIMATE REFAIR COST FOR GU3113U
TO SUPPLY :
List [tems
I 1PC HEADLAMP RH (Ae § 1,14580
2 1PC RH CORNER PANEL A § 32980 X
3 1PC  RHDOOR Ldm S 1TA260 =
4 1PC LH STEP GARNISH a2a 8 330X
5 2PC DOOR HINGES bf S 19728~
$ 3,733.78
287 less20% S (746.76)
$ 2,987.02
6 1PC  FRONT DOOR STICKER A § 1500 *:23
7 CHECK WIRING $ 3500
8 SPRAY PAINTING( PILLAR, DOOR, PANEL BUMPER ,ARH)  § 1,150.00 42
9 LABOUR CHARGE 5 980.00 4 5~
§ 5,167.02
r- odtr &

— o Sy
| W L{z? 1{ 13#'36

,w/ L(f(‘
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Your ref :
TP:
M/S EQ INSURANCE
DEAR SIR/ MADAM
TO SUPPLY
is! 5

1 1PC HEADLAMP RH
2 1PC RH CORNER PANEL
3 IPC REH DOOR
4 1PC LH STEP GARNISH
5 2PC DOOR HINGES
6 1PC FRONT DOOR STICKER
7 CHECK WIRING
B
9 LABOUR CHARGE

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 Defu Lane 10 #01-412
Singapore 539195
Tel:62898126 Fax :62870590
Company Reg No:200704370C GST Reg No 2:200T04370C

ESTIMATE REPAIR COST FOR GU3113U

SPRAY PAINTING( PILLAR, DOOR. PANEL BUMPER .ARH )

S

% $
s -
7
: 15.00 7,

$

$

S

£ y
F 1
L et

FH‘:%{ L.z

25/42019

$ 114580

LAean 8 174260 —

$ 32980 ¥
$ 31830 7
S 19728,

3.733.78

(746.76)

2.987.02

35.00 0
1,150.00 400
980.00 /

5167.02 -



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire-PARFfCOE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Business
Owner |D: 0160A
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GU3113U
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 25 Apr 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: DYNA 150 5MT
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2018

Engine No.: 1KD2802000
Chassis No.: JTFAT35Y30K210616
Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $27,084.00
Original Registration Date: 10 Sep 2018
First Registration Date: 10 Sep 2018
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $1,355.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details ¥ _

COE Expiry Date: 0% Sep 2028
COE Category: _ C- Gn;:rds Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: - $32,001.00
COE Rebate Amount: $29.999.00
Total Rebate Amount: $29,999.00

Page | of |

The information contained herein is correct as at 25 Apr 2019

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov. sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore DeregInput 7FUNCTION _ID=F030... 25-Apr-19
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Khanchna (LKK Autu!

From: Khanchna [LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 June 2019 1:40 PM

To: "jouis’

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK

REF.CCH/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19HO01115-)G)

Without Prejudice
(save as lo cosis)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

The above matter and your e-mail as frailed refers.

wWe confirm settlement ot a global sum of $4,800,00{all-in).
Wwe will proceed 1o close file accordingly.

Tharnk you.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settiement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter{s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settiernent sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Maonday, 3 June 2019 3:05 PM

To: Khanchna [LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3
(DM19HDD1115-JG)

Without Frejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

we reler to your email 28.5.19.

Repair cost is 554011.70



Rental 802.50 ( 25/4 till 30/4 is 4 repair days and 1 Sunday)
To settle the claim amicably , we prepared to settle at 55 4800.00 all in.
Please reply .

Thank you & Best Regards,
louis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Lid

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel :(65) 62898126
Fax :(65) 62870590

Email : jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 28 May 2019 9:43 AM

To: jouis@jinauto.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lk o.com>

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19HO01115-JG)

Without Prejudice
(save as to cosis)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

The above matter refers.

We propose setllement at a global sum of § 4,.540.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settiement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter{s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters,

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlerment sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Clalmant, Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| emall: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



I hanchna (LKK Auto)

e ———————————————————————————— e ————————

Feam: Khanchna [LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 28 May 2019 9:43 AM
o jouis@jinauto.com.sg
c: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto): Admin A
Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019

***| KK REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19HO01115-)G)

thoul Prejudice
[tove as lo costs)

Ll Sirs/Mdm

obove matier relers.

(i propose setllement at a global sum of § 4.540.00{all-in),
I'1rase confim acceptlance.

N yau.

© ase note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
1 ar an the part of our Insured/driver. Terms of such settiement should also not be disclosed In any other related matter(s) in respect of the

lert. Cur offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
¢ sottlnment arising from this offer in any other related matters.

U ement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher [for

pment sum above 520,000/-) by the Plalntitf/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
g seEttlemant sum,”

il fpgards,
.enchna| Case Handler
L4k Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
1111}, 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
[s « 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

rom: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 12:20 PM
To Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
“ibject: FW: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
CCS/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19HO01115-)G)
111 i-hancha / Hsiao Tong,

MA Thanks

| HErards.,

| P Adrmin



Shu Pei (LKKAuto) R —————

From: loel Geh <joel goh@eqginsurance com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 April 2019 2:40 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuUtS)

Co Admin A

Subject: RE:- GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2012
***LKK REF.CCE/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19HO01115-1G)

Attachments: GU3OTTR pdf

Dear Shu Pei

Attached our insured's accident report.
Best Regards,

loel Goh

L]
EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel fax

'EgEgsLonfaennod rrermation may 0@ contoined i this messoge. If you are not the intendied recipient, ol

From: Shu Pel (LKKAUto) [mailto:shupel@lkkauto.com|

Sent: Thursday, Apnl 25, 2019 9:37 AM

To: Joel Goh; jouls

Ce: Adrmin A

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19HO01115-1G)

Dear loel,
Please refer to the attached email
Kindly re-sent the Ol GIA report.

Thank you

Beit Regards
Shu Pei| Admin



LEN Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phane: 61660055 | email! ghiupei@ikiayio cormn | fani §741-3108
Bk 51, Paye Ubi industnal Fark, Ub Avenue 3, 802-35 | 5408933}

From: Joel Goh <joel goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 April 2019 9:06 PM

To: jouls <jouls@]Inauto.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com»

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF-CCG/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19HO01115-1G)

Without Prejudice

Dear Jouls

We had assigned LKK to handle this direct settlement.
Kindly liaise with them directly.

Best Regards,

loel Goh

1
eCF‘ surance
Run [pef ™ el
EQ Insurance Company Limited

aid el fax

-\.t lﬁ—-_ =

Frivileged/Confidential infarmation may be contained i this messoge. If you are nol the intended recipient, please notify [he sen

From: jouls [maillo: jowsi inauto.com.sq]

Sent: Wednesday, April 24, 2019 11:45 AM

To: Joel Goh

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3

Dear Joel
G ATIAL THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GUITTR ACCIDENT ON 194720149

W are assisung owner ol GU3TI3U handling their thind panty cliim

2



recovery againgt GUMITTR  EQ INSURED

Have vour insured reported?

Thank you & Best Regards,
Toniis Seow

Fin Auto Services Pre Lid
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10

Singapore 539195

Tel L (65) 62898126
Fax 1 (65) 62870590
Email : jouls@ii



Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 Defu Lane 10 #01-412
Singapore 539195
Tel:62898126 Fax :62870590

Mursdioess Registration No:200T0IT0C GST Regivtration No: 0TI TR

Date: 145719

/O LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1
HO1-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park

(5) 2408933

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GU3113U AND GU3077R ON 19/04/2019

we are now seeking the total amount of claim as follow:
Repair cost S54011.70( with gst)

‘hewleTt) - S$802.50
Rental spays ¢ $150 €2 lett) 500

Wi shall appreciate if you could kindly consider our claim at your earfiest convenience and kindly let us
have your acknowledgement of receipt of this letter within 14days of your receipt of this letter.

Yours faithfully

Joubs Seow (Email: jouls@jinauto.com.sg)



T L
B B& B Pie Lia

31 UBIAVE L #1-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62563501 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC6/EQI19007066/Upb3
09 MAY 2019

TAN KIAN HUA

BLK 667A PUNGGOL DR
#12-586

SINGAPORE 821667

Dear Sit/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GU 3077R & GU 3113U ALONG/AT SEMBAWANG PARK
OPEN CP LOT 72 ON 19/04/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed
by vour motor insurer, EQ) Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from GU 3113U against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your driver's favour as your
vehicle reversing out from parking lot and collided with third party who driving straight. Under
Motor Accident Guide, Vehicle reversing in/out or moving infout of parking lot should exercise
greater caution. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third
Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to
this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CHEW HSIAD TONG
Case Handler

DID: 67423197

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: chewhi@lkkauto.com

c.c. EQ Insurance
fMotar Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

To: Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

D T oG OUR Y g GUISRR on 1914 1€
|

/We, the owner of Vehicle qumﬁunﬂmhu."‘“ 3M3 U hereby authorise you 1o
repair my/our vehicle repair, mhmit,um-rupoml,negnﬁmmm: my/our claim for cost of
rmhmﬂfmmlmm&omwabwumddm.

I/We further authorise you M/S Imﬂmﬁuﬂmmnd,mmmﬁmnﬂmddaﬁwaﬂ
mmwmmﬁmmmmmdmmmﬂrmdw any payment due to
me/us in respect of my/our claim above.

Wchﬁydﬂmmmmﬂmmdmwmﬂﬁnmuufﬁmﬁmﬁm
on my!uurhelnlfnhallheguodwﬂﬁmdcﬁnmulmmmm and purposes whatsoever as if
the same had been done or executed by me/us in person .

Wnﬂ:ﬂbﬂmﬁmthumcwhthlhAnmsmmu&ufﬂnmﬂmm
ammm:i.nmspmlnfmhdnimshaﬂmn:ﬂmﬁmﬁﬂldimanfmﬂawdaimhﬂm
of such loss and damage.




Jiv Auto Services PTe LD

Bik 14 #01- 410/412 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539195
Tel; 6289 8126 (24 hrs) Fax: 6287 0590

Email: jin@jinauto.com.sg

Company Reg Mo 20704330C G5T Reg. N FOMEITOC

mis _EQ. Wiirun e Q&NP“\_JJ Dwadod .
|

TAX INVOICE
Invoice No: 166 52

Vehice No:_ 1Y 3“3 U

olslf
Quantity DESCRIPTION _N‘ Amount
oot 0f Aodid - AT
(OMAROlIS 160 ) .
| w
P ot vy Qo iﬂ{‘m&r 5 UGS
| |
| |
|
ety | Eacs swoaer |8 b3 %ﬂl
S roraL || # 4OL| 4

JIHMMML‘I‘D




}{w H

HeLbERARRBRALSE
Ul WANG ENTERPRISE PTE LTD

BLK 5, DEFU LANE 10, # 01-576, SINGAPORE 539186
TEL: 6288 4541, 6283 0717 FAX: 5281 0647

Co. Reg, Na. 2014284008

%4 WeEE - LWaE 1 1d - TATF

LORRY. VAN RENTAL VEHICLES

WIRER™S PARTICULARS
o Ehilfgrari From Sacton 1 1 of

fuerwhy conlinm kaviag syreed o hire
remial fees a0 shown below sl 1

N¢ 21398

HEPAIRING, SPRAY PAINTING, PANEL BEATING, INSURANCE CLAIM. ETC

VEHI RENTAL AGREEMENT

1Ava

_ i No;

Tal Mo

e ——— —

this day from Mesars Hill Wang Enterpris Pre Lid the undermentioned NEW/USED i
-liMIhmﬁhhmmﬂwd 23,0000 / $3,000.00 for| sy los

|
ot the

i { the sehicls in
wmiliior s cauned 10 the ulﬂ-:.-Jm.'.lnlui!Mlihmlhhmuywhulmwpi.mm@n
te event of the Vihicle being CONFISCATED o awy lows pesulting from THEFT of DESTRUCTION of the said ﬂhiv:k1':l.h-r

ar ok such dusmaps or luss (s eoused by pogligence of by any booach by me of the terms and eondifinms of hire, heroinafier menty

= nl prosed.

Vericle Redg. No. 20t GBE 6644

@Pmm

Socmon 1 Hinks And / Or Doeer's Peficuten 2444 ) TRAR A28 m‘lﬁﬁgﬁ; 35 ‘f[ﬁ ”'}'] Lin
name & HoSSena Nazmul E.‘E'.'&%,‘.‘.'H“ Sﬂ,ﬂ'i‘/ﬂ f*l'E."ﬂ
aadoms . 20% Freacl hoad B 06151 Riddhewor [2momas 150 | 350
fmﬂ,pkﬁ |SE-LWM X% Weaks 9§
Bt ioance Mo VT Na: 6BLO1IGw Taine: 19333213 |4 mommse |
S | Datn 01 Bt WAL Net-Total '
oy (Disssl / Patrl) | 4 & Deposit !
[iaghinn e
Eﬁ%‘ﬂ“ Balance To Pay !
* Wote: A repossesalnn fee of S5100.00 will be charged on repostess vehicles Cash / Chaqus
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HUI WANG ENTERPRISE PTE LTD

BLK 8, DEFU LANE 10, #01-578, SINGAPORE 539188
TEL 6280 4541, B283 07T FAX. 6281 0847

mgil.coem
Mo, 201426488N
. TAX INVOICE
Jin Auta Irwaica Na 00016088
Cale 140872018
Refarnos
Vehicla Num
Abin Date Of Repair :
] DESCRIPTION ] AMOUNT
Aantsl of GEESEAKL Ir 250/10-30:4110 §750.00
| (w24 3
| |
[
[
INTEREST AT THE RATE 1 5% FEA mﬁmﬁ CHARGE DN OVERDUE ACCOUNTE Sub-Total $750.C3
GSTTH $s210
Total Payable $B0ZL0
Received By ssued By m
ELQE




¥ 717 s
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Company Registration No. 199607 188R

S UHIAVE L BI2-25 PAYA LR INDUSTHIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J089A3 TEL : 10651 A2563501 FAX @ ((68) 62564315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 18/08/2019

THIRD P LEMENT
L e GU 3077R (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DM18HO01115-JG
ehicle No. . —
GU 3113u (TP Veh) Qu@ﬂf._ No. : CCB/EQI19007066/Upb3g2
Date of Accident 19/4/2019
Liability 100%
Final RepairCost |1 § - 4,011.70
Loss of Use ' $ o _‘!‘??’i B
Rental (If any) - 802.50 5 days -
Others: 1 =
481420
Final Setllement Sum | § 4,800.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks
nt | ion: !
1) [JIN AUTO SERVICES PTELTD - 4 800.00
— e .| I8 : .
JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #07-25 Pays Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 180B07188R GST Reg. No. 18-B607198-R

Affiliatod to Federation Internationale Des Exparts En Automoblle

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref 1 CCB/EQI190070686/Upb3g2

IR

5 MAXWELL ROAD

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date : 18-06-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GU 3077R _ Veh. Inspected GU 3113V
Policy No. DMCPHQ19-000970 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM19HO01115-JG Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 25/04/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA DYMNA (M) c.c 2982
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. JTFATISY30KZ10616 Colour WHITE
Odometer 34470 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |19575 R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/75 R15 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[155R12 (D) BRIDGESTONE 6/6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |155R12(D) BRIDGESTONE 6/8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE Q/S FRONT PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/D4/2018 Inspection Date 25/04/2018
Survey held at JIN AUTO SERVICES FTE LTD
BLK 14 DEFU LANE 10
#01-412
SINGAPORE 539185
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimata Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Warking Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 62568 4315

Reg No: 168507T186R GST Reg. Mo. 15-8607198-R Page Na 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GU 31130U
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (8)) ()
REPLACEMENT QOF PARTS
1|HEADLAMP RH CRACKED 1,145 80 1,145.80
1|RH CORNER PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 328,80
LABOUR
1|RH DOOR BADLY DENTED 1,742,680 1,742 60
1|LH STEP GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 318.30
2|DOOR HINGES BENT 197.28 197 28
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -748.78
LESS 25% DISCOUNT 771,42
2,987.02 2,31426
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER (SN} NECESSARY 15.00 15.00
15.00 15.00
LABOUR
CHECK WIRING. 35.00 20.00
SPRAY PAINTING (PILLAR ,DOOR ,PANEL 1,150.00 800.00
BUMPER ARH).
LABOUR CHARGE INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF RH 980.00 600.00
CORNER PANEL
2,165.00 1,420.00
GRAND TOTAL 5.167.02 3,749.26
|  RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS [ | T | 3,749.26)

Report Ref No. CCB/EQI18007086/Upb3qg2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appralser

CISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES: - This Repari is mase solely for the uss and benslil of the Clenl named an ihe ol page ol Bis Report




Joanne Lee !LKI( Autu!

From: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 3:10 PM

To: ‘lanet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg'

Cc: ‘chewhti@|kkauto.com'

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GU 3077R (O1) and GU 3113U (TP) on
19/04,/2019

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdl: TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT pdf

Dear SinMadam,
Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.
Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@|kkauto.com
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933



