Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 28 May 2019 9:43 AM

To: jouis@jinauto.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019

***| KK REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19HO01115-JG)
Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
The above matter refers.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $ 4,540.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 12:20 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19H001115-)G)

Hi Khancha / Hsiao Tong,

FYNA.Thanks

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 12:07 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19H001115-)G)

Dear Shu Pei,
The rental expenses for GU3113U is S$802.50 .

Please refer to the attachment.

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 11:32 AM

To: 'Shu Pei (LKKAuto)' <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19H001115-JG)

Dear Sir/Madam

Letter of Demand and document attached

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg




From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 25 April 2019 9:37 AM

To: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>; jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19H001115-)G)

Dear Joel,
Please refer to the attached email.
Kindly re-sent the Ol GIA report.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 April 2019 9:06 PM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19H0O01115-]G)

Without Prejudice
Dear Jouis

We had assigned LKK to handle this direct settlement.
Kindly liaise with them directly.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sq]

Sent: Wednesday, April 24, 2019 11:45 AM

To: Joel Goh

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3

Dear Joel

GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019

We are assisting owner of GU3113U handling their third party claim
recovery against GU3077R ( EQ INSURED ).

Have your insured reported?

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg




