Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 April 2019 9:40 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019
***L KK REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19HO01115-JG)

Attachments: GU3077R.pdf

Dear Shu Pei

Attached our insured’s accident report.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the senc

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, April 25, 2019 9:37 AM

To: Joel Goh; jouis

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19H0O01115-]G)

Dear Joel,
Please refer to the attached email.
Kindly re-sent the Ol GIA report.

Thank you

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 April 2019 9:06 PM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3 (DM19H001115-JG)

Without Prejudice
Dear Jouis

We had assigned LKK to handle this direct settlement.
Kindly liaise with them directly.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims
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From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sq]

Sent: Wednesday, April 24, 2019 11:45 AM

To: Joel Goh

Subject: RE: GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/EQI19007066/pb3

Dear Joel

GU3113U THIRD PARTY CLAIM AGAINST GU3077R ACCIDENT ON 19/4/2019

We are assisting owner of GU3113U handling their third party claim
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recovery against GU3077R ( EQ INSURED ).

Have your insured reported?

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg




