Jia Le (LKK Autu!

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2019 3:57 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19VP05/021688 Direct Settlement (WT) - Accident Involving

SFZB778D & SLF9224M DOA 16.04.2019 [External General)

Lonpac External - General
Dear Jia Le

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

(65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

—

The all £ new ) lonpac.com.sg

e NOw

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 12 September 2019 3:25 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Ce: ONG LI LI

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19VP05/021688 Direct Settlement (WT) - Accident Involving SFZ8778D &
SLF9224M DOA 16.04.2019 [External General]

Lonpac Ref: 18/19/19/VP05,/021488
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC19007018/R 1da3
Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

We have highlighted to your good office on 18/04/2019 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settflement with
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

Insured collided onto Third Farty parked vehicle. Liability is not in our driver's favour.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, "BORNEQ MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD" is as follows: -
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Claimed Amount Revised Amount

1. Cost of Repair [w/GST) $ 29.340.59 $ 24,464 .05
2. Loss of Use (7days x $1 00.00) $ 700.00 $__700.00 (7days x $100.00)
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee 3 2.00 3 2.00

Total | § 30.062.59 $251 66.05

**06days recommendation for repair + 15un = 7days.

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.,

The above is for your approval.

Best Regards,
Carlor Chan | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408937)

From: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 1:38 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; CS A Team: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19VP05/021688 Direct Settlement (WT) - Accident Involving SFZ8778D &
SLF9224M DOA 16.04.2019 [External General]

L)

SAVEAS TO COSTS

LPC ref: 18/19/19VP05/021688
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19007018/R1ea3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
Estimated cost of repair

- Preliminary advice

We have not authorized repairs.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 April, 2019 5:23 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) <Meikwan(@lkkauto.com>
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Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com=>; CS A Team <cs-a(@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKK Auto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19VP05/021688 Direct Settlement (WT) - Accident Involving SFZ8778D &
SLF9224M DOA 16.04.2019 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Mei Kwan

Please see attached.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

e

The all (¥w } lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 22 April, 2019 3:20 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; CS A Team; Admin A; Asher 5ng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19VP05/021688 Direct Settlement (WT) - Accident Involving SFZ8778D & SLF9224M
DOA 16.04.2019 [External General]

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

LPC ref: 18/19/19VP05/021688
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19007018/ea3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of insured’s'accident réport for 6Ur necessary action,
Our case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 85(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]
Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 3:52 PM




To: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC <SuraidahB.Saidi@inchcape.com.sg>; assignments(@lkkauto.com; Admin-D
(LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19VP05/021688 Direct Settlement (WT) - Accident Involving SFZ8778D &
SLF9224M DOA 16.04.2019 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Mdm

Please check & confirm date of accident.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555

TEL: (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: 65) 6296 2706
‘ Fguclm The all (vew ) lonpac.com.sg
— s

B

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: ONG LI LI

Sent: Thursday, 18 April, 2019 3:33 PM
To: 'Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC': assignments@lkkauto,com; 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19VP05/021688 Direct Settlement (WT) - Accident Involving SFZB778D & SLF9224M

DOA 16.04.2019 [External General]

Lonpac External - General

Without Prejudice

Dear Suraidah

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for assessment of liability as well.
All correspondences should be forward to them for handling.

Dear Nivitha

Fya

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel ; (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706



From: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC [mailto:
Sent: Thursday, 18 April, 2019 3:29 PM
To: ONG LI LI

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19VP05/021688 Direct Settlement (WT) - Accident Involving SFZ87780 & SLF9224M

DOA 16.04.2019 [External General]
Dear Li L,

Please be inform that our client vehicle has been survey by LKK today.
Hence, appreciate if you could revert on the liability the soonest.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

SURAIDAH

TPR TEAM, CLAIMS DEPT

D: 6631 1887 | F: 6872 7260 | E: suraidahb.saidi@inchcape.com.sg

Inchcape Centre

Level 4, Bodycare Centre

2 Pandan Crescent

Singapore 128462

www.bomeomotors,com.sg [ www.lexus.com.sg I www.toyotasingapore.cOM.SE | www. hing.com.sg | www.suzukicar.com.sg

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 12:56 PM
To: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC <SuraidahB.
(LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=>

Ce: MT _Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19VP05/021688 Direct Settlement (WT) - Accident Involving SFZ8778D &
SLF9224M DOA 16.04.2019 [External General]

e.com.sg>; assignments@lkkauto.com; Admin-D

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the ur_gaﬁii_a’tiai_i_ {Inchcape]Dunﬂt‘cllﬂkllﬁkgéfﬂﬂén :
attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe. b T Sy U e

Lonpac External - General

Without Prejudice

Dear Suraidah

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey.
Dear Nivitha

FYA



i

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

i q

The all { vew } lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC [mailto:SuraidahB.Saidi@inchcape.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 18 April, 2019 11:23 AM

To: MT_Claim_5SG

Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG LI LI

Subject: Direct Settlement (WT) - Accident Involving SFZ8778D & SLF9224M DOA 16.04.2019

Hi

¥

Reference to the above-mentioned.

Please find attached herein a copy of our client’s Accident Report, Damaged Photos & Estimate Invoice for
your kind perusal.

As our client is claiming against your insured SLF9224M thus would appreciate if you could revert to us on
the liability urgently or we could settle the case under Direct Settlement with Car Rental of @ $150/day x

no. of days as recommended by your appointed surveyor.

Kindly have your surveyor contact our Motor Claim Accessor, Wally Tan @ 9847 6178 / 6631 1506
located at 2 Pandan Crescent, Level 4 for an appointment to inspect our client’s vehicle (currently vehicle

i5s NOT in the workshop).

r liability clearance, kindly revert to this email.

Your kind attention into the above is greatly appreciated.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

SURAIDAH

TPR TEAM, CLAIMS DEPT

D: 6631 1887 | F: 6872 7260 | E: suraidahb.saidi@inchcape.com.sg

Inchcape Centre

Level 4, Bodycare Centre

2 Pandan Crescent

Singapore 128462

www,borneomotors.com.sg I www lexus.com.sg | www.toyotasingapore.com.sg | www_hino com.8g | www, suzukicar.com.sg

This e-mail (and any attachment) is intended for the addressec(s) only and contains information that is legally privileged and confidential If you are nol the
intended recipicnt, please be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any use, dissemination, distribution, printing or copying of this
communication is unauthorized and sirictly prohibited, Kindly notify us by replying to the sender’s ¢-mail address and delete this e-mail immediately. E-mail
transmissions cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, cormupled, lost, destroyed, delayed or incomplete, or could
contain viruses. We therefore do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this c-mail which arise as a result of e-mail transmission, and
you are ndvised to cary out your own virus checks and confirm the sccuracy of the contents of this e-mail before relying on it for any purpase.

This e-mail {and any altachment) is intended for the addressee(s) only and contains information that is legally privileged and confidential. If you are not the
intended recipient, please be advised that you have received this c-mail in error and that any use, dissemination, distribution, printing or copying of this
communication is unauthorized and strictly prohibited. Kindly notify us by replying to the sender’s c-mail address and delete this e-mail immediately. E-mail
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transmissions cannet be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could he intercepted, cormupted, lost, destroyed, delayed or incomplete, or could
contain vinses. We therefore do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this e-mail which arisc as a result of e-mail transmission, and

you are advised 1o carry OUL YOUr Own Virds checks and confirm the accuracy of the contents of this e-mail before relying on it for any purpase.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




o Hpg Mg 126 D006

Borneo Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd
Inchcape Bodycare Centre

e Borneo Motors Level4, Inchcape Centre

2 Pandan Cresceni

Singapore 128462 U[ﬁ { €
Tel: +65 6631 18551500

Fay, «65 6872 7260
wiww.borneomotars.com.sg

Our Ref: BMS2019/06/LK8484/DS(WT)
Your Ref: CC4/LPC19007018/ea3

28 Jun 2019 BY HAND (INS COPY)
MJ’S. LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD E‘(D LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Attn  : Asher Sng

Dept :Motor Claims

RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFZ8778D AND SLF9224M ON 16 Apr 2019

Dear Officer,

We refer to the above captioned.

The accident was caused by the negligence of your insured and as a result, our client has incurred
the following losses:

A, Hepaér Cost -524,464.05 B. LTA Search -52.00
o Eirase Lossof Use _

. : $700.00(5100x7days) ]
E. LossofRental - F. Others

G. Medical Claims -
-Undertake By Claimant

] Total Claim -$25,166.05

We would appreciate if you could revert to us with an offer to settlement within 8 working weeks as
required under NIMA Protocol.

Enclosed are the following documents for your kind perusal:

(¥') Original Tax Invoice (X) Vehicle Registration Card

{¥) Car Rental Invoice/Agreament/Medical Receipt (¥) Driver's driving license / ldentity card
(¥') GIAS/Police Report/s (X) Original Photograph X

(¥') Certificate of Insurance (X) Original/Photocopy Survey

(') Letter of Authority (¥') LTA Search Fees

*Cheque is to be made payable to BORNEO MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD & mail it to, Inchcape
Bodycare Centre Level 4, Inchcape Centre, 2 Pandan Crescent, Singapore 128462, Attn: TPR
Department®

Yours faithfully,
TPR Team
Claims Service Department

F:68727260 E: claimstatusenguiry@borneomaotors.com.sg

(As this is a computer generated letter, no signature is required.)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING ZEZLIAED ang QLE TR o 1e 4+ \9

Own vehich's number Other wehicle's number Diate of accigent

aong Bk 1€ Faav Rls Srn geel

Accaden] lncalicn

&y THE LETTER OF AUTHORITY, iwe, Mike <l Ewmos s Naveuda Cuway

Wame of Fokicy Halder £ [1CPassportCompany Fepisiraton! number

o 11¢ Fasiv e 940 HoD-K53 SCEHDHQ

Apgrecs of Podicy Holder

owner of Vehicle Registration Mo ‘3 {g © hereby appoint BORNEO MOTORS
(SINGAPORE) PTE LTD (hereinafter refers to BMS), a company incorporated in Singapore and
hsving ils registered office at 33 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 152102, to do all or any of the following:

1 To submit, resolve and make any claims which “liwe may have against the other
*party/parties to the Accident and under the ineurance “policy/policies taken up by such
*party/parties or alternatively under Insurance Policy number {1o0i24 93 taken up

by "melus and pay the compulsory excess in respect of the cost of repairs suffered by "melus
arising from the Accident {loss and damage).

2. To collect payment(s) due in respect of any such claim(s) for the loss and damage, such

payment io be made by way of Cheque in favour of BORNEC MOTORS (SINGAPORE] PTE
LTD and give a valid receipl and discharge therefore.

3. For any of the purpose zforesaid, to execule, sign and deliver all documenis whalsoever in
relation thereto.

4, Generally do all such acts as it shall deem necessary for the purpose of settling such claim.

“IWe hereby declare that all acts, instruments and documents done by virtue of this letter of authority
on *mylour behalf shall be as good valid and effectual to all intents and purposes whalsoever as if the
same had been done or executed by *mefus in “my/our own proper person(s) and *lfwe hereby ralify

and confirm, all acls, instrumenis and decumenis done or executed by virtue of the authority and
powers hereby conferred,

*I\We hereby further declare thal the letter of authority hereby conferred shall remain
irrevocable.

*IWe further confirm that the acceptance by BMS of the setlement amount in respect of such
constitute the full discharge of *myfour claim(s) in respect of such loss and damage.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, *l/iwe have hereunto tg set *my/our hand and sign this I:}

of
the month N‘*l;-ﬁ vear 20 1 .

Witness By:

gy

(To be sign by the policy holder only) f
“*Blease sfamp the company chop far
vehicle registerad under a company's name

*delete as appropriate



" LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 18/19/19/VP05/021688
DATE : 17 SEPTEMBER 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, MITESH KUMAR S/O NARENDRA KUMAR confirmed acceptance from
M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of SLF 9224M the sum of
Singapore Dollar Twenty-Five Thousand One Hundred Sixty-Six and Cents Five
Only ($25.166.05) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all
property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to
become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident involving SFZ
8778D and SLF 9224M on 16 April 2019 along BLK 116 PASIR RIS STREET 11
OSCP.

| /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ RAVINDER KUMAR AND/OR SHARMILA KUMARI RAJ) against all
claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in
respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly 1o BORNEO
MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD.

I/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

(]
/\
Il
WA Fd i R ¢
CEDECZoA .
Signature of vehicle owner/Date

MIESH OMAR —oee 709

MName of vehicle owner /Date

[ s sattament does it precludelprejudios the.
1 | erimantDrivenPassengar for personal ingury at
4 {ater tate shoulil such & ciaim aises. i

LKa4a84
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TAX INVOICE

Co RegNo  : 1967000862
G5T Reg Ne  : MR-8500000-9

TAX INVOIGE

Borneo Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd

www.lexus.com.sg
Lexus Bodycare Centre
No.Z2 Pandan Crescent
dingapore 128462
Tel no.: 6631 1388

Account No :
Account Detail Customer Detail
S 51000007 fICLFI1
Lonpac Insurance Berhad Mr Mitesh Kumar
100 Beach Road Document Mo 116 Pasir Ris Street 11
#19-00 Shaw Tower 36006978 #03-553
Singapore 189702 Singapore 510116
AtTn: Mz Lily Koh/Mr Chia
Document Date Mobile: 00263050
' 17/05/2019
Year Make Maodel Reg Date Veh Reg Ma Kilometers WIP Mo Order Mo/Remarks
13 BETQH L1 GRL10OR 21/06/2013 SFZ8778D 57351 17077 4ADS/SFZ8778D/ 16041

Chassis No Engine Mo Terms Lexus Consultant Vehicle In Collected On

JTHEE1BL105024218 2GREBO4191 &0 Wally Tan G H 23/04/2019 16.11 17/05/2019 10.28
[

L | Cd lobifParts Description Chy Unit Price Disc % Amount
“1[Z [BP-SUNDRY SUNDRIES 50.00
| T/P INS,:LONPAC ACC DATE:16.04.19

T/P VEHICLE NOQ.:SLF9224M
TOW-IN:16.04.19 DATE SURVEY:18.04,19
NC OF REPAIR DAYS:7 DAYS
BY:RASUL (LEK) *DIRECT SETTLEMENT*
2| & [BP-SUNDRY TOWING IN CHARGE. 380.00
3B BP-LAB3 CHECE WIRING SYSTEM AND * 216.50
FOCUS HERDLAME. (NETT)
4|!B BP-LAR3 REMOVE/REFIX FRONT BARKING ; 216.50
SENBSORS. (NETT)
5|B BP-LAB3 REMOVE ALL NECESSARY PARTS, TO ENABLE * 2598, 00
REFAIRING AND STRAIGHTEN FRONT SUPBORT
FANEL, R/H AND L/H HEADLAMF PANELS AND
FIT NEW FARTS.
6|B [BP-RES3 SPRAY PATINT ON DAMAGED o 1855.00
L AFFECTED PORTICH OF CAR.
7|58 P-SLANT SUPPLY SEALANT (NETT) 100.00
8(B PP-ECU3 TO RESET ECU & REPROGRAMME, (NETT) = 216.50
Borneo Motors is the only authorized workshop to maintain your Lexus. Service your Lexus every
& months or 10,000 km (whichever comes first) to enjoy warranty benefits, Canditions apply. |
Fﬁ;&.g: Eﬁ!;:ﬁ:: Customer’s Signature Change Summary Tatal
Please acknowledge receipt of vehicle | Parts
Labour
Materials Less
\ g E Lubrication/Fluid
—— 6\4{- - COihers S —
) Amount Due
_ _ _ PLEASE MATL YOUR CHEQUE TO 2 PANDAN MREBUENTALCMMECROTANGMEAPE CENTRE, SINGAPORE 128462
OSECURITY GUARD
DATE  17/05/2019
'LEASE ALLOW THE UNDERMEMNTIONED TIME 10:29

‘EHICLE TO LEAVE THE COMPANY PREMISES,

VEHICLE NO

USTOM

SFZB778D

SIGNATURE
FOR BORNEO MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

@ Borneo Motor:
Inchoope




TAX INVOICE

EE]B;IE Nﬁ :19&?0%03&2
‘1 o : MR-8500000-9

NVOICE

Borneo Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd

www.lexus com.sg
Lexus Bodycare Centre
Ho.2 Pandan Crescent
Singapore 128462
Tel no.: 6631 1308

Account Detail

Account No

51000007 JICLPI1

| Lonpac Insurance Berhad
100 Beach Road

Customer Detail

.-D:Jc;u- nt Mo

Mr Mitesh Kumar
116 Pasir Ris Street 11

#19-00 Shaw Tower 38006978 #03-553

Singapore 189702 Singapore 510116

Attn: Ms Lily Koh/Mr Chia

Document Date Mobile: 90263050
17/05/2019
Yiemar Make Madel ReqDate Veh Reg Ma Kilometers WIF Mo Order Mo/Remarks
12 BETQH L1 GRL1OR 21/0&/2013 SFZBT778D 57351 17077 ADS/SFZBT78D/16041"
Chassis Mo Engine No Terms Lexus Consultant Vehicle In Collected On
JTHBELBL105024218 ZGREB0O4191 60 Wally Tan G H 23/04/2019 16.11 17/05/2019 10.28
L | Cd Job/Parts Description Oy Unit Price | Disc% Amaunt
9L HP-LE_"D EUPPLY REGN PFLATE (POH4183) E33 26.00
FRONT (NETT)
101 [L11293-31120 LABEL, ENGINE 1.00 4.20 4.20
11 |2 [T88723-42070 LABEL, COOLER 1.00 3.60 3.60
12|13 |L53301-3049]1 HOOD SUB-ASSY 1.00 2754.60 2754, 80
134 [T20467-09050 CLIP 11.00 2.40 26.40
145 |LBL145-30F60 UNIT, HEADLAMF RH** 1.00 3735.30 3735.30
15| 6 |[LB11B5-30F60 UNIT, HEADLAMP LH&** 1.00 2735.30 3735.30
16 |7 |L53111-30D%0 GRILLE, RADIATOR 1.00 981.30 281.30
178 [L53115-30070 BRACKET, GRILLE 1.00 24.70 24.70
18| 9% [L90975-02125 EMELEM, SYMEOL 1.00 472.10 472.10
192|0 [L52711-30270 MOULDING, RADIATOR GR 1.00 379.20 3719.20
20| 1 |552161-0K040 FIECE, RR BUMPER %.00 4.00 36.00
2112 |L5Z2535-30230 RETAINER, FR. BUMFER 1.00 T4.20 74.20
22|13 |L52536-30220 RETAINER, FR BUMPER 1.00 74,20 74.20
23|14 |L52115-30150 SUFPORT, FR. BUMPER 1.00 63.80 63.80
24(5 |[L52116-30100 SUPPORT, FR BUMPER 1.00 63.80 63.80
25| 6 |L52115-30140 SUPPORT, FR. BUMFPER 1.00 35,50 35.50
26| 7 |L52116-300%0 SUPFORT, FR BUMPER 1.00 35.50 35.50
27|18 |L52611-30420 ABSORBER, FR BEUMPER 1.00 126.00 126.00
Borneo Motors is the only autharized workshop to maintain your Lexus. Service your Lexus every
& months or 10,000 km (whichever comes first) to enjoy warranty benefits. Conditions apply.
ey el | Customer'sSiansture Changs Summary Toto
Please acknowledge receipt of vehicle | Parts
Labour
Materials Less
; Lubrication/Fluid
&-ﬂ Others
* |! Amount Due

ISECURITY GUARD

DATE 17/05/2019
[EASE ALLOW THE UNDERMENTIOMED TIME 10:29
sHICLE TO LEAVE THE COMPAMNY PREMISES.
VEHICLENO  SFZ8778D
SIGMATURE
JSTOMER FOR BORNEO MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

@ Bomeo Motors



TAX INVOICE

Co Reg No

TR INVGCE

: 1967000862

Borneo Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd

www.lexus.com.sg
Lexus Bodycare Centre
No.2 Pandan Crescent
Singapore 128462

Tel no.: 6631 1388

Account No
Account Detail 51000007 / ICLPI1 Customer Detail
—tonpac—Tnsurance Berhad [ MW Mitesh Kumart
100 Beach Road i) 116 Pasir Ris Street 11
“#19-00 Shaw Tower ocumentiBo7g #03-553
§ingaptre-l189702 Singapore 510116
Attn: Ms Lily Koh/Mr Chia | I
Doc t cblle:
e} Be9 2019
Year Make Model Reg Date Veh Reg Mo Kilometers WIP Mo Order Mo/Remarks
13 BETQH L1 GRL1OR Z21/06/2013 SFZBT778D 57351 17077 4DS/SFZ8778D/ 16041
Chassis Mo Engine Mo Terms Leaus Consultant Wehicle In Callected On
JTHEE1BL10502421A ZGREBBO4191 &0 Wally Tan G H 23/04/201% 16.11 17/05/2019 10.28
L | Cd leb/Parts Description Oty Unit Price | Diisc % Amount
LY [LSZTIIS-3R93Z COVER, FRE EUMFER T.00] Sebh.q07 965 .90
29(0 |[L52421-30110 FRONT BUMFEER PAD, 1.00 5.90 5.90
30| 1 |L53112-30240 GRILLE; RADIATOR LWR 1.00 183.50 183.50
31| 2 |L52535-50060 RETAINER, FR BUMPER:Z 2.00 B.70 17.40
32| 3 |L89341-76010 B3 SENSOR, ULTRASONIC 2.00 490,80 981.60
33| 4 |LB9348-30030 Bl RETAINER, ULTRASONIC 4.00 21.70 g85.80
34| 5 |LB9348-35030 CLIF, ULTRASONIC 2.00 3.70 7.40
35| 6 [L53217-30903 BRACE, HOOD LOCK 1.00 72,60 T79.60
36 |7 L52129-30907 COVER, FR BUMPER 1.00 20.90 20.%0
3718 |L52114-30230 BRACKET, EXTENTICON 1.00 159. 20 159.20
38| 9 |L85207-30060 ACTUATOR SUB-ASSY 1.00 586.00 586.00
390 |LB2114-30200 WIRE, ENGINE FROOM 1.00 122 .80 122.80
4011 |L53285%-30180 COVER RADIATOR 1.00 286.70 586.70
41 I= 2 |L51410-30090 COVEER,; ENGINE 1.00 &670.70 670.70
4213 |T90981-13075 BULEZ 1.00 35.50 35.50
Borneo Moters is the anly authorized workshop to maintain your Lexus. Service your Lexus every
| & menths or 10,000 km (whichever comes first) to enjoy warranty benefits. Conditions apply.
22,863.60
Fﬂi‘,:: ﬁﬁﬁ Customer’s Signature Change Summary Total '
Please acknowledge receipt of vehicle | Parts STeddvedd 1GET  To00N 1,600.45
Labour 5,632.50 i
Materials 96.00 | Less :
ﬁz qﬁ Lubrication/Fluid 0.00
; Others 0.00
Amount Due 24,464 .05

FLEASE MAIL YOUR CHEQUE TO 2 PANDAN GREGGEMTA oWEMER:k(ENGECAPE CENTRE, SINGAPORE 128462

D SECURITY GUARD

LEASE ALLOW THE UNDERMENTIOMNED
EHICLE TO'LEAVE THE COMPANY PREMISES.

VEHICLEMNO

WUSTOMER

SFZR7T78D

DATE 17/05/2019
TIME 10:29
SIGNATURE

FOR BORNEO MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

@ Bomeo Motor:
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CA GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
. | RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
: b GENERAL 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
e INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
- ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Mo: GR-19-061160
Date of Request: 18/04/2019 Your Ref Mo: Online Purchase

Borneo Motors (5) Ple Ltd
33 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 159096

Dear SirMadam,

Enguiry Date 18/04/2019

Enquiry By Suraidah Saidi

TP Vehicle No. SLF9224M

Accident Date 16/04/2018

Enguiry Result

TP Wehicle Mo. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SLF9224M Lonpac Insurance Bhd 16/09/2018-15/09/2019 +65 62507388
Thank You.

The images provided o you are taken from the criginal repons forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy of contents and shall be under no liability whatsoewer for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reperts or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

bt Hermmamars marimen comdelaim "\'."l'i n d ex ,C'ﬁ'ﬂ ? I:L]_Sﬂ huxzh-'lT RSHS& f‘u seact i_|‘_‘.r|=d3p &... 2 S_Ilrﬁfzﬂl g
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ASSOCIATION

INSURANCE
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
8 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to S5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE G5T Registration No: M400017735

Cur Ref No: GR-19-061180
Date of Request; 18/04/2019

Borneo Motors (S5) Pte Lid
33 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 159096

Dear SirfMacdam,

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Enquiry Date 18/04/2019

Enquiry By Suraidah Saidi

TP Vehicle No. SLF9224M

Accident Date 16/04/2019

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official use:

Date:

[%] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque
https://singabore.merimen.com/claims/index cfm?fusehox=MTRsas& fiseaction=dsn a  75/6/7010



