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Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 5:10 PM

To: Ng Hak Joo; SUR

Subject: RE: mkt val FELB304) UNDER OD CLAIM: MT/1037508
Dear Sir,

The market value for FBL 8304J IS 57K — S8K(est) as at April 2019.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email; denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Hak Joo <hakjoo.ng@income.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 4:10 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: mkt val FBLB304) UNDER QD CLAIM: MT/1037508

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type

Singapore NRIC

Owner 1D 6BO1F

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No. FELB304)

Vehicle to be Exported No

Intended Deregistration Date 17 Apr 2019
Vehicle Make SCOMADI

Vehicle Model TL200

Primary Colour Black

Secondary Colour Silver

Manufacturing Year 2016

Engine No. 1P63ML41633200607
Chassis No. SIRTLS206GU000583
Maximum Power Output -

Open Market Value 52,680.00

Original Registration Date 23 Mar 2017
First Registration Date 23 Mar 2017
Transfer Count 1

Actual ARF Paid $402.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date -

PARF Rebate Amount $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date 22 Mar 2027
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Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Mg Hak Joo <hakjoo.ng@income.com.sg >

Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 4:10 PM

To: SUR

Subject: FW: mkt val FBL8304) UNDER OD CLAIM: MT/1037508

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type

Singapore NRIC

Owner |D 6801F

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No. FELE304)

Vehicle to be Exported No

Intended Deregistration Date 17 Apr 2019
Vehicle Make SCOMADI

Vehicle Model TL200

Primary Colour Black

Secondary Colour Silver

Manufacturing Year 2016

Engine No. 1P63ML41633200607
Chassis No. SIRTLS206GUD00583
Maximum Power Qutput -

Open Market Value 52,680.00

Original Registration Date 23 Mar 2017
First Registration Date 23 Mar 2017
Transfer Count 1

Actual ARF Paid $402.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date -

PARF Rebate Amount $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date 22 Mar 2027

COE Category D - Motorcycle

COE Period(Years) 10

QP Paid $6,412.00

COE Rebate Amount 55,084.00

Total Rebate Amount $5,084.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Apr 2019

Thank You

Ng Hak loo
Executive

Maotor Insurance

T +65 643078390
Www.income.com.sg




E(' Incom At Income, we are ‘In with You' on Performance, Growth, t\
macke diffenan Innovation and Impact. These attributes reflect what we promise W"
as an employer and what we want our people to exemplify. ‘ yo1
E n H Find out more at Income.com.sg/careers

Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s)
named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies
of it. Thank you.



4182019 Scomadi TL200, Motorbikes, Motarbikes for Sale, Class 2B on Carousell

{https:/fwww facebook com/sharer/sharer php? (httpsy//twitter.com/intent/tweet?

u=https://sg.carousell.com/p/scomadi-tl200-  wrl=https://sg.carousell.com/p/scomadi-
211196696/) t1200-211196696/) @

Public Comments

Be the first to write a public comment. Ask a guestion or @mention a friend to check this out!

Past a Mew Comment

Scomadi TL200

@ 2 months ago by zaki_dzulkeffli (/zaki_dzulkeffli)
& 548,500

@ 15 Likes

% Used

= In Class 2B (/categories/class-2b-1595)

@ 1st owner
Registration 23 mar 2017

- upgrade chrome fork

read more

= .
ib 15 Chat Make Offer

ht‘tps;.f.fsg.camusﬂl.mmrp.fsoumaﬂl-tlmﬂ-m11Qﬁﬂgaﬁ?mhlegacysearchLandingPage&ref_fefener-%Zlenrbikes-T 08%2Fscomadi%2Fé&ref_r... 2/15



Auto
Consultants

Pie Ltd Company Registration No, 199607 198R

51 UBI AVE 1, #01/02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: (065) 6256 3561 FAX: (065) 6256 4315

Your Ref s MT/1037508
Our Ref - CV/INC19006958/Bts2 Date: 23" April 2019

NTUC Income Insurance Co-Operative Ltd

73 Bras Basah Road

#05-01 NTUC Trade Union House

Singapore 189556

Attn: Ng Hak Joo

Dear Sir/Madam,

RE: Vehicle No. FBL 8304J (Make : SCOMADI TL200 Year of Registration: 2017)
Accident Date: -

We refer to your enquiry on 18/04/2019,

Please be informed of the following:

Market Value (Est.): S$7.000/= to $$8.000/=

(as at April 2019)

Enclosed please find our invoice for your necessary action.

Yours faithfully,

Lkl

]| F LI TO I - i n f n
front page of this Report. No liability or responsibility whatsoever, in contract or tort, is accepted to any third party who may rely on
the Report wholly or in parl. Any third party acting or relying on this Report, in whole or in part, does so at his or her own risk.




