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D S RT Without Prajudicu
m SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
& Ang Mo Kio Streel 62
Singapore 559140
Tel 65 BBBG 2650

Fax ' 65 8368 7421

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE Pte Ltd WS COm.AR
C/O LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

#02-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Our Ref - BUS/03/19/5066/PT
Singapore 408933

Date 01.07.2019

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB5077G AND SKM9570M ON 29.03.2019

M NSE

[] We refer to your letter dated and our letter dated
[C] e claim on behaif of
[[] We acknowledge the receipt of your letiericlaims dated
[[] We have forward your claim to our Insurer. They willliaise directly with you
We enclose our documents marked "E" I the list below:

[[] Piease give us your documents marked "R" In the list below:

[ ] Police’SAS report of [E] Discharge Voucher [ ] Others:
[ ] Investigation Resulis | ] Repairinvoica

[ ] Photographs [ ] Leterof Claims

[ 1 Confirmation of Taxi Rental | 1 SurveyRepor

We are looking into this matter and will revert 1o you.

We disclaim our liabllities. The accident was caused by your driver

Without admission of liability, weofferyouSs &l in to settle the case amicably.
Please guantify your claims

[[] We wish to survey / re-survey your vehicle. Please arrange and let us know the date & time
[[] we have no ather altermatives but have 1o take legal action against you.

oaoo

D Your offer of 5§ 15 accepted, Please let us have your Discharge Voucher
[ vour offer of S8 is rejected Please increase your offer to S§

Pleass let us have your cheque payable to  SMRT BUSES LTD

D Others

Paék}‘i‘an

+ for Manager, Claims
Claims Department

FR-AS-CLM-01 REV 2



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ot
LK = Save the Earth Print only when necessary-

This &-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in emor, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached ltems. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies therecf, and inform the
sender that you have deleled the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you,

From: Elleen Bay Yee Ling (Auto Svcs/Claims & 1A/Claims & |A/Buses) [mailto:eileenbay@smrt.com.sgl
Sent: Friday, 17 May, 2019 11:23 AM

To: CS A Team; Admin A
Cc: Karen Chan Siau Chin {Auto Sves/Claims & |A/Claims & IA/Buses)
Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB5077G AND SKM9670M ON 29/03/2019 ALONG BT TIMAH RD

Our Ref: BUS/03/19/5066/EB

Dear Sir / Madam,

We claim on behalf of SMRT BUSES LTD, owner of the vehicle Reg. No.: SMB5077G.
Your driver’s negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses:-

Cost of Repair $2,250.00
Loss of Use $1,050.00 | 3 daysx 535000 )
LTA Search Fee $7.00
Total $3,307.00

We enclose the following documents;
1) Repair Invoice
2) LTA Search
3) SASreport

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email.
Kindly issue payment in favour to SMRT BUSES LTD.

Thanks and regards,

Eideen Bay

Claims and Insurance Agency

DID: +65 6556 3549 | E: elleenbay@smr.com.sg
6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62

Singapore 569140
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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Vic [LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 3:36 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB5077G AND SKM9670M ON 25/03/2019
ALONG BT TIMAH RD LKK ERF CC3/AIG19006937/)hb3

Attachments: 20190405_BUS03195066_SAS2579627 pdf; img-517111633-0001.pdf; INV.PDF;
STATEMENT.PDF

From: Eileen Bay Yee Ling (Auto Svcs/Claims & |A/Claims & IA/Buses) [mailto:eileenbay @smrt.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 17 May, 2019 5:44 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Buses); Admin A; Jia Le (LKK Auto}

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB5077G AND SKM39670M ON 29/03/2019 ALONG BT TIMAH RD LEK ERF
CC3/AIG19006937/1hb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Vic,
There is no CCTV for this case.

Thanks and regards,

Eileen Bay
Claims and Insurance Agency

DID: +B65 6556 3549 | E: elleenbay@smrt.com.sg
6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62
Singapore 569140

SINRT

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 3:25 PM

To: Eileen Bay Yee Ling (Auto Sves/Claims & I1A/Claims & IA/Buses)

Cc: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB5077G AND SKM9670M ON 29/03/2019 ALONG BT TIMAH RD LKK ERF
CC3/AIG19006937/Ihb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Eileen,
We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Both drivers reported that the other vehicle cut lane (please refer to the attached Insured statement). As such, we
would like to request for any evidence from your side for our further action.

1
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S UREAVE 1 #00-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408913 TEL = (065) 62563361 FAX : (065 h2564313

Our Ref: CC3/AIG19006937/Thb3
30 MAY 2019

LOW LIYEAN

19 GILSTEAD RD
#01-01

SINGAPORE 309083

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKM 9570M & SMB 5077G ALONG/AT NEWTON CIRCUS
ON 29/03/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by vour motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid to deal with the third panty
claim against yvour policy.

We have received a claim from SMB 5077G against your motor insurance policy.

Hased on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
favour. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if vou have further queries,

Yours faithfully,

CHAN JIA LE
Case Handler
DID: 6749 5792
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: JiaLe@lkkauto com

&C. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Movor Claims Dept)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
AlG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim

. SMRT BUSES LTD (the third party claimant™ of 6 ANG MO KIO STREET 62 (S)569140
(address), owner of SMB_3077G (vehicle no.) hereby authorize SMRT _AUTOMOTIVE

SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair cosls
and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no SMB_5077G that was damaged
pursuant to the accidem which occurred on 29/03/2019 (date) along BUKIT TIMAH ROAD
AFTER BS: 40031 (NEWTON _FC) (location) involving vehicle no/s SKM 9570M (“the

accident™).

| further authorize the workshop 1o settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payvment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the weskshep: (SMRT BUIES LTD)

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

. 2F ; | o .
Dated this __~ (day) of A2 (month) 20_'9 (vear)

= |

Signed by “the third party elaimant” Signed by “the wu::kﬁlmp“ —
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l. SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that
we'l have reached an agreement with the appointed survevor of A1G Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed
for SS1.125.00 (Repair Cost), S8525.00 (Loss of Use/Rentat), SST.00 (Disbursement) for vehicle
no. SMB 50776 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 29/03/2019 (date)
along BUKIT TIMAH ROAD AFTER BS: 40031 (NEWTON FC) (location) involving vehicle
no/s SKM 9570M. This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 17/042019 (date) at “the
workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner SMRT BUSES LTD (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SMB 5077G make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his'her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the lener of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant Lo the
damage 1o SMB S077G (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same,

I."-rlr:.i

Dated this <5 (day) of (month) 20_ "] (year)

¥ ., f " u ;__._
|-' .."'"\:1" .f.'?

= Ou /“ltl__;_

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “th¢' workshop™fwith chop)




SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE

Q'EGEIVEO

BHRT hutcmotive Ssrvices Pte Lid

251 Morth Bridge Road Singspors 175102
Tel: 65 63311000 Fax: &5 E3340247

Tax Invoice

Customer Code: 3000066 L % GST Reg Mo. : MR-8500001-7

CRN : 1980042802
SMET BUSES LTD 16 MAY 208 E Invaice Mo. : IV19050023%

&, caims o Date : 14,05.2019
Bleck Unit 0. Depatment & Vshicle Mo. : SMBS077G
STREET &2 \“‘bhw__ - Your Ref No. : BUS/03/1%/5066
6 ANG MO KIO it 4 our Ref No. : 24101201
SINGAPORE 569140 Terms : 30 Days
Dascription Qty Unit Add / (Discount) Amount
Cost L] Amount

LUMP 5UM AMOUNT FOR REPAIR 1.00 5 2,250.00
AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECCMMENDATION

GRAMD TOTAL 5 2,250.00

Remark :

Make/Model : ENVIRO 500
Accident Date : 29.03.2019

H.E. Paymant by chegua should be crossed and
made payable to "EMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd'.
o receipt will be issued unless requestsd.

Page 1/1

Authorised EBigh¥ture
for SMAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

E. & 0.E



Enquire Transaction History

B Transaction History Details

Log Date/Time: 02 Apr 2019/ 15:00:49

Asset Type Vehiche Transacthon Amount: a9

Azt ID: SKMPSTOM

Transaction Type: 1832 Insurance Enquiry [GIRO Payment)  Channel: External Agency

User IO ESASBAHO - BALQISH BINTE ABDUL HALIL - /=5 Transaction 20190404150049803974
Reference Mo

Search Date / Time: 29 Mar 2017 15:45:00

Insssrance Comparny: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURAMNCE PTE. LTD.

Information displayed Is correct as at the log date and time.

Enquire Related Logs Back to List



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

«..CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Express
CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING B - - -
Cuse | Motified Est Submitted Adj Assgnad | na) Rpt _|Adj Sunmitted | Ing Autfied Status
|06 Apr 2019 AT ApC0IS se22s0.00  |s82,250.00 | P s oy
| £t Reg_ | soe A Aot | gon Extimates | | view mpe | et ]

Main Reference Clalm Detalls
'CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
[lnsured: | LOW LIYEAM, I0- 572877500

Main )

Pan | SMRT BUSESLTD, Co. Reg. No.: 1962022920

Vehicie Reg. | ~[29/03/2019 00:00 - 159
No.: SMB50776 Date of Lots: |1 43 Months and 26 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥rj]
Ciaim Type: | TP / 570716362556 Note o | (comprehensive)

[Wehicle Reg.
No SKMISTOM
{Insured): |

Policy Mo.
{Claimant}:

iD‘l!D‘iﬂ!ZlW

| Excess: l S
| SMAT Autamotive Sarvices Pie Ltd (Woodlands) 60 Woodlands Industrial Park £4, 757705 Woodlands - Tel: 68662618

| AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-56419-3000 ... |[Handled by MdNoor, Norslah] Norsiah. MdNoorDalg com

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62222311

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handled by ONG HWEE J1E] ... [Final Rpt duse 30/04/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view A1 | ::mmr.;nnml
= AIG_SG (22/04/2019); Reguest To Upload TP GIA Report

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task |  Complete |;

Due Date  Priority Type  Tosk Group — Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On ~ Done? |
Ho results

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_c... 9/7/2019



Merimen e-Claims

uplmm] Upload Fhotos I cn-munumrl unmml Lrpluut.iml

Claim Documents

*SMB5077G (57071636255G)
[SKMa570M]
™

SMRT BUSES LTD
Mar 29 2019 12:00AM
[LOW LI YEAN]

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

Letters/Correspondences Loerpage vl & |
(Mo Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) - | Thumbnail | Print
1 (Dram) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown | Ear
Fhmeml 3 per page ’:""l il
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) [ Thumbnail | Print
1 2UD4/1910:20 | General View D aaws || A
2 23/04/19 1020 | General View @ | oaawc | M |
I3 [22/04/1010:20 | Genarsi view @ | aaws | B
4 23/04/19 10:20 | Genaral View 0 | cacws | A
'S 23/0419 10:20 | General View @ | weaws | A |
6 1304151020 | GeneralView - 1@ | tedws | BB |
7 |23/04/19 10:20 General View 0| cadws & |
B 2304191020 Genersl View © | v | B
9 23/04/19 10:20 | General View D | Loadirc | A
10 204181020 | General View © | s | BB |
(11 [23/04/19 10:30 | General View 0 | aaws | A
17 |23/04/19 10:20 | General View - 0| weows | &
13 23/04/1910:20 | General View O | cwawc & |
14 [ 10/05/19 10:13 | Photo After Spray B 0 | waarc 4|
15 10/05/1510:13  Photo After Spray O wews B
16 10/05/19 10:13 | Photo After Spray B [ RET A=
E’&Eﬂmﬂn Lperpage  [v])| O
No_|Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - | Thumbnail| Print
1 22/04/1% 15:13 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED _8 Load POF

2 [22/04/19 18:13 | TP GIA REPORT | Load POF

1 |08/07/18 09:31 | WORKSHOP INVOICE D | loacror

4 [08/07/1509:31 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM @) | Load poF

5 |09/07/19 09:31 | Release Voucher Load POF

6 |09/07/1909:31 | LTA SEARCH 3 Load POF

7 [09/07/19 09:31 | LETTER TO O1 0 | LosaFor
|No_|Fmakzed On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnail | Print
1 [22/04/19 09:44 | OT GI Report ©  lcsaror |

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST
There are no document checklsts configured.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 9/7/2019
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
[\"!hh‘:l! No: SKMS570M (Insd veh) Model: DER DENNIS
SMBS0T7G (TP veh) NVIROS500 8.8 D (A)

| Date of Accident: |29/03/2019

Global Sum Settiement | [ [ ] Yes | [X] Neo

Repair Estimate % 3,144.09

Final Repair Cost '$ 1,125.00

Loss of Use ‘s 525.00 3.00 days at $350.00 per day

Rental (if any) £ 0.00 days

LTA / GIA Search Fee :$ 7.00

Others . 0.00

-
Final Settlement Sum 1 1,657.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? I 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindly indicata
below)
A) For Non GIA Ru_gimlmﬁ Workshop: Agreed Liability 50 (%)

BOLA icable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: Appl

BOLA Liability; (%) Assessed Liabllity (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1} |SMRT Buses Ltd $ 1,857 .00
2) -
3) ' 8
02 Jul
JOANMNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd Data

Please attach all the supparting documents to the form,
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act: Survey Report; Medical
Repaort/ Bill (If any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreq ne 1sseoriser
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6B44-8805 Emall sur@ikkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Our Flle No: CCXAIG18008937/JDB3Q2
Date: 08/07/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer:  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Palicy No:
E::":'"'“t Vehicle smasor7a Insured Vehicle No :  SKM8570M
Date of Loss: 29/03/2019 Nature of Claim: P Claim No: 570718382556
DESCRIFTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SMBS0TTG
Make & Model: ALEXANDER DENNIS ENVIROS00, B.B D (A) Engine No: 22145513
Regq. Date: D3/0B/2015 (Man. Year: 2014) Chassis MNo: SFDTBCLRSEMTL3876
Colour; Multi-colour Ddometer: 2208773 km
Engine Capacity 8B40 cc
Markel Valua/Mew Car Price: N/&
Sum Insured (S5) Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition; Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-acciden! Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 305/70 R22.5 Rear Tyre Size: 305/70 R22.5 (D)
Front Left Side Firenza 7 mm Rear Left Side Firenza 7/7T mm
Front Right Side Firenza 7 mm Rear Right Side Firenza 7/7 mm
The abowe valles rapreson! ihe semadining lyre reads depif
COST OF CLAIMS o Repairers  Adjuster's  Difference  DIff %
Paris B4B.09 799.68 46 .41 549
Miscellan=ous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.298.00 1.588.00 700.00 a0.45
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total [S$) 3.144.00 2,397.68 T46.41 23.74
Approved Toltal (Overridden) (S$) 2,250.00
Nett Amount (S$) 3,144.09 2,250.00 89409  28.44
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x 58350.00/day) (S%) 1,050.00
(S5) 3,300.00
Liable Amount (50.00%) (5%) 1,650.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 7.00
Nett Liability (S5) 1,657.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 17/04/2019
Date Inspected 17/04/2019 Inspected AL SMRAT Aulomolive Services Ple Lid
(Woodlands)
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60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4
Singapore 757705
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: ONG HWEE JIE Manager: CHAN JIA LE

NOTE This mport represents aur findings af the fime and place of ingpection stated harein. Such inspeciion has been carmod cut fa (he best of our
kowledpe and sbilily but any athor Sabilily under any othor Circumstances (s hereby sxpressly sxclided.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Partlculars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *PANEL.EXTERIOR:R/H.FOR ADL DD BUS Buckied 464 08 F *464 09 FL
2 B *ADHESIVE :DIRECT GLAZING Necessary 22200FS *22200FS
3 1 "PRIMER (SIKA 206 G+P) Necessary BO.OOFS *B0.00FS
4 1 *ACTIVATOR Necessary BD.ODFS *B0.00FS
F=Franchise parl. S=5pcNetl L=ListhemDisc
Sub Total [S%) B846.09 B46.09
- List Item Discount on L Items 0.00/10.00% (S§) 0.00 46.41
Total Parts (S§) 846.09 799.68

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellansous itema selected.

Recommended Labour

Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltams

1 TO REMOVE & REPLACE RH SIDE SWIPE BODY TO REAR RH Mew 1,590.00 1,060.00

PORTION

2 TOPUTTY & RESPRAY Mew T708.00 538.00

Gross Labour Cost [S§) 2,298.00 1,598.00

Report was unsubmilted during this prinl-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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