Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Sharon <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 June 2020 1:52 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: You Ref: SMF3791U // DOA: 14/04/2019 // Our Ref:

CC6/AIG19006934/Abb3(SCN8019K)

Dear Hsiao Tong,

As per our tele conversation with Adrian, we will absorb the nominal fee from my side.
We will withdraw from our legal department, please let us have your offer soon.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Sharon Chia

MG Solution Pte Ltd

Phone: 6243-1373 | fax: 6243 1376
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 | S(415933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 June, 2020 2:23 PM

To: 'mg3solution@gmail.com' <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: You Ref: SMF3791U // DOA: 14/04/2019 // Our Ref: CC6/AIG19006934/Abb3(SCN8019K)

Without Prejudice

Hi Sharon,

We refer to the above matter.

As per our tele-conversation earlier, we are prepared to direct settle this matter with your good office.
Appreciate if you could get your client to withdraw this case from lawyer.

Thanks.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)




