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MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing) #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376
Reg. No: 201427944N

TO : QBE INSURANCE DATE : 16-Apr-18
ATTENTION : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT JOB TYPE : T/IP CLAIM
ESTIMATE REPORT

VEHICLE DETAILS

VEHICLE NO tSLT2BASY

MODEL . HONDA CITY 1.5 e bMdda] 7000t

CHASSIS NO ﬂg ZJ‘—(

ACCIDENT DETAILS =~ DATE : 14-Apr-18
TIME : 20:50HRS

THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR / CONTACT : DEON

CLAIM DETAIL : PARTS

SIN DESCRIPTION ary ”“;E::"EST T“;;:‘C'E‘ST 2
: L
1|FRONT CENTRE PILLAR Deaded 1 18 85000 | § 85080 | *
2ReAR DOCRLH Dedd 1 |s 10s000]s @."" 706
3|REAR DOOR STICKER LH ¢~ 1 |s  eoools 20.00 |~
4|REAR DOOR HANDLE CHROME GARNISHLH ‘= | 1 |s 170005 170,00 | *
5|REAR DOOR HINGEIUPPER] Jorz Roof 1 |s  7200]s 72.00 | #7
slREAR DOOR HiNGEILOWER] | i |s 7200 | 5 200 |
7|REAR DOOR OUT PROTECTOR 7€+~ 1 | s 92.00 | § g2.00 |*
8|REAR DOOR LOCK ™ A A 1 |s 2s5000]s 25000 | *-
o|REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIP /4 = 1 |s  21100]s 211,00 | 4
10|REAR DOOR INNER BOARD Cacl o 1 |s  38000]|S 380.00 | 2
11|REAR DOOR POWER WINDOW MOTOR ~ Mt 5~| 4 |5 31000]s 310.00 |
12|REAR DOOR POWER WINDOW REGULATION "~ 1 |s 230008 230.00 |[Z—"
236> TOTAL PRICE s  a777.00
1§52 LESS 20% 5 755.40
SUB TOTAL PRICE s 3,021.60

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
SIN DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT SINETT | TOTAL SINETT




REAR DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP (SET) Ak 1 5 00015 30.00

—

CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING (FRONT)

SIN JOB DESCRIPTION PRICE "mm“:r'm APPROVED
PANEL BEATING, REMOVING AND :
1|REPLACING PARTS § 120,&6' Y ki M’
i
2|SPRAY PAINTING TO AFFECTED AREA | § 1.00040 ﬁ’é 603
3| TUFF COAT § 25000 | X
4|WIRING CHECK g soge| 37
REMOVE AND REFIX REAR DOOR ,
5{MECHANISM 5 12000 39
7
TOTAL $2,650.00 10
ESTIMATE REPORT
TOTAL PARTS COST : § 3,051,680
TOTAL LABOUR COST : § 2.850.00
TOTAL REPAIRCOST © § 5,701.60
VED DETAI
SURVEYOR
CONTACT NO : Ak
PART BY PART / LUMP SUM s
NO OF DAYS 1 Adoin A'f; bl 3232

L/f !‘I/nﬂ/(‘ia f‘/: 2550
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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

e ————————————

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>

Sent Monday, 15 July 2019 2:49 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIS4470G (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SLT2835Y (TP
LKK REF - CC6/QBE19006932/Aeb3) on 14.04.2019

Attachments: SAS PDF

Qur ref: VC012610
Dear Shu Pel
Please find attached as per requested.

regards

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims | Asia

1 Rallles Cuay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225

Website Linkedin Twitter

@ QBE

From: Jenny Toh

Sent: Monday, 15 July 2019 9:17 AM

To: Shu Pel [LKKAuto) <shupel@Ikkauto.com:

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5J54470G (O : QBE - TBA) AND SLT2835Y (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/QBE15006932/Aeb3) on 14.04.2019

Hi Shu Pei
Till date our insured had yet to report the accident, we have sent another chaser.

regards

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims / Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+B5 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225

Waebsite inkadin Twwiites

A QBE



From: Shu Pel [LKKAuto) <shupel@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 15 July 2019 8:49 AM

To: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5J54470G (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SLT2835Y (TP : LKK REF -

CC6/OBE19006932/Aeb3) on 14.04.2019
Dear Jenny,

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
necassary action,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@ikkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubd Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuta)
Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2019 9:45 AM

To: Jenny Tah <jenny.toh@gbe.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving SI54470G (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SLT2835Y (TP : LKK REF -

CCh/OBE19006932/Aeb3) on 14.04.2019
Dear Jenny,

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of Insured’s accident report for our
necessary action,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6366-0055 | emall: shupei@ikkauto com | fax: 6741-2108
Blic 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{(A08933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 June 2019 9:00 AM

To: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving S154470G (O1 : QBE - TBA) AND SLT2835Y (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/OBE19006932/Aeb3) on 14.04.2019

Dear Jenny,

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of Insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.



Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupel@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, B02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shu Pel [LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 9:29 AM

To: ‘Jenny Toh' <jenny.toh@abe com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving 5J54470G (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SLT2835Y (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/QBE1S006932/Aeb3) on 14.04,2019

Dear Jenny,

Noted with thanks.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupel@ikkauto.com | fax: 5741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(2808933)

Fram: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe com>
Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 9:22 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving S54470G (O : QBE - TBA) AND SLT2835Y (TP : LKK REF -
CC&/0OBE19006932/Aeb3) on 14.04.2019

Hi Shu Pel

Our insured had yet to report, once we got it will forward to you.

regards

Jenny Toh

Sanior Assistant

Claims | Asia

1 Raffies Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+B5 6224 BB33 | +65 6477 1225

Websile Linkedin Twiller

S QBE



From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) <shupe|@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2019 11:52 AM

To: lenny Tah <jenny.toh@gbe com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving S154470G (01 : OQBE - TBA) AND SLT2835Y (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/QBE19006932/Aeb3) on 14.04.2019

Dear lenny,
Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email; shupsifilkkaute com | fax: 6741-2108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, B02-25 | S{408933)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe com>

Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2019 10:27 AM

To: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <As om>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5154470G (O1 : QBE - TBA) AND SLT2B35Y (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/OBE19006932/Aeb3) on 14.04.2019

Qur ref: VCO12610
Dear Shu Pei
We refer to this matter,

Our insured Informed us that their driver was not involved in this accident. you may request third party for the evidence
of claim.

_regards
Jenny Toh
Senior Assistan!
Claims / Asia
1 Raffles Quay, #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225
Webaite Linkedin Twaller

S QBE

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 9:44 AM
To: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe com>



Ce: Asher Sng [LKKAuta) ng@lkkauto.cam>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 51544706 (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SLT2835Y (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/QBE19006932/Aeb3) on 14.04.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupsi@ikksuto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333]

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 22 April 2018 6:47 PM

To: 'lenny Toh' <jenny.toh@gbe.com>
Ce: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 51544706 (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SLT2835Y (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/QBE19006932/Aeb3] on 14.04.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SLT 2835Y at M/s MG Solution Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a
direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
. TP's GlA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051,

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Fhane: 6366-0055 | emall: shupei@kkaute.cam | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 31, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, §02-25 | 5{408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this emall and destroy any hard coples produced,

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the Information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.
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MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ava 4, AAS Kakl Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapora 415833

\ Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1378
, (GST Reg. No. 20-1427944.N)

PROFORMA BILL

8ill Te:

QBE INSURANCE (INTERNATIONAL) LTD

NO.60 ANSON ROAD
#11-01 MAPLETREE ANSON

SINGAFPORE 079914

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

Bill No : 198153

Date : 30-May-2019

Vehicle Number : SLT 25835Y

Tax Invoice will be [ssue upon amount finalfsed.

Qry CLAIM AMOUNT
1 |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation s 2,550.00
{Lump Sum)
BEFORE GST 2.560.00
7% GST 178.50
TOTAL | § 2,728.50

Flease note that our above offer and any settiement arising from the above offer are made on a without
prejudice basis with sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal
proceeding. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in
respect of the accident. No reference shall be made to this offer ar any settlement arising from this offer

Ca's stamp & Autholised Signature



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 9:36 AM

To: MG Solution

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident inmlving SLT 2835Y (TP) & 5JS 4470G (QBE) on 14,/04/2019
Attachments: QBE DV pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer 1o the above matter and yvour e-mall below,

We confirm settlement as per your LOD on this matter.
We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negoiiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed |/ inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
linbility/damages, either party ks not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement,”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchno e lkkauto.com Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution(@ gmail.com=

Sent: Thursday, 12 September 2019 11:52 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna/@lkkauto.com=

Ce: Admin A <admin-aia@/lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SLT 2835Y (TP) & SJS 4470G (QBE) on 14/04/2019

Your Ref: SIS44700
Our Ref: SLT2835Y

Dear Khanchna,

We refer to below email, we already sent the cerv footage 1o your Admin-Ms Shu Pei on 19/06/2019.
Please find attached cctv footage and photo for your reference.

Best Regards,



MG SOLUTION PTELTD
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 (South Wing) #02-03B
Vicom Inspection Centre, Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376 /
GST Reg. No. : 201427944N '

MOTOR CLAIM DISCHARGE
fl . % b LA
INSURED: ’*!,._1-..'.',5”'“_ T e

— j L
3¢

1Y
CAR/ LORRY/CYCLE: REG NO: oo 22 2 L BOUCY NG oo

L

ACCIDENT CLAIM NO: s e scieisecns e

I/ We confirm that | / we have taken delivery of Car / Larry / Motor Cycle

& - = 2.0 \
Registered No. ......... : '.'.‘...F a2 .;'F ................................... from the repairers,

MMk TorwTionn PTE L7

And that all repairs necessary 2s a result of 2n aczident in which the aid vehicle was Invalved an ar

-

]

\ oy f :
aboutthe b ool 20....'..1. have baen completed to my / our satisfaction, znd that

I/ we have no further claim on the above company in Respect thereof.

Co's SEmMD: i EE SRl [ 2 '] L P v P —



Insured Veh.

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTELTD

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 198607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

1 RAFFLES QUAY #28-10 SOUTH
TOWERSINGAPORE 048583

Ref : CCB/QBE18006932/Akalq2

Date : 18-02-2020

Code: QBE

or jfl RD PARTY CLAIN

T

Make & Model

HONDA CITY

Assign Date

5J5 4470G uh. Inspected SLT 2835Y
Policy No. 8-V0018019-MVA Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. VC012610 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From 170412018

L/H Rear Tyre

Accident Date

THE "JEGLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

14/0472019

BRIDGESTONE

c.c 1497

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. MRHGMBE60JT000124 Colour GREY
Odometer 27470 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD

Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/55R16 BRIDGESTONE B mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/55 R16 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/55R16 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm

185/55 R16 6 mm

Survey held at

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
(SOUTH WING) #02-03B

VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE,

SINGAPORE 415833

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFAIRS.

1ta [} af Repall

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

ey

PREJUDICE" BASIS.

5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL 6258 1581 FAX G256 4315
Reg No: 199807198R GST Reg, Mo. 19-9807198-R

Page No. 1 of 2

1|FRONT CENTRE PILLAR DENTED 850.00 615.00
1|REAR DOOR LH DENTED 1,050.00 806.00
1|REAR DOOR STICKER LH NECESSARY 80.00 90,00
1|REAR DOOR HANDLE CHROME GARNISH LH NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
1|REAR DOOR HINGE (UPPER) BENT 72.00 72.00
1|REAR DOOR HINGE (LOWER) BENT 72.00 72.00
1|REAR DOOR OUT PROTECTOR NOT NECESSARY 9200 -
1|REAR DOOR LOCK NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
1|REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIP NOT NECESSARY 211.00 -
1|{REAR DDOR INNER BOARD CRACKED 380.00 380.00
1|REAR DOOR POWER WINDOW MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 310.00 -
1|REAR DOOR POWER WINDOW REGULATION DAMAGED 230.00 230.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -755.40 -473.00
3,021.60 1,802.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
30.00 30.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING .REMOVING AND REPLACING PARTS 1,200.00 £00.00
SPRAY PAINTING TO AFFECTED AREA. 1,000.00 B00.00
TUFF COAT NOT NECESSARY 250.00
WIRING CHECK 80.00 30.00
REMOVE AND REFIX REAR DOOR MECHANISM 120.00 B0.00
2,650.00 1,310.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,T01.60 3,232.00

Report Ref No. CC6/QBE19006932/Aka3q2



KL

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LLABRILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:. This Report s mads solely fof the uss and benelil of the Clienl named on the ront pegs of thin Report,




