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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Southern Motor <soumotor@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 May 2020 3:54 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FBJ1544P

Hi Shirley Hiew, 

 

We confirm the finalised  amount is $ 1,650 / 3 days lump sum . 

 

Thank you. 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, May 8, 2019 3:56 PM 

To: Southern Motor <soumotor@hotmail.com> 

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: FBJ1544P  

  

Hi, 
  
Refer to attachment 
Finalised  amount is $ 1,650 / 3 days lump sum 
Kindly confirm 
  
  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Southern Motor [mailto:soumotor@hotmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 12:27 PM 

To: Jasmine Lok Kheng Kwei; Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: FBJ1544P 
  
Dear Sirs, 

 

 

We shall be much obliged if you would let us know whether 

the above motorcycle No FBJ1544P is authorized for direct settlement. 
 Thank you. 
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Yours Faithfully, 

Southern Motor 
  
  

From: Jasmine Lok Kheng Kwei <jasmine_lok@sg.msig-asia.com> 

Sent: Monday, April 22, 2019 10:50 AM 

To: soumotor@hotmail.com 

Subject: RE: FBJ1544P  
  
Our ref: M588853 
  
Hi Sir/Mdm, 
  
Liability is not cleared for this case. 
  
Please let us have scene photograph, video footage or witness statement for our perusal. 
  
Alternatively, you can forward a copy of the police investigation for us to review the matter. 
  
Thank & Regard 
  
Jasmine Lok 
Executive, Claims Services (Motor) 
Direct line +65 6594 2550 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | jasmine_lok@sg.msig-asia.com 
  

      
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.  16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581  I  Tel +65 6220 

9644  I  Fax +65 6225 6371  I Co. Reg. No. 200412212G  I  http://www.msig.com.sg/  I  Follow us 

on        
  
  
  

From: Southern Motor [mailto:soumotor@hotmail.com]  

Sent: Monday, April 22, 2019 10:15 AM 

To: Claims <claims@sg.msig-asia.com> 

Subject: FBJ1544P 
  

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s). 

  
Dear Sirs, 

 

 

We shall be much obliged if you would let us know whether 

the above motorcycle No FBJ1544P is authorized for direct settlement. 
 Thank you. 
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Yours Faithfully, 

Southern Motor 
  


