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> Back to OneMotoring

PAREINNE Rakals Famdng

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Detalls

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Viehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Na.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Iin:istritinn Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PA_EF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amaount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
7495)

SLZ1800Y

No

20 Nov 2018

MNISSAN

QASHQAI 1.2 DIG-TCVT
Silver

2018

HRA2585765A
SINFEAJ11U22 18282
EE_._Q kW (113 bhp)
$£20.452.00

27 Mar 2018

27 Mar 2018

0

§20,633.00

Yes

26 Mar 2028
$15,474.00

26 Mar 2028

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$38,000.00

$35.527.00

$51,001.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Nov 2018

s vl 113 GOV SQIVVACHON EnguireHaDate sy FUBHCHSIorsDRregInpurYF UNC TION,_ID=kU30s00u 1l
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Missan Qashgal ey sy 2018 Ay Ariy
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

NISSAN AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder  : Tan Pheck Lan Jeannie (Chen BiLan) Vehicle No SLZ1800Y
Period of Insurance : &7 Mar 2018 To 26 Mar 2019 Policy No. : 1800031185
Engine No. ¢ HRAZSB5TEEA Endorsemant No.
Chassis Ne. : SINFEAJ11U2218282 Issuad Date ; 18 Apr 2018
ABOUT THE COVER
| Make/Model : NISSAN Qashgal 1.2 DIG-Turbo
Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 1,1867.00 CC Sum Insured | Marks! Valus First Year of Registration - 2018
Drriver Rastriction WA Olf Peak Car : Mo Insuring with COE/PARF - Yes

Person or Classes of Persons Enfitled to Dirive® -

A} The Pubsyhokie
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limn T pear dtiveng smpicianta
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Loss of Lisa 1500ce - 1800cc
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Firn - $0 Own Damags - S600 Thait - $0 Flood Cower - 5
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PropeTy Damegs - B0

Windducrean ;| §100
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Tan Pheck Lan Jaannis [Chen Biian) - §600 (Own Damage)
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4. Tan Chong botor Seise Ad #113 Busil Timah Eoed Sigesoi SIS 4504081 Ba0s40ms [E
A.Vun Choeg Mator Bulet AGT 17 Lesong A Tan Payah Blngasony I10EN EXSTIISE BI5 75754

For o Approved Reporting CenrealdiS Aumoree: Regaiien, plems soresc oor 28-S Rsei wmergEncy noing s - GEHE B200. Admmmtneedy, v may ioier m A wabdie waes, g oo ag
(o ANG S0 Medile App. Sirpdy sasech gned dewsinad "AT 37 iramn [Tanee or eyl Play

IMPORTANT NOTES

i Hire Purchase Company/Employar's Loan: MayBank

WWe neretry cortihy Mat S polcy 0 whick s et of ML wNCe rRIEWE W EsEd © Eooreenne silh B proyisiees of the Wolor Warkriaa{Thith Fady Foths and Comparaannn] & (Cas B Part o _-.I:
it Fianct Trammpnr Acs THAT (Mabeysin) and leins Yaticien [Thind Fary Rise) Aues, Y550 (Wainea) |
|
=
E
OSODET0ATE
-ﬁ‘\"
TAN CHOMNG CHEDIT FTE L TE-0P%
211 BUKIT TIMAH ROAD TAN CHONG MOTOR CENTRE ) =
BINGARCRE ST ANBP-MOTOR AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.
Underwritien by AlG Asls Peeific Inpurmnce Ple. Lid. AUTHOIISED AEPRESENTATIVE =

A Srasiom M| PRS00 | F s




REPUBLIC OF §







Cecilia Chuna !I.I(I( Autuz

From: Cecilia Chang (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2012 4:04 PM

To: ‘Steve Lim'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Your ref; GBG9003Y/SL/p! (Our ref: CS/RGI18020893/Ugb3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING
GBG 9003Y & SLZ 1800Y ON 16/11/2018 ***

Attachments: ADJUSTMENT REPORT pdf; INSPECTION REPORT.pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO 2.pdf, LKK
RESURVEY PHOTO 3.pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LOD
AND OTHER DOCUMENTS.pdf

EG| ref : GBGY003Y/SL/pl
LKK ret ; CS/RGI8020893/Ugb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 7003Y & SLZ 1800Y ON 14/11/2018

We refer 1o the above matter.

This is a head-to-rear collision,

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" at 514,090.846,

The summary is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount
|. Cost of Repair {w/G5T) § 28.908.51 $13,538.86
2 lossof Renfol [5.5days x $10000) | $ 55000 |§$  550.00 [5.5days x $100,00)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 200 |§ 2.00
Total | $29.450.51 514,090.86

**5days recommendation for repair + 1PRS = édays
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal,

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction.

Best Regards,

Cecilin Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Led

Phone: 6740-4274 | email: CecilinChong e lkkauto.com) fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5[408933)



.Catilia Chnnﬂ !LKK Auia!

From: Nancy Lam <nancy lam@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 1:10 PM

To: Cecilia Chang [LKK Autg)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuta); Admin A

Subject: RE: Your ref: SLZ 1800Y (Our ref: CS/EGI18020893/Ugb3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING

GBG 9003Y & SLZ 1800Y ON 16/11/2018 ***

Dear Cecilia
We do accept your offer as below.

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pre Lid
lel: 6746 3403

Fax: 6745 8520

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [malito:CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com)|

Sent: Tuesday, April 23, 2019 1:01 PM

To: Nancy Lam <nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Your ref: 5LZ 1800Y (Our ref: CS/EGI18020893/Ugh3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 9003Y & SLZ 1800Y ON
16/11/2018 ***

Your Ref: SLT 1800Y without Prejudice
Our Rel: CS/EGI18020893/Ugb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG F003Y & SLZ 1800Y ON 146/11/2018

We refer to the above matter.

We propose sefflement of $ 14,090.00(all-in) .

Flease confirm acceptlance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be desmed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,
Ceeilin Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone:"6749-4274 | email: CecilinChongan lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)
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Catherine thung suut Autu]

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd) <Survey Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 19 November, 2018 4:06 PM

To: ‘admin-d@Ilkkouto.com’

Ce SUR (sur@lkkauto.com)

Subject: Ol 1 GBGS003Y / TP : SLZ1BOOYALKK / DOA ; 16/11/2018

Attachments: SLZ1800Y - PRS FORM n SAS.pdl

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" In regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Lid have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD,

ADDRESS : 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
¥D1-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT : MR YONG @ 6746 5405

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVELIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please note that our Insured/Insured driver has yet to e-file their SAS
for this accident. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle. Obtain estimate from workshop
and inform the repoirer in_writing, that you are require to conduct @ re-survey before vehicle is returned to
claimant. They are to contoct your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report @ergo COm 58,

Attached is TPs SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.

Kindly acknowladge receipt of this email,

Ragards
Yeog Pail L)
Clarms Assistant (Mator)

ERGO insurance Pie. Lid

& Temgset Bousvam 804-01 Suntec Tower Five
Srgapoie 038585

DD  -05 0825 5164

Tol =55 0526 G160

Far =BS5S G829 8247

WaW BT SO ag ERGO

ERGO & ane of the maar insurance grougs in Garmany and Europe Worliwide, ERGO & repressnied in mors inan ¥ courtres ang condentwtes
on Ewmope and Asia ERGS @ part of Munch Fie (Grauph, soe of ihe aorid § iasding nek camers



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) I ——

Fmr;n Shiau Chan [LEXAUTD)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 3:12 PM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid}'; 'Steve Lim'
Cc SUR; assignments

Subject: RE: GBGSOO3Y / TP : SLZ1B00Y/LKK / DOA : 16/11/2018
Dear Steve,

Please be informed that we have Inspected the vehicle SLZ 1800Y on 19/11/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer,

Best Regards,

Shinu Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: hagb-a561 | email: sowse@® kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
1k 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1. #0225 | Slan8ga3)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 November 2018 4:13 PM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Ce: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBGI003Y /TP : SLZ1B0OOY/LKK / DOA : 16/11/2018

Dear Pei LI,

Thank you for the assignment,

Hesst Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

KK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408931)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey Repori@ergo.com.sil
Sent: Monday, 19 November, 2018 4:06 PM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d @lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR (sur@Ikkayto.com) <sur >
Subject: Ol : GBGS003Y / TP : SLZ1800Y/LKK / DOA : 16/11/2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

in compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the "Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD,

ADDRESS ¢ 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY



Dlake
Cur Relergrce
Your Relerence:

Ta:

13.11.1018

ERGO

Bani wis Fax

GBG 9003Y/5L/pl

SL¥ 1800Y

FASTECH AUTO PTELTD

Pre-Repair Survey [PRS) Acknowledgement

vahicts For Inupection: SLI 1800Y
inaured's Vehicle: GBG 9003Y
Date Of Azcident: 16.11.2018
We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS onc
in compllance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 20167, do select an sssessor from

tha list Below snd indicate your selection in th box marked *. |' LK

15.11.2018

A5 aurpmobile inspection Services P Lid 85 LS Aute Consultants Pie Lid
FTa FormTeam Consultancy Pie Lid LEK | X Auts Comuuitants Pie Ld
s [intinitl Agpraial barvica " | Prinelty Services

[ 1P Knights Pe Lid VAL [Vicom Lid

OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM

V' |rour nquent for inpection does nat have your chient's cost of nepalr ertmate, kindly forward 3 copy.

V  |Veur request for lnipection does nol have vour client's GIA repart. kindly forward b capy.

W acknowledge your imEret fer direct settament, we il e b arver 50on upen receipt of estimale
v Isasred's dibver hay not reported the sceideat o i tadne.

.:r"f e

Prapered by Q‘g\/ L @H9M [claims@ergo.com.sg
Hgnature: 3 FAX : 6829 5147
Apsenaor uyg only; Workyhop ys eniy;

daveryor sriended wgrigheg on;
Anpegnrmen| Dalet Dale
Ausigrment Time: Tumd

InLpestae
Remarii: [ vahicts net availshia ot the sppointad dets and thm.

Windly schnowledge our Alneior provance for the shove job .

Warishog Agkngwled pament & Stamp.
Wate Cier inppwction Iy o @ witheu! admiion te Lasilny besle.




Cecilia Chuna !LI{I( Auto!

From: Steve Lim <steve lim@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 12:15 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Your ref: GBGS003Y/SL/pl (Our ref: CS/RGI18020893/Ugb3) *** ACCIDENT
INVOLVING GBG 9003Y & SLZ 1800Y ON 16/11/2018 ***

Attachments: ADJUSTMENT REFORT.PDF; INSPECTION REPORT.PDF; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO 2 pdf;

LKK RESURVEY PHOTO 3.pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO.PDF; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.PDF;
LOD AND OTHER DOCUMENTS.PDF

Hi Cecilia,

Please proceed

Steve Lim
Manager - Claims

ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard #04-05 Suntec Tower Fiye
Singapore 038585

DID  +5% 6824 8197

Fox . +85 BA2E U247

stgve imBgrgo com 5g

ERGO

ERGO s one of e majer insurance groups in Germany and Europe Werldwite, ERGO & repressntad in more than 30 countres and concentrates on
Europe and Asii. ERGO is patt of Munich Ra (Group), ate of the warld § lsading nsk cariers

e E:Iq'l LTl

EMAIL DISCLAIMER

The infermation contained in this email communicalion s confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-tranemil, copy, distribute. act in reliance on of
commercialize tha information If you are suthorized to do 2o, If you are not the intended recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by
replying fo tha emall and destroy any electronic or paper copy of this message.

Any views expressad in this email communication ane thosa of the individual sender. ERGO Insurance Fle. Lid. does nol represent, warmant or guaraniog 'Irlll
the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the communication |s fres of errors. virus or inlsrlerence,

|EFlGD Insurance Pte. Lid. asseris copyright in respect to this email including any aftachment. No parl may be reproduced by any process or for any purpose
without prlar writlen parmission. (

Dincigiewsr THIL aaagos A0c (14 aBschiments s oonfidentisl (nended onty ko the ramed sitdressee. ared ey be privilege |f yvou mrs rat e mtanced recipilent. you
whowld nol omcoes. SWiNDUE. CoORy OF WED e commumeatan i you ard ol 1he intandad oo D s nofify the sSnder by elum el and dolele (i meEsEge By
OpEning oy Anpchment o Mis messags. vou agr=s io acospl (he sk thal 4 may contion 8 s o damaging cooe, and you sgres inat ERGO inpuance Pis L8 wil sot be
limdeng *0r @hy WCEa Oof damage hereby Cawseq

From: Cecilla Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 22 April, 2019 4:04 PM

To: Steve Lim

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Your ref: GBGS003Y/SL/pl (Our ref: CS/RGI18020893/Ugb3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 9003Y & SLZ
1800Y ON 16/11/2018 ===



EGI raf : GBGY003Y/5L/pl
LEK ref : C5/RGI18020893/Ugb3

Dear Sirs/Modam.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 9003Y & SLZ 1800Y ON 14/11/2018

We refer to the above matter.

This is a head-to-rear collision.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" at 514.090.86.

The summary is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount

Amaunt
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $28,508.51 |$13.538.84
2. Loss of Rental [5.5days x $10000) | $ 55000 |$  550.00 [5.5days x $100.00)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee 3 200 | % 2.00

Total | §29.460.51 | $14.090.84

**5days recommendation for repair + |PRS = édays
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal,

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction.

Best Regards,
Cecilin Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong 6 lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{308933)



FASTECH AUTO FTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date: 13.12.2018

ERGO Insurance Pte Lid

5 Temnsek Boulevard,
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five,
Singapore 038985

Atmn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: SLZ 1800 /| GBG 9003Y ON 16112018

We are the suthorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no:  SLZ 1800Y , which was involved
in the captioned nccident with your insured vehicle no: GBG 9003Y . The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us to assist him in presenting hisMer claim against the party responsible for the damage o the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of ihe ownerfclaimant,

1) Cost of Repair {inclusive of GST) 5 13,538 86
2)  Reotul 5 550.00
3) GIA Search Result $ 2.00
4)  Surveyor Report Fee 5 -
5)  Unisured Losses (Damage Goods) ] -
5 l&ﬂﬂ-&ﬁ
We enclosed herewith the following documents to suppart the elaims:
a) Final Repair lovoice ; ¢) Vehicle Registration Log Card
b) U/C & Driving License 0} Letter of Authorisation, etc...
¢) GlA Report/ GLA Search Result g) Car Rental Involce / Agrecinent

d) Insurance Certificate

Kimndly look toto the matter and let us hear from you on the sertlement of onr customer’s claims
15 5000 s possible.

Mlense note that it Is o condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal Injury clalm (If any) of the owner/claimani.

Thank you. i
Yours fithfully,

Jason Tang (jason@(h 10.COMLSE)
FASTECH AUTOD LTD




¢

DATE : 16.11.2018

RE = ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLENO.  SLZ 1800Y &

e e Rt T Dol e e T R L Wl e S

GBG 9003Y only

ALONG Ang Mo Kio Ave ]

ON 16.11.2018

'We, TAN FHECK LAN JEANNIE

of (NRIC No/ROC No.) §7127495)

of 33 PEMIMPIN PLACE SINGAPORE 576030

owner of vehicle - SLZ 1800Y in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

repairing myfour  SLZ 1800Y &t my/our instruction and hereby

authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settlement whatever
amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal

proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,
ete. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all elaimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

'We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the above-mentioned claim cost
which may arisen therewith.

T desde
Signature of Owner :

Name of Owner : TANFHEICKIANJEANHIE ' _




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520

Tax Reg No: 2000062621
Tax lmvoice  :20705

ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd
5 Temasck Boulevard, Date :13.12.2018
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five, Vehicle No  :SLZ 1800Y
Singapore 038985 MakeModel NISSAN QASHOQAIL
Chassis/Eng# :
Accident Date :16,11.2018
Claim No :1118- 20705
Attn: Motor Cloims Department Reference
Palicy No
Amount
To Proceed on with Parts by Paris, Repair, 58 12,653.14
inclusive of Knocking, Spray painting, Parts,
Labour Charges and etc
E&£O0.E Total ; 5% 12,653.14
GST @ 7% : S8 885.72
Amount Due : 5% 13,538.86
FASTECH AUTO PTE EID

All Invoices are subjected to GST

Pty sy



DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel No: 6741 7244 / 6746 5405 Fax No:67458520

Co. Reg No: 52928467K

To: TAN PHECK LAN JEANNIE

Invoice : DCR-2018-11-34

Date : 22112018
Agreememt No @ 20237

Ref : LOD
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle : SLHTS86X [ 111820705 ) 5 550.00
Rental Period from  17.11.2018 to 22.11.2018
E.&0.E, Total § 550.00
Hagly L

for Dynamic Car Rental




Dynamic Car Rental

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 8. 20146450 AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417852
TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786
Cu. Reg. No. 528268467K

AENTAL TEAMS AND CONDITIONS
' TRER
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M7 Involcs

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF

SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
l"sums 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
ASSOCIATION Phone; +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Refl No: GR-1B-178381
Data of Request: 17/11/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
{gingapum 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 17/11/2018
Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
TP Vehicle No. GBGS003Y
Accident Date 16/11/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
GBGE2003Y ERGO Insurance Ple. Lid, 27TM1/2017-26/11/2018 6829 9189
Thank You,
E a

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded 1o the centre by the mambers of the General

Insurance Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no
liability whatsoaver for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This |s a computer generated document and requires no signature,

hitps:/singapore.merimen. com/tlaima/ndax. cim Musabox=MTRzasAlsssclion=dsp_geninviphrefid=10775634ACFID=440113734CFTOKEN=325. ..

1




1nrzoa frveice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF

SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
INSURANCE 6 rames Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
ASSOCIATION Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-178361
Date of Request: 17/11/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #0148
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

{?i ingapore 417883

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enguiry Data 17/11/2018
Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
TP Vehicle No, GBGo003Y
Accident Date 16/11/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S§)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

{-This is @ computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Data:
[X] GIRO[] Cash [ ] Cheque

hittps:/fsingapare. merimen. com/claims/index.cfm Musebox=MTRsasAfussaction=dsp_geninviphrefid=1977534&CFID=440113734CFTOKEN=25. . 272
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Company Registration No. 189607 186R

S1UHEAVE |, #02-25 PAVA UHI INDUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J00930 TEL : (085) A3581581 FAX : (045) A25541]5

To : M/s ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD

Dale: 28/05/2019

THI P |
' GBG 9003Y (Insd Veh) |Your Ref No. : GBG3003Y/SL/pl
\Vehicle No.
SLZ 1800Y (TP Veh) |Our Ref, No. - CS/EGI18020893/Ugb3g2-1
Date of Accident 16/11/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost 5 13,538.86
Loss of Use ' $ days
Rental (If any) - 550.00 5.5 days
Others: $ 2.00
$

14,090.86

Final Settlement Sum |: § 14,090.00 |GLOBAL SUM

Remarks

ayment Instruction: Pa

's Breakdo

1) [FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

% 14,080.00

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubpi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315
Reg. No: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8807188-R

Affiliated to Federation internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref CS/EGHBO20BE3/Utbn2
for1 SONTES TOWER T
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 05-12-2018
SINGAPCORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBG 9003Y Veh. Inspected SLZ 1800Y
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GBGa003Y/SUpl Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From ¥EE PEI LI Assign Date 19/M11/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN QASHQAI (A) c.c 11897
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. SJNFEAJ11U221B282 Colour SILVER
Odometer 6301 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/80 R17 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R17 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/80R17 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 215/60 R17 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  16/11/2018 Inspection Date 18/11/2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTELTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg, Mo. 19-9607188-R Page No. 1of3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLZ 1800Y
s condition | Estimate By |Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | Cop )| ($).
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN WIMOULDING NECESSARY 1,855.30 930.00
2|REAR WINDSCREEN INNER SIDE GARNISH @$165.00 NOT NECESSARY 330.00
1| TAILGATE BADLY DENTED 3,066.20 2,936 B0
1|TAILGATE OUTER GARMISH WARPED / BENT 450.00 336.00
1| TAILGATE REAR LOGO NECESSARY 38.50 38.50
1| TAILGATE "QASHQAI" EMBLEM NECESSARY 78.50 78.50
2| TAILGATE REFLECTORS @3$650.00 CRACKED 1,300.00 43180
1| TAILGATE REAR WIPER ARM NOT NECESSARY 166.00
1|TAILGATE REAR WIPER MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 866.00
1|TAILGATE INNER LOCK TWISTED / JAMMED 282.00 118.70
1| TAILGATE INNER TRIM BEOARD DEFORMED / 585.30 488.20
CRACKED
1|SET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1| TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP TWISTED 166.20 166.20
1|TAILGATE REVERSE CAMERA SHORTED 485.00 485,00
2| TAILGATE LICENCE PLATE LAMPS @553.00 NOT NECESSARY 106.00 .
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED !/ B91.00 717.00
DEFORMED
1|REAR BUMPER TOW COVER NOT NECESSARY 2200 .
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS @368.00 NOT NECESSARY 136.00
Z2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @535.00 N/S BENT 70.00 35.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY as5.00 35.00
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE TORN 185.00 126.40
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DENTED 721.00 §19.20
Z|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKETS @$150.00 |BENT 300.00 252.00
1|REAR END PANEL BADLY DENTED 720.00 482.60
1|REAR SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED / 408.00 315.30
TWISTED
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 1.288.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD SERVICEABLE 822.00
2|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOOLS SPONGES @$305.00 TORMN 610.00 580.00

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18020893/Utbn2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6256 3581 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R Page No.2of3
e choa . . Estimate By | Our :
Description of Parts Condition | Fsmee ¥ ‘i:{“'“"‘
1|REAR END PAMNEL LOCK SENSOR NOT NECESSARY 265.00 -
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD SPONGE TORN 485,00 4895 00
1|REAR EXHAUST TO REPAIR SEE 1,122.30
LABOUR
2|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTINGS @5$60.00 NOT NECESSARY 120.00
2| TAILLAMPS [@5$580.00 CRACKED 1,160.00 B47.40
2|REAR FENDERS @51 150.00 TO REPAIR SEE 2,300.00
LABOUR
2|REAR FENDER OUTER PROTECTORS @5$541.00 DEFORMED /! TORN 1,.082.00 98200
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -1,131.48
22 477.30 10,183.14
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR LICENCE PLATE WHHOLDER (SN) BENT 50.00 40.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) MECESSARY 50.00 40.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 280.00 200.00
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|SET REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
480.00 330.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. BO.00D 30.00
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REVERSE SENSOR B0.00 50.00
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REAR WINDSCREEN 150.00 120.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR EXHAUST. NOT NECESSARY 150.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX SEAT,CUSHION UPHOLSTERY. 100.00 80.00
TO SPRAY RUSF PROOFING 120.00 60.00
TO MOUNT VEHICLE ON CAR O-LINER. NOT NECESSARY 380.00
LABOUR FOR PAMNEL BEATING & REPLACING 1,500.00 £00.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR FLOOR
PANEL,REAR EXHAUST AND REAR FENDERS.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING, 1,500.00 1,000.00
4 060.00 2,140.00
GRAND TOTAL 27,017.30 12,653.14
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 12,853.14]
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