Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premiertaxi.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 8 May 2019 9:07 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SHB 8319Z-DOA: 13/4/2019

Attachments: IMG20190413210626.jpg; IMG20190413210613.jpg
Dear Veron

Please find attach

Regards

Goh Wee Dek
Assistant Claims Manager
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 068 | DID: 6544 6682 | Fax: 6214 1511

Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.Sg

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact the
sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

3 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION g&

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 8:38 AM

To: Goh Wee Dek; SUR

Subject: RE: SHB 8319Z-DOA: 13/4/2019

Dear Wee Dek,

Kindly provides us accident scene photos, OI dispute.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 11:29 AM

To: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premiertaxi.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SHB 8319Z-DOA: 13/4/2019




Dear Wee Dek,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm PxP $1,123.67 & 2days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to MSIG

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premiertaxi.com>
Sent: Saturday, 27 April 2019 9:11 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SHB 8319Z-DOA: 13/4/2019

Dear Veron
Please confirm PxP $1,123.67 & 2days.

Regards

Goh Wee Dek
Assistant Claims Manager
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 068 | DID: 6544 6682 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.Sg

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact the
sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

3 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION g&

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@|kkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 26 April, 2019 3:48 PM

To: Gary Shi; Goh Wee Dek

Subject: SHB 8319Z-DOA: 13/4/2019

Dear Wee Dek/Gary,

Kindly advise vehicle status.



If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



