Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 5:50 PM

To: 'Sim, Priscilla-LK'; SUR

Subject: RE: Re: OD / 0403038504SG / SKZ 3887X Date of Accident 18 March 2019
Dear Ms Sim,

According to surveyor, based on SG car mart, 2 vehicles same model as insured vehicle is about the same price
$78K-$79K.

The vehicle with price of $57,888 could be with hidden cost.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 April 2019 10:26 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Re: OD / 0403038504SG / SKZ 3887X Date of Accident 18 March 2019
Hi Veron

Based on the references, LKK market value $ 65k - S 66k

Is the mv of $ 57,888/=‘ Grand ‘i.e. same model ? difference of $ 21k



Citroen Grand C4 Picasso $78,800 $10,210 fyr 05-Apr-2016
Diesel 1.6A BlueHDi

Fuel Type: Diesel (Euro 5 Engine and Above)

7 Seater MPV With Huge Fuel Savings. 1 Owner. 5 Years C&C Warranty. 1.6L Diesel Engine, Aget
Seats For Flexible Seat Configuration. Flat 2nd Row Flo...

Citroen C4 Picasso Diesel 1.6A  $57,888 57,590 fyr 25-Feb-2016
BlueHDi

Fuel Type: Diesel (Euro 5 Engine and Above)
Loan Awvailable, Diesel Engine For Best Mileage, Call To View Now. Car In Mint Condition, Road T:

Citroen Grand C4 Picasso $79,800 $10,200 fyr 12-May-2016
Diesel 1.6A BlueHDi

Fuel Type: Diesel (Euro 5 Engine and Above)

7 Seater MPV With Huge Fuel Savings. 1 Owner. 5 Years C&C Warranty. Fully Agent Serviced An
Flexible Seat Configuration. Flat 2nd Row Floorboard. Speak...

Priscilla Sim LK
Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755
priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.




From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, April 17, 2019 7:58 AM

To: Sim, Priscilla-LK; SUR

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Re: OD / 0403038504SG / SKZ 3887X Date of Accident 18 March 2019

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Ms Sim,

The market value of SKZ 3887X is $65K-$66K (Estimated) as at March 2019

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 5:15 PM

To: Alvin Yit (alvinyit@fta.com.sg) <alvinyit@fta.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; 'cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg'
(cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg) <cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg>

Subject: RE: Re: OD / 0403038504SG / SKZ 3887X Date of Accident 18 March 2019

Hi

Kindly assist with market value.

Priscilla Sim LK

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755
priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
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accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.
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