Vic (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Hi Rasul,

sin hup lee <sinhuplee@gmail.com>

Monday, 20 May, 2019 9:37 PM

Rasul (LKKAuto)

Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Re: After repair photos GBE5162H

GBE5162H_LOA .pdf; GBE5162H_invoive.pdf, GBE5162H_carRental.pdf;
GBE5162H_Final.pdf

Attached is the LOA, Car rental invoice and final bill. Please prepare cheque payable to m/s Sin Hup Lee

Service Co Thank you.

Regards,
Mr Wong

On Thu, May 16, 2019 at 8:52 AM sin hup lee <sinhuplee @ gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Rasul,

We confirm

Finalised amount is $ 4,750 / 8 days lump sum.

Thanks!

On Wed, 15 May 2019, 9:13 am Rasul (LKKAuto), <Rasul @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Mr Wong,

Kindly confirm the finalise amount

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-



From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 May, 2019 9:28 AM

To: sin hup lee

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: After repair photos GBE5162H

Hi Mr Wong,

Refer to attachment,

The emblems is a bit high, required to be reduce
Finalised amount is $ 4,750 / 8 days lump sum

Kindly confirm

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: sin hup lee [mailto:sinhuplee@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 13 May, 2019 8:47 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: After repair photos GBE5162H

Hi Rasul,



We confirm final lump sum of $4,800.00 with 8 days of loss of used.

Please confirm and we will proceed with the final bill.

Regards,

Mr Wong

81122116

On Wed, 24 Apr 2019, 8:34 am sin hup lee, <sinhuplee @ gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Rasul,

As requested, after repair photos for vehicle GBE5162H

Sin Hup Lee Service Co.



