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From Data:
Estimated Cost

QQ..HF RES | OD RES | EVA | INV | MV

To Inspect Vehicle No
W
at Workshop m/s
ﬂ-[ . T L r'\f’mgm4
Insured:
Policy Mo

Claims Nao.

Sum Insured: Excass:

(Client's Recard)
Make of Veh: HM ﬂ

(Palicy Gondition)
remark: The veh had commenced its NS | OfS

repair at the time of ins pection.
L e J{

Bal. or Markel Valug
IDAC Accident Rporl: Consistent? : Yes or No
GlA | PR Seen: Consistent? : Yes or No
Est. Repairs: days Res: Yesor No
Lum Sum % 3Val: Yes or No

CA | REV I REP. | 24HRS '4f
Venicle: INTOUT

i SR 79674 10 7)1S

1 Reqn

Type: fACar/ M.Cycle 1 Bus 1 Van | Lorry | Taxi | Prime Mover |
TrthmiIerul

Make: ' Ttyﬂfa A,-‘?'rf GG LSF%]C

Colour (i G Insured | Std [ NIT NA

spReading §§ 8/ TiRadio: Insured | Std 1 NIT NA

Eng/Mo:

e VIR OSIPEH104S 25113

zen. Eunrl Good Poor | Burnt .

Sleering of | Jammed | Leaked | Bumt or

Brake: af | Jammed | Leaked | Bumt or
Modi:  Nil i. STD AIRIm or
Tyre Size: F: ?‘ﬁ / S:fﬂ 6

R: o

BS/ DUN | EXNOVA | GY [ FS I LIZA T MIC [ OHTSU | PIR | SUMI
TOYO | L

Front Rear

RiBal. mm RILBE"Il 6 mm
uBa. i LiBal 6 =
DOA i f{ﬁ/f‘? DOl )}ﬁ/ﬁ -
:'SI.II‘\I'E':" hald at M ova

Des. of Daméges : Frt @r OIS | NIS | UIC | Rooftop o

-

Date: Person Contacled: The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Strueture affected due to collision
“Date/Time | _Action / Instruc B _
ik e O NGI0.45 T dar (Leal s oMb e o)
(% 983 o 44-53?{)
= _ 13
RELEWES 2 0\S A
DialiTire, Fila Pass 107 l . Preli. Report Days Of Repair: il
beg':f 9 = |
i IZ Final Report Resurvey No. of Trip: | |Survey Fee: /D
DatefTime. File Return 107 | Transporlation f e
|
il Add Fee: - Site Ingp (% ) §+RS,__§ s 0
D. Interview (% )| Photos K2
Report Format : Tech. Invs (% } Chtars .
Lump Sum /[ LBL (S 1g20q0 P/ ‘Weekend (% )
TOTAL L. b |




H i M5 First Capital Insurance Limited e feg. Mo, LOS000L0GC G587 Rug he. ME 000167649
MS . FlrstCaplta I f Ratfles Quay #21-00 Singapare 048580

Tel (65 622 2311 Fan [B5) 6222 3547

Claims & Hater Usderamiting Dept: 36 Fobinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 058877
Tel (B5) 6507 3648 Fax 165] 6507 3349
www mefirstcapitaloom.ig

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

15-04-2019 Our Ref No. D19002535MFSH
11-04-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC3140Z Third Party Vehicle. SKR7863A

BLOCK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08
NITHA

62723892/ 0 Fax No. 62708314

DIRECT SETTLEMENT: QUANTUM TO BE AGREED (EST. COR - $2,898.52)

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE
LTD

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This iz a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Keong <keong@mova.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, May 23, 2019 11:29 AM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: ‘Enny’; "Suann’; "JIAYU'

Subject: RE: SKR7963A Ready For Finalise
Dear Steve

Confirmed

Best Regards,

Goh Chai Hock (Keang)
Claims Estimatar

Meva Automotive Pte Lid

HF : 96510098

Tel: 8272 3802 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Lid

This message s cenfidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this massage in eror. please da nol copy, disclose ar use ifs
Py

content. Wa would be grateful If you would natily us by email and delete the original iransmission and any attachment from your systam
Any attachmeant 1o this e-mall may contain saftware viruses that could damage your compuler system. Although we will take reasonabila precaution 9 minimize this
rick. we do not accept any liability rezulling from software viruses. Pleasa carry out your own virus checks before opening any allachment

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) [mailto:SteveChen@Ikkauto.com

Sent: Tuesday, 7 May 2019 8:58 AM
To: Keong
Subject: SKR7963A Ready For Finalise

Hi Keong,
The finalize is $1,820.90 (P/P, before G5T). 3 days.

Kindly confirm

Thanks

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S({408533)

From: Keong [mailto:keong@mova.com.sg
Sent: Monday, May 06, 2019 1:38 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Subject: SKR7963A Ready For Finalise



Shirtel Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 26 April 2019 5:43 PM

To: 'May Chua Hui Chin'; 'CWS Motor Claims’

Ce: assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002535MFSH/1
Attachments: SKR 7963A - Preli Advise -.pdf

RE-SEND

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Libi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 24 April 2019 5:51 PM

To: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'CWS Motor Claims'
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; 'SUR’ <sur@lkkauto.com>; ‘Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002535MF5H/1

Dear May,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKR 7963A.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 11:29 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002535MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.



Shirle! Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 24 April 2019 5:51 PM

To: 'May Chua Hui Chin’; 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002535MFSH/1
Attachments: SKR 7963A - Preli Advise - pdf

Dear May,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKR 7563A.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 11:29 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002535MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha! Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 9:28 AM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua Hui Chin
<maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002535MFSH/1



Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com
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Ssm mam  Peld Company Registration No. 199607 188R

51 UBLAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 405933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (I65) 62564315

Your Ref: D19002535MFSH Date: 24 April 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19006800/Esd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SKR 7963A .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 22/04/2019 at the premises of M/s Mova Automotive Pte Ltd and have the following
to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S5$  2.708.90
REevised Estimate Amount 1 5% 1,730.00
“Check” Items Amount : 88 571.50
Market Value : 55 .
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 58 .
Nett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 3 Days

Yours faithfully,
Chen Tsue Yee
Automotive Assessor



oy =i = Fre Lid Company Reglstration Mo, 109607 198R

51 URI AVE 1, §02-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAFORE 405933 TEL ; (065) 62563561 FAX : (065 61364315

Your Ref: D19002535MFSH Date: 24 April 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19006800/Esd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SKR 7963A .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 22/04/2019 at the premises of M/s Mova Automotive Pte Ltd and have the following
to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :8§ 270890 .

Revised Estimate Amount (lump sum) : 5% 1,730.00

“Check” Items Amount : 83 571.50

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : S8

Nett Value : 8%

Description of Damage: —a

The vehicle sustained damages ——

at the rear portion. B | | froe
e

ifigide

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 3 Days

Yours faithfully,
Chen Tsue Yee
Automotive Assessor



MCCCT047900 / Cham's Customerafy - ¢
ENTRY OATE & TIME: 1200412018 16:27
SLUBMITTED BY: Kark Kar Seng

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Flease report gorractly the details of Ine accident o speoed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be compheted by the Policyhelder andlor the Autharised Driver

3. Infarmation provided must be as ruthful and accurale as possible, Any willl misrepreseniation or witholding of material facts may allow INsurance companies Lo
repudiate policy liablity

4, The isswe and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admissian of policy liability on (he part of the InSUrance companies

5. Any false reporting may be refarred to the Police for investigation.

fi. This report will be forwarded by fhe insurers of the GIA Records Managament Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, he madse available upon application by interesled paries

7. By the lodgement of his report o the insurers, you hereby consent o the archiving of this repert at the centre and to coples of the report being made availabie
aforasaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

Yehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
NRIC MNo

Email Address

Mobile Phone Mo
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category
Insurance Company
Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleet Palicy

Paolicy Number

Cover Nole Number
Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupaltion

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Maobile Number

Fax Mumber

Contact Number
EMail Address

12/04/2019 16:27
11/04/2019 18:00

JURONG TOWN HALL RD (AFT JUNC JURONG EAST 5T 11)

SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

SKRTIG3IA

LIM SIOK MU

51443630H
SUMAYLINE@HOTMAIL.COM
(LOCAL) +65-91374188
OFFICE-MOPHONE

TOYOTA
COROLLA ALTIS-1.6 {A)

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

VATGA446094

LIM SIOK MU

S1443630H

25/0311960

INDOOR

09/09/1986

32 YEARS AND 7 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-91374188

OFFICE-NOPHONE
SUMAYLIN@HOTMAIL.COM



Address

Postcode

BLK 526 BUKIT BATOK STREET 51 #02-116
2365

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If Mo, Relaticnship of the Driver with the Insured OWNER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Qwn -

Yehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident
Weather Conditions
Road Surface

Other Information

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
CLEAR
DRY

Was any fareign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Mumber of vehicles {including own vehicle)

invalved in the accident 2
VWas any body injured in the Accident? MO
Was any injured conveyed o hospital by NG
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES
| have been Eppru:uat:lfted by upkn:}wn.ﬁersnn[s] NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers {Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported o the police? WO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

VWas notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If ¥es.against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO SKETCH PLAN

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? MO

\Was there any audio recorded?

Wehicle Registration Mumber
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properlies
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
MNRIC/Passport Number
Contact Mumber

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
MNature Of Damage

Mo. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
SHC3140Z
HYUMNDAI

TAXI
TAY KIAN HENG

8209 7577

F‘:-'.;_:ln 2of 14



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SHKETCH PLAN
IMEORTANT NOTICE

1. Pease report cormectly the detais of the acoent to speed up the oleims progess.

2 This Formoust be completed by the Policyholder andfor the Authorised Driver

3 Inforrration provaded must be a8 truthiul and accurate as possible Any wilful msrepresemanan o withhalding of mateslsl {ecs may
iz meurance companies to repudiste policy liability.

4 The fssue end accoplance of this Formby nsurence companes & not anacrission of-pohcy labildy on the part of the meurance
toimpanies

b any lalse reporling may be referred to the Polica for inyestigation

&. The report wil e torw arded by Ihe nsureis of the G Records Management Cantre establiehed by tha Genaral swrance Associaton
of Singapoee (W) for archaing amd that copies of this report w il for 2 fee be mada avadable upon appication by maresied parios.

T By 1he lodgermant of this repor 1o the msurers, you hereby congent o the srchang of thig repodt al the cenireé and to sopes of the
rapert beng insde svailable sforesad

B Consent under the Porsonal Data Protection Act (POPA)

lunderstand -acknow lodge: agrae and consend ihal

[a} My insuret | my warkshop and the General hswrance Assocabon of Smgspora [ GIAT) maylara permitted 1o colisct, uge, discloses
and'or process m personal datodpeesonal information sed out in ths [form] and any other personalnlormaticn provided by e o
possessed by my ingurer |colectivaly he “Porsonal Information”| and disckse ang ransfer such Personal nformation to all insurer (s}
w hd have naured veluclals ) nvolved in ths accidant (all inswee(s) w ho have nsured vehickls) mvolved in this accidand shal be
collectvely raferred 1o 8% tne “Insurers”), the beurers' law yersflaw fins, the Manetary &uthardy of Siogapore and any rekvant
gevernment agancylauthorily (such as the poce], for the purposeis) of -

(i} processing. handing andler dealing w ih my claine schading ihe setilement of the claive and any recessary investigatons relating 1o
the clames

{#) imvestgalng ihe accident andior my claims;

[m) carrying oul andior dealing w ah my mElictions of Tesponding o any enguines by me

(w} admmilaring my claime (nchoding the maling of cormespandénce. statarmenis nvoces Tagedts o natices 1o ma, which could imolve
d=closure of ceriain personal dats aboul me fo Wing atout delvery of the same a5 wel as on (he extermal cover of envelupesimad
packages); andior

i) complying w ilh applicable e in sdministering, processing. nending andion deghng w ih my clairms

(colecively the  Purposes’)

(k) all ingurar(s) who have insurea vebicke(s) iwoived n this accident and the Inswrees’ law yersfaw tinms, may/are permilted 1o colect,
s, distloge andlor process my Pevsonal information for one or more of the above Parpoges, and

) rmy Fersonal Information may/can-be disclosed by any of tha bsurers and/or G 1o thelr thied perly servics providers of agents
tinchuding their law yersiaw firma), which may be sited culside of Bngapare. 1or one or more of the abeve Purposes.

(/”;W/ w}q\ﬁ

Folicy holder's Swnstue § Dale 3'. Deiver's Sgnature (H diiveris nod the pobcyholdor} | Data VWiness eu by BEporing Cenlrg
T
e ﬁlﬂﬂf\ £ Tirre Flers anne|

Sketch Plan

Page 3of 14



Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1

Dajl_ci_ri be Circumstances of the Accident -

1 was civine  alwg Tduedd Buwa Hail Roned begelwg
aicods < Jue choA Mrel wachen ap Ot St Mgec |
owgs o buygld wp o cars ) Bent . Tiitet cars v
CAvout  bvaleedd oa'd T wes blakeel . The 4R ,
behind wg obdd  nopy step on % e gncl bymprd
o dne btk o-t ML elav 1
Tarr olviver i Thy ddmidee] el he as ar Foul l-
Fud afel pesstl - 7 St | b emtlee] pma b ool
H esk e a"-t,*f-?v‘f‘t' G A ofcy i --Hnmu,_?‘u ;r‘E‘lLbf‘u‘h

-

Declaration

e declere Lhe foregoing pain ulans Are o ih avery e e

% ﬂ

) ;,[*-'-}\ R
Folicyholder's Sgnature § Dale & Draver's Signature (F dilves i nol the policyholder) | Dale Witne=ser by Reporfing C=nire
Teria & Tinw Parsonnel

9:% l

Fage 4 of 14



412200

> Back to OneMotoring

DARFITNE Rahata Enaiing

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner 1D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make;

Vehicle Model;

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
FARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Apr 2019

Singapore NRIC
3630H

SKR7943A

Mo

22 Apr 2019

TOYOTA

COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT
Grey

2014

1ZRY 135140
MROS3REH104523113
90.0 kW (120 bhp)
$17,398.00

10 Mar 2015

10 Mar 2015

0

$12,398.00

Yes
09 Mar 2025
$9,298.00

0% Mar 2025

A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$57,199.00

$33,606.00

%42 904.00

FUIERE 0 v g v D TR W10 BRI I T VAT | A AR N T I 0 AR L e I B0 e B

"



MOVA

: s e 1 s |
L-’f i !."“ .Il 1 e 159 Lf ! (e Automotive Pte Litd
.:-r# b j Main Office:
Ly WMowa 8 _|||-'I-.'||_|
" Me. 22, Jalan Kilang
b | ﬂ/ﬂ Singapore 159419
» Page# - 1 Tl (65) 8476 3332
mta A ,1 f |‘ Fax: (65) 6271 5891
P o Mo, 1% VWWLITYOVELGOIM, 50
| A5 0¥ veh# .. SKR7963A sbasaalds,
| orkshop Dept:
TAE0RY Veh Model - TOYOTA ALTIS R
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Estimate# - CK418997 e
¥ = Fax: [BS) O BE314
#16-01 City House aim ax ; [B3) E
- 17, 19820400330
Singapore 068877. ACC. Date :- 12/04/19 (ST Rag, M2-008EA64-2
Terms . C.0.D Days
Aftention - XAD26 Remarks -
Mo.  Description Qty U.Price Amounts S%
LIST ITEMS : an
1. RearBuMPER .~ /1)) a7 0 1 pe SJ0-9¥57s.60 579,60
2. REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT - o 1 PC 378.90 378.90 /
3, REARBUMPERBRACKETLH y /7 YU 1 PC 17140 171.40/
4 REARBUMPER SIDE RETAINERLH ~  ff 1 PC/7]90, 18140 18140
5. REARBUMPERCLIPS ~ [t - adfpc  3g0Ar! 77/30.00
6. REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR s I 1 PGV~ A"3a3.10 383.10
7. REARLAMPLH X WA 1 PC 371.80 371.80%
a. REAR PANEL - REPAIR ~ K 1 PC
8. REARFEMDERLH-REPAIR v f 1 PC
A Y = p
LIST TOTAL S§ et = J 5% f- 1744 2.105.20
25% DISCOUNT S§ Ay, 526.30
710 &'ﬂ s e
1,578.90
LABOUR :
TO REPAIR REAR PANEL, REAR FENDER LH, REAR ’
FLOOR PANEL, REMOVE & REFIX DAMAGED PARTS. ﬂ 140§ {q .
STRAIGHTEN AND REALIGN AFFECTED AREAS ! 497 480,00
|I - : Ll
TO SPRAY AFFECTED AREAS 'I:?‘E : J$7  eo0.00
19068 7
Ve
TO INSTALL REVERSE SENSOR & CHECK WATER )
SEEPAGE Jo 5000
LABOUR TOTAL $§ 4 5 P 1,130.00
LKK Auto Consultants hence notify E &OE
ﬁ"TE Repairer of the following: s NON-TAX AMOUNT £
* To resurvey beforelafter spray painting
* To display damaged part{s) during resuirvey . AMOUNT 5% 270830
* Paris prices are subject lo confirmation \ ?_____,.» GST @ 7% 189.62
* Third party survey is on @ “Without Prejudics™ basis | o e S T R
» No I.'ll:*..jﬂl l-'l:}:||'.-;_1_1_|.}"_::i' 18 allowed : " .II _'____.-"' :
. SUPN""ET@E:IE\.H}] r:l. I “,L I ,-f"'_:.‘a-"l_.L mh‘{ AMOUNT DUE 5% 2,808.52
W SUBRC 0 fnal approval rom Insurancs ¢ —— ey e
Customer's Sianature/Co. Stamp 'MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
Acknowledged by Repawer
Signature;
Date:
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Estimate AL .
J?‘j Veh# .. SKR7T963A
13/04/2019
Veh Model - TOYOTAALTIS

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

i .. CK418997
36 Robinson Road Estimate#

#16-01 City House Claim# -

Singapore 068877. ACC. Date .- 12/04/19
Terms i C.OD Cays

Attention ;- XAD26 Remarks -

@MOVA
¥ CERTTERLDRTIR
Automotive Pte Lid

Main Office:
Mmﬂlﬂd'm
o, 22, Jalan Kﬂarg,

pore 159419
Tol+ (o5 0470 3009

Faot: [B5) 6271 5891
WA ITIONE O, S0

Weorkshop Dept:
Block 1008,

Buklt Marah Lane 3,
#01-04/06/08/34
Singapore 159722
Tal 65) 6272 3802
: (B5) B2T0 8314

. Reg. 19890403306
GéTF!ag A2-0083864-2

Mo,  Description

U.Price ‘Amounis S§

Qty

LIST ITEMS :
1.  REAR BUMPER f 1] a oW 579.60 579,60
2. REARBUMPERREINFORCEMENT - 7y 378.80 378.90 o~
3.  REAR BUMPER BRACKET LH 171.40 171.40 —
4, REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINE LH ¢ 181.40 181,40 o~
5.  REARBUMPERCLPS ~ Al pc - 380 77 3800 o~
8.  REARBUMPER REVERSE smsun . 0F 1 PG 383.10 383.10
7. REARLAMP LH 1 PC 371,80 7180 3¢
8. REARPANEL-RePAR x K 1 PC
8. REARFENDERLH-REPAIR ¥ £ 1 PC

LIST TOTAL 5% 2,105.20

25% DISCOUNT 5§ %Lﬂﬂ ':13’/ 4/9" ! C? -526.30

g/}ﬂ 9 chate £ 1,578.90

LABOUR : | I’ﬁ("ﬁ d 1133. I{D{. e

TO REPAIR REAR PANEL, REAR FENDER LH, REAR ﬁ,ﬁ 2%2.%

FLOOR PANEL, REMOVE & REFIX DAMAGED PARTS.

STRAIGHTEN AND REALIGN AFFECTED AREAS | 260 .0 s J97 48000

TO SPRAY AFFECTED AREAS i G .00 J57  s00.00

TO INSTALL REVERSE SENSOR & CHECK WATER

SEEPAGE j?" Il G{‘?U = U'{ Jo =000

LABOUR TOTAL S$

é&agztﬁﬂ.ﬂﬂ

2duy:

2

ek NON-TAX AMOUNT §
o 1}, AMOUNT §§ = 2,708.90
GST@ 7% 189.62
K ogny AMOUNT DUE S$ 2,808.52

: 8
Customer's Slanature/Co. Stamp MOVA ALITGMDTWE[ETE LTD
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL:

6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Feg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref . CS/FCIS006800/Esd3s2
$16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068677 Do | 200R0e ” u""m"”"“mu
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 31402 Veh. Inspected SKR 7963A
Policy No. Coverage (3$) 0.00
Claim No. D19002535MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MAY CHUA Assign Date 16/04/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. MROSIREH104523113 Colour GREY
Odometer 55815 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55R16 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre [205/55R16 YOKOHAMA & rmm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55R16 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  11/04/2018 Inspection Date 22/04/2018
Survey held at MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08 .
SINGAPORE 159722
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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I Pl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 8256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKR T963A

B ; ‘- ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Page No.:1 of 1

. Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rkehnpﬁ{‘g]} [$]}_'
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 579.60 530.30
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DENTED 378.90 378.90
1|REAR BUMPER BRACKET LH DENTED 171.40 171.40
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH BROKEN 181.40 133.80
1|REAR LAMP LH NOT NECESSARY 371.80
1|REAR PANEL (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER LH (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE .
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -420.77 -303.62
1,262.33 910.88
1|REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SN} NECESSARY 39.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) BROKEN 383.10 200.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -105.53 -
316.57 230.00
LABOUR
TO REPAIR REAR PANE REAR FENDER LH,REAR FLOOR 480.00 300.00
PANEL.REMOVE & REFIX DAMAGED
PARTS.STRAIGHTEN AND REALIGN AFFECTED AREAS.
TO SPRAY AFFECTED AREAS, 800.00 350.00
TO INSTALL REVERSE SENSOR & CHECK WATER 50.00 30.00
SEEPAGE.
1,130.00 BA0.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,708.90 1,820.88
|  RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 1,820.88|

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19006800/Esd3s2

e

CHEN TSUE YEE

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, M. MATAI

Licensed Appraisar

MSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made salely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report




