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+65 6286 3032

' Bedok Motor Engineering Pte btd
30 Defu Lane 9 Singapore 539270
http://www.bedokmotor.com
enquirefdbedokmotor.com

r 7 YUT H
Chassis No : LZYTETD63B1007081
S/No Quantity Description Amount
LIST ITEMS =
1 1pc  |Front windshield glass AL 205 $ 3133434
2 1pc  |Front side view mirror assy witharm R/H 7 A $ 184221 |
3 1pc  |FrontwiperarmR/H Lo/ $ 20942 ——
4 1pc  |Front wiper blade R/H A $ 89 74 “"'
5 lpc  |Front wiper arm L/H 41 $ 32174 "
6 1pc Frant wiper blade L/H A1 ) s 74 42 | ¥
7 1pc  |Front body panel Fﬁ-}{fw?v-q § 294274} —
8 lpc  [Front body panel badge 4 $ 169424+
9 2pes  |Head lamp @2 $1047.21 o [ [ A s 200442 | W
10 1pc  |Front body centre reflector garnish ~ ( ~t $ 64724
11 1pc  |Front bumper ) $ 287279 |
12 1pc  |Front bumper stay @2 $247.79 ‘L s agsse|
13 1pc  |Front licence plate panel T $ 17824 |~
14 lpc  |Front bumper spot lamp @2 5132?1 &/ era § 56444 | ,0.
NIT /';M_‘:‘,?U Al 6uB3ST/ (3 W03k
NPT ’ $ 15,805.83
o 5 12208 b=y lessio% |5 158088 | ((4]27]
TS ' $ 1422525
s }n’w" ¥ JT'
PECIAL NETT | MS B
15 1pc  |Front windshield glass repair kit /&1 $ 50000| & <
16 1pc  |Front licence plate ¥l s 50.00 | ¥
$§ 55000
LABOUR & MISC CHARGE =
1 To remove/refit front windshield glass. $ 5500050
2 To remove/ refit instrument dashloard assy to facilitate ~
repairs. § 70000/ ¢
3 Check lightings and focussing head-lamp. $  B0.OO 2’1;'_
4 Panel beating. $ 3,000.00 |00
5 Spray painting. $ 220000 |/000
6 Tao check aircond assy , vaccum and charge In aircond gas. $ 28000 ! oD
$ 681000
1214
Total $ 21,585.25




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 1654W
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: CB6725G
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 17 Apr 2019
Vehicle Make: YUTONG
Vehicle Model: ZK6100H
Primary Colour: White
Secondary Colour: Green
Manufacturing Year: 2011
Engine No.: ISBE425021979735
Chassis No.: LZYTBTD63B1007081
Maximum Power Output: .
Open Market Value: $105,094.00
Original Registration Date: 18 Jun 2011
First Registration Date: 18 Jun 2011
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $5,255.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Rebate Amount: $0.00
Total Rebate Amount: $0.00

Page 1 of |

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Apr 2019

OK

hitps:/vrl.a.gov.sg/lia/vel/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput ?FUNCTION _ID=F030... 17-Apr-19



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Chan, Kian-Meng <Kianmeng.Chan1@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 May 2019 3:08 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: 297915714256, ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 3473T (O1) & CB 6725G (TP)
ON 11/04/2019

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Dear Asher,

Kindly assist to reject claim. Third party should keep a safe distance and scenario is still relating to BOLA 27.

Best regards,

Chan Kian Meng

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 078120
Tel +(65) 6419 1678

KianMeng.Chan1@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mallto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2019 2:04 PM

To: Chan, Kian-Meng

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Your ref: 29791571425G, ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 3473T (0I) & CB 6725G (TP) ON
11/04/2019

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Hi Sir,
We refer to the emall dated on the 08/05/2019.
Please kindly let us have your instruction if any, third party is chasing for liability.

Thank You.,

Best Regardy

Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LKK Aulo Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 4841-605] | emal; gshesng@tkkouto.com | hox: 67414108



Blk 51, Paya Ubi indusifial Park. Ubl Avenue 1. #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 8 May 2019 4:11 PM

To: Hunchung.Gan@aig.com
Subject: Your ref: 29791571425G, ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 3473T (0I) & CB 6725G (TP) ON 11/04/2019

Your ref: 29791571425G
Qur Ref: CC6/AIG19006770/Ueb3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 3473T (Ol) & CB 6725G (TP) ON 11/04/2019

We refer to the above matter.

TP reported that Ol stop to make a lane changed to the right, he collided to the rear of Ol vehicle.
Ol reported that TP rear ended his vehicle.

Based on the above accident scenario third party rear ended insured vehicle,

We are of the opinion that BOLA 27 is applied and insured shall not be liable for the accident.

In view of the above, we are intending to reject TP claim.

For your approval/ comments/ instruction.

Thank You.

Best Regords,
Asher Sng | Cose Handier
LKE Avle Consullants Ple Lid

phone: 5841-6051 | email: gshersng@kkauto.com | fox: 6741-4108
fik 51, Paya Ubl iInclustrial Park, Ub! Avenue |, #02-25 | 5{408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended reciplent, you must not
use or disseminate the information. if you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any coples or printouts thereof. Although this emall and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



Asher Sna (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuUto)
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 11:55 AM
To: shuwen@bedokmotor.com
Subject: RE: ACC INVLG CB6725G & GBF34737 ON 11-04-2019 23.40 P.M *** LKK REF:
CCe/AIG19006TT0/Ueb3
Attachments: Ol SKETCH PLAN pdf
WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS
Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.
We attached here with a copy of our insured's accident statement for your easy reference,

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client rear ended our
insured vehicle.

We are of the opinion that liability is not In your client’s favor,

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Cose Handles
LEK Aute Consultonts Pe Lid

phone: 6841-8051 | emaolk gshenng@lkkguipcom | 'ox &741-4108
Bk 31, Payo Ut industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #0225 | $[408733)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto}

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 7:23 PM

To: shuwen@bedokmotor.com; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.coms

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACC INVLG CB6725G & GBF3473T7 ON 11-04-2019 23.40 P.M *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG19006770/Ueb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that O has reported. Please refer to the below O1's sketch plan and statement.
1



Please provide us the following.
» evidence ie. video and scene photo,
* PIR result (if any)
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Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact KSHEEALGRTLG0SE

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultunts Pte Lud

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: Meikwan@lkkauto com | fax: 67414108
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080933)

From: shuwen@bedokmotor.com <shuwen@bedokmotor.com»
Sent: Tuesday, 23 April, 2019 4:28 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACC INVLG CB6725G & GBF3473T ON 11-04-2019 23.40 P.M

Hi Mel Kuan,

As per requsted.

Thanks and Best Regards,
Shu Wen



Bedok Motor Engineering Pte Ltd
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Revoked /| No aettiement

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case Notified Est Submutted Adj Asmgned Ad) Rpt Adj) Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status -
vy |17 Aer 2018 Shbpr2018 5$12,00000  |S$12.000.00 T Yot S
n y
it Reg Ecit Rat I Ean Estimares Wiew Fpt c Case l

Mair Reference

Clalm Detalls

'CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]

| Irsured: | POPULAR RENT A CAR PTE LTD, Co. Beg MNo.: 1596081857
| Main i
| Clabrmant: BEDOK TRANSPORT PTELTD, Co, Reg No,: 200311654W

|Vehicie Reg
‘Nou

11/04/2019 33:00 - 159
[93 Months and 24 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]

0999594447 (Comprehensve)

Date of Loss:

CB6725G
TP / 297915714256

Policy/Cover
Note Na.:

Folicy No.
(Claimant):
Excess:
Bedok Transport Pte Ltd (HQ) 30-32 DEFU LANE 9, 539270 Defu Lane - Tel:

AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel: £5-5419-3000 ... [Handled by Chan, Kian-Mang]
Kianmeng.Chanl Seig.com

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6461 6555
LKK Auto Consultants Pts Lid (HQ) - Tel: 6356-3551 ... [Handled by MARCUS CHUA) ... [Final Rpt due 26/04/2019]

(Claim Type!
Wehicle Rag,
L]

[ Insured):

GHF3473T DIBMTSCEU000295

E“Iﬁ I‘I';I'
[Handling

| Insurer:

| Claimant's
| Insurer:

| Adjuster:

iﬂsnm‘rm MAIL RECEIVED

|* AJG_5G (23/04/2019): Re: No O GIA Report
i+ AlG_SG (17/04/201%): No O GIA Report

view All | Compess Case Mail |

View Al | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Compiete ||
Task Group  Subject  Handler  Assigned By  Completed On  Created On  Done?

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS—

Dues Date  Priocty Type
| Mo resules.
|

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 24/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2

Claim Documents

*CB6725G (29791571425G)
[GBF3473T]
T

BEDOK TRANSPORT PTE LTD
Apr 11 2019 11:00PM
[POPULAR RENT A CAR PTE LTD]
Bedok Transport Pte Ltd

View [View in Browser

Upload Documents | _Uplasd hotos | _ Compose New Letter | _Upicad Wideo | _Uplowd Audio |

Photos/Images 3perpage Lv]
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5 |0B/08/19 17:46 | General View 0 | adwc | A
& |08/08/1917:46 General View 0 | earwc | W
7 |09/06/19 1746 General View 0| wwors | 4
& (0H/06/1917:46 | General View D | wadws | 4
9 (D8/DE/10 1746 General View D =dwvc |
10 |DB/O&/19 1746 | General View 0 | tcadc | B2
(11 |DE/D&/19 17:46 | General View 0 | oscws | A
(12 |DB/DE/19 17:46 | General View D | wad#s | 4
13 |DB/06/19 1746 | General View O | eaaws | R
14 | DB/O6/19 17:46 | General View D | wadwvc | A
15 |0B/D6/19 17:46 | General View | ceawc | B
16 |08/06/19 17:46 | General View D | wadws | A
17 0B/06/19 1746 General View 0 | eairs | B2
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19 |DB/06/19 17:45 | General View 0D | lcadic | A
|20 |0BJOB/1G 17:46 | General View D! loadic | A
21 0B/06/19 17046 | Gemeral View ©  iosaws | &
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26 |0B/06/19 17:46 | Genersl View D | Lad e |
27 |oB/06/18 17:46 | General View 0 | Leadrc | A
I8 |DB/UG/19 17:46 General View g Load PG | BA
29 |0B/06/19 17:46 General View 0 | wasws |
30 |D8/06/19 17:46 | General View 0 | waawc | A
31 |08/06/19 17:46 | General View 0 | werec | F
32 |0B/D6/15 17:46 | General View 0 | Losors | @
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34 [DB/0A/19 17:46 | General View D | oosdwc |
35 |0B/06/15 17:46 | Ganersl View 0D | cadwrc | A
36 |0B/06/1% 17146 | General View O | edre |
37 |08/0B/19 17:46 | General View © | woawc | A
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Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno 1se07158m)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 62568-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@ikkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCE/AIG190067TTVUEB3O2
Date: 24/06/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No: 0999904447
Claimant Vehicle cae725G Insured Vehicle No: GBF3473T
Date of Loss: 110472018 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No; 287915714256
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: CB&725G
Make & Model YUTONG ZK8100H, 6.7 D (M) Engine No: ISBE425021679735
Reg. Date: 18/06/2011 (Man. Year: 2011) Chassis No: LZYTBTDE3B 1007081
Colour: White/Grean Odometar: QO km
Engine Capacity: 6693 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$). Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Siearing (Serviceahble): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-acciden! Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/80 R225 Rear Tyre Size: 205/80 R22 5 (D)
Front Left Side GoodTyre 6 mm Rear Laft Side: GoodTyre 6/6 mm
Front Right Side GoodTyre 6 mm Rear Right Side: GoodTyre 6/6 mm
The above vaiuas represont the remaining fyre resds depth
COST OF CLAIMS B Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Dff %
Parts 14,775.25 11,632.92 3,242.33 21.54
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour B8,810.00 3,720.00 2,080.00 4537
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 21,585.25 15,252.02 6,332.33 29.34
Approved Total (Overridden) (55) 12,000.00
(5%) 21585.25 12,000.00 9 58525 44 41
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5) 1.510.97 840.00 670.97 44 41
Nett Amount (S§) 23,096.22 12,840.00 10,256.22 44.41
Global Sum Settlamant (5§) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignmenl: 17/04/2019
Date Inspected: 17/04/2018  Inspected Al Bedok Transport Pte Ltd (HQ)
30-32 DEFU LANE 8
Singapore 539270
Estimated Period of Repair: 7.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 24/6/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Asher Sng Rong ¥i

NOTE: This report reprasents our fngings af ihe Bme and place of inspection stated herein, Such inapection hag been camed oul o the bos! of our
knowisdge and ahility but any ather kabiity undar any other circumstances is hereby sxpressly srciuded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 24/6/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT WINDSHIELD GLASS Broken 313343FL "2.500.00FL
2 1 *FRONT SIDE VIEW MIRROR ASSY WITH ARM R/H  Cracked 1,842 21FL *1,84221FL
3 1 *FRONT WIPER ARM R/H Bent 208.42FL "29042FL
4 1 *FRONT WIPER BLADE R/H Nol Necessary BB.7T4FL *FL
5 1 *FRONT WIPER ARM L/H Nol Necessary 321.74FL *.FL
B 1 *FRONT WIPER BLADE LIH Nol Necessary T4 42FL ~FL
7 1 *FRONT BODY PANEL Dented / Warped 2042 74FL "2,842 F4FL
8 1 *FRONT BODY PANEL BADGE Necessary 160.42FL *16942FL
B 1 *HEAD LAMP /S Cracked 2094 42FL *1,047 21 FL
0 1 *FRONT BODY CENTRE REFLECTOR GARNISH Cracked B47 24FL  *G47 24FL
1Mo *FRONT BUMPER Distorted 2,B72.7T9FL "2872.79FL
12 1 *FRONT BUMPER STAY Repair 485 58 FL “FL
13 1 *FRONT LICENCE PLATE PANEL Repair 178.24FL *-FL
14 1 *FRONT BUMFER SPOT LAMP O/S Cracked 564 44FL *282.22FL
15 1 *FRONT WINDSHIELD GLASS REPAIR KIT Necessary 500.00F5 *100.00FS
6 1 *FRONT LICENCE PLATE Nol Necessary 50.00FS *-F8
FaFranchise part S=SpcNett. L=LisiltemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 16,355.83  12,803.25
- List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (5%) 158058 1,270.33
Total Parts (S$) 1477525 11,532.82
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellsncous Hems seiected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE/REFIT FRONT WINDSHIELD GLASS New 550.00 300.00
2 TO REMOVE/REFIT INSTRUMENT DASHLOARD ASSY TO New 700.00 300.00
FACILITATE REPAIR
3 CHECK LIGHTING AND FOCUSSING HEAD-LAMP New 80.00 20.00
4 PANEL BEATING New 3,000.00 2.000,00
5 SPRAY PAINTING New 2,200.00 1,000.00
2] TO CHECK AIRCOND ASSY VACCUM AND CHARGE IN MNew 280.00 100.00
AIRCOND GAS
Gross Labour Cost (S%) 6.810.00 3,720.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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