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This mail is associated with :

*JPT5831 (C0402054)
[SIR9536Z]
TP
JOSOPHIENE A/P SINATHAMBY
Sep 18 2016 7:00PM
[LEE KOK KIONG]
Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd
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From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 14/02/2017 14:58 PM.
To cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg; AXA_SG; LKK_HQ

CcC zayyer@lkkauto.com

Subject TP's repairer purchase Survey report

Dear Cynthia,

Best Regards

Zayer

Dear Cynthia.
We refer to the below email.
Kindly inofrmed that TP's repairer had accepted our offer of 20% of $$853.40 convert to Singapore dollar. Below is breakdown.
COR - RM 11700.00
LOuU - RM 1200.00 (RM 150 X 8DAYS)
-RM 12900.00
@20% - RM 2580.00 ($$851.40 Singapore Dollar) exchnage rate document is uploaded in merimen.

GIA - $$2.00 + $$851.40 (20% offer Singapore Dollar)
TOTAL -$$853.40

We will proceed to submit the report to you office. thanks.
Best Regards

Zayer

<-- Original Message -->

From: AXA_SG

To: LKK_HQ

Sent On: 21/12/2016 02:58 PM

Subject: Re: TP rejected 10% offer and proposed 30%
Dear Zayer,

Please try to negotiate with TP at 20%. Thanks.

Regards,
Cynthia Loh

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg; AXA_SG

Sent On: 21/12/2016 02:38 PM

Subject: TP rejected 10% offer and proposed 30%

Dear Cynthia,

Refer to the below email.

Let's have your further advise as our offer TP's is rejected and counter propose at 30% of liablity. See uploaded email in merimen.
Please advise for the next course of action. thanks.

Regards

Zayer
LKK

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp ...

As spoken, we will release the survey report to TP's repairer and inform them to issue the cheque under your company name. thanks.

14/2/2017
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Dear Cynthia,
We had made 10% liablity to TP but TP rejected. Email from workshop is being uploaded in merimen.
kindly advise the nest course of action. thanks.

Best Regards
ZAyer

<-- Original Message -->

From: AXA_SG

To: LKK_HQ;sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
CC: AXA_SG

Sent On: 04/10/2016 09:19 AM

Subject: C0402054/P1636112 - NON MCF

M redefining / insurance

Dear LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd,

‘| (65) 6338 7288
Z (65) 6338 2522

MV 00, DO 5]

Please take note that the chain collision is a Non-MCF case.

Regards,
Cynthia Loh

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
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DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.
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