Zayyer (LKKAuto)

From: Autoexcel <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 November, 2016 4:53 PM

To: Zayyer (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Date of accident on 18/9/2016 involving vehicles SJR 9536Z & JPT 5831 & JFR
9336

Hi Boss

Can help counter propose for 50% to 30%
Please help talk to insurance
Thank you

Regards
Ryan Soh

From: Zayyer (LKKAuto) [mailto:zayyer@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, November 2, 2016 4:34 PM

To: Autoexcel <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: Date of accident on 18/9/2016 involving vehicles SJR 9536Z & JPT 5831 & JFR 9336

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Doreen,
Date of accident on 18/9/2016 involving vehicles SJR 9536Z & JPT 5831 & JFR 9336
We refer to the above matter and our tele-conversation on 11/10/2016

As spoken, this is a 3 vehicles involved in the accident as a chain collision. Your client JPT 5831 was 1%
car, our insured was 2" car and another Malaysia vehicle JFR 9336 was last.

As first car and last car were foreign vehicle (Malaysia vehicles) BOLA is no longer applicable and
liability is just contribution.

Therefore, on a without prejudice basis, as per principal instruction, we will proceed to settle the claim at
10% and kindly redirect the remaining 90 % from the insurer of last vehicle. Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Zayer | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2409, email: zayyer@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




