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ANTRME

> Baék to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Crwner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Na:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make

Vehicle Model;

Primary Calour;
Manufacturing Year;

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility;

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount;
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

PQP Pald:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

PARFMNF Rahats Froirg

Company
536%K

SHB1B5U

MNo

17 Apr 2019
TOYOTA

PRIUS TAXI (SMRT)
Maroon

014

2ZRA124484
JTDKN36US05748767
100.0 kW (134 bhp)
$32,920.00

10 5ep 2014

10 5ep 2014

0

$8,088.00

Yes
09 Sep 2022
$6.066.00

09 Sep 2022

A-Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
8

$50,704.00

$2152300

$27,589.00

Please note that the B-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or
when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan [if applicable), whichever is earlier,

The information contained herein is correctas at 17 Apr 2019
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b —— NOps.VBCEWan Smit.com.sg/Estimalion. aspx "
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Case Details

Cann Reforance Number ; TAX/DL 182048 Company Type : SMAT Taxs Ma Lig
Type of Repalr : Accidernt Bepal Estimation 1D ESTE481D

Vehicis Regintration Numbar : SHE 185U Anslgred By : Tas Claims Manages Team

Documents / Photographs

View Documents / Photographs | Tonad Documanss: 1
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 12:.04 PM

To: Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & 1A/Taxis);
‘sur@lkkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc Sherini Pillai ,

Subject: RE: SHB185U - Survey (IlI) 1:-5&?"‘@) %/4114

Attachments: 2049 - 185.pdf

wehicde In

Dear Sir / Mdm, WO &M-&L .
M“GM

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SHE 145U and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Shern.
*Kindly upload this survey request emall to merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

o InDIA
® < |NTERNATIONAL
( INsURANCE
PPN G ATORI]
Serving the reginn mnce T

64 Cecil Street; #05 - 0B Bullding
Singapore D49711
Tel: 5347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Shanti B Thalyal Nayagi (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Taxis) [mailto:BThaiyalN@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: 16 April, 2019 10:02 AM

To: Motor Claim - Ill emotorclaim@iil.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SHB185U - Survey (Ill)

Dear Sir / Mdm,

We agree to your proposal

Thank you & Regards

Shanti

SMAT Automaotive Services PTE LTD
Accident Reporting Center (Claims Dept)
6866 2671/2 | i

AUTOMOTIVE



- From:,Motor Claim - III [mailto:motorclaim @iii.com.sg]

Sent: 16/04/2015 09:20

To: Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis)
Subject: RE: SHE185U - Survey (I11)

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email,
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

» LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
*» \icom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyar agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

o INDIA
® o |NTERNATIONAL
|nsuRANCE

F1 WG &P OEID
Servimg [ region Emaer 5T
64 Cecil Street; #05 - 10B Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi (Auto Sves/Claims & I1A/Claims & |1A/Taxis) [mallto:BThaiyalN@smrt.com.sg)
Sent: 16 April, 2019 8:59 AM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iil.com.sg>

Cc: Kok Tuck Foo (Auto Sves/ARC/AR & SC/Taxis) <TuckFoo@smrt.com.sg>; Yeo Poh Suan [Auto Svcs/ARC/AR &
5C/Taxis) <YeoPohsuan@smrt.com.sg>; Koo Yew Chung (Auto Svcs/ARC/AR & 5C) <YewChung@smrt.com.sg>; Phua
Zhi Yang (Auto Svcs/ARC/AR B SC/Taxis) <ZhiYang. Phua@smrt.com.sg>; Grace Ng Siu Ching (Auto Sves/ARC/AR &
SC/Taxis) <ngsiuching@smrt.com.sg>; Chew Tuck Loong Kelvin (Auto Sves/ARC/AR & SC/Tauxis)
<ChewTuckloongKelvin@smrt.com.sg>; Lim Kha Chiew (Auto Svcs/ARC/AR & SC/Taxis)
<limkhachiew@smrtian.com.sg>; Lim Wei Siong (Auto Svcs/Claims & 1A/Claims & I1A/Taxis)
cweisiong@smrt.com sg>; Chin Kim Ming (Auto Sves/ARC/AR & SC/Taxis) <kimming chin@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SHB1B5U - Survey (I}

Dear Sir / Mdm

Kindly arrange to survey the vehicle SHB185U within 48 hours according to GIA guide line, invalving your insured
SHA1932D

VEHICLE 1S IN WOODLANDS

Regards



shanti . -
SMRT Autamotive Services PTE LTD
Accident Reparting Center {Claims Dept)

6866 2671/2 | bthalyaln@smrt.com.sg

%SIHRT

AUTOMOTIVE

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing vour personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person 10 whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
vou by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
[nternet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India Intemational Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both nside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If vou do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

[t may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.



Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment,
India International Insurance Pte Lid.
" Registration No. 198703792-K



TIarz01a Mermen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail |s associated with :

*SHB185U (MCT19040845)
[SHA1932D]
|
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
Apr 13 2019 3.00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
SMRT Automotive Services Ple Lid

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Il_SG), sent on 08/05/2019 17:02 PM.
To LKK_HOQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$0.00) - SHB185U - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillai

Approved:0.00.

hltp::.f.fﬂnnipnm.n‘nﬂm&n.mdnlnnih'hdu:.dmﬂuubm=5‘#‘¢mﬂﬁhmu:ﬁm=dsp_ﬁpnnl&cﬂ[#5561 3633ACFTOKEN=00a05a48126aT0-16382C mn



Tr252010 Mariman e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mall is associated with

*SHB185U (MCT19040845)
[SHA1932D]
TP

SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
Apr 13 2018 3:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
SMRT Aulomolive Services Ple Lid

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (II_SG), sent on 0B/05/2019 17:02 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (550.00) - SHB185U - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillal

Approved:0.00.

hittps:/isingapore. menmen.com/claims/index. cimTlusebox=SVCmailkfuseaction=dsp_Prinl&CFID=56537T5058CFTOKEN=868TT312a5:07 1b6b-BC1FE..

"



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek [Auto Sves/Claims & |A/Claims & 1A/Taxis) <LeeGek@smricom.sg>

Sent Thursday, 27 June 2012 12:27 PM

To: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 13/4/2019 involving SHB 185U & SHA 1932D ((lIl's insured)
Our Ref TAX/04/19/2049/1g

Attachments: TAX 04 19 2049.pdf

Categories: clear

Dear All,

We quantify our own losses as follows:-

Cost of Repair 51700.00
Loss of Rental 5853.37 | 9 daysx 510593 )
Total $2653.37

We enclose the following documents:
1) Repair invoice
2) Proof of rental rate
3) Police/GIA reports
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report
5) Hirer's letter of authorisation

Our hirer is claiming his injury and loss of income through his own lawyer,

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

%.SHIRT

AUTOMOTIVE




B0

Mernman a-Claims
Print Received Message

This mail is associatad with :

*SHB185U (MCT19040845)
[SHA1932D]
TP
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
Apr 13 2019 3:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
SMRT Automotive Services Ple Ltd

From
To
Subject

Indla International Insurance Pie Ltd (HQ) (III_SG), sent on 15/01/2020 14:04 PM.
LKK_HQ
Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2335.58) - SHB185U - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillai

ihppmwed:l]]S.SH.

hiips;/singapara, menmen.comiclaimafindax.cfmTusaboor=SVCmall&fuseacvon=dsp_Prim&CFID=5656T343LCFTOKEN=1e807 1c1c5409000-BC
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Menimen e-Claims

Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Seltiement

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case Motiltied Est Submitied Adj Assigned Adj Rpt Ad| Subrmitied Ins Auth'ed Status

|02 Mav 2019 Ty $$1,700.00  |5%1,700.00 m fox Sy
| Edit Rmg I Iﬂtlmlhtl Edit Estimates Wiaw Fiot | Cancil Casd I

Claim Detalls

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

| [Created by adjuster]

Insured | COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co feg Na 1933038218

Main :

B i |SMAT TAXIS PTELTD, Co. Reg No.: 198905369

vehicl “[13/04/2015 03.00 - :59

iy "9 sHe185U Date of Loss: | |5y Manths and 3 Days From LTA fleg Date (Man Yr}]
Policy/Caver

TP/ MCT159040845 MCOMOC S

Mote No:

: Palicy No
?‘Ihruwm} SHAL1932D (Clai b): .D-lm.!!.E'THFEH
Excess: |

Repairer SMAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd [Woodlands) 60 Woodiands Industrial Park E4, 757705 Woodiands - Tel: 68662628

mm India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) - Tel: 83476100 . [Handied by Sherinl Piliai]

famants | ms First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62222311

Adjuster; LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6256-3561 . [Handied by CHEN TSUE YEE] . [Final Rpt dus 26/04/2018]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compase Case mail |

« (115G (1501720207 Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$2335.58) - SHE185U - Claim Handler: Sherinl PIl...
» [11_SG (08/05/2019) Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved ($%$0.00) - SHEL85U - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillai

View Al | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Compiete |
Assigned By Complated On Created On  Done?

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS—
Due Date  Priority Type

No resufts

Task Group Subject  Handler

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 20/2/2020
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Claim Documents
*SHB185U (MCT19040845)
[SHA1932D]
T
SHMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
Apr 13 2019 3:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
SMAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
upioad Doacumenss | Upsoag Pratos i Compose New Lerer I “H
Photos/Images oerpage [v] B4
o | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thismbnall | Print
1 [23/081910:18 | General View 0| weawe |
2 | 204a/19 10:18 Ganeral View g ioad 3G | B
|3 |2/oen19 10018 | General View 0 ledic | B
4 |73/04/19 1018 | General View 0 lciws | F
§ | zyoa19 10018 Ganeral View ! Load G | A
& | 23/04/19 10:18 General View 0 | caaws | B
7 23/04719 10:18 General View ) | Loadiec | &4
B |23/04/19 10:18 | General View 0| avres | B
§ |ZNTH/1910:18 | General View @ | wedrs | B
10 |2304718 10:18 | General View @) | Loaaws Eﬁ
11 | 23/04419 1018 General View g wao G | B
12 |2304/39 10:18 | General View @ | wediec | &
13 |2W04/19 1018 | General Yiew 0D | baawe | A
14 |03/06/19 10:14 | Photo After Spray 0| eaps | A
15 |03/06/1% 10:14 Photo After Spray _g Led PG | B
16 |01/08/18 10:14 | Photo After Spray 0| wews | A
17 | OW06/19 10:14 Photo After Spray 0| adwc | A
18 |00/06/19 10:14 Photo After Spray 0| oaaws | A
Documantation 1 per ﬂ ]
ho | Relabel/Reorder | LK Auto Consultants P Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |16/04/18 14:07 | EMAIL FROM II1 DD 16042019 = Load POF
7 |16/04/19 14:07 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
3 | Z304/19 18:30 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF
4 |04/12/18 18:04 | LDD AND OTHER DOCUMENTS Load PDE
§ |02/01/20 14125 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
6 |02/01/20 14:25 | RENTAL RECEIPT Load POF
7 |03/01/30 14:25 | RENTAL MILEAGE Load PDF
8 |20/02/20 09:08 AUTHORISATION TD ACT FORM Load PDF
o |/p2/2000:08 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load PDF
10 |20/02/20 09:08 | LOD Load POF
|Na_| Finalized On India International Insurance Pie Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 0W/05/1910.34 | Singapore Accident Statsment - 01D [ TG
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | Save | eom |

Thers are no document checklists configured.

Show Remarks To: [] Handling Insuree
Note REmarkn are priGEbe unimss you show @ fo gifier parfees

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 20/2/2020
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Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co regne 1sssor1ser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ilkkauto.com:assignments@Ikkauto,com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/11118006749/JGS3N2
Date: 20/02/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: MCOMOD1S
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SHB185U Insured Vehicle No : SHA1832D
Date of Loss: 130472019 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT19040845
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No SHB185U
Make & Model; TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI, 1.8 (A) Engine No. 27RB1244584
Reg. Date: 10/09/2014 (Man. Year 2014) Chassis No: JTDKN3BUS05748767
Colour Marcon Odometer: 798589 km
Engine Capacity: 1797 cc
Markel Value/New Car N/A
Prica
Sum Insured (S8), Markel Valua/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceahle). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/85 R15
Front Lefi Side: Chilles & mm Rear Left Side: Chilles & mm
Front Right Side: Chilles & mm Rear Right Side: Chilles & mm
Tho above viluves represent e remmnng fyre reads deplh
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  DIff %)
Paris 451038 1.052.14 345824 76.67
Miscellaneous liems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.381.00 B20.00 1.561.00 85.56
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total {S§) 6,891.38 1,872.14 5,019.24 T2.83
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,700.00
Nett Amount (S5) 6,891.38 1,700.00 519138 7533
+ Car Rental {6.0 x $5105.93/day) (5%) 63558
Nett Liability (S$) 2,335.58
Global Sum Settlement (S$) 2,330.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 168/04/2019
Date Inspected: 16/04/20198 inspected Al SMRT Automotive Services Ple Lid
(Woodlands)
60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4
Singapore 757705
Estimated Period of Repair. 3.0 days

Adjuster: CHEN TSUE YEE Manager: Chong Pul Lin

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 20/2/2020



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE: This repart represents our findings at the lime and place of inspection stated hersin, Such inspection has been carred oul ko the boal of our
knowiedge and abifly but any offver labiity under any other circumetances is hereby sxpresaly excluded

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 20/2/2020



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS

'Reference

|Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchranised: 02 Jan 2020)

Parts: 144 TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI 1.8 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0}

Labour: Repairer's tPrim—denumlnmd Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SHB185U)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the |ast estimate page
:_Fuﬂh-r Info: Itemsivalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an aslerisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Conditlon Repairer's  Amount
] A *FENDER FRT/LH (DISC 25%) Dented T2340F "54255F
2 1 *NAME PLATE (HYBRID) (DISC 25%) Necessary 51.80F *3893F
3 *FENDER LINER FRT/LH [DISC 25%) Crushed 171.70F *128.78F
4 1 *STICKER DECAL SMRT (DOOR) (DISC 25%) Necessary 6000F *45.00F
5§ 1 *ADVERTISEMENT STICKER (SN) Necessary 206 88F “206.88F
8 1 *PROTECTOR FRONT FENDER SIDE PANEL LH Not Necessary 114 50F *F
T N *HINGE LOWER LHF,DOOR Not Necessary 20.10F *-F
8 1 *HINGE UPPER LHF,DOOR Not Necessary BO.SOF “F
8 1 *CHECK ASSY ,FR DOOR Not Necessary 150.30F *F
10 1 *MIRROR ASSY RH Not Necessary 1,307.10F “F
b *COVER OUTER MIRROR ,RH Not Necessary 107 40F .-
12 1 *"MIRROR LAMP RH Not Necessary 65.30F *F
13 1 "QUARTER GLASS FRT/RH Not Necessary 234 80F *F
14 1 *SEALANT W/SCREEN Not Necessary 37.00F *F
15 1 *DOOR FRTILH Repair BB4 40F *F
16 1 *SOLAR FILM Mot Necessary 125.00F *.
F=Franchus pan

Total Parts (S§) 4,510.38  1,052.14

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 20/2/2020
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellansous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 PANEL BEATING & BODY WORK MNew B45.00 400.00

2 SPRAY PAINT MNew 935.00 400.00

3 TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION MNew B80.00 0,00

4 TO APPLY RUST*FHGDFIHG ON AFFECTED AREA MNew 100.00 20.00

5 TO TRANSFER DOOR MECHANISM New 120.00 0.00

6 TO REMOVE & REFIX FRONT LHS/RHS QUARTER GLASS New 120.00 0.00

T TO REMOVE AND REFIT WIRE HARDESS Mew 120.00 0.00

B8 TO WASH AND VACUUM New 80.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 2,381.00 B20.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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