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wenty  wel REF: /zér . ’
ASS REC BY: Yéreaf e
. : ASSIGNMENT
R Dite Veh No._ Sf%}{ 77 viver {1 [ 6
Estimated Cost: ) Typoﬁjﬂ.ﬁr'!' M.Cycle ! Bus | Van | Lorry | Taxi) Plil‘l‘ll Mover |
ﬂ@jﬂ&ﬂmﬂ_ﬂmﬁm Truck | Trailer or 0}
To Inspact Vehicle No S {2-%%37 T’ Make: S i_‘,'j';;m 5;1,4—’.;/:7 e ff?of:’
Ca .;[1' ¢ AL,/ Insured | Std/ NITNA
al Workshop mis /_’\4‘/ = lour _
ol L /‘ ; Sp Reading (/ 15/ 5)’; TiRadio: Insured | Std ] NI/ NA
Insured: B EngMa -
Poey o SHY| ?cftf e N TR M A0 U 4T
Claims No. Gen Condy'Good | Fair | Poor / Bumt
Sum Insured: Excess. Steering: | t{ Jammed | Leaked | Burnt of
(Client's Racord) Brake: | med | Leaked / Burnt or
Make of Veh Madi:  Nil SIRim | STD ARRim or ) B
|Tyesze B/ @/ bo T/ ¢
(Policy Condilion) N R: {
Remark: The veh had commenced its NiS ' _1@5mumE:Huumnps:m;mmm:mfsuun
repair at the time of inspection, TOYO I YOKO
-
Bal. of Markst Valus; Feond / Rear
(BAC Acsidenl Rport Consisten(? : Yes or No RBA. C mm RBal A mm
@) FR Seen JQ Consistent? : Yes or No LiBal . -
Est Repairs 3 days Res: Yes or No DOA | 4/%”9 Dol JL]‘"’"J g/%f
Lum Sum: 2 % 3Val: Yes or No Sumrhaid at
CA | REV | REP. | 24HRS Des. of Damages : Frt | Rear | O/S { NIS | UIC | Rooftop o
Vehicle. INJOUT E.'?(’:(' Ko
Person Contacted: The WIC | Chassis frame | Bodr ture affactad due o collision

J Action / In
/4)?/? coafs "’J’ L1000 vl M M,

(82222 co pd LI S27L)D

RECEIVED 1 ¢ |
“W"";‘m" : Preli, Report Days Of Repair: 3
i Tw : Final Report Resurvey No. of Trip: / Survey Fee: |35
DatsTime, i Return 127 Transanation, m
7 Add Fee:| | Stelnsp (8 ) _SeRS__8 )
Interview  ($ } Pnots 3C\
Report Format: ‘Tech. Invs (% ) Ooen
" Lump Sum [ LB.I: (§ g.m;- Hs ) ‘Weekand ($ )
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Bdn mam  Peln Company Ragistration No. 199007 108R

S1UTTAVE 1L #02-25 PAYA UBE INDUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE JUN913 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX 1 (65} 62564315

Your Ref: D1900253 |MFSH Date: 16 April 2019
Our Ref: CS/FC119006687/Usd3
The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SKZ 8637T .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 15/04/2019 at the premises of M/s Falcon-Air Auto Services Pte Ltd and have the

following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount S5 427300 .
Revised Estimate Amount (lump sum) : 58 2.050.
“Check” Items Amount : 5%

Market Value : S8

LTA Reimbursement Value : S8

Nett Value : 88

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages -

at the o/s body. -
Comments/ Present Status:

Damages Consistent.

Repair days: 3 Days

Yours faithfully,
Marcus Choa
Automotive Assessor



MS‘FI rstCa pi ta{ M5 First Capital INSUrance Limitod cokes s (S5000T08C D18 lng e P DRGIETE N

B Ratfies Dusy 221 00 Singopore 48580
Tet (65] 6228 F311 Fax [BS] 6222 3547

i ks Py Unasrwiming Depe 36 Rotinsen Roaed & 16-01 Oty House Sngapore 0OSETT
Tel (§5) 6507 3848 Fax [E5) 6507 3849
e ey Pryioashtnl com g

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 15-04-2018 Our Ref No. D19002531MFSH
Accident Date 12-04-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHe178U Third Party Vehicle, SKZB637T
Survey Location BLK 8008 TAMPINES ST 83 #01-200
Contact Parson. JEREMIAH NG
Contact No. 67897997/ 0 Fax No. 678872497
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
A inted

S LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA, Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST
FALCON-AIR AUTO
Cc: W
c : Workshop SERVICES PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and T days for re-inspection
This is a computar generatad lsttar, no signature required,




Shirley Hiew !LI{K Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 3:50 PM

To: ‘Eileen Lee’; 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002531MFSH/1
Attachments: SKZ 8637T - Preli Advise pdf

Dear Eileen,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKZ 8637T.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall; Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 15 April 2019 5:44 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002531MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkouto.com | fax: b256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Maotor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 15 April 2019 5:42 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002531MFSH/1



Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avE.com




Used Nissan Sviphy Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page 1 of 2

sGCAarRRMART.COM an  Sign ug

MNew Cars Used Cars Sall My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

SELL YOUR CAR YOURSELF

Get listed until it's sold » we will handle all the paperwork!

Few 5 Years Coe Renewal Toyota Alts 164
Past an Advertisement '

E PRIME MOTOR & LEASING

Sl it yoursell Adverime i 50 just

£58 until it's SOLD!

Browse by Category hd | Sor by Cate Posted w| I results/page  + |
10 vahicles Missan Sylphy - Casbmmiil
gl Price Thenreriaer Eng Cag e VEn Type
Saarch Salection Miesan Sypljptry 2018
Mistan Sylohy L.6A Premium 67, i $E.430 /v Wi-Apr- 1016 1.598 cx 36, 154 krm Sadan Availahie

#

$..000 Rapublc Aute Warranty Workshop Credits. 3-Years Tan Chong Warrsnty. Well Malivtsned By | Owner. Excellest Condition. Egible For Up T
"“’ T Loan With uthorsed Ranks. Cally'SMS 'Whatsapo For i
—

Miszan Sylphy 164 Premiwm 855 _ 800 £8. 150 [y J5-Apr- 016 1,508 o 58,000 krm = 1o Avuilable

$2.000 Republic Auto Warranty Workshop Credits. 3-¥ear Tan Chong Warranty Tl 28-Apr 2015 Well Maintaned By 1 Dwner. Exceflent Condition
Eligitile For Up Ta 70% Loan With Aufhosised Banks. CallSMS

Missan Syiphy 1.64& Pramiom w4, BOG 57550 S -How- 216 1558 < 49,000 km Sedan Availabie

Graded A by §TH

| Owerer, Milmage Dore Onty 25000 Km, Full Agent Serviced. Under Full Agant Warranty Eurmilerd Condiaon! By With & Peace OF Mad From &sard

0 -
Accredited Company! Attractive Loan Packags Tnterest From
Missan Sylphy 164 Premium 50800 8575 fyr (e -Fet- 2010 L5086 o 02 Seda Available
oPC)
Viery Low Misspe. Dpc Comeert $52 800, Accderd Fiee. | Owner Only, Like New, 5o To Belewe
The or
- Tra Faceidfted Homda Jarr continues o deliver the pracncsiey, comfort and familiarty that has been @s enduring sppesl
Mizan Sylphy 1.64A w62 00 £7.520 1y OB-Jul-2018 1598 x SeRCimn Avarlabie
1 Careful Owner, 100% Loan Avaslable, Full Serviced By Agent And Aluo Under Agerit Warranty, Low Mileage, Low Price. Low Deprechation, Wil
Maintmired By Previcus Owner, Very Sgacious And Big Boot Sp
Nizman Sylphy 184 Premium LE2 A0 17,6830 Iy 1]-Mav- 2018 1598 ox 43,375 km Sedan Availabie
Lo Mileage L, Agent Servced? Seffing Cheap! Spattis And Comfortabis Catvn! Beg Boor Space! Fuel EMMoent And Pracoca® Call For An Viewng
Appoeiment Today! | Swmmm— wp |

Lompare

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing. php?RGD=2016&MOD=Nissan Sylphy&RPG=20&VEH... 15-Apr-19



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
6930G

SKZ8637T
No

15 Apr 2019
NISSAN

SYLPHY 1.6 CVT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
4DR

White

2015

HR16983992B
MNTBBAB1720026683
85.0kW (113 bhp)
$16,283.00

05 Feb 2016

05 Feb 2016

0

$16,283.00

Yes
04 Feb 2026
$12,212.00

04 Feb 2026

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$46,651.00

$31,745.00

$43,957.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 15 Apr 2019

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput 7FUNCTION _ID=F030...

Page 1 of 1

15-Apr-19



Page 1/2
FALCON-AIR AUTO SERVICES LTD

CaL REG. NO.: 1995-01140-D
GST REG. NO.: 19-9501140-D

FALCON-AIR
MS FIRST CARITAL INSURANCE LIMTED
S IRORBMO0N ROAD W / M,,A Estimate . ES707340

#18-01 CITY HOUSE SINGAPORE 088877 150472018
D Mﬁ m;ww
_— "
Attertion Motor Claim Degariment ,1/4, 9‘ Chassis/Engt MNTBBAR1720028883
Coninet 8272722311 Faa N G220 3547 Accident Date 120472019
/% I Cam No
' Refersnce  IFTY

8N Quanaty Earmcutar ﬁf‘ /Pm f”l ' Livt Price  Amounl 55

NETT ITEMS
QS FRONT DOCOR ?ﬁw)»{

1 1PC 296 40
2 2BC O/S FRONT DOOR BLACK STIC 5730 54 50 —
a 1PC O FRONT DOOR CHROME MOULDING &4 286 7O
4 1PC OfS FRONT DOOR WEATHERSHIP /.24 85 30 —
5 1PC QIS REAR DOOR 7L 296 40 D¢
8 3PC O REAR DOOR BLACK STICKER 4 27 30 5180 X
7 1PC QS REAR DOCOR CHROME MOULDING T el 68 Th —"
Neft Total 55 2770.00
10 00% Ciscount 5§ 277 00
2453 00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1 1PC S FRONT DOCR SEALANT /A gooo ¥V
2 1PC 05 REAR DOOR SEALANT  # 1 6000 »
Special Netl Total 5% 12000
LABOUR &
TO TRANSFER DOOR MECHANISM & DOGOR GLASS IBOTH) 160.00
RE-SPRAY ANTIRUST 100 D0 3&?
CONTINUE |
169(]
A8
s
wnil

FALCON-AIR AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
[ seiEsciary of Falconds Moldings M L)

Head Office: | 74 Sin Mireg Drioe 0 OADT/ 13 0051 T Sik Ming Algiccre Sidcapors 5TS72 1 Tel 8452-0B30/8A458-0880 Fa £454-7862
Branches: Tengees S 93 Bis 9008 #0200 15288401 T 6T8%FFST Fax ATBB-7T = No B Panciwd Loop (Bl | 7 B ) 5|1 28726) B4 &7 TS5565 Fax &TP9-1110
Websites: Wy Sscorysr corm ug E-malls ermna@alcorysi coen g



Page 2/ 2
- — FALCON-AIR AUTO SERVICES i’I'E LTD

FALCON-AIR

MS FIRST CaPITAL INSURAMNCE LIMITED i
I8 ROBINSON ROAD Estimate
#16-01 CITY HOUSE SINGAPORE 068877 Date
ek Num
- B MaksMode
Altenfion | Molor Claim Department! Chassis/Engh
Comnact - 62222311 Fax Mo | 62273647 Accident Date
Clamm No
Reference
Pollcy Mo

SN Cuantity Farficular

CO. REG. NO.: 1995-01140-D
GST REG. NO.: 19-9501140-D

ES707340

1anazaie

SKZ BE3TT

NISSAN SYLPHY
MNTBBRAB17T20026683
12042018

3ETY

UmiPnce  Amoumt S5

TO REMOVE NECESSARY PARTS TO REFAIR INNER PANEL REPLACE

ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS AND ALIGN THE SAME 292 w000
TQ PUTTY AMD RESPRAY ACCIDENT DAMAGED AREAS 6.99 B00.00

M4 la Conet o

I i g )

| .

| o v

| -ﬂl.‘T

I oo Lompany
|
EELDE Total S8 49730

for FALCOM AIR AJTC SERVICES PTE LTD

| TAMIRES BRAMC

FALCON-AIR AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
A sutmielary of Faioorn's Holdndgs B L)

Head Office: 175 5in Ming Ditve #01-D6/7713. #0517 S0 Ming Autiscare Singapone 575721 Tl £452.0B80/6458 0880 Fax &454-TB62
Brawsches: Tairigine: S 93 Bk 9004 W00 5[528840) Tel ATHS-7997 Fax 67RB-7997 = Mo B Pancsr Loog (Bl | 7 BIk K| 5{1 28226) T 7795565 Fax 67791110

Whshabtes: veany bailiors corm &) E-rail et o com g



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 8258 3567 FAX: B255 4315
Reg. No: 1R080T108R GST Reg. Mo 19-0607 198-R

Affillated to Federatio

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

$16.01 CITY HOUSESINGARORE 068877 Date 17042018 I“"Ill“lllll

ry ! D PARTY CI
Insured Veh.  SH9178U Veh. Inspected SKZ 8637T
Paolicy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18002531MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  EILEEN LEE Assign Date 15/04/2019

2 : Vehicle Particulars & Condition g 1 (e
Make & Model NISSAN SYLPHY (A) c.c 1588
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. MNTBBAB17ZD026683 Colour WHITE
Odometer 42698 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD

3. == ont

Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185@0 R16 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/80R18 BRIDGESTONE B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |19580 R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm

4 i __ Description o
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

G St ~ Gowrlnfomaton
Accident Date  12/04/2019 |iInspection Date 15/04/2019
Survey heldat  FALCON-AIR AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

BLK 2006 TAMPINES ST 83 #01-200 SINGAPORE 528840
bae CRREDRT | ~ Remarks.
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
b, dame lisaw _ Est s of Repair
|[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days




Reg. No. 198607198R GST Reg No. 18-6607168-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO, SKZ 8637T

nofParts

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Lbi Ave 1#01-25 Pays Ubi indusiral Park, Singapore 408533
TEL A258 1561 FAX G258 4318

1|C/E FRONT DOOR (M) DENTED / WARPED 896 40 996 .40
2|CVS FRONT DOOR BLACK STICKER ([@S827.30 (N) NECESSARY 54 B0 54 60
1|OrS FRONT DOOR CHROME MOULDING (N} CRACKED 288.70 286.70
1|0iS FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP (N} NECESSARY B5.30 B5.30
1{CvS REAR DODOR (N) TO REPAIR SEE 906 40 -
LABOUR
3|O/S REAR DOOR BLACK STICKER @3$27.30 (N) NOT NECESSARY 81.80 -
1|0/S REAR DOOR CHROME MOULDING [N) SCRATCHED 26B.70 268.70
LESS 10% DISCOUNT «277.00 -169.17
2.493.00 1,622.53
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|O/S FRONT DOOR SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 40.00
1]0/S REAR DOOR SEALANT [(SN) NOT MECESSARY 60.00 .
120.00 40,00
LABOUR
TO TRANSFER DOOR MECHAMNISM & DOOR GLASS 160,00 B0.00
(BOTH).
RE-SPRAY ANTI-RUST 100.00 3000
TO REMOVE NECESSARY PARTS TO REPAIR INMNER 600,00 300.00
PANEL REPLACE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS AND
ALIGN THE SAME INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF Qv
REAR DOOR
TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY ACCIDENT DAMAGED AREAS BOOD.00 B00.00
1.660.00 1,010.00
GRAND TOTAL 4.273.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI15008687/Usd3n2

CHUA KANG SENG
Liconsed Appraiser

SCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTILS:- This Mapor s made sokely for ke uss and benell of the Clhent namad i the from page of ihis Repar.
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