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[ .Y, S il
From Date |5f4 h"!
Estimated Cost
0D (TP WS | TP RES | 0D RES J EVA | INV [ 1V
To Inspect Vehicle No AR '.}553[‘1
al Waorkshap mis Mg Coty (7 m].l—uﬂ.
o 53 WUH Ind: puk #or33
Insured;
Palicy No.
Claims No,
Sum Insured: Excess:

{Client's Record)
Make aof Veh:

Hui &n@ % 3300060

{Policy Condition)

Remark: The veh had commenced its MS N5

repair at the time of inspection,

5
Bal. or Market Value:
IDAC Accident Rport: Consistent? : Yes or Mo

GlA | PR Seen: Consistent? : Yes or No

e 7 days
1g. "

f
GA | REV | REP. | 24HRs "2

Est. Repairs, Res: Yes or No

Lum Sum; Ival: Yes or No

Vahicle: INJOUT

Vieh No: %R.’?SS}M YiRegn 2% -"{5’3./(}“

Type M@J W.Cycle | Bus / Van | Lorry [ Taxi [ Prime Mover |

« (773

Insured | Std [ NITMA

Truch | Trailer of

To}/ ,_,fq e H R
o B [(1 2 AIG
T

o0 ZYX (0200 TS

Gen. Cond: (‘tiad | Fair | Poor | Burnt
Steering: In@rr Jammed | Leaked | Burnt or
Brake:  Ingffer | Jammed | Leaked I Burnt o
Nil I SIRim | STO £Rim or

"Ll";/ 6:3? R(7)
R: ) |

Bs;@amwuwFs:uzmmcmmsu [PIR I SUMI |
TOYO /| YOKO or

Make:

THadio: nsured | Std T HIT MA

Midi

Tyra Size K

Front Rear

RiBal é mm RiBal, /6 . mm
L/Bal, 6 i LBal. 6 -
D.OA DOl [5" = GLro o {?
IEun'a;.' held at w{ S | pan

Des, of Damages : Frt | @ T

Date: Person Conlacted: The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affecled due to :;:misaun.
Date { [ime Action { Instruction iy
l%ﬁf f@-,J(IML bove (attr
. .-""l - e = | =
“ s ]" 2o v = _7( DL 'lﬁ\g’\ \Ci
sloghe | Gorbmnt Hs ¢ xv/- T B peyc i Seg A
(g 15962 At~ F4i D
RE :_- iJ
Diabe/Tema, Fia Pass o7 - Preli. R o ir:
*iﬁ%‘ﬁ D .re eport ays Of Repair z- |
e, S g B: Final Report Resurvey No. of Trip: {Survey Fee: 10
Dale.ﬁimr?_lﬁu Returm ta? - Iranspertalion 5[}
il Add Fee:  Site Insgp ($ M__s+RS,_8 50
D. interview  ($ ) Photos Th
ReportEgrmat Tech” Invs (% )| s .
M TLB.: (5 “1’4/' A/,S. Weekend ($ )



MS @ FirstCapital

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (55) 6222 2311 Fax (B3] G222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited cofed lee 1950001060 G50 e fa M2 CO0LETH-S

Claims § Motor Underwslting Dept: 36 Robinsan Road #1E-01 ity House Singapare [+]:]: )

Tel (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (55) 6507 3845
www msfirstcapitaloom.Sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

02-04-2019 Our Ref No
01-04-2018 Claim Type
SHA4B0BX Third Party Vehicle

53 UBI AVE 1 #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
KAl LING

83300060/ 83300060 Fax No.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

. D19002242MF5H

. Third Party

. SLR7553M

. BB416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MY CAR CONSULTANT Attention
MA TP Solicitor Fax No
EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

. NIL
. NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: My Car Consultant <admin@mycar.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 11:43 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SLR7553M

Attachments: Attachment 1.dat; ESTIMATE MARKED.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shirley,

Pls close at the same.

Best Regards,

Huigin

Direct line: 88668832 | Fax: 69255219

My Car Consultant Pte Ltd
53 Ubi Avenue 1

Paya Ubi Industrial Park #01-33
Singapore 408934

This Email, including attached files, may contain confidential informatian and is intended only fer the use of the Individual and/or entity 10 which it i5
addressed. If you have received this message in eror, please natify the sender of the ermor and delete the message. Thank you

From: "Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)" <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, August 15, 2019 11:41 AM

To: "admin@mycar.sg" <admin@mycar.sg>

Cc: "SUR" <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLR7553M

Dear Hui Qin,

Please confirm final fig $ 550.00 (lump sum) @ 2 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you.

Bost Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkautg.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408923)

From: My Car Consultant [mailto:admin@myca r.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 14 August 2019 5:18 PM

To: sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: 5SLR7553M

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sur,



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 457 PM

To: ‘Eileen Lee’; 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002242MF5H/2
Dear Eileen,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLR 7553M on 15/04/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 15 April 2019 4:53 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12002242MFSH/2

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Elk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 3(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 15 April 2019 3:00 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM



Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002242MF5H /2

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards.

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




B/15/2019 PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry
> Back to OneMotoring

'Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner |D: 434G

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SLR7553M
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo

Intended Deregistration Date: 15 Aug 2019
Wehicle Make: TOYOTA

Wehicle Model: C-HR HYBRID 1.85 A
Primary Colaur: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2017

Engine Mo.: 2ZRB049759
Chassis Mo Z¥¥102018075
Maximum Power Output: 90,0 kW (120 bhp)
Open Market Value: £28.008.00
Original Registration Date: 28 Aug 2017

First Registration Date: 28 Aug 2017
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $5,000.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yies

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date; 27 Aug 2027
PARF Rebate Amount: £3,730.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 27 Aug 2027

COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: £49,1346.00

COE Rebate Amount: $40,964.00

Total Rebate Amount: £44,714.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 15 Aug 2019

OK

I'IT[DE:J.'V!I.I'[EI.QI’.‘N.SQJII.E.l"l.I'FlI'E’JIIDI'I.I'HI'Iqu|I‘Er\iBDHIBHYI"UEIIIEESETUFEUEKBQIHF'LH FEUMNL UM _ DUl |



Addendum Sheet

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOC/ATION OF SINGAPORE RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GENERAL & Raflier Tusy V13 00 Singaporr (48580
INSURAMCE  7+i55:5212 001 Few JR8) 224 0030
AHICUTION CIperatiog Huurs - Mandsy te Friday, 90,00 - 17:0

REDORTE MANAGEMEMT ZENTRE UBRL SRASICERNG § GFT Reg. Mo M40 17T

NTNOTE: Pleasesubmitthe completed Addendurm form to the game Authorised Reporting Centre
with whom yousubmiited the Origina! Report.

ADDENDUM

(A] PARTICULARS OF PERSON MAKINGTHEAMENDMENTS:

Orignel ReportNo l‘nsl.a'l"‘luqmll'i Vehicle Segisrationty:  FLE FE¥3 M
Marmeas shanwryis NAIC) -Jlﬁ FFHR. H LM ﬁhﬂi MC{' NR'C;HN ."IFHMET.'!EI rtNG * i ?'ll'-{.v_?ﬂiﬂ CT )

{*Vehicie Driver / Vehicle Owners) {*) Plesse delats a: appropriate

AbT £Le J5E ';Ilul'thL; WesT STREET 3y Aoy-4F Singaporc 6MOFER)

Atddress S
Contact (Tel! o Iy Iey? Mobile No -+ 93548442 -
Email Address : cj'iini:q]'l @ yaheo, com . 5y -
Date ofAccident :_ O1- OY . 3oi§ ____Vimeof Accident: I —
PlaceofAccident @  AMport BOVLEWARD 7JowARDT PIE .

Insurance Company: N Tve o ) B

(B] ADDITIOMALINFORMATION fAMENDMENTS:

| have made a report on the above mentioned accide nt and would like to include acdit'onal information o
makea rha Irll.._'l.,.l.l'.-rg amendments:

@— | ‘wouLp LILE To AMEND MY REPoRT PurfOIe  FrOM ALPogrmis oLy T

CLAMmG  THIRD PARMy

- i
@ -1 ouk® Wes To AmeEqd Wy EWMAIL apoegxs  Te dﬂ;,ﬁq,qh E,qnhl’aﬁ-ﬁaﬁ.s}
[ % n

K IDAD - BUUN LAY
X \ STA Ingpection Pie Lid |
o 245 Jalzn (don Lay .
\d.‘u,;\g Singaptre 619523 -jr—"’
o= ; Tei : G555 6151
Fax 6515 5215 :

Pdi':c*.rl:a],d@’r )'\[.\\r:-.-er's Signature Raporting Centre paf* ?LFF., Signature
ke Klmeains

Page 23 of 23
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LTAMNT

Reg no.: 2016058782

Address: 53 Ub| Ave 1 #01-33 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Singapore 408934
HP: 9RBR5R8S

MY CAR CONSULTANT PTE LTD

Estimation
Cate 24 hpr 19
Vehicla; SLA7553M
Make [ Model: TOYOTA/CHR
Chassis:
Description Unit Unit Price Amount
Parts Replacement:
REARBUMPER  ~ D€ T S 808.00 | & 708,00 | 398
REAR REFLECTORLH X AJAS = ]ES 12390 | 5 123.90
4 931.20
Less 20% 5 126.38
?
Total 3 745.52 2’95_‘?)
S/Nett items: %
REAR BUMPER CLIP —~ w2 C 1|8 40.00 40,00 | 2o
40.00
Labour to;
TO CHECK REAR ELECTRICAL WIRING 1 5 500015 50.00 ,‘( :

TO. RESPRAY UNDERCOATING 158 |58 100,00 | 5 100.00 (]Miz
"SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS 1 5 6000015 600.00 50#
FPANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS 1 5 600.00 | 'S 600.00 | 2e>

5 1,350.00

Parts Replacement Amount 5 785.52
Total Amount for Labour 5 1,350.00
Total Amount S 2,135.52

12€.7%
o7, . S50

Unss.



’ V V' LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

&ii—.:i 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. Mo, 19-0607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCH9006679/Gsd3n2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date: 15-08-2019 ”ll’l‘||||"‘l|‘"‘ ||n
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 4608X Veh. Inspected SLR 7553M
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No, D19002242MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 15/04/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA C-HR c.c 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. Z¥X102018075 Colour BLUE
Odometer 48196 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Meodification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R17 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60R17 DUNLOP 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R17 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[215/60 R17 DUNLOP 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5 General Information
Accident Date  01/04/2019 Inspection Date 15/04/2019
Survey held at MY CAR CONSULTANT FTE LTD
53 UBI AVENUE 1 #01-33
PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK SINGAPORE 408934
5a. Remarks
ADAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WaAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]EﬁTihMTED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




s X W

L

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page MNo.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLR 7553M
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
o P Workshop ($)| __(5)
BREPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED BOE.00 398.30
1|REAR REFLECTOR LH MOT NECESSARY 123.90 4
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -186.38 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -89.58
745.52 208.72
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) MECESSARY 40.00 30.00
40.00 30,00
LABOUR
TC CHECK REAR ELECTRICAL WIRING. MOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
TC RESPRAY UNDERCOATING. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
SPRAY PAINTING OM AFFECTED AREAS. 600.00 200.00
PAMEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS. 600,00 200.00
1.350.00 400.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,135.52 T728.7T2
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 550.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19006679/Gsd3n2

XING GUD QIANG

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: - This Repen is made solely Tor the uwse and benefit of the Clisnt named on the front page of this Repart.

Bility of i

ponsibility whatsosver, in contaot or tort, | apbied 1o

) 9%

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




