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51 UBLAVE 1, #02.25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: ((65) 62563561 FAX ; (65) 625643

Yourref;  D19002197TMFSH

Our ref: CS/FCI19006657/Evd3 Date : 22/4/2019

The Motor Claims Department

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Withow! Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.  SMH 6678]

We thank you for your instruction on  15/4/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

18/4/2019  at the premises of M/s STAROW HOPPFTELT
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 585,453.60
Revised Estimate Amount : 5%4,007.20
"Check” Items Amount : 8%
Market Value : 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%
Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

STEVE CHEN
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited (cReq o 1930000060 GST ®eg ho, M2 000167564
& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4B580
Tel (B516222 ¢311 Fax (65} 6222 3547

Clalms & Mator Undewriting Dept: 36 Robinsan Road #1E-01 City House Singapore 0GEE7T
Tel {65) 6507 3848 Fax: [65) 6507 3845
www, msfirsteapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location

Contact Person.

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

01-04-2019 Our Ref No. D19002197MFSH
29-03-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHAZ956H Third Party Vehicle. SMHB678J

36 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST#01-42 ENTERPRISE HUB
ELSON

0/ 92366896 Fax No. 0

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No. 68416315
MA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

STAR 8 WORKSHOP PTE Attention. NIL
LTD
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
HENRY KAO

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is a computer ganarated latter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 3:54 PM

To: ‘Henry Kao Cai Jie'; 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc SUR; 'Aini Binte Md Min’

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002197MFSH/1, SMH 6678)
Attachments: SMH 6a78) PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir'Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SMH 6678]
Date of survey: 18/4/2019
Number of days : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 9:14 AM

To: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'CWS Motor Claims'
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Aini Binte Md Min' <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002197MFSH/1

Dear Henry,
Thank you for the email.

wWe will contact the workshop now.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5(408933)



From:; Henry Kao Cai Jie [mailto:HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 9:05 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; CWS Motor Claims <cwsmoto rclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>;
assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Aini Binte Md Min <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002197MFSH/1

Hi Nivitha,
Please refer to the email from the third party workshop. Please reply to them urgently.
Best Regards

Henry Kao
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507

3584| Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: henrykao@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C
A Member of EEEE Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom
it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please
delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 15 April, 2019 2:01 PM
To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments @lkkauto.com>

Cc: Henry Kao Cai Jie <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002197MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)
Sent: Monday, 15 April 2019 1:08 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai Jie <HenryKao @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: 5U RVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002197MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWw.aVE.Com




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

f

From: H P Tong <etong@star9.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 10:03 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auta)

Subject: SMHE678) - accident statement for DOA 29/3/2019
Attachments: MCD519041097-01.pdf

Dear Steve,

Please find attached accident statement MCD519041097-01 by SMHE678..

Rgds,
Elson
92366896
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Enquire Transfer Fee
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.

Vehicle Type

Wehicle Attachment 1:
Wiehicle Scheme ;

Vehicle Make :

Vehicle Mode| -

Chassis Mo, ;

Propellant :

Engine Mo, :

Maotor Mo |

Engine Capacity ;

Power Rating :

Maximum Pawer Cutpat :
Maximum Laden Weight :
Unladen Weight :

Year Of Manufacture ;
Original Registration Date :
Lifespan Expiry Date ;
COE Category

Quota Premium ;

COE Expiry Date:

Road Tax Expiry Date :
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date :
Inspection Due Date -
Intended Transfer Date
CO2 Emission

CEVAVES Rebate Utilised
Amount ;

CO Emission;
HC Emission ;
MCx Emission :
PM Emission:

Tranefer Faa Frnnin

SMHGATR]

P11 - Paszenger Station Wagon/leep/Land Rover

Mo Attachment
Mormal

HOMDA

SHUTTLE HYBRID 1.5 AUTD
GP71212245
Petrol-Electric
LEB&S54834
H13714773

14%6cc

220 kW

101.0 kW [ 135 bhp)
1445 kg

1190 kg

2018

2% lan 2019

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
$31,001.00

28 Jan 2029

28 Jul 2019

28 Jan 2029

28 Jan 2022

13 May 2019

89.00 {g/km)
$10,000.00

0029000 (gfkm)
0.013000 (g/km)
0.006000 (g/km)
0.200000 (mg/km)

The current road tax expiry is 28 Jul 2019, You may renew the road tax from 29 Apr 2019 with all pre-requisitels) fulfilled. If the road tax is
renewed after 28 Jul 2019, late renewal feels) will be imposed. Please use Enquire Road Tax Payable te check on the late feels) pavable.

Road tax. including Over Fayment (if any), of a vehicle will follow the vehicle to the new registered owner when its ownership is being transferred.
Amount Payable (From 29 Jul 2019 to 28 Jan 2020)

Transfer Fee:

Additional Levy :

Sub Total :

Mett Road Tax Amount (After
Offsetting Over Payment) :
Total Amount Payable :

Amount Before GST
(5%)

25.00

16,999.00

341.00

Amount Payable (From 2% Jul 2019 to 28 Jul 2020)

Transfer Fee

Additional Lewvy

Sub Total :

Mett Road Tax Amaunt (After
Offsetting Over Payment) ;
Total Amount Payable :
Message

Amaount Before GST
(5%)

25.00

16,999.00

SB2.00

GST Amount
is3)

GST Amount
5%)

Amount After GST
(s$)

25.00

16,995.00
17,024.00

341.00

17,3465.00

Amount After GST
(5%)

2500

16,99%.00
17,024.00

&82.00

17.706.00

From 18 Feb 2019, the Government has further reduced the annual special tax by $100 and $850 for diesel and diesel-hybrid cars and taxis
respectively. The Government will also grant road tax rebates for diesel and diesel-hybrid buses and goods vehicles for a 3-year period from 1
Aug 2019, The current enguiry result does not include the revised special tax reduction and read tax rebate commencing 1 Aug 2017, Please
refer to the Press Release for maore information,

You may print this page for reference.

TS AVTLIE. QU SO/ ILE VIV BCHONYENGUIE | TANSIET T BEUSTBISFTOXY fF UL | IUN_ ILUSFUSU U ISE |
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' Sketch Plan Pg. 4

# ERGO
Ceortificate of Insurance

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RIZHS AND COMPENSATION] ACT {CHAPTER 189)
MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1860
ROAD TRANSPORT ACT, 1087 (MALAYS1A)

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-FARTY RISKS) RULES, 1050 (MALAYSIA)

Cerilicate/Policy Numnber : DMPG19001327

vehlcle Reglatration Humbor i SMHEGTL

Cover Type :  Superor Comprehensiva

Palicy Typa : Private Car

Mame of Palicyhalderlnsured ¢ WU KHENG BOON

Commencemant Date of Insurance ¢ q&mif2019

Expiry Date of Insurance ;o 1ED12020

Excass ¢ EXCESS: (SECTION Humrimrsicisninimiee 5 500.00
ADD'L 5 UMMAMED DRIVERS (SECTION [).., 5% 500,00
ADDYL EXCESS: NON-ALTH WORKAHOPE (SECTION I} 55 30000
EXCESS: WINDSCREEN 13 100.00
YOUNG & INEXP DRIVERS [SECTION ) 5% 3,000.00

Financa Company/Hire Purchase Ownar:  STANDARD CHARTERED BANIC (SINGAPORE) LIMITED
*Parsons af Classes of Parsons entitled lo dive

1. The Policyholder
2. WU HUISHAN PESEEN
5. Any Person wha is diving on the Polioyhclder's ordaer ar parnisslon

Provided ihal the persan diving |s permitied In sccordance with the ficensing or ofhar lows o regulations (o drive tha Botar Vehlcle or has bean
s permitted snd is nolt dsgualified by order of B Courl of Lew or by reesan of any enseiment or reguiation In kel beball from driving the bMolor
Vahicla. And provided further that the Mater wahicle Is roglstered undar the Road Traffic Act and lis registration under the Rload Trafio Act hag
nol e canceled al the tima of the accident Joss or damags.

¢ Limilations as to Use:

1} Use only for sockal domestie and ploasyre purposes
23 Use for Polleyholder's business

This Policy doas ncl cover

1) Use for hire o reward, racing, pace-making, reliability iral ar speed-lesling and on race irack
2) Usa for the cariaga of goods oihar than samplas In connaction with any rada or business

3) Use far any purpase In connection with the Motor Trade

Uimitations rendered hoperaiive by Sactlan 8 of e Pkt Viehlchas (Third Party Risks and Compensalion) At {Chapter 188) and Sechion 85 of tha
Road Tranaport Act, 1987 (Makaysia) are nel Lo be included under thesa hoedings (7).

WE HEREBY GERTIFY that the Pallcy to which this Carlificate relates ls sued In accordance with the pravislans of the Motor Vehicles {Third Party
Rlsks and Compenaation) Act (Chapler 188) and Par IV of the Road Transpart Acl, 1987 (Mataysia)

For andt on behall of ERGO Insurance: Pie., Lid.

Approved insures
MCA—-‘U—E b Mi‘
Aulhorzad Signaiure
ADDOS58 [ON= Linik INSURANCE AGENCY FTE LTD [Contaet Number: 63633633 ]
Vahide Chassls Number : GP7-1212245, Venicle Engine Number ; LEB-655483G PCA, 26001/2019 17:10 |

ERGO Ingurance Ple, Lid. Co, Rag. No. 189305211H GST Reg. Moo h2-0116830-5
§ Tamssek Bowlevard #04-01 Suntec Tower Flve Singepors 030505 Tal: 465 G20 5198 Fax: 465 GA29 9248 www.argo.com.sg

Page & of 20



Addendum Sheet Pg. 1

GEHERAL IMSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SIMGAFORE RECOROS MARASEMENT CENTRE
A Raffles Quay K18-00 Singapan: Q45580

. BEMERAL

- INSURANGE  Tel(65)6224 0010 Fax (65] 6224 0030

LS isdood  Dperaing Hous s Monday to friday, 09:00 - 1740
HEECHDS AL MAGEMENT CEHTRE LED: 665500206 [ GST ftrg, No.2 MABXILFTES

IMPORTANTHOTE: Please subrmit the completed Addendum formtothe same Authorised Reporting Centre
with wheom you submitted the Original Report,

ADDENDUM

(4] PARTICULARSOFPERSON PAANING THE AMENDMENTS:

Original Reporte ML%]IT ol ﬂu! :FI Vehicle Registration No: N hl é':":} ?Ji

i 'y

Mame(as shownin HRIC) WU E‘}mﬁ ri’wﬂ MRIC/FIN/Passport Mo ¢
{(*\eljtebriver { Vehicle Ow ner} (?] Please delete as appropriste

Address ! Singaporel i
Contact {Tel) : __Moblle No.:

Email Address -

Date ofAccident 1 2 ] a3 Jvol Titne of Accident : ol

Place of Accldent & ﬁ-ndw frm'ﬂﬁ{ ) .
Insurance Company: 0

() ADDITIONALINFORMATION [ AMENDMENTS:

| have made a report on the above mentioned accident and would fike to include additianal information or
malte the following amendments:

To  awaul  policy o B DMPG 1 00127

Coue, Hlui oilsv)1g

pollcyholder f Driver's Signature Reparting Centre Personnel's Signature
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STAR 9 WORKSHOP PTE LTD

36 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST, #01-42 ENTERPRISE HUB, SINGAPORE 608580
CO. REG.NO. 201T31150W

TEL: 666568668 FAX: 66651308

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED QUOTATION
36, Robinson Road Nat& ¢ 11042019
#16-01, City House \ chicle No.  * SMHBGTEI
Singapore DbEETY ’@%‘ Make/Model : HONDA SHUTTLE HYBRID 1.5 AUTO
Attention: Claims Officer lﬂ«-‘JL lﬂu,'uu).' it Chassis No : GPT1212245
Lot 1770 EED H Engine No. - LEBBSS4835
E‘jl__,:rf’l :?EL}'E - lrﬁ.frq['/-"l? ..? .llj— fﬁ n{:l; . 29/01/2010
g Y . 4‘ IJ,,,” Policy MNa. ¢ Third Barty Claim
_i_'.,__ll'l-f-'"l"'f r JLLM Ef_'] th(m‘?‘ﬁ (om H‘{_ .p'/';’? Accident Dn:te : 29/03/2010
brAE—3pmy fewy belu §4
j d |
= T =) : 3
A |Parts v QTy. Unit Price Total (S)
01 |[TaitGate ~ [} 1 1,380.00 138000 |19 79
02 Tail Gate (SHUTTLE) name plate .  J/{( 1 65,00 65.00 '
03 Tail Gate {(HYBRID) name plate — UL | 1 94.00 24.00 /L ;-rj
04 |Rear windscreen outer moulding - 1L 1 178.00 178.00 1Yy
05 Rear windscreen glass sealant - I.L.'L'-; 1 141.00 ({ d/ 141.00 :
06 |Rear Bumper - in 1 1,330.00 1,330.00— |\ % o 'fa\ﬂ vl
o7 Reverse Sensor - [ 1set 204.00 TT7, 294.00
08 |EndPanel ¥ J 1 708.00 708.00 X
[ Rear Bumper Clips .~ AlF{ 4 4,50 27.00 7
Sub Total {I) LIST 4,217.00 79£5 71
List price less 20% 84340 : -E‘iﬂ
Sub Total (1) NETT 3,373.60 ;‘é?q- w
B |(LABOUR CHARGE Qry. Unit Price Total (8)
01 To kneck, repair and replace rear end panel, 1iot 300.00 900.00 "35.1-‘
tail gate, rear bumper and dismantle and fix.
Sub Total (2) 900.00
c |DISMANTLE & FIX Qry. Unit Price Total (S)
01 Dismantle and fix rear windscreen glass 1Llot 280.00 fgd 28000
Sub Total {3) 280.00
D |SPRAY PAINTING Qry. Unit Price Total (5)
01 Spray painting an tail gate {inside/autside), 1 Lat 500.00 900.00 £47
and panel, rear bumper, etc, f;"f?ﬂ
Sub Total {4} 900,00 i
F 19
- } Total (S)
3 S W'é‘tmmation of abol& rEpalr o _-f ﬂf by hmemuy 5,453.60
* To resurvey belorelafier spray m‘ '
-;aﬂﬂnﬁumnnldmtu:mmm
o 7 ort prices are subject to confirmation S s 8
Yours sincerely, . TH:""“ party survey is on a ‘Without Fhepamarsadgtior: | (L Mot o
iflegal modification(s) is afiowed 58 i ] o
’ 'Elm:& Ihﬁajmmm““u _— l._ +
AP SR e——crey | W OasT
T el Adknowledged by Repairer
/ Swgnature;
Date:
HF TONG
Advisor Date



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Fark, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19006657/Evd3n2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Pater 13052018 M"HI"“”I“I” NI
Code - FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 9856H Veh. Inspected SMH 8678
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D19002197TMFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From HENRY KAD Assign Date 15/04/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA SHUTTLE c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. GPT1212245 Colour BLUE
Odometer 2056 Steering IN CRDER
Brakes IN ORDER Madification SPORTS RIM
General GoOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[185/60R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[185/60R15 YOKOHAMA, & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[185/0R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear T]I'I'E 185/80 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR F'DHTTGN-.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  29/03/2019 Inspection Date 18/04/2019
Survey held at STAR 8 WORKSHOP PTE. LTD
36 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST #01-42
ENTERPRISE HUB
SINGAPORE 608580
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

5 Working Days
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Asa ng B

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMH 6678J

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No. 193G07198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Page No..1of 1

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop f‘}} ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1| TAIL GATE DENTED 1,380.00 1,193.70
1|TAIL GATE {SHUTTLE} NAME PLATE NECESSARY 65.00 6:3.00
1|TAIL GATE (HYEBRID) NAME PLATE WMECESSARY S4.00 9400
1|REAR WINDSCREEMN OUTER MOULDING NECESSARY 178.00 178.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS SEALANT NECESSARY 141.00 60.00
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 1,330.00 1,150.60
1|SET REVERSE SENSCR BROKEMN 294.00 200.00
1|END PAMNEL TO REPAIR SEE 708.00 -
LABOUR
S|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @34.50 NECESSARY 27.00 27.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -843.40 -553.66
337360 2,374.64
LABOUR
TO KNOCK REPAIR AND REPLACE REAR END 900.00 550.00
II:&NEL.TNL GATE REAR BUMPER AND DISMANTLE AND
DISMANTLE AND FIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS. 280.00 100.00
SPRAY PAINTING ON TAIL GATE (INSIDE/QUTSIDE), END S00.00 560.00
FPANEL REAR BUMPER ETC
2,080.00 1,200.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,453.60 3,5674.64
] RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 3,;51.’4.“]
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