Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 11:52 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)
Cc: Liew Thye Wui; Faeaz

Subject: RE: SKW 629K-DOA: 10/4/2019 (CHINA TAIPING)

Hi Veron Chen,
We accept this Limit Repair $35000.00 for Vehicle: SKW629K

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ary Chua Wai Ngee

Bodyshop Service Advisor Kah Motor Co.Sdn.Bhd. Address:15 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408610
E-mail: arychua@honda.com.sqg H/P:81006306 DID:68465673 Fax: 67480770

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April, 2019 11:29 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>
Subject: SKW 629K-DOA: 10/4/2019 (CHINA TAIPING)

Dear Ary,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKW 629K Not exceeding repair
cost $35,000/- or which ever lower (Excess $1000/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741
8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual
or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete
the mail. Thank you.



