Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: margaret@kkimhin.com.sg

Sent: Thursday, 19 August 2021 11:11 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: claims@kkimhin.com.sg; 'filenet-ctom-p-sg'; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SOMO1JWG_LKK_DIRECT_SETTLEMENT_Accident_involving SKT4590B & SLE7189A

Along filter to Bt Batok West Ave 5 on 10 April 2019 *** LKK REF :
CC4/ASM19006574/Kga3q?2
Attachments: SKT4590B - DS Form.pdf

Dear Cecilia

Enclosed is the duly chop and signed Direct Settlement form for the amount of $3,204.90 for you to effect payment to
K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd. Please note that we have an account with AXA therefore the payment form is not required.

Thanks and Regards

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Dr #02-20
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 64527018

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 17, 2021 4:56 PM

To: margaret@kkimhin.com.sg; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: claims@kkimhin.com.sg; 'filenet-ctom-p-sg' <filenet-ctom-p-sg@axa.com.hk>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>;
Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SOMO01JWG_LKK_DIRECT_SETTLEMENT_Accident_involving SKT4590B & SLE7189A Along filter to Bt Batok
West Ave 5 on 10 April 2019 *** LKK REF : CC4/ASM19006574/Kga3q2

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Margaret,

We are pleased to accept your proposal of $ 3,204.90 (all-in).

Kindly sign on DV and payment form as attached and email back to us (LKK).

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
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